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KILLEN URGD TO ANNOUNCE 

A prominent young Kent Coun- 

tian urges State Auditor Ernest 

E. Killen, Harrington grain deal- 

er, to announce his interest in 

securing the Democratic nomina- 

tion for governor in the election 

this year. 

“Of the Kent Countians who 

have shown a definite interest in 

receiving. the nomination , he 

would make the best candidate,” 

said James G. Smith, a member 

of the Delaware River and Bay 

Authority, this week. 

Kent Countians believe the can- 

didate for governor should come 

from their county, since they be- 

lieve the candidates for U. S. re- 

presentative and U. S. senator 

will again come from New Castle 

and Sussex Counties, respectively. 

Furthermore, it has been 20 years 

since a Democratic candidate for 

governor has come from Kent 

County, they point out. 

Smith, prominent in the activi- 

ties of young Democrats, come 

from a family long prominent in 

politics. His grandfather, the late 

Will Smith, of Harrington, was 

sheriff of Kent County. It was he 

who introduced Killen into poli- 

tics in 1940 when he asked him to 

assist Sen. Fred Bailey, then 

chairman of the Democratic Com- 

mittee for the upper part of the 

Ninth Representative District. 

Upon his return from service in 

the armed forces, Killen was 

made Ninth District chairman and 

was also made a member of the 

State Committee, replacing J. 

Gordon Smith, former chairman 

of the State Highway Commission 

and father of James G. Smith, up- 

on his moving from Harrington 

to Dover. 

Killen’s supporters point to his 

long experience in politics and 

his three terms as state auditor, 

state election commissioner, a 

member of the State Buget Com- 

mission, a member of the Board 

of Pardons and the Post-Mortem 

Board, as qualifications for the 

gubernatorial post. 

Young Smith and Killen are 

strong supporters of youth in 

politics. Killen says, “President 

Kennedy left with us a challenge 

for young people to take a more 

active part in politics and to hold 

more offices.” 

a 6000 majority in his last contest 

for auditor and was second high 

man on the state ticket, is also a 

former collector of internal rev- 

enue, being appointed by Presi- 

dent Truman upon the recommen- 

dation of U. S. Sen. J. Allen 

Frear. 

Dover District 
WSCS Annual 
Day Apart Service 

The annual “Day Apart” Serv- 

ice of Dover District, Woman’s 

Society of Christian Service, will 

be held in Mount Olivet Metho- 

dist Church, Seaford, on March 

9, Monday, at 7:30 p.m. It is an 

evening service announces Mrs. I. 

C. King, president of Dover Dis- 

trict. 

Mrs. Granville Hooper, Cam- 

bridge, conference secretary of 

spiritual life, will be the guest 

speaker. Mrs. Hooper has served 

in several offices of the Peninsula 

Conference WSCS, and the annual 

conference. Prior to her present 

line of work, she was the secre- 

tary of children’s work of the 

Northeastern Jurisdiction, Metho- 

dist Church. 

The Rev. Milton H. Keene, host 

minister, will give the preparation 

and instructions for the sacrifi- 

cial meal at the conclusion of the 

(Continued on Page 8) 
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Development Dept. 
Circular Distributed 

The Delaware State Develop- 

ment Department s currently dis- 
edition of 

“Adventure Out-of-Doors in Del- 

aware,” an attractive six-panel, 

three-fold brochure listing all of 

the state’s public camping, fish- 

ing and picknicking sites. The 

brochure also includes a chart, 

listing activities permitted at 

various recreation areas, and a 

map, pin-pointing location of va- 

rious facilities. 

Copies of the 1964 edition of 

  

“Adventure Out-of-Doors in Del- 

aware” may be obtained by con- 

tacting the Development Depart- 

ment at 45 The Green, Dover. 

They are also available at the 

Game and Fish Commission, 

North treet, Dover; Recreation 

Promotion and Service, 1301 Or- 

ange Street, Wilmington; Dela- 

ware State Chamber of Com- 

merce, 1112-14 King Street, Wil- 

mington, and the Travel Bureaus 

of the News-Journal Company at 

Wilmington, Dover and George- 

town. 

  

  

CANDIDACY FOR GOVERNOR 
  

Sabin Oral 
Vaccine Clinic 
Open April 19 

All three types of Sabin oral 

vaccine will be made avail- 

able to Delawareans at 15 lo- 

cations on Sunday, April 19. 

Dr. Henry H. Stroud said re- 

cently that the Medical Society 

of Delaware will sponsor the 

clinics in order to make all types 

of vaccine available to persons 

who missed one or more types 

earlier. Previous clinics in 

November, December and Janu- 

ary were held for the distribu- 

tion of Types 1, 3, and 2, vac- 

cine, respectively. 
Although all three types will 

be distributed on one day thig 
time, individuals may not take 

more than one. If they have 

missed two or more, they will 

be advised to take one of the 
missing types on April 19 and 

obtain additional does later, 

after a waiting period of six to 

eight weeks between doses. 

Dr. Stroud said that the clinics 

will be conducted in the same 

manner as the three earlier pro- 

grams, with drops of the oral 

polio vaccine placed on cubes of 

sugar and the cubes eaten. 

The clinics will be open from 

11 a.m. to.3 p.m. 

Locations of the April 19 clin- 

ics are as follows: 

NEW CASTLE COUNTY — 

Claymont Fire Company, Tal- 

leyville Fire Company, Stanton 
Junior High School, Aetna Hose, 

Hook and Ladder Co. (station 

No. 2, Newark), Goodwill Fire 

Company (New Castle), and 

Five Points. Fire Company 

(Richardson Park). 
WILMINGTON Public 

Building, 10th, and King Sts.; 

(Continued on Page 8) 
  

Ground-Breaking 
For Benedictine 
School March 15 

The Benedictine Sisters of 
Ridgely, Maryland «have an- 

nounced ground breaking cer- 

emonies for the new classroom 

addition will take place on Sun- 
day, March 15th at 2:30 in the 

afternoon. 

The Benedictine School, once 

known as St. Gertrude’s Acad- 

emy, a boarding school for girls, 

was founded in 1959. It is a 
residential, private facility for 

the education and training for 

mentally handicapped girls and 

boys. 
The new $1,000,000 construct- 

ion was found to be a necessity 

with a steady increase in appli- 

cants each year and the con- 

stant advances being made in the 

care and treatment of the ‘“re- 

tarded”. or exceptional child. 

The Benedictine Sisters have 

been assisted in the past and 

continue to enlist the financial 

assistance of the public in pro- 

viding sufficient funds for the 
badly needed new facilities. 

There are presently 56 boys 

and girls at the school and with 

the plans for construction of g 

completely new unit, this num- 
ber will be increased to 100. 
The proposed classroom wing 

will contain ten classrooms with 

attached bathrooms. The great- 

est difference between these 

new classrooms and standard 
ones will be in the equipment 

which will be much more spec- 

ialized. The dining area will 

accomodate 100 children with a 

fully equipped kitchen and ser- 

vice area. The design includes 
two large recreation areas for 

meetings, etc. 
The dormitory section willl 

have five self-contained units, 

each comprising a Sister’s room, 

two baths and 20 beds with 

dressers and closets. At the end 

of the dormitory wing will be 

an infirmary unit with nurse's 

quarters, 4 additional bedrooms 

for Sisters and a utility and 

laundry room. 
The administrative wing will 

consist of “offices for the direct- 

or, secretary and treasurer. Also 

included will be a conference- 

library room, a file and recep- 

tion area and a lobby. 
The Benedictine Sisters have 

a long range goal for develop- 

ment and expansion of their fa- 
cilities at Ridgely to include ad- 

ditional buildings that will ulti- 

mately accomodate 250 mentally 

retarded children. This goal, 

however, is a 10 year objective. 
  

Alumni Association 
To Meet Tuesday 

The Harrington Alumni Associ- 

ation will meet Tuesday evening, 

March 10, at 7:30 in the high 

Chicken Festival 
Cook-Off to Be 
Larger than ’63 

This year’s national chicken 
cook-off in June at the 17th 

annual Delmarva Chicken Festi- 

val in Easton, promises to be 

even more cosmopolitan than 
its predecessor last June at Sal- 

isbury, according to a report 

just received from the Pou'‘ry 

and Egg National Board of Chi- 

cago. 
The Poultry Board is national 

consumer informative agency for 

the poultry industry and co 
sponsor of the National Chicken 

Cooking Contest, along with the 

Delmarva Foultry Indu:try As 

sociation. 
Lloyd Geil, its general man- 

| ager, reported that entries an’ 

recipes counted since the en'r 

mailing deadline of Februar: 

15 were up 40 percent over last 

year’s total. They came from 

46 states, the District of Colum- 

THREE OF A KIND—Pose 

of St.   bia and Canada. 
All eligible entries are now 

being sent to state cooking con- 

test committees, Geil said. Judg- 

ing panels named by the state 

committees or the Poultry and 

Egg National Board will select 

state winners and alternates in 

the four divisions of the contests 

during recipe eliminations or 

cook-offs held in March and 

April. Four finalists from each 

state will then be eligible to 
compete in each of the four di- 

visions of the national cook-off 

at Easton, June 18, 19, and 20. 

Maryland’s and Delaware’s top 

cooks will be choosen at three 

separate cookoffs and in an 

additional two recipe contests, 

according to the two Peninsula 

cooking contest chairmen. 

Delaware will hold a state 

cook - off in the senior, junior, 

J Doris appliance and barbecue 

divisions of the contest on April 

4th at Harrington, reports Mrs. 

chairman. 

Maryland will hold two cook- | 

offs rather than the one pre- 

viously announced, reports Mrs. | 

[Judy Dike of Denton, the Free 

State chairman. Senior divis- 

ion entrants will vie for state 

prizes and chance at the nat- 

{ ional finals in Denton on March 

| 21st. State cook-off in the port- 

able appliance division will be 

held at the historic Lexington 

Market in Baltimore on March 

14th. 
Maryland winners and nation- 

al finalists in the junior and 

barbecue divisons will be chosen 

in a recipe contest held late 

in March under the auspices of 
her committee and the Poul- 

try and Egg National Board, 

Mrs. Dike reports. 

Felton Students 
Wins Science 
Project Awards 

The eighth and ninth grades of 

Felton School, which have been 

busy making science projects, 

  

next PTA meeting on Monday, 

March 9. 
Mr. Luff, the high school prin- 

cipal; Mr. Mastin, the high school 

science teacher, and Mrs. Parker, 

the junior high science teacher 

{formed the committee which 

judged the projects. There were 

many commendable ones, but the 

winners were as follows: 

9A—first, Ted Combs; 

Richard Farley; third, 

    
second, 

George 

Nashhold. 
9B—First, Jean Poynter; sec- 

ond, Lana Davee, and third, 

Wayne Saulsbury. 
9—First, David Alexander: sec- 

ond, Harold Minner, and third, 

Rosalie Tribbitt. 
8A—First, John McDowell, sec- 

ond, Susan French, and third, 

Allan Dill. 
8B—First, Billy Browne; sec- 

ond, James Boone, and third, 

Eddie Cole and John Hennessey. 

The effort put forth by the stu- 

dents was excellent, and they will 

be pleased to have their parents 

come to the PTA meeting to see 

the results of their work. 

  
  

Walters-Moore 
The marriage of Miss Evelyn 

J. Walters, daughter of Mr. and 

Mrs. Samuel Walters Sr., of Can- 

terbury, to Walter W. Moore, son 

of Mr. and Mrs. Walter H. Moore, 

of Felton, took place Friday eve- 

ning, Feb. 28 in the Felton Metho- 

dist Church. The Rev. Donald 

Washburn officiated. Mrs. Reed 

Hughes was the organist. 
Mrs. William Swain, sister of 

the bride was the matron of 

honor and Clifton Chambers, 

brother-in-law of the bridegroom, 

served as best man. 
Following the ceremony, a re- 

ception was held in the Fellow- 

ship Hall of the Church. 

Mr. and Mrs. Moore are resid-   
school ‘cafeteria. All alumni areing at the Rice Farms Apts., on 
urged to attend. the Felton-Frederica Road. 

will proudly display them at the! 

low of Harry L. Boyer, of 13 

Stephen’s. 

    

PEACE BE TO THIS   
(S.T.D., Bishop of Delaware, 

| 
| 
i 

  
after the dedication of the] 

vicarage of St. Stephen’s Episcopal Church here Sunday. 

They are as follows (left to right): 

Hinks, retired vicar of St. Stephen’s, who took part in the 

dedication; the Rt. Rév. John Brooke Mosley, D.D., S.T.D., 
Bishop of Delaware, and the Rev. Quay’ D. Rice, Sr., vicar 

Price Photo. 

The Rev. John S. 

  
HOUSE; AND TO ALL WHO 

ENTER HERE—The Rt. Rev. John Brooke Mosley, D. D., 

dedicates the vicarage of St. 

Elva Short of Lewes, Delaware | Stephen’s Episcopal Church here Sunday. Price Photo. 

  

Elisha Dukes 
To Speak to 
‘Democratic Club 

of the 9th District Democratic 

Club will be held Wednesday eve- 

ning, March 10, at 7 p.m, This 

meeting is being held the second 

Tuesday rather than the first, 

due to the unexepected death of 

Mrs. George Vincent. Mrs. Vin- 

cent was a loyal club member 

who had devoted many hours to 

the club serving for many years 

on the kitchen committee. Her 

husband, George Vincent, is vice- 

president of the club. 

The meeting at Farmington 

Fire Hall will be a covered dish. 

As usual, an excellent dinner is 

being planned for the Farmington 

meeting. 

The Honorable Elisha Dukes, 

secretary of the State of Dela- 

ware, will be the featured speak- 

er. Mr. Dukes will be represent- 

ing Governor Elbert N. Carvel, 

Governor of the State of Dela- 

ware who had been scheduled to 

speak at the postponed meeting. 

Governor Carvel will be enjoying 

a ten day vacation in Florida. 

Mr. Dukes will inform those pre- 

sent of the current political .at- 
mosphere. 

The purpose of the 9th District 

Democratic Club is to provide an 

informal meeting place and forum 

for Democrats to keep informed 

on the affairs of our government. 

Throughout the coming election 

year candidates for political off- 

ices will be given the privilege of 

coming before Democrats in the 

9th District. In addition to the 

serious business of government a 

pleasant social evening is pro- 
vided. 

The monthly meetings are held 

alternately at the Farmington 

Fire Hall and the American Le- 

gion Home in Harrington. Cur- 

rently the club has approximately 

100 active members. All loyal 

Democrats are invited to join. 
  

Mrs. Harry L. Boyer 
Mrs. Katie W. Boyer, 74, wid- 

E. Mispillion $St., died Tuesday 

in Milford Memorial Hospital. 

She had operated the Boyer 

Funeral Home here for many 
years before her retirement in 
1961. 

She was formerly secretary 

for the Messenger Canning Co., 

of Federalsburg, Md. In 1922 

she moved to Harrington and 

was bookkeeper at the Peoples 
Bank of Harrington. 

She married Major Wyatt, 

Harrington funeral director, and 

continued: the business after his 

death. Some years later she 

married Mr. Boyer and changed 
the name of the business to the 

Boyer Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Boyer was a graduate 

of the Eckles College of Mortu- 
ary Science, Philadelphia. 

She was a member of the 

(Continued on Page 4) 

The regular monthly meeting: 

Jobs Available 
On Ferry 

| Watermen interested in pos- 

itions with the new Lewes-Cape 

May ferry have been invited to 

Lewes Town Hall on Monday, 
March 9 and Monday March 16 

for interviews, general mana- 

ger Nolan C. Chandler said 

this week. 

Chandler said he is interested 
in talking to qualified person- 

nel in the following job classifi- 

cations and he listed the open- 

ing monthly pay rates. They are 

as follows: Chief Engineers, 

$651.86; First Assistant Engin- 
eers, $539.67; Second Assistant 

Engineers, $485.10; Firemen and 

able bodied seamen, $303.19. 

Interviews will be conducted 

from 9 a. rm. to 3 p. m. on each 
of the two Mondays, and candi- 

dates should have their seaman’s 

certificates with them, showing 
their Coast Guard ratings and 

qualifications. 

It is understood that crews 

will work “two days on and two 

days off” which makes the pos- 

itions most attractive, Chandler 

believes. 
Watermen who are not able 

to apply for positions on March 

9 and 16 may do so by writing 

or calling in person at Delaware 
River and Bay Authority head- 

quarters, at Delaware Memorial 

Bridge. Information is also 

available for those who write to 

Delaware River and Bay Auth- 

ority, Box 71, New Castle, Del. 
  

Legion Auxiliary 
Exec. Committee 
Meets Tomorrow 

The third executive committee 

meeting of the American Legion 

Auxiliary, Department of Dela- 

ware, will be held at the Log Ca- 

bin Sussex No. 8 Post Home, of 

The American Legion, at George- 

town, tomorrow at 10 a.m. 

Mrs. George Hess, of Dover, the 
department president, will pre- 

side. 

Reservations for the luncheon 

are being taken by Mrs. William 

B. Hickman, Jr., of Route 2, Mil- 

ton, president of the Sussex Unit 

No. 8. 

Walter J. Harrington II 

Walter J. Harrington, 43, died 

Tuesday night at St. Francis Hos- 

pital, Trenton, N. J., after a long 

illness. 
He was the son of Mrs. Helen 

S. Harrington and the late Lee 

Harrington, of Felton. 

In addition to his mother he is 

survived by his wife, Ruth Cu- 

sick Harrington; two sons, Mich- 

ael Lee and Walter J. III, of Tren- 

ton, N. J.; one brother, Dr. Lee 

Harrington, Winston-Salem, N. C. 

Funeral services will be held 

today from the Ivans and Taylor 

Funeral Home, Trenton, N. J., at 

2 p.m. 

        

Expand Facilities 

ly on four new horse barns and 

Delaware State Fairgrounds in 

: Harrington. 

Delaware State 
Fair to 

Construction will begin short- 

a new grooms’ quarters at the 

J. Gordon Smith, president of 
the fair association, said that the 

$120,000 project will be com- 

pleted’ in time for use during 
this year’s fair which will be 

held July 25 through August 1. 

“These new barns and quar- 
ters,” Smith said, “are part of 

our continuing program aimed 

at enlarging and improving fair 

facilities. Only recently we 

completed and occupied a new 

office and administrative build-: 

ing built at a cost of $60,000. 
“Since 1961 when the name of 

the annual event was changed 

from Kent and Sussex Fair to 

Delaware State Fair,” he con- 

tinued attendance has in- 

creased almost 50%. The fair 

is becoming a growing source of 

education and enjoyment for 

Delawareans throughout the 

state. To provide adequate fa- 

cilities for all phases of the fair 

will require a constant expan- 

sion plan and program.” 

The four new concrete block 

barns will replace present frame 

structures and will provide some 

100 stalls plus tack rooms. The 

two-story grooms’ quarters will 
provide living accomodations for 

60 persons. 
Smith said that establishment 

of a 20-unit trailer court is also 
planned in time for this year’s 

fair.’ 
  

Resource Material 
Available On 
Heart Disease 

If you have heart disease, what 

adjustments must you make in 

your daily routine? What steps 

can you take to protect your 

child against rheumatic fever? 

How can you plan your meals 

so that cholesterol. and ' other 

fatty substances can be kept ta 
a minimum? 

These and hunderds of other 

questions can be answered by a 

phone call or post card to the 

Delaware Heart Association. 

As a part of its public edu- 
cation program, the Heart Asso- 
ciation makes available a host 

of booklets, films, slides and 

transcripts covering practically 

every phase of heart disease. 
Some are prepared for medical 

groups, while many others are 

designed to explain to members 

of the public the facts about 
heart disease and what should 
be done. 

Dr. Richard N. Taylor, presi- 

dent of the Delaware Heart As- 

sociation, issued an open invi- 

tation to all individuals and 

groups to explore the resource 

  

Reciprocity Day 
At Century Club 
Tuesday 

Tuesday afternoon, March 10, 

women from the Federation of 

Women’s Clubs in Kent County 

will be guests at a Reciprocity 

Tea, given by the Harrington 

New Century Club. Also expect- 

ed to be present for this annual 

affair are the state officers of 

the Federation. 

Mrs. Lester E. Smith is serv- 

ing as chairman for the after- 

noon. The program has a slight 

air of mystery about it, since 

only the geenral topic “American 

Homes” has been announced. Mrs. 

Smith did hint this week that the 

and most enjoyable to all who at- 

tend. 

Assisting with the arrange- 

ments are Mrs. Kenneth D. Aiken, 

Mrs. Robert H. Creadick, Mrs. 

Fred S. Bailey, Mrs. Samuel M. 

Williams, Mrs. G. Fred Wilson, 

Mrs. Charles L. Peck, Jr. and Mrs. 

Robert T. Weaver. The hospitality 

Committee under the direction of 

Mrs. William W. Shaw and the 

Decorating Committee with Mrs. 

Floyd N. Nasser, chairman, have 

also been engaged in preparing 

for this meeting. 

Don’t forget the date—next 

Tuesday, March 10, 2 p.m. — in 

the club house for an afternoon of 

pure pleasure and an opportunity 
to meet members of the other 

clubs in Kent County. 

KCEA Annual 

  

[Convention Today 
The Kent County Education 

Association will hold its annual 

convention today at the Caesar 

Rodney High School. The conven- 

tion will mark the forty-third 
year of service to Delaware edu- 

cation. Mrs. Beatrice ‘Holland, 

president of the KCEA, will pre- 

side. # 

The theme of “Let’s Be Pro- 

fessional” has been chosen for this 

convention which will be attend- 

|ed by all Kent County Educators. 

A business session in the morn- 

ing will be followed by an ad- 

dress by Dr. Richard P. Gousha, 

State Superintendent of Public 

Instruction. In the afternoon, 

teachers, administrators, nurses, 
librarians, and school lunch per- 

sonnel may attend any of the 

twenty-four sectional meetings 
, they desire. 

KCEA is a professional organi- 

zation dedicated to the welfare of 

Kent County teachers and pupils. 
It was organized in 1922 and with 

the exception of an interruption     
material of the Association for 

both private consumption and 

for meeting program material. 

‘You can find exactly what 
materials are available by phon- 

Olympia 4-5269 or writing to the 
Association at 2108 Baynard 

Boulevard, Wilmington,” he said. 

“This service, doubly import- 
ant because of the position of 

heart disease as first among 

this nation’s killers, is made pos- 

sible by the annual contribu- 

tions to the Heart Fund.” 

Telephone Co. 
Reports Income 
On Increase 

The Diamond State Telephone 

Company reports that net in- 

come for 1963 was $4,632,000, an 

increase of $283,000 over 1962. 

The Company said expendi- 

tures for expansion and service 

improvement programs amount- 

ed to $7,646,000 in 1963. Of this 

amount, $5,119,000 went into ad- 

ditional plant, bringing the total 
amount invested in plant facili~ 

ties to $86,687,000. 

This progress was accomp- 

lished without an increase in the 

general level of telephone rates 

and despite increases in wage 

and saalry rates and other em- 
ployee. costs, higher prices for 

some purchased materials and 
services, and higher taxes, W. D. 

Gillen, company president, states 

in the firm’s annual report pub- 

lished recently. 

Over the last few years, he 

adds, additional and supple- 

mentary communications servi- 

ces have provided approximate- 

ly $60 of every $100 increases in 
local service revenues and more 

than $40 of each $100 rise in 

total operating revenues. 
He reports substantial in- 

creases in installations of data 

transmission facilities and oth- 

er services for business custo- 

mers ‘and in such items for res- 

idence customers as Princes 

  

ing the Heart Association at 

  
| during World War II, 1943-47, has 

| been active to the present time. In 

i the beginning it worked primari- 

| for professional interests and 

educators’ welfare. Over the years 

it became interested in all phases 

of education including the em- 

ployment of a paid State Secre- 

tary, standardized courses of 

study, specialized education, FTA 

Clubs, a school budget to include 

increments in salary, teacher and 

school personnel retirement, pen- 

sions, federal aid to public school 
education, to mention a few. 

Perhaps, at the present time, its 

most effective function is to act 

as a liaison organization between 

county interests and state and na- 

tional organizations. 

KCEA has brought to Kent 

County teachers many well-known 

educators and national figures to 

keep the county up to date on 

the trend. of the times in educa- 

(Continued on Page 8) 
  

Farm Bureau Young 
Peoples Organization 
Formed in Kent County 

A Kent County Farm Bureau 

Young Peoples organizaton was 

formed at a meeting in Dover on 

Thurs., February 27. 

Robert Biggs, of Felton, was 

elected temporary chairman, Wil- 

liam Mack, temporary vice-chair- 

man, and Elaine Mack, temporary 

secretary. 

A group of about 25 young 

farm people were present and de- 

cided they would like to organize 

in order that they might meet 

with people who have similar 

problems and attempt to find so- 

lutions to them. It was explained 

that they would work closely with 

and be affiliated with the regu- 

lar Farm Bureau organization. 

Plans for future get togethers 
were discussed and it is anticipat- 

ed that business will be liberally 

mixed with pleasure. The next 

meeting is scheduled for March 

12 at which time Mr. and Mrs. 

Charles Dempsey and Mr .and 

Mrs Alfred Moore are in charge   (Continued on Page 8)     of the program. 

program will be in a light vein | 

COUNCILMEN INTERESTED IN 
SECURING INCREASED REVENUE 

The City of Harrington needs 

money and some members of the 
City Council, at its regular March 

meeting Wednesday: evening, 

thought it was about time more 

revenue was raised. 

Councilman Burton Satterfield 
said the City had to raise more 

revenue. He was backed up by 
Councilman Albert 

said the City’s services had been 
increased but the revenue to pay 

for the increase had not been 
raised. fel 
‘Vice Mayor Howell Hitchens, 

who presided in the absence of 
Mayor Fulton J. Downing, who 

is on a Caribbean cruise, said the 

Council would have to have a 

pow wow when the mayor re- 

turned. 

Mentioned as probable sources of 

income were increased capitation 

taxes and a sewer rental. Price 
explained that some towns south 

| of us had raised capitation taxes ih: 
considerably. That tax here is 
$4.15. Councilman Wilson Brad- 
ley believed some change might 
be made in the capitation tax but 
he did not favor a sewer tax. 

~ The discussion on increased re- 
venue came up after the Council 

tide the City over until taxes were 

paid. This is a normal procedure. 
In other business Wednesday 

night: gi 

The Council voted to hold a 

25, on a proposal to rezone two 

lots from residential to commer- 

cial. The request was made by 
Rowe Pleasanton, of Dover, con- 

cerning lots 5 and 6 on the 

from the General Baking Com- 

pany. Pleasanton said the Tastee 

Freez Company wanted to buy 

patrolman. 

In other business, the vice 
mayor appointed Councilman F. 

i Lawrence Price, Albert C. Price 
and Burton Satterfield to a com- 
mittee to study the water code, 

with recommendations to be pre= 
sented to the Council at its April 

meeting. pres 

Accepted the scrap sisessment 2 
list and agreed to hear appeals 
from 7 to 9 p.an., Mon., Marca 16. 

Heard City Manager Alfred G. 

B. Mann say the dog warden, of 

the State Game & Fish Commis- 

visit a particular area, in answer 

(Continued on Page 8) 

Ferry Contracts 
Awarded 

Low bids on ferry terminal 

  

and Lewes ran approximately 

$57,000 more than engineering 

estimates when bids |were 
opened at Delaware River and 
Bay Authority headquarters, 

Delaware Memorial Bridge 

Tuesday. 

The bids covered preparations 

of sites in both states, includ- 

ing grading, wiring, 

parking and service 

storm drains, toll booths and 

other items. fis 
On the Cape May side, bids 

also included: construction of a 

complete ship fueling and water 
system and storage facilities. 

This is what made the Cape 
May bids nearly $300,000 higher 
than the Lewes estimates. 

J. J. Nugent Company, of 
Northfiled, N. J., was lowest 

of seven bidders for the Cape 

May work at $696,420.00. Con- 
sulting engineers estimated thig 

(Continued on Page 8) 

Democrats to Hear : 
Maurice Hartnett 

Maurice Hartnett, director of 
the Legislative Reference Bureau, 

of Dover, will address the Ninth 

District Democratic Women’s 

Club at 6:30 p.m. at a covered 

dish supper Wednesday in the 

restaurant at Delaware State 
Fairgrounds. 

Adults are requested to bring a 

covered dish and 50c; children 
admitted free. Tickets are avail- 

able at the door or from Mrs. 

Roland Hitchens. 

Mrs. George Bodine Sr. 

Mrs. Anne Bodine, 86, wife of 

George Bodine, Sr., died Sat- 

urday at her home in Milford. 
In addition to her husband, 

she is survived by two sons, 

George Jr., and Charles, both 

of Milford; two daughters, Mrs. 

May Faulkner of Dover and 

Miss Anne Bodine of Milford, 

and a grandson. 

Services were held Tuesday at Ee 

the Berry Funeral Home at Mil- 

ford. 

    

Price who 

had voted to borrow money to fe 

public hearing at 7:30 p.m., March 

southbound lane of U. S. 13 across 

the lots from him to erect a stand. 

Voted to employ a part-time 

sion, had visited Harrington but 
had not seen any dogs running 
lose. Mann said the warden would 

construction work at Cape May | 

paving, 
areas, 

work at $684,000.00, according  
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Houston 
Sunday School at 10 a.m., Rob-| 

ert H. Yerkes, Sr., general su- | 

| perintendent; Alvin O. Brown, | 

| supt. of the Junior Department. 

Worship Service begins at 11 

a.m. with the prelude, Mrs. Agnes 

Mrs. Robert I. Moore 
  

Hughes - Moore 
The marriage of Miss Jane 

Lynn Hughes, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Benjamin Hughes, Jr. 
of Harrington, to Mr. Robert Ir- 

vin Moore, son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Lester S. Moore, of Harrington, 

took place Saturday evening, Feb. 

8, in the Asbury Methodist 

Church. : 

The 7 p.m. candlelight cere- 

mony was performed by the Rev. 

Olin Shockley. The church was 

decorated with palms and white 

chrysanthemums. A reception fol- 

lowed at the Collins Hall. 

Given in marriage by her fa- 

ther, the bride wore a gown of 

white satin velvet fashioned with 

a skirt of released dart pleats and 

a fitted bodice, scoop neckline, 

long sleeves tapering to a point, 

and a circular chapel train. Her 

finger tip-length silk illusion veil 

was held by a white satin pillbox 

hat accented with rosettes. She 

carried a cascade of white roses 

and orchids. 

Miss Barbara Hurley, of De- 

troit, Mich., was maid of honor. 

Bridesmaids were Miss Barbara 

Bitting, of Oreland, Pa., and Miss 

Linda ‘Brenner, of Cambridge, 

Md. The attendants were gown- 

ed alike in candy pink velveteen 

street length dresses, white fur 

pillbox hats, and carrid white fur 

muffs with pink roses attached. 

Cynthia Lee Hughes, sister of the 

bride, acted as flower girl. She 

wore a white satin velvet dress, 

white fur pillbox hat, and carried 

a white fur muff adorned with 

pink rosebuds. 
Mr. William Parker, of Har- 

rington, served as best man. Ush- 

ers included William Wells and 

David Wells, both of Milton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Moore will make 

their home in Harrington. The 

bride is a senior at the University 

of Delaware. Mr. Moore is now 

employed by the DuPont Com- 

pany. 

Baptist Church 
News 
Sunday, Sunday 9:45 am. 

school. A class for every age. Wil- 
liam Pritchett, Sunday School 

supt. 11 a.m. Morning worship. 

~The Rev. Halliburton’s message 

will be entitled “The Judgment 

Seat of Christ”. Youth Choir will 

sing a special number. 

6:30 p.m. Training union. Muriel 

Rifenburg, training union direc- 

tor. Study continuing from the 

Book of James. Pastor’s message 

will be “Strife in the Church” 

Monday, 7:30 p.m. Church 
Council meeting. Wendesday, 7:30 

“Hour of Power”. 
Bible study and prayer and 

business meeting. 

8:30 p.m. Adult Choir practice. 

Fri.,, March 13, 8 p.m. brother- 

“hood planning committee will 
meet at the church. Each member 

of the brotherhood is urged to at- 

tend. Pre-revival prayer meetings 

will be planned. 
Last Sunday our Sunday 

School took a decline with 82 

present compared with 88 the 

previous week. 

Our morning worship service 

also was on the decrease with 78 

present compared wth 91 the pre- 

vious week. The pastor’s message 
was entitled “When Jesus Re- 

turns in the Air”. The Adult 

Choir sang “What If It Were 

Today.” 
Our evening worship service 

brought together 62. This indeed 

was an increase over the previous 

Sunday of 49. Mrs. Taylor played 
and sang 

the “Gospel Melody.” Our pastor 
her accordion for us 

brought the message “The Re- 

sponsibility of Teachers.” 
  

SHOP AND SWAP 
IN THE WANT ADS 

10f Local Titerest 
Miss Nancy Taylor, of Madison 

College, Harrisonburg, Va., spent 

the weekend with her parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Edward Taylor. 

A group of local women mo- 

tored to the Colt Bowling Lanes 

Wednesday, had lunch and en- 

joyed an afternoon of bowling. 

A covered dish supper was 

held at Trinity church last Wed- 

nesday, Feb. 26 at 4 o'clock by 

the Harrington Ministerial Asso- 

ciation at which time all minis- 

ters of the community and their 

families, 30 in number, were pre- 

sent to welcome the Rev. William 

Halliburton, his wife and chil- 

dren. The Rev. Halliburton is 

minister in charge of the Baptist 

Church on Fleming Street. 
Mr. and Mrs. William Krame- 

das attended an engagement par- 

ty for Miss Ann Volen, of Wil- 

mington. They also attended a 

birthday party for Mrs. George 

Case, also of Wilmington, last 

weekend. 
Norma Frost celebrated her 

15th birthday Friday, Feb. 28. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Burgess 

and son visited Mrs. Sylvia Wil- 

ley, of Greenwood, Monday eve- 

ning. 
Mr. and Mrs. Riley Melvin and 

Lyman Rash spent Saturday af- 

ternoon in Langhorne, Pa. 

Many Harrington people attend- 

ed the 3rd Delaware Independent 

Tournament Wrestling meet held 

at St. Andrews, Middletown, on 

Friday and Saturday. Louis Star- 

key and Jim Cain won champion- 

ships. 
Elwood Shultie and Miss Grace 

Wanda Quillen are patients in the 

Milford Hospital. " 

Billy Dill celebrated his 16th 

birthday party Saturday with a 

party held in the Century Club. 

Lester Minner Jr. left Wednes- 

day of last week for basic train- 

ing at Great Lakes, Ill. 

Mrs. James Kelley, of Phillips- 

burg, N. J. spent several days 

with her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 

Harold McDonald and daughter. 

Mrs. Alice Hudson, of Toronto, 

Canada, is spending the winter 

with her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 

Walter Winkler and sons. 

Bob Quillen and Ronny Ban- 

croft spent the weekend in Bal- 

timore. 

Mr. and Mrs. Theodore Har- 

rington returned home Saturday 

from a two weeks stay in Ft. 

Lauderdale, Fla. 

Mrs. Earl Sylvester entertained 

a number of friends at her home 

Saturday afternoon at dessert and 

bridge. 

Robert Gillette, of the U.S. 

Navy, stationed at Portsmouth, 

Va., spent the weekend with his 

grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Oscar 

Gillette. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Jones 

have returned recently from a 

tour of southern Florida. 

Mrs. Blanche Mitchell enter- 

tained several friends from 

church Thursday evening in hon- 
or of the 15th wedding anniver- 

sary of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 

Brown. An anniversary poem was 

recited by Carlton Goodhand and 

a prayer was offered by the Rev. 

William Miller, followed by re- 
freshments. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Welch Sr. 

spent Sunday afternoon with Mr. 

and Mrs. Dunworth Welch and 

family in Burrsville and Sunday 

evening visited Mr. and Mrs. Lou- 

is Welch in Felton. 

Mr. and Mrs. LeRoy Wheeler 

and children attended a house 

warming for his brother and wife, 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Carter, 

    

  

warming, at which 36 persons at- 

tended, was given by Mrs. Norma 

Marvel, Mrs. Pauline Carter and 

Mrs. Leah Wheeler. 
  

Shop and Swap—In the Want Ads   of Wyoming, Sunday. The house 

| Webb at the organ. Call to wor- 

lip by the pastor, the Rev. H. 

Norman Nicklas, who will talk 

to the children’s group and de- 

liver the gospel message. The 

Senior and Chancel choirs will 

sing special numbers. 
The Adult Fellowship Society 

will hold its regular monthly din- 

ner meeting Saturday evening, 

March 7, beginning at 6:30 in the 

    
| Fire Hall. 

The church received a gift of 

money Sunday morning in mem- 

ory of J. Benton Counselman 

from the family. 
Sunday morning after the wor- 

ship service a reception and social 

hour was given in honor of Mrs. 

Elizabeth J. Coulbourne for her 

long service as organist of the 

Sunday School and her faithful- 

ness to her church. She was pre- 

sented with a beautiful gift, a 

necklace and ear-rings. 

The W.S.C.S. will hold its regu- 

lar meeting on Thursday night, 

March 12 in the Fellowship Hall 

beginning at 8 p.m. Hostesses for 

the occasion are, Mrs. James Hall, 

Mrs. Edwin Prettyman and Miss 

Myrtle Deford. 

A membership meeting will be 

held Sunday morning, March 16, 

immediately following the wor- 

ship hour for the purpose of 

electing three trustees. 
The P.T.A. auction held on 

Friday night was quite a success 

despite the inclement weather and 

the failure of the electric lights 

to function. A sum of $340 was 

realized, with more to be sent in. 

John P. Lemmon Jr. is a pa- 

tient in Wilmington Memorial 

Hospital receiving treatment. 

Mrs. Robert Snyder returned 

to her home Saturday from Mil- 

ford Memorial Hospital after un- 
dergoing minor surgery last week. 

Mrs. Eva Wilson’s condition is 

improving with the exception of 

her eyesight is going bad. 

Mrs. Minnie Armour is fine but 

her limb is painful and causes 

quite a bit of trouble. 

Mrs. Pearl Messick is much bet- 

ter after being quite ill last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Laird and 

family and mother, Mrs. Gladys 

Laird, of Philadelphia, spent Sun- 

day with Mr. and Mrs. Walter 

Studte Sr. 

Mrs. Helen Gilbert and Mrs. 

Gene Morgan, of Stamford, Conn., 

spent the weekend with Mrs. 

Anna T. Hawkins. 
Mrs. John Lemmon and Mr. 

and Mrs. Maurice Blessing visited 

John P. Lemmon at the Wilming- 

ton Memorial Hospital Sunday. 

Mrs. Hulda Mulholland , of 

Milford, was the Sunday guest 

of Mrs. Minnie Armour and on 

Saturday afternoon, Mrs. Helen 

Gilbert, of Stamford, Conn. 

visited Mrs. Armour. 

Mr. and Mrs. Francis Simpson 

spent Sunday with their son and 

daughter-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. 

Wayne Simpson, of near Newark. 

Other guests of the Simpsons 

were Mr. and Mrs. James Richard- 

son and son and Mrs. Edna Wall- 

ason, of Camden. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. Emory Webb 

visited the Jack D. Kennedys on 

Old Porter near Bear. 

David and Carl, sons of Mr. 

and Mrs. Robert Snyder, spent 

last week with Mr. and Mrs. 

James Whaley, at Red Lion, while 

their mother was in the hospital. 

Miss Annalee Thistlewood was 

the Sunday and overnight guest 

| of Miss Frances Welsh, in Mil- 

ford. 
  

Greenwood 
Our cafeteria menu for March 

9 to 13: Monday: milk, pizza 

burger, buttered lima beans, cole 

slaw, fresh fruit or fruit cup; 

Tuesday: milk, tomato soup, ham 

and lettuce on seeded roll, assort- 

ed relishes, applesauce, fruit or 

cup cake; Wednesday: milk, beef 

pie with crust, mashed potatoes 

and gravy, butter kale, hot bis- 

cuit and butter, fruit or cookie; 

Thursday: milk, chicken and 

dumplings, buttered potatoes, 

buttered peas, bread and butter, 

fresh fruit or applesauce; Friday: 

milk, crab cake or chicken cro- 

quette, scalloped potatoes, but- 

tered stringbeans, corn bread and 

butter, fresh fruit or peaches. 

The Greenwood Home Econo- 

mics Extension Club will meet at 

the home of Mrs. Nelson Mere- 

dith Tuesday evening, March 10. 

Miss Frances Shoffner will be 

present. 

Saturday luncheon guests of 

Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Meredith 

were Mrs. Violet Bringhurst, of 

Viola, and Mr. and Mrs. Earl 

Meredith, of Jersey Shore, Pa. 

Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Meredith 

and Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Mere- 

dith joined Mr. and Mrs. Earl 

Meredith, of Jersey Shore, Pa, 

and Mr. and Mrs. Ward Meredith, 

of Wyoming, for Sunday dinner 

with Mrs. Violet Bringhurst, of 

Viola. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Conaway 

have returned home from a va- 

cation in Florida. 

Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 

and Mrs. John Mariner and fami- 

ly were Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 

Rutter and children, of Stockton, 
Md. 

Mrs. Louise Pittman was a 

Thursday caller at the home of 

Mrs. A. Fay Grassmeyer and Mrs. 

Jacob Hatfield. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Jones en- 

joyed a recent Saturday evening 

which included dining at the Din- 

ner Bell Inn in Dover with Mr. 

and Mrs. Robert Hochstedler of 
Lewes and Mr. and Mrs. Ray- 

mond McCready, of Harrington. 

The group returned to the Mec- 

Creadys for the rest of the eve- 

ning. 

News from the Mennonite 

Church bulletin: Remember the 

revivals at Laws Church, Brother 

Norman Bechtel, of Springs, Pa., 

will serve each evening through 

March 8. The services begin at 

7:45. 

We are grateful to again have 

Brother Lee Yoder and Edna 

Schlabach to worship with us. 

We welcome Sylvia Mast, who 

is now living in our community, 

to join our church fellowship. 

We rejoice with our friends, 

Carol and Earl Swartzentruber, of 

Kentucky, who welcomed Robert 

Gene into their home, Feb. 2. 

Ruby and Harold Esbenshade, of 

Pennsylvania, were blessed with 

a 7 1b. 14 oz. son, Feb. 18. 

Felton Church of 
God News 

Fri., March 6, teenage banquet. 

Guest speakers, the Rev. Garland 

Stout, the Rev. Ruth Morris. 

Sunday, 10 a.m. Sunday School, 

classes for all ages. 11 a.m. Morn- 

ing worship. 7:30 p.m. Evangelis- 

tic service. 
Wednesday, 7:30 p.m. Prayer 

and praise service. 
Old fashioned revival, preach- 

ing and singing March 16-22. 

    Evanglist, the Rev. Ruth Morris. 
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Hickman 
The Rev. Lathan, a retired 

minister was the speaker at the 

Union Church and other church- 

es on the charge Sunday morning 

in the absence of our pastor, the 

Rev. Blair, who, accompanied by 

Mrs. Blair, left early Sunday 

morning to visit an uncle, a Meth- 

odist minister in Virginia, of Mrs. 

Blair’s, at the Medical Center in 

Richmond. 

Morning worship at 

Church Sunday morning at 10 

a.m., the Rev. G. Bryan Blair, 

pastor.” Church school 11 am, 

Robert Collins, supt. 

Wesley Church School 10 a.m., 

Norman Outten, supt. Worship 

service 11 a.m., the Rev Bryan 

Blair, pastor. 

Quarterly conference will be 

held in Union Church Sunday 

evening. Following worship serv- 

ice and. preaching by our district 

supt. the Rev. Howard Amose. 

Several of our church folk on 

the charges are on the sick list. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Scott, Kenny 

and Rita Ann were Sunday din- 

ned guests of the latter’s parents, 

Mr. and Mrs. Dallas Neal, of rural 

Denton. 

Mr .and Mrs. Jesse Fearins 

were Thursday evening guests of 

their son and family, Mr. and 

Mrs. Alvin Fearins, of Williston. 

Ira Bragg spent the weekend 

with Wade Isner. 

Miss Rita Ann and Kenny Scott 

were Sunday evening callers of 

ther grandmother, Mrs. Leslie 

Scott. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Bragg, 

Mary, Anna, Charlie, Tommy, 

David and Clyde Ira, spent the 

weekend with Mr. and Mrs. Or- 

ville Bragg, of Glen Burnie. 

Mrs. Wade Isner spent the 

weekend with her daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 

Smith, of Baltimore. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Torbert were 
Thursday evening guests of their 

son and family, Mr. and Mrs. 

Louis Torbert, of Laurel. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Fearins 

spent Saturday evening with Mrs. 

Isaac Noble. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Larimore, of 

Denton, were Sunday dinner 

guests of Mr. and Mrs. Jesse 
Fearins. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Porter, 

and Joyce were Wednesday eve- 

ning guests of the former’s par- 

ents, Mr. and Mrs. Joshua Porter, 

of rural Denton. 

Union | 

Andrewville 

| Tighman Outten, supt. 

| bert Cannon and Mrs. Fred Walls 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Charley 

Collison last week. 

Mrs. Emma Ryan, Mrs. Eliza- 

beth Wilson, of Harrington, visit- 

ed Mrs. Ryan’s cousin, Mrs. Ma- 

C., over the weekend. 

Congratulations to Mr . and 

Sunday. 

The community extends their 

Mrs. Jane Vincent. The sympathy 

brother, Leland Draper, 

passed away Saturday. 

Charley Cannon has been on 

the sick list. Mrs. Barbara Sauls- 

bury is much improved at this 

writing. 

Walter Outten visited his par- 

ents, Mr. and Mrs. Tilghman Out- 

ten, over the weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Taylor cele- 

brated their 50th wedding anni- 

versary at Farmington fire house 

Saturday evening. Their daugh- 

ter, Mrs. Matilda Cartright, of 

Dover, had charge of the program. 

The 4-H Club of Cool Spring 

played several selections. The 

leader, Mrs. Hudson, was in 

charge of the group. Mr. and Mrs. 

Taylor have three children, Har- 

lan, Matilda, and Louise, and 

three grandchildren. 

  

  

MARY CARTER 
PAINTS 

Every Second Galion Free 

Special Prices on Quarts 

Paint & Supplies 
For All Purposes 

Mary Carter 
Paint Store 

315 W. Loockerman Street     Dover, Del. 

    
  

  

  

Farm Home 

Using the Most Modern 

S. Washington 
Milford, Delaware   

TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE 

ATLANTIC CONCRETE AND 

ASPHALT CO. 
Asphalt Driveways & Parking Areas 

Constructed 

CALL US FOR ESTIMATE 

and Industry 

Methods and Equipment 

St. & Railroad 

Phone 422-5164   
  

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Nelson|be Mr. and Mrs. Fred B. Greenly, 

were supper guests of Mr. and |Jr. 

| Sunday School at 9:30 o'clock, | Mrs. Alton Breeding and mother,| ANNOUNCEMENTS— 

| Thursday evening. Mrs. 

| Mrs. Maurice Wright, Mrs. Hu- | also visited Mrs. Lizzie Butler] 
in the afternoon. 

Nelson March 10—The choir Tues., 

mother’s auxiliary will meet at 

|8 p.m. at the home of Mrs. Ful- 
  ton Downing with Mrs. 

Asburv Methodist to serving as co-hosteass. 
Wed., March 11—Bible study at 

Earle 

Church Notes 
10 a.m. Church School. Classes 

rion Shebert, of Washington, D.| for all ages. Howard S. Wagner, 
superintendent. 

| 

| 10 a.m. 

Quarterly Conference at 7:30 

p.m. presided over by the Rev. 

Mr. Hartwell Chandler, our new 

| District ~~ Superintendent. All 

  

11 a.m. Morning worship serv-| members of the church are eli- 
Mrs. Harold Calvert on the ar- ice conducted by Guy Wine- 

rival of a new daughter, born at' prenner, the church lay leader. 
the Milford Memorial Hospital | The sermon will be given by 

Kenneth E. Shinn. Anthems will | 

[be sung by the Crusader and Ca- 

sympathy to the family of Mr. thedral choirs. Nursery will be 
George Vincent and family of the available 

death of his wife and mother, dren. 

for pre-school chil- 

7:30 p.m. The Lenton Cantata 

goes to Miss Grace Draper and|will be held at St. Stephen’s 
brother on the death of their | Episcopal Church with the choirs 

who! of Asbury, Trinity and St. Ste- 
phen’s cooperating. 

Altar flowers this week will be 
  ‘presented by Mr. 

Charles Greenhaugh in memory | 
of father. 

and Mrs. 

gible to vote in the Quarterly 

Conference. 

Thurs., March 12—All choirs re- 

hearsing at their regular appoint- 

ed times. 
  

Leland Draper 

Leland Draper, 49, died Satur- 

day at the home of a sister, Miss 

Grace Draper, Farmington. 

A life resident of the Farm- 

ington area, Mr. Draper also is 

survived by a brother, Woodrow 

Draper of Greenwood. 

Services were held Tuesday 

| afternoon at the Fleischauer Fu- 

  
Friendly greeters this week will | neral Home, Greenwood. 
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HOOTE 
at HARRINGTON HIGH SCHOOL 

April 3 and 4 

Sponsored by 

THE FUTURE 

It Will Be 

SCHOOL PARKING LOT 

Grand Prize $25 Each Night 

Anyone wishing to enter can do so by writing 

THE FUTURE 

Harrington 

THERE WILL BE 
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NURSES CLUB 

High School 

A $2 ENTRY FEE 
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   bills later. 

i | ; 
i Texaco Service Center 
- : JACK PITLICK 
" Phone 398-8482 
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Get top performance now, avoid costly repairs later 

Poor gas mileage? Rough idle? 
Using oil? If you're not getting 
‘new car’ performance, come in 
now and we’ll give your car a 
complete checkup, absolutely free, 
on our new Dyna-Vision elec- 
tronic analyzer. Our trained 
mechanic will quickly locate the 
source of trouble—he actually sees 

test takes only about 15 minutes. 
Do it today—avoid big repair 

ENGINE 
ANALYSIS 
with your next 
grease and oil change 

on a TV-type screen. The whole 

Harrirgton, Del warez 
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  Passing, cornering, threading through 

traffic, sudden stops—Chevelle excels 

all around! Chevrolet’s new surprise 

package has what it takes to meet any 

driving challenge: Six or V8 engines, 

hefty brakes, Full Coil suspension—and 

atrim size that makes the most of them! 

Chevelle means performance 
aplenty —standard 120-hp Six or 
195-hp V8—and optional at 
extra cost, a 155-hp Six, a 220- 
hp V8, a new 327-cu.-in. V8! But 
Chevelle’s performance means 
more. Chevelle’s a foot shorter 
than the big cars. And the space 

Chevelle lets you choose Power- 
glide*, 4-speed manual* or 
3-speed manual transmission. 
Knowing how people like the 
custom touch, we wrote out a 
long list of extra-cost options. 

Knowing all this, what's keep- 
fng you from a test drive? 

Chevelle saves in size comes off Certainly not 
the ends, not the middle. So it your Chev- 
rides like you want a car to ride. rolet dealer! 

90 ptional at extra cost 

THE GREAT HIGHWAY PERFORMERS Chevrolet « Chevelle » Chevy II » Corvalr » Corvette 
See them at your Chevrolet Showroom 
  RTE 

HARRINGTON MOTOR CO. 
HARRINGTON, DEL. Phone 398-3201 
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Felion 
The subject of the Rev. Donald 

Washburn’s Sunday morning mes- 

sage was, “All of My Time Be- 

longs to God.” Cathy Adams 

sang the solo part of the Senior 

Choir anthem, “Make Me A Bless- 

ing.” The Junior Choir sang, 

“Six Days Our Father Gives Us.” 

The Sunday morning friendly 

greeters were Mrs. Pearl Delong 

and Mrs. George Harrington. 

March 2 was District officers 

visitation day at the Woman’s So- 

ciety of Christian Service of the 

Felton Methodist Church. A call 

to worship was lead by Mrs. Don- 

ald Washburn, worship leader of 

the afternoon. Mrs. Bess Harga- 

dine was in charge of the pro- 

gram. The theme of the program 

was “Easter—The Cross and the 

Resurrection.” Readings were 

given by Mrs. Hargadine, Mrs. 

William M. Hammond and Mrs. 

Russell Torbert. The program 

ended with a recording of the 

Hallelujah chorus. Mrs . James 

Cahall presided at a short busi- 

ness meeting and welcomed the 

visitors, Mrs. William Holden, 

leader of Zone 3 and Mrs. Hubert 

Jicha, district leader of promo- 

tion secretaries. Both Mrs. Hol- 

den and Mrs. Jicha spoke briefly 

of their work. A tea followed the 

program. The hostesses for the 

afternoon were, Mrs. Gordon Ma- 

ris, chairman, Mrs. Leland Price, 

Mrs. Grace Turner, Mrs. Donald 

Washburn and Mrs. Bess Harga- 

dine. 

The Methodist Youth Fellow- 

ship met Monday evening. The 

subject for the evening was, “Ju- 

daism and Christianity.” The fel- 

lowship is studying the different 

religions of the world. 

The Sarah Rebekah Lodge will 

hold a card party tomorrow, 

March 7 at the Odd Fellows Hall 

at 8 p.m. There will be prizes and 

refreshments. Mrs. W. B. Macklin 

is in charge of the party. 

The Willing Workers Class met 

for their regular covered-dish 

supper and meeting Feb. 26. The 

hostesses for the evening were 

Mrs. Larry Renner, Mrs. L. J. 

Kates and Mrs. John Dill. Lynn 

Torbert, president, presided at 

the meeting which was opened 

with a prayer by the Rev. Larry 

Renner and a Bible reading by 

T. L. Kates. The class voted to 

have an apron booth at the Street 

Fair to be held Sat., June 27. 

Mrs. George Harrington will be 

the chairman assisted by Mrs. 
William D. Hammond. Happy 

Birthday was sung to members 

having birthdays in February. Mr. 

and Mrs. Herman Woikoski and 

daughter, Shirley, were welcom- 

ed into the membership of the 

class. The March 25th hostesses 

will be Mrs. Donald Washburn, 

Mrs. Paul Woikoski Jr. and Mrs. 

Walter Moore. 

The Felton Community Fire 

Company will hold their semi-an- 

nual fried oyster, chicken salad 

and dumpling dinner at the fire 

house, Saturday, March 14, start- 

ing at 2 p.m. Suppers may be tak- 

en out. The auxiliary of the Fire 

Company will have an apron and 

miscellaneous table. 

Februray 19, James Blades and 

son, Jimmy, Lynn Torbert and 

William D. Hammond with Dor- 

sey Hammond, of Newark, at- 

tended the Drexel-University of 
Delaware basketball game at 
Newark. Mrs. Hammond and Mrs. 

Torbert spent the evening with 

Mrs. Dorsey Hammond. 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Melvin, 

of Baldwin, Long Island, N. Y,, 

spent last weekend with his moth- 

er, Mrs. Ella Melvin. 

Mrs. Orella Wilson and Mrs. 

Layton Farrow were recent 

guests of Mrs. Wilson’s grand- 

daughter, Mrs. Gladys Ann Lang- 

shaw and son, Jay, of Denton. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Dill were 

Tuesday evening dinner guests of 

their son-in-law and daughter, 

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Parsons, in 

Seaford. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Pizzadili 

have returned from a trip through 

the Smoky Mountains in Ten- 

nessee. : 
Mrs. Annabel Morrow and Mrs. 

Emma Wiltbank, of Rehoboth 

Beach, were Wednesday luncheon 

guests of Mrs. Paul Chase. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leland Price have 

returned from a three weeks va- 

cation in Florida. 

Harry Carlisle Jr., of Salisbury, 

visited his parents and family, 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Carlisle Sr., 

Marie, Pat and Gene, Saturday. 

Mrs. Lynn Torbert and Mr. and 

Mrs. Walter Moore spent last 

Tuesday in Wilmington. 

Clarence Bradley, who has been 

a patient in the Kent General 

Hospital, Dover, has returned 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Taylor, 
of Washington, D. C., spent the 
weekend at his mother’s home, 
here. 

James Pizzadili is a patient in 

the Kent General Hospital, Dover. 

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Torbert 

were last Sunday dinner guests at 
the DuPont Country Club of Mr. 

and Mrs. Claude Davidson, of 

Wilmington. 

Mrs. Lillian Cubbage, of New- 

ark, spent last week with Mr. and 

Mrs. Wililiam M. Hammond. 

Mrs. Lewis Taylor, Mrs. Arthur 

Jones and Mrs. Orella Wilson 

visited Arthur Jones at the Wel- 
fare Home, Smyrna, on Wednes- 

ou day. 

| Poore. Mrs. Reed is director of the 

| Donald Brittingham and Thom- 

as Flannagan, of Springfield, Mo., 

spent the weekend with the for- 

mer’s mother, Mrs. Mystle Brit- 

tingham. Both boys are stationed 

in the Navy at Bainbridge, Md. 

Patty Warren entertained 41 

guests at her 17th birthday party 

at the V.F.W. home Saturday 

evening. 
Sunday dinner guests of Mrs. 

Orella Wilson were Mrs. Carolyn 

Wilson and daughters, Joan and 

Pam, of Wyoming. 

Mrs. Grace Turner is a patient 

in the Milford Memorial Hospital, 

Milford. 

Wade Shaub spent four days in 

Wilmington with his daughter, 

Mrs. Howard Wood and Mr. 

Wood. He also visited his sisters, 

Miss Edna Shaub and Mrs. H. J. 

Wheeler and his brothers, H. G. 

Shaub and Charles W. Shaub. Mr. 

Shaub observed his 73rd birthday 

Feb. 28. ; 
Mrs. Howard Henry returned 

home Saturday after being 

the Memorial Hospital, Wilming- 

ton, more than two weeks. 

Mr. and Mrs. William D. Ham- 

mond were Sunday visitors of 

Mrs. Walter Cole, Goldsboro, Md.; 

Mr. and Mrs. James Hall and 

family, of Churchill, Md., and Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Harris and 

Mrs. Anne Sharp returned 

home Sunday after spending 

three weeks in Wilmington with 

sister and niece, Mrs. Bertha 

Heim, Mrs. Marie Russell and 

children. Mrs. Sharp also visited 

was a Monday visitor of his aunt 
‘Mrs. James Cahall. 

Bobby Donaway, student at the 

University of Delaware, Newark, 

spent the weekend with his par- 

‘way. 

St. Stephen's 
Episcopal Church 
News 
Tonight, FRIDAY— 

7 p.m. Physical fitness 

weight lifting at Armory. 

9 p.m. Participation in Church 

League Bowling. 

SATURDAY— 

10 am. Youth Confirmation 
Class. 

SUNDAY— 

8 a.m. Holy Communion. 

9:30 a.m. Church School. 

11 a.m. Mornng prayer, baptism 

and sermon. ! 
12:15 p.m. Coffee hour. 

7:30 p.m. Lenten Musicale Can- 

tata at St. Stephen’s. 

MONDAY— 

and 

3:30 p.m. Catechism. 

7 p.m. Physical fitness 

weight lifting at armory. 

7:30 p.m. Inquirers’ Class 

home of George Von Goerres. 

7:30 p.m. Junior Altar Guild. 
WEDNESDAY — 

3:30 p.m. Girl Scouts. 

7:30 p.m. Healing service. 

8:30 p.m. Lenten Bible study. 
THURSDAY— 

7 p.m. Youth Choir. 

7:45 pm. Youth and 

choirs combined. 

8:15 p.m. Adult Choir. 

It is a pleasure for St. Stephen’s 

to be the host church, as Asbury, 

Trinity and St. Stephen’s join to- 

gether in giving a Lenten Musi- | 

cale Cantata this coming Sunday 

evening, March 8, at 7:30 p.m. The 

Cantata is under the direction of 

Melvin Brobst, director of music 

of the Harrington High School. It 

is entitled “The Last Words of 

Jesus” by Rob Roy Peery. 

This is a fitting observance of 

the Lenten season and people of 

all the churches are invited to 

attend. There will also be a social 

refreshment time in the Parish 

Hall immediately following the 

cantata, to which everyone is in- 
vited. 

This Sunday morning at the 11 

o’clock service of Divine Worship, 

little Douglas Poore, the son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Poore, of this 

church, will receive the sacrament 
of baptism. Little Doug is also the 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Clar- 

ence Reed, of this church and the 
baby brother of little Karen Sue 

and 

at 

adult 

two and three-year-old Sunday 
School Class. 

This coming Sunday is desig- 
nated as Arrowhead Sunday. All 
youth and children who plan to 
attend Camp Arrowhead this 
coming summer are urged to get 
their applications at Church 
School or during coffee hour this 
coming Sunday as it is important 
that the applicatons be returned 
to the Diocese as soon as possible. 
Camp Arrowhead is one of the 
most popular camps anywhere in 
this part of the country and there 
will be plenty of competition in 
gaining admission for the coming 
summer However Delaware Epis- 
copalians do have priority if they 
get their applications in early. 

Felton P.-T.A. 
Notes 

The next meeting of the Fel- 

ton PTA will be held in the 

school auditorium Monday, March 

9th at 8 p.m. There will be a safe- 

ty program by the Delaware State 

Police. Parents may visit the 

teachers in the classrooms from 

  

in | 

family, of Henderson, Md. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Kolb. { 

Howard Parker, of Harrington, | 

» Bruce Collins, 

ents, Mr. and Mrs. Robert Dona- | 

10 a.m. Harrington ministerium. | Blair’s uncle, who is a patient at 

| dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. 

Burrsville 
Wesley Methodist Church-Sun- 

day School 10 o'clock, Norman 

Outten, supt. 
Union Methodist Church—Mor- 

ning worship service, 10 o’clock, 

|the Rev. G. Bryan Blair. Sunday 

| School 11 o’clock, Robert Collins, 

supt. Classes for all ages. 

M.Y.F. meets at 6:30 p.m. 

A worship service will be held 

Sunday evening, March 8, at 7:30 

p.m. at Union Church, followed 

by the Fourth Quarterly Con- 

ference for the Burrsville charge 

in which Dr. Amoss, district su- 

perintendent, will be present. 

Miss Sara Thawley, of Balti- 

more spent the weekend with her 

mother and family, Mrs. Housten 

Thawley. 

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin James, of 

Milford, visited Mrs. R. H. Staf- 

ford, Sunday evening. Mrs. Staf- 

| ford has been confined to her 

i home during the past week. 

Mr. and Mrs. James H. Lari- 

more and Mr. and Mrs. James 

Thawley, of Milford, have return- 

led home after spending ten days 

| vacationing in Florida. 

I Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bradley 

and son visited her brother and 

family, Mr. and Mrs. Melvin 

Brown and children, of Dover, 

Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Davis and 

son, Wally, of Ruthsburg, and 

i Mrs. James Reed, Alan, and Janet, 

of rural Greenwood, visited their 

| parents, Mr. and Mrs. Russell 

Stevens, Sunday. 

Those on the sick list in our 

community this past week are 

Robert Collins, 

Mrs. R. H. Stafford and Hyland 

Webb. 

Mrs. Edwin Hopkins returned 

home Saturday after spending ten 
days with her daughter and fami- 

ly in Fayetteville, N. C. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Torbert 

of Hickman visited Mr. and Mrs. 

Barton Torbert and family, Sun- 

day afternoon. 

Ronnie Collison had the mis- 

fortune to fall last week and 
sprain his wrist. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bradley 

and son attended the fiftieth wed- 

ding anniversary party given in 

"honor of Mr. and Mrs. Frank Tay- 

lor, of near Andrewville, last 

Saturday evening at the Farming- 

ton Fire Hall. 

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Blades, of 

Harrington, visited Mr. and Mrs. 

Harlan Blades, Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Stafford 

and Elma Jean, of Denton, visited 

Mr. and Mrs. Roland Draper and 

family, Sunday afternoon. 

The Rev. and Mrs. G. Bryan 

Blair spent Sunday in Richmond, 

Va., where they visited Mrs. 

  

  
| 

  

  

  
the Medical Center there. 

Mrs. Housten Thawley, Miss 

Elizabeth Ann Thawley, Miss Sara 

Thawley and Donna Werner were 

Paul Butler and 

evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Colli- 

son, Darlene and Ronnie, Mrs. 

Edwin Baker, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 

Baker, of Lynwod, Pa.; Mrs. Gola 

Henderson, of Marcus Hook, and 

Mrs. Mary Sweetman, of Chester- 

town, were dinner guests of Mr. 

and Mrs. Carroll Williams, of 

Crumpton Sunday, the occasion 

being to celebrate Mrs. Collison’s 
birthday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mervin Usilton 

and daughter, of Denton, visited 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Usilton and 

family, Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bradley 

and son, visited Mr. and Mrs. Les- 

ter Tucker and family, of Har- 

rington, Sunday evening. 

sons, Sunday 

  

WE'RE PROUD OF 
OUR BUSINESS 

  

Harrington 

Lumber & 

Supply Co. 

Phone 398-3242 

  

‘WE'RE PROUD OF 
OUR PRODUCT 

WIRE TERT 

  

Premium Quality Atlantic 
Heating Oilistriple-refined 
joes to ignite instantly, burn 
clean and steady...to 
give you the most for your 
‘heating oll dollar. Call 
NOW. We provide prompt, 
automatic delivery service. 

Radio Dispatch 
Truck Service           7:30 p.m. to 8 p.m. 

  

visited Mr. and Mrs. Jonathan! 
Hopkins, of Harrington Sunday 

afternoon. 

Hobbs 
Sunday morning in the absence 

of our pastor, the Rev. G. Bryan! 

Blair, the Rev. Latham, a retired 

minister, filled the pulpit and 

delivered the sermon. The Rev. 

and Mrs. Blair visited a sick un- 

cle, a Methodist pastor, in 

Virginia. 

Next Sunday evening the Rev. 

Amoss, supt. of the Easton Dis- 

trict of the Peninsula annual con- 

ference will preach in Union 

Church, Burrsville, after which, 
Quarterly onference will be con- 

ducted. 

Miss Mary Robinson, West 

Chester, Pa., spent a recent week- 

end with her sister, Mrs. Red- 

mond Long and nieces, Mrs. Paul 

Stafford and Mrs. Frank Wil- 

loughby. . 

Mr. and Mrs. Francis H. Trice 

Jr., Sharon and Cynthy, visited 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Maloney Tues- 

day evening of last week. 

Clifford Towers visited his 

brother, Benson Towers, last Sun-! 

day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Harris and 

Theresa, of Cordova, visited Mr. 

and Mrs. Frank Willoughby re- 

cently. 

Mrs. Roland Towers and Mrs. T. 

H. Towers, motored to Laurel, 

last Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Willough- 

by, Dianne, Jimmy D., Jodey, 

Francis and Rebecca, were Sun- 

day dinner guests of Mr. and 

Mrs. Redmond Long. 

Mrs. W. G. Holbrook entertain- 

ed several friends last Saturday 

afternoon. ; 

Mrs. Mamie Willis visited Mr. 

and Mrs. Jimmy Corkell and fam- 

ily, last Sunday, Burrsville..: | 

Roland Statum observed : his 

birthday anniversary Sunday. 

Francis Fluharty observed his 

fourteenth birthday one day last 
week. 

Mrs. Frank Willoughby, a mem- 

ber, attended the Feb. meeting 

of the Double Hills Homemaker’s 

Club at the home of Mrs. William 

DeFord, Sr., Tuesday of last week. 

Mrs. Curtis Andrew, president, 

will entertain the ladies in March. 

Mrs. Elmer Butler has been on 

the sick list and under a physi- 

cian’s care.’ Mrs. Harvey Harris 

has also been ill. 

Mrs. ‘Paul Maloney called on 

Mr. and Mrs. L. H. Thomas last 
Friday. 

M.Y.F. counselors, Mrs. Francis | 

Trice Jr, and Mr. and Mrs. | 
Toinmy Ireland, accompanied by! 
their M.Y.F.’ers attended a bowl- 

ing party in Denton last Saturday 
evening. 

E. A. Pearson called on Mr. and 

Mrs. IL. H. Thomas, Monday after- 
noon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard J. Dukes 

  

  
  

  

  

Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Hopkins of Centreville, were Monday eve-) 
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs. L. H. 

Thomas. During the past weeks 

they had visited relatives in 

Florida, and Capt. and Mrs. Ber- 

nard H. Thomas and family, in 

Texas. 
  

Nazarene Church 

News 
9:45 a.m. Sunday School. “I 

Will Stand by Christ and His 

Church” contest. Marck 1-29. 

Graded lessons for graded classes. 

Robert H. Lord, Supt.; Mrs. Grace 
Hughes, supervisor. 

11 a.m. Morning worship. Child 

evangelism month. Our pastor 

will be bringing messages to the 

parents and children. 

5:45 p.m. Junior Fellowship. 

7 pm. N.Y.PS., Mrs. Grace 
Hughes, leader. 

7:30 p.m. Evangelistic service. 

Friday—a missionary rally’ at 

Seaford at 7:30 p.m. Douglas 
Alexander, speaker. 

Tuesday, skating party. 

Wednesday, 7:30 p.m. Mission- 

ary service. Election of officers. 

Choir practice following this ser- 

vice. 
  

Building Permits 
Kent County 

Wilds Building Corp., 2 houses 

at $25,000 each. 

Dover Coca-Cola Bottling Co., 

improvements, $10,000. 

Elwood K. Sellers, Wyoming, 

improvements, $1200. 

Alcott Development, Inc., Wil- 

mington, five houses at Cross- 

gates Development, $107,000. 

Villa Development, Dover, 11 

houses, $182,000. 2 

Villa Development, Dover, 12 

houses, $199,000. 

. James M. Calvert, Harrington, 
improvements, $1000. 

  

  

Trinity Methodist 
Church Notes 

Saturday: 2:30 p.m. Hat sale! 

sponsored by the intermediate 

choir. Everyone is welcome. 

Sunday: 10 a.m. Church school 

  

for all age groups. Lesson for 

adults: “The Man Born Blind.” 

Manlove Bradley, supt. of school. 

11 a.m. Worship service. Ser- 

mon: “The Secret of Survival”. 

Anthems by Senior and Junior 

choirs. “Why Hast Thou Forsaken 

Me”, Passion Chorale. A special 

offering will be received this 

morning in conjunction with all 

Protestant churches all over the 

world in “One Great Hour of 

Sharing”. Immediately following 

the worship service there will be 

a brief meeting of the Pastoral 

Relations Committee. Ushers this 

morning are: John Minner, Bailey 

Minner and William Outten. 

7:30 p.m. No evening Vespers 

at Trinity. There will be a special 

Lenten musical presented by the 

combined choirs of Trinity, As- 

bury, and St. Stephen’s Church 

on “The Seven Last Words of 

Christ” by Peery. Everyone in 

the community is welcome. : 

The pastor of Trinity Church 

will lead in worship over the 

Chapel Hour of WKSB this 

week. 

Tuesday: 8 p.m. Regular meet- 

ing of the O.U.R. Bible Class. 

3:30 p.m. Pastor’s Confirmation 

Class. 

‘Wednesday: 7 p.m. Lenten 

prayer in the chapel. 

Thursday: 6 p.m. Junior Choir 

rehearsal. 6:30 p.m. Youth Choir 

rehearsal. 8 p.m. Senior Choir 

rehearsal. . 

Friday: 9 p.m. Church league 

bowling in Milford. 
  

Farmington 
Our community was shocked by 

the death of Oscar Tatman, Le- 
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WATCH & JEWELRY REPAIRS 

Phone 398-3866 
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HARRINGTON JEWELERS : 
SILVER - CRYSTAL - CHINA : 
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Funeral Home 

50 Commerce Street 
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Harrington, Del. 

398-3228 
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WHILE YOU COLLECT 

  

Py 
5000 stamps with a 
  

DISHWASHER 
  

Look at that glass sparkle! 

GREEN 
STAMPS 

5000 stamps with a 
  

CLOTHES DRYER 
  

Beats the rain, wind and sun any day! 

You may buy your electric dishwasher or electric clothes dryer from 

any dealer, then take sales slip to our district office and colleet your 

stamps. Only requirement is that appliance be installed in a home 

on our lines. Offer good during February and March, 1964. 

ONY Delaware Power & Light Company 
INVESTOR.OWNED, ‘BUSINESS MANAGED 

Kent and Sussex Counties   
  

  

ammR— — 

land Draper and Mrs. George the junior and senior high school 
Vincent. Their families have the 

sympathy of their many friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jarvis, of Del- 

mar, and Mr. and Mrs. Milton 

Pratt, of Bridgeville, spent the 

evening with Mrs. Mildred Gray 

and Mr. and Mrs. William Mes- 
sick. 

Mrs. Lester Hatfield and daugh- 

ter were in Wilmington, Tuesday. 
Mrs. Mary Hatfield is on the 

sick list. 

St. Bernadette’s 

Church Notes 
Evening devotions will be held 

Friday at 8 and will consist in 

the Stations of the Cross and 

Benediction of the Most Blessed 

Sacrament. J 

Mass will be offered Saturday 

morning at 9 o’clock. 

Sunday will be Laetare or Re- 

joice Sunday and marks the mid- 

point of the Lenten season. Mass 

will be offered on Sunday morn- 

ing at 9:30. Confessions will be 

heard before the Mass. 

Confraternity classes of religion 

will be held Sunday evening at 

7 o'clock for all the students in 

  

classes. For all the younger chil- 

dren in the parish there will be 

classes on Thursday afternoon at 

3:30. 

Making the Way of the Cross is 

a devotion in honor of the Passion 

of our Lord. It consists in mov- 

ing from one to another of the 
fourteen crosses that hang on the 

yas of the church. While stand- 

ing in front of each of the crosses 

| prayers are said and a short medi- 

i tation is made on a particular in- 

cident of Christ's Passion. This 
custom began in the fifteenth cen- 

tury and has continued down to 

the present time. The original 

stations at Jerusalem, from which 
this practice derives, is often- 

times called the “Via Dolorosa”. 

  

Pre-School Exams 

‘March 19-20 

Pre-school examinations will 
be held at the West Harrington 
Elementary School on Wednes- 

day and Thursday, March 19 and 

20, from 9:00 .a, m. to 11:00 a. 

m. > 

Parents are requested to bring 

birth certificates of children to 
, enter school in September 1964. 

  
  

HARRINGTON Each 
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P. 0. Box 252 
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GOT PROBLEMS? 
OVER ALCOHOL? 

(Either Beginning or Advanced)? : 

There is an Alcoholics Anonymous Meeting in 

After 3:30 P.M. Any Day or Write 

TUESDAY EVENING 
398-3513 

Harrington, Del. 

  

LXXXX3 

Unloading 

856-2749 
Seaford, Del. 

XIX XXIXIIIXIIIXIXIXXXX 

WANTED 
CORN, Cob or Shelled 

SEAFORD FEED COMPANY 
CALL FOR LATEST PRICES 
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SECTION ONE, LITTLE & IVES 

WEBSTER DICTIONARY 
SECTION ONE, LITTLE & IVES 

Complete Book of Science 

With $5 Purchase or 
More and Coupon From 
Booklet You received in 
the mail. 

SAVE 50c 
Towards Purchase of a 4-Piece Place Setting of 

“SIERRA” PATTERN MELMAC 

DINNERWARE 
With Coupon From Your Acme Coupon Book 

One Break-Resistant, Old Fashioned 
RAB oe 

Fh der (4 ¢ ZA od 0 Fe Foi 8 

Yorth 6%9¢ 

With Redemption of Coupon From 
Your Acme Coupon Book  
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“THE STARDUSTERS”—A 
made its debut at the 16th 

  
new combo of local talent, 
birthday party of Bily D.I, 

: Saturday night at the Century Club. Supplying the groovey 

beat were (front left to right): Jimmy Simpler and Ron- 

nie Hughes on the electric guitars, Randy Knox on the 

~~ drums and Chuck McNally on the saxophone. 

  

In Radiological 
Monitoring 

The University of Delaware is 

now accepting applications for 
a Civil Defense course to train 

~~ men and women as instructors 
in radiological monitoring. The 

fiveweek course will begin April 

3 at the Agricultural Substa- 

tion, Georgetown. 
“The training for instructors 

is an intensive course,” said 
Arthur McDaniel, supervisor of 

continuing education at the Uni- 
versity, “but persons with a sci- 

ence background will find this a 

challenging and rewarding learn- 

ing experience.” 
Those who complete the tui- 

tion free, 30-hour course will 

make up a corps of monitor in- 

structors who in turn will be 

able to teach monitors in Kent 

and Sussex Counties. County 

Civil Defense directors stressed 

the need for trained instructors. 

Some 300 monitors will be 
needed in Sussex County alone, 

according to Lt. Col. Charles 
Bruner, county CD Director. 

~ Emory Lynch, CD director for 
Kent County, indicated the same 

i need. 
McDaniel said the radiological 

training for instructors course 
covers concepts of nuclear sci- 

oR 

  ence, radiological instruments,’ 

monitoring techniques, dose rate 

calculations, radiation protect- 
jon and related subjects. In 

addition, enrollees will handle 

radioactive material by actual- 
ly participating in demonstra- 

tions. 
Enrollment forms are now be- 

ing distributed to science 

county area. Requests for ap- 

6s plications should be made to 

~ McDaniel of the University of 

~ Delaware Extension Division, 

Raub Hall, Newark. 

iG o 
~ Bankers’ Ag. 

~ Forum March 12 
i A noted agricultural economist 

and a bank president will be the 

featured speakers at the annual 

Delaware Bankers’ Agricultural 

~ Forum at the University of Del- 

aware on Thurs., March 12. 

Dr. Lawrence L. Boger, head 

~ of the agricultural economics de- 

partment at Michigan State Uni- 

  

| versity, will discuss “The Farm-: 

_er’s Needs and Credit Creeds”. 

Dr. Boger, known as an authority 

on agricultural marketing and 

‘price structure, has served as a 

consultant to the Pakistan gov- 

ernment. 

Edward M. Norman, president 

of the First National Bank, 

Clarksville, Tenn., and president 

of the Tennessee Bankers’ Asso- 

ciation, will speak on “The 

Country Bank—Future or fail- 

ure.” 
A panel discussion will follow, 

teachers and others in the two-, 

‘Delaware Food 
Market Report 

To some women, the approach 

of spring means shopping for a 

gay chapeau, to others it means 

pouring over flower seed cata- 
logs, and to others, it means serv- 

ing food that’s new, different - 

light and airy, but delicious. For 

this woman, spring is now arriv- 

ing on local grocery shelves as 
many new products arrive. After 

months of testing two new cakes 

of extra quality are available, 

one is a German chocolate cake 

loaded with toasted pecans, the 

other a coconut cake with a but- 

ter cream frosting. Both cakes 

can be found in the frozen foods 

department. Also, new in frozen 

foods are ready-to-cook pie shells, 

two to a bag. Loaf bread in the 

pan is available too. 
Round bread is newly out in 

the form of a bran loaf studded 

with sesame seeds. Cracker bak- 

ers have just introduced a brand 

new snack in a unique shape. It’s 

crisp and golden and tastes just 

like chicken in a biscuit. There’s 
a whole school of new tiny fish 

shaped crackers in such flavors 

as pizza, cheese and garlic, all 
delicious. 
Another new treat is a moist 

date nut bread with its own bake- 

in-a-package pan. The batter it- 

self is in a tube and all you do 

is squeeze the batter into the pan 

and bake. 
Sun bathers just back from 

Florida will find the makings of 

Flordia’s famous key lime pie 

awaiting them here in a new 

packaged pudding mix. 

There is little that is new in 

the meat situation, however. Beef, 

pork, and broiler marketings con- 

tinue to be very abundant. Stocks 

of frozen ducks and turkeys are 

above year ago levels and should 

be attractive buys. 

Bad weather in all producing 

areas has retarded growth, and 

affected the quality of most vege- 

tables now coming to market. The 

vegetable in best supply with the 

least amount of quality damage 

are: Brussels sprouts, beets, cab- 

bage, carrots, mushrooms, onions, 

and spinach. Cucumbers continue 

to be expensive and are mostly 

imported from the West Indies 
and Mexico. Tomatoes, corn, cau- 

liflower, lettuce and eggplant are 

all higher in price this week. 

At this season of the year, 

many fruits are being sent in 

from foreign countries. Honey- 

dew melons and nectarines from 

Chile and pineapple from the Ca- 

ribbean area are quite plentiful. 

Bananas from South America, are 

still a bargain. To round out the 

fruit choices select from Western 

and Eastern Apples, hothouse rhu- 

barb, oranges and grapefruit. 
  

Mrs. Harry L. Boyer 
(Continued Irom Page One) 

American Legion and fire com. 

pany auxiliaries, Home Demon- 

stration Club, Delmarva Funer- 

al Directors Association, of   led by Dr. William E. McDaniel, 
chairman of the University of 

Delaware’s department of agri- 

resident instruction for the School 

a vegetable producer from near 

Laurel, who has developed a re- 

creation enterprise on his farm, 
and Willard T. McAllister, ex- 

' tension farm management special- 

ist at the University of Delaware. 

More than 180 Delaware bank 

directors, bankers and leading 

farmers are expected to attend 

noon with a luncheon in Kent 

Hall on the University campus. 

is sponsored annually by the Del- 

aware Bankers’ Association in co- 

: operation with the University of 

A Delaware School of Agriculture.   which she once was secretary; 

| Daughters of America, and was 

! past matron of Kent Chapter, 
cultural economics and director of | Order of the Eastern Star, and 

la past grand officer of the 

of Agriculture; Carlton W. Lowe, ! Grand Chapter of Delaware. 

She is survived by two broth- 

ers, Elvie Truitt, Ardmore, Pa.; 

and Roland Truitt, Hollywood, 

Fla.; and three sisters, Mrs. 
Mary Lamont and Mrs. Hilda 
Young, both of Atlantic City,   

the session, which will begin at | 

The Bankers’ Agricultural Forum | 

N. J.; and Mrs. Gladys Spence, 

| Ventnor, N. J. 
! The funeral will be Saturday 
at 2 p. m. in Trinity Metho- 

‘dist Church. Friends may call 
lat the McKnatt Funeral Home 

Friday evening. In lieu of flow- 
‘ers, donations may be made to 
the building fund of Trinity 
Church of which Mrs. Boyer 

was treasurer for many years. 

  

Lenten Program 
At Asbury 
Society Me=t'ng 

“The Cross and the Ressur- 

rection and the meaning of 
Easter were points considered 

during the program portion of 

the Women’s Society of Chris- 

tian Service meeting Tuesday 

| evening in Asbury Church. Mrs. 
Loris Henry was leader with 

Mrs. Donald McKnatt participat- 

ing in the program. Highlight 

of the evening was the spot- 

lighted cross and the recorded 

rendition of the “Hallelujah 

Chorus,” from the “Messiah.” 
Mrs. Floyd Nasser, president 

announced the following dates 

of interest to members. Monday, 

March 9, Day Apart Service at 

7:30 p. m. in Mt. Olivet Church, 

Seaford. Anyone who is going 

and might have room to take 

others should call Mrs. Nasser. 

April 13, Annual District Meet- 

ing to be held in Rehoboth 

‘Beach. April 14, 7 p. m., a cov- 

ered dish supper which will cul- 

minate a three day period of 

Stewardship and Service in As- 

bury Church. The Woman’ 

Society will assume responsibil- 

ity for main course of supper. 

April 8, 15, and 27 there will be 

a study course entitled “The 

Christian Famliy and its Mon- 

ey.” Rev. Shockley will teach 

the course, beginning on the 

8th at 7:30 in the Pathfinder’s 

Room. Mrs. Guy Winebrenner 

would like the names of any 

members who wish to take the 

course so that she may order 

the text books which are $1.00 
each. Trinity society will also 

be taking the course at Asbury. 

Mrs. Mark Willey announced 

that there had been seven new 
members in the society since the 

first of January. 
Mrs. William Sharp, leader of 

the Ruth Circle read the names 
of four new members of her 

circlee They are Mrs. Austin 

Swann, Mrs. Amos Minner, Mrs. 

Welch. 
Mrs. Sharp also read portions: 

of a letter from Barbara and | 

Ruth Reynolds, missionaries in 
Korea. They are the daughters 

of Rev. and Mrs. Paul Rey- 

nolds of Clarkesville, Delaware, | 

and are of special interest to 

those in this conference. 

The Prayer Groups on Wed- 

nesday morning at 10 and Wed- 

James Hawpe 'and Mrs. Lewis : 

‘Miller to Speak 
| To Ferry Counc'l 

Director William J. Miller Jr., 

of the Delaware River and Bay 

Authority will brief mem- 
bers of Delaware Travel Coun- 

cil on the Cape May - Lewes 

ferry, Friday evening. 

Miller will speak at the Coun- 

cil’s March meeting in Reho- 

both Beach where Vice Presi- 

dent Mae Hall McCabe and 

members of the Rehoboth Beach 
Chamber of Commerce will be 

hosts. | 

President Harry F. Green soid 

that Council members and the 

executive committtee will con- 

tinue to study plans to promote’ 
the “See Delaware and the 

Fair,” theme adopted at the an- 

nual meeting. 
ion, Green says the Coun-! 

cil hopes to have reduced prica 

tickets available for its member- 

ship and for use in promotion 

work. 
The Council has plans to place 

billboards and other promotion- 

al material earlier this year 

in order to encourage fair visi- 

tors to make stops in the First 

State, Green said. 

Delaware attractions will bz 

widely heralded through news- | 

papers and radio spots, as well 

as at dedication exercises of the | 

Chesapeake Bay Bridge Tunnel 

complex on April 15, it was, 

pointed out. Opportunity for 

distribution of promotional lit- 

erature is greater than ever be- 

fore, according to Green. 

. The Rehoboth Chamber of 

Commerce, which will help host 
the Travel Council is also look- 

ing forward to a season of 

greater activity, according to C. 

W. Martin, president. Some of 

its plans will be discussed at 

the Council session. 

  
  

    

Downings Write | 
From Barbados | 
“We are having a wonderful 

trip on the “Empress of Canada.” 

We departed from New York, 

Monday the 24th at 3:00 o'clock 

P.M. We like the ship, it is new. 

Last year was its first trip. It is 

650 feet long, cruises at 25 miles 

an hour, driven by two steam 

turbines of 15,000 H.P. each. 
“Yesterday we landed at St.! 

Thomas where we took a sight- | 

    
nesday evening at 7 have been. 

very successful. Rev. Shockley 

invites all women of the society 

to join the’ group. 
A rummage sale has been 

scheduled tentatively for Some 
time in April by the local 

Church Activities Committee. 
Anyone who has rummage is 

asked to save it for this sale. | 
The next meeting will be on 

April 7 with Mrs. Donald Jar- 

rell presenting the topic, “The 

Christian Woman.” Ruth Circle 

will be hostesses. 

BIRTHS 
Milford Memorial Hospital 

Feb. 19: 

Mr. and Mrs. Mackey = Bass, | 

Milford, boy. : 
Mr. and Mrs. Joseph E. Parsons, 

Milford, twins, boy-girl. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Robinson, 

Milford, girl. 

Feb. 22: | 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Hatfield, 

Milford, boy. 

Feb. 23: 

Mr. and Mrs. 

Greenwood, boy. 

Feb. 24: 

  

    
Jesse Yoder, 

an average of 80 degrees. 

seeing trip, visiting Bluebeard’s 

Castle and other points of Tater 

est. 

“The sun is very hot, but a good 

breeze keeps the temperature at 

| 
t 

“Last night we passed Martini- | 

que close enough to see the lights 

of the town. We are going ashore 

now at Barbacos, where we will 

mail this letter. The town is 

Bridgetown. 
“Tomorrow we arrive at Port 

of Spain, Trinidad, then to Cur-| 
acao , then Kingston, Jamaica,’ 

| where we leave for New York. | 
“We have met some very nice 

people, of the 620 aboard; almost 

half are from Canada. 

“It has been interesting seeing 

the flying fish jump out of the 

water and fly along with the ship 

sometimes for a hundred yards. 

“Barbados is called the land of 

the flying fish. We expect to eat 

some for lunch. 

Yours truly 

Fulton and Anna Downing.” 
  

Canterbury 
The Community welcomes Mr. 

and Mrs. Horace Goode, former- 

ly of Harrington, to their new   
Mr. and Mrs. James Norton, 

Feb. 25: 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Callaway, 

Seaford, boy. 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Wiley, 

Ellendale, twin boys. 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve Rementer, 

Georgetown, boy. 

Feb. 26: 
Mr. and Mrs. William Finkbind- 

er, Greenwood, girl. 

Feb. 17: 
Mr. and Mrs. Odie Davis, of 

Lewes, a boy, Melvin Willie. 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hopkins, of 

Millsboro, a girl, Jacqueline De- 

nise. 
Feb. 18: 

Mr and Mrs. Arlington Wilt- 

bank, of Lewes, a boy, Gilbert 

Anthony. 
Feb. 19: 

Mr. and Mrs. William Schaeffer, 

of Lewes, a boy, John Allan. 

Feb. 23: 

Mr. and Mrs. George Williams, 

  

of Frankford, a boy, Renaldo 

Tolentino. 

Felton Schoo! 
News 

MENU—March 9 - 13 

MONDAY — Macaroni and 

cheese, stewed tomatoes, milk, 

bread and butter, applesauce. 

"TUESDAY — Spaghetti sauce, 

buttered peas and carrots, milk, 

bread and butter, fruit jello. 

WEDNESDAY—Vegetable beef 

soup, cheese or peanut butter 

sandwich, milk, peaches. 
THURSDAY—Chicken pie, but- 

tered string beans, milk, bread 

and butter, deep dish apple pie. 

FRIDAY—Baked fish sticks, 

succotash, milk, corn bread and 

butter, rice pudding.   
Harrington, girl. | 

{ home which they have recently 

built on the John Richardson 

property. 

Sunday guests of Mr. and Mrs. 

Samuel Walters, Sr. were Mr. 
and Mrs. Alvin Melvin of Har- 

rington. 

Dinner guests of the John 

i Richardsons on Tuesday was 

their grandson, Tpr. John Har-| 

'rison of the Delaware State Pol- 

ice. 

Weekend guest of the Aiken 
sisters was Miss Connie Mitchell | 

| of Smyrna. 
| Mrs. Shirley Alexander spent: 

! Thursday afternoon with Mrs. 

| John Richardson. 

| Donald Darling of Viola was 
la luncheon guest of his sister 

and family, Mr. and Mrs. Norm- 

an Wilkins on Saturday. 

Guests on Friday of Mr. and 

Mrs. John Richardson were Mrs. 

Gladys Smith of Woodside, and 

Mrs. Richardson’s brother, Roy 

  

Blades of Laurel. 

Saturday evening guests of 

Mr. and Mrs. Clement Aiken 

and family were Mr. and Mrs. 

Robert Hutson and family of 

| near Harrington, Mr. and Mrs. 
| James Mitchell and family of 

Smyrna, and Mr. and Mrs. Nor- 

man Wilkins and family of Can- 

terbury. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Wilkins 

and family visited Mr. and Mrs. 

Alfred Mays and children of 

Rising Sun on Sunday afternoon. 

Norman Wilkins and Alfred 

Mays visited Robert Russum at 

the Kent General Hospital in the 

afternoon. 
  

BE WISE — ADVERTISE 

SHOP AND SWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS 

  
A BIG SNOW JOB—Th2 heavy, wet snow here Friday en- 

In that connect-| gphled the construction of this &-foot snow man in the 409 
block of Delaware Avenue. 

ricks, Jr. Price Photo. 

Those in the picture are (left 

to right) : Myles Crebs, Lewisburg, Pa., and Frank in Hend- 

| 
| 

| 
| 

  
  

Veterans News 
QUESTIONS and ANSWERS 

Q@ — A friend of mine takes 

“War Orphans Education” courses 

and her mother is living. How can 

she qualify as an orphan? 

A—The War Orphans Education 

Program (which now also in- 

cludes children of peacetime ve- 

terans under certain conditions) 

was set up for children whose 

veteran-parent died because of 

service-connected disabilities. For 

the purpose of the program, such 

chidren are considered orphans 

even though the other parent still 

lives. 
Q—Are there VA hospitals in 

Alaska and Hawaii? 

A—These are the only two 

pital within their borders. 

Q—Are plans under way to 

honor survivors of the Spanish- 

American War? There are only a 

few of them left. 

A—This may happen in the fu- 

ture. At present there are still 

20,000 of these Spanish-American 

War veterans alive. 
  

Kent General 
Hospital News 

Feb. 25 - March 3 

ADMISSIONS 

Rosemary Leo, Frederica 

Robert Hemminger, Felton 

Virginia Forbes, Felton 

Luella Allsbrooks, Harrington 

John Melvin, Felton 

Lucy Jordon, Frederica 

DISHARGES 

Mildred Wagner 

Clarence Bradley 

Elizabeth Lewis 

Lois Russum 

| Virginia Forbes 

Rosemary Leo 

BIRTHS 

To Mr. and Mrs. Nick Leo, Fre- 

derica, baby boy. 
  

  

A MESSAGE 

Sent by You 

On 2.000 Cards 

Would Cost $20 

For Postage Only 

PLUS 

Writing or Typing 

And Addressing 

A WANT AD 

WILL DO MORE 

For 

Only $1   

' County, east of but not adjacen 

  
states that do not have a VA hos- to National Mortgage and Finance 

‘Harrington to Canterbury. 

 Mispillion Hundred, lying on both 

  
    

Property Transfers 
Shipley Construction Co. to 

Manor Park Co.; situated in to 

U. S Route 13, dual highway 

which leads from Dover to Smyr- 

na. 

Eugene J. Wood, Wilmington, 

to Freeland Horsey and Beulah 

Horsey; Duck Creek Hundred, ly- 

ing on the westerly side of public 

road leading from Severson’s 

School to Bayview School. 

Shipley Road Constructon Co. 

to Manor Park Co.; East Dover 

Hundred, east of but not adjacent 

to U.S. Route 13, the dual high- 

way which leads from Dover to 

Smyrna. : 

Shipley Road Construction Co., 

Co.; situated in East Dover Hun- 

dred, Kent County, east of but 

not adjacent to U. S. Route 13, 
the dual highway which leads 

from Dover to Smyrna. 

J. Harold Schabinger and Mar- 

garet M. Schabinger, near Felton 

to Doris Marie Carlisle, Felton; 

South Murderkill Hundred, east 

side of highway leading from 

Elma Ella Thorpe, Harrington, 

to James H Harris and Agnes L.| 

Harris, Harrington; in or near the 

western limits of the town of Har- 

rington and lying on the north 

side of Mispillion Street. 

Frederick G. Hubbard and 

Helen W. Hubbard, Dover, to 

William H. Hubbard, Harrington; 

sides of the State Highway lead- 

ing from Felton to Whiteleysburg. 

BE WISE — ADVERTISE 

SHOP AND SWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS 

  

Russell Stover. 
"~Y CANDIES       
    Assorted 

Chocolates 

$160 $315 
1 Ib. box 2 Ib. box 

the finest, freshest candies you 
can buy . . . exclusively ours 

CLARKE 
AND 

McDANIEL 
Gift Shoppe and Druggists 

25 Loockerman St. 

734-2741 Dover, Del. 
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Lakeland Furniture Mart 
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7 Indicted 
In Burglary 
In Harrington 

The Kent County grand jury, 

before completing its work for 

the present term of court Tues- 

day, returned indictments in a 

| Harrington burglary case. 

Seven men were indicted for 

fourth degree burglarly at the 

Harrington Moose Home, on Dec. 

11. They were Thomas Edward 

Robinson, David Shefield, Ken- 

neth Edward Wood, Grady John- 

son, Cecil Wayne Donovan, Lee 

Warren Johnson and Robert Hen- 

ry Warren, Jr. 

Three men were indicted on 

two charges of fourth degree 

burglarly at a building owned by 

George & Lynch, near Sandtown, 

on Dec. 2, and at Lee’s Record 

Shop, near Felton, on Dec. 2, and 

at Lee’s Record Shop, near Felton, 

on Dec. 6. 

The men are Cecil Wayne Don- 

| ovan, Kenneth Edward Wood and 

Robert Henry Warren, Jr., all of 

whom had been indicted in con- 

nection with the burglarly at the 
¢ | Harrington Moose Home. Thomas 

Edward Robertson was also in- 

dicted in connection with the 

George & Lynch burglarly. 
  

Highway Dept. 
Snowed Under 

The heavy snows of the winter 
are giving the State Highway De- 

partment a $193,000 deficit prob- 

lem. : \ 

Ernest A. Davidson, director of 

operations, told the highway com- 
mission Wednesday that the sal- 

ary account for maintenance and 

construction will be short that 

amount by June 30 unless reme- 
dial steps are taken. 

The commission directed David- 

son to adopt a policy of cutting 

down any further overtime and 

not to employ any new personnel 
to fill vacancies. 

Davidson said the chief reason 

for the impending deficit has 

been the unusual overtime costs 

for crews that battled the snow 

through the night and early hours 
  

| BEHELD TOOSTOTTOoS5Se 

of snow storms. 

The commission also Wednes- 

day authorized Davidson to pro- 

ceed with plans for dualizing U.S. 

Route 113 from Georgetown to 

Selbyville and State Route 14 

from near Nassau to a point north 
of Broadkill River. 
  

Gruwell Named 

To Racing Unit 
Hudson E. Gruwell, of Dover, 

Wednesday was named to the Del- 

aware Harness Racing Commis- 

sion succeeding Carroll B. Staats, r 

of Smyrna. 

Staats, who was chairman, was 

serving a term that expired last 

April 22. Gruwell’s term will run 

until April 22, 1969. Jia 

The three commission members 

are paid $1 each per year, plus 

“reasonable” expenses for travel 

to meetings and! official commis- 

sion business functions. | 

  
  

BE WISE — ADVERTISE 

SHOP AND sWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS 
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You've Got To 

TELL. 

  

If You Want 

To Sell 

  

    

GO0O RESULTS 
when Mr Buyer meets Mr Seller 

  

  

  

  THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL 
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or use this handy order form 

CLASSIFIED RATES: 
® Minimum: 25 werds or less — 

@ 3 cents per word additional 

@ For Box Numbers in ads add 25¢ 

@ Classified Display — $1.00 per column inch 

SELL 
Appliances, Furniture, Cars, Boats 

Real Estate: Rent. Buy or Hire 

J IN 0 I OO OO I I OO 1 A CK OT OO 

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING 
SELLS and SELLS — To place your order, cali Harrington 398-3206, ask for “CLASSIFIED” 

PP 
  

  

  

  75¢ 
  

Name   

Address 

Number of timey to run _____ 

/ 
    

Date To Start 

DEADLINE — 5:00 P.M. Wednesday 

{SO 0 0 OO OO 0 Do OO OO J OO IC 
  

  

— - RATE SCHEDULE 

All ads in this column must be paid for in advance. This is the 

only way in which orders will be accepted for want ads. No ad 

arder accepted for less than 75 cents. If you have an ad which 

you want inserted count the words (name and address in- 

cluded), and multiply by the number of times you want the 

ad to run. Send that amount with the advertisement 

One Insertion, per word 3 cents 

Repeat Insertion, per word 2 cents 

With Black Face Type & CAPITALS, per word 4 cents 

Classified Display, per column inch .... _..._- $1.00 

Card of Thanks, per line : ---.. 10 cents 

Memorial, per line 0-10 cents 

\ (Minimum $1.00) 

Legal Advertising, per col. inch 

  

  

  

  

$2.10 
  

Accounts of bakes, dinners, rummage sales, entertainments 

are considered as advertisements. If you charge, we charge. 

  

NOTICE 
WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR | 

rt —————— re 

SERVICES 

  

Classified Rates 
CREDIT SERVICE 

A pookkeeping charge of 

25c will be made fer all 

Classified Ads not paid in 

agvance aad an additional 

charge of 25c¢c for each 30 

days hills renaip unpaid. 

RATES ARE NET.     
  

  incorrect insertions or classified or 
display advertisements for more 
than ONE {srue 

THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL 

| FOR SALE ¢ By Month 
POR S82 LE—Floor cevering. Arm- | 

strong and Gold Seal in 6, 3 and 
33 foot widins. worse Linoleum Co.. 
Milford, Del., phone 311-330 

  

  

BEST OF CARE 

  

IT TAKES 

WALLPAPER 

Toe Bring A Room To Life 

Llp 349 - 4173 

Horses Boarded 

Stud Service If Desired 

RALPH BOWER 

  

. 

  

  

  

. CUSTOM - MADE 
Milford Wallpaper 

SLIPCOVERS DRAPERIES 

& Paint Co. RUGS FABRICS 
UPHOLSTERY 

Phone Milford 422-8317 
SEE-AT-HOME SERVICE 

For Sale—4-room house on West| SMITH CHISM 422-8838 
Street. Call 398-8586. tf 3-30 tf 10-19 

Wallpaper, pew Dr lierne Juss \ 

LHL Taylors ar WTS 3-25 FLOOR COVERINGS 
  

Sandran and Forecast 

6, 9 and 12° Widths 

Gleem Paint 
Wholesale and Retail 

MILFORD 

WALLPAPER CO. 

For Sale—fill dirt by load. Also 
chain saw work wanted. Walter W. 
Winkler. Harrington - Frederica 
Road. Phone 398-8754. tf 2-22 
    

  

ALL KINDS OF 
USED FURNITURE 

Priced from 13¢c and UP 

LAKELAND 
  

; Ph Milford 422-8317 
FURNITURE MART a | 
  S. State St. Ext. DOVER, DEL. 

Phone 674-0180 ELECTRIC 
MOTOR REPAIR 

      
  

For sale—sleeve ironing board; 
full set of hand painted Blue Ridge Welders Generators 
ware, service for 6, 8 or 10; 3 wood- Saws-Drills Mixers-Vacuums 
en barrels; Pyrex coffee server and om ——— 

\ Rewinding - Reconditioning warmer.—Phone 398-8827 after 4:30 
p.m. tf 
  

PHOTOS FOR SALE 
A single print of most photo- 

graphs published in The Harrington 
Journal will be for sale for $1. Re- 
quest for photo must be made with-|   

WILSON ELECTRIC CO. 
Vernon Road ~- Harrington, Del. 
Day-398-3804 Nigut-395-5740     

in two weeks after publication. 
  

  

FOR For sale-—8cratch nads. 4x6 inch- 
es, at barzaln prices—The Journal. 

  

sale—Lespedeza Seed—Leon 
Phone after 5 

t 3-6 exp. 

For 
Kent—Felton, Del. 
p.m. 284-4164. 

Quality new and used mobile 
homes at low, low prices and rea- 
sonable down payments. We trade 
furniture, cars, boats or anything of 
value. IGE POINT MOBILE 
HOMES, U.S. 113 3 miles north of 
Frederica. Telephone 335-8816. ihe 

All Work Guaranteed 

Free Estimates 

— Call — 

RAYMOND DEAN 
Harrington 398-3539 

  

  

TERMITE CONTROL 

tt 3-14 b 

  

SERVICES | 
WE HAVE REPAIR PARTS for 

g washers. Foal 

  

all modern May 
and Shaw Furniture. 

i FOR RENT |, 
  

For rént-—newly renovated, 2 
bedroom house trailer at Clukey 
Farm, Route 13, Harrington. na 

For rent — north side of brick 
house, 103 Commerce Street. Modern 
improvements. Call Miss. Elva Reese 
398-3819. tf 2-14 

For rent—first floor 2 bedroom 
apt. on Dorman Street opposite Fire- 
house. Automatic washer, venetian 
blinds, floor furnace, hot and cold 
water. Ernest M. Smith, Harrington. 
Call 398-8507 after 3:30 p.m. i 

For rent—6 room house with bath, 
hot water on Ward St. Call Mrs. T. 
C. Collins, Milford 422-4820. tf 3-6 

| HELP WANTEL | 
Wanted — automobile 

family man preferred. No experi- 
ence necessary. We will train. Write 
Box 239, The Harrington Journal, 
Harrington, Delaware stating age, 
references and marriage status. 

4t b 3-6 exp. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

RETIREMENT makes available 
Rawleigh Business in S. Kent Co. 
Opportunity to take over 43 year 
old est. bus. Write Rawleigh, Dept. 
DEC-21-1104, Chester, Pa. \ 

4t b 3-27 exp. 

| IN MEMORIAM | 
IN MEMORIAM 

In loving memory of my son, Ed- 

  

  

ward Hammond, passed away March 
4, 1963. 

He was a wonderful son 
He played life's battles square 
No matter when I needed him 
I always found him there. 

God saw the road was getting rough 
The hills were hard to climb 
He gently closed your loving eyes 
And whispered, ‘Peace be thine.” 

Sadly missed and will never 
be forgotten. 

p MOTHER 
1t 3-6 exp. 

  

WA NLED 

Wanted—practical nursing and 
housekeeping. Real experienced. 
Phone 492-3549. If no answer please 
call again. t b 3-6 exp. 

~~ Miscellaneous 
SUPPER 

Felton Fire Co. supper, Sat., March 
14, starting 2:00 P.M. Fried oysters, 
chicken salad and dumplings with 
dessert. Suppers to go out. Tickets 
$1.75, children .75. 2t 3-13 exp. 

| NOTICES 

  

  

—
t
 

  

  

  

    All memorials reduced 10% until 
March 15th. Granite and marble 

  monuments cast bronze markers and 
vases, statuary. See our large dis- 
play. Erected anywhere. Moore Me- 
morial, Denton 261. 2t b 3-13 exp. 

For sale—house, 3 bedrooms and 
bath upstairs, also attic, living room, 
dining room, sitting room, sun porch, 
open stairway, kitchen and laundry 
room, downstairs. Also cellar. Forced | 
hot air heat, garage and garden lot, 

SCHREIBER 
Heating & Service 
FREE ESTIMATES 

24-Hour Burner Service 

Clarence (Pete) Schreiber 

  

near shopping center. Call from 
9 am. - 6 p.m. 398-3418 after 6 p.m. Owner 
398-3368. tf 2-21 

Call Harrington 398-3656   

For sale—soybean hay, soybeans,       and split wet oak posts. 349-4347. 
Tilghman Outten 2t 3-13 exp.   
  

FOR SALE—Due to ill health, our 
70,000 gladiolus bulbs will be sold, 
also 400 bulb trays. H. C. Burton, 
1-V16-2561 Delmar, Del. Route 1. 

3t 3-20 exp. 

R.C.A. and ZENITH 

TV SALES 

We Service All Makes 

Full Antenna Service 

TROTTA’S 
APPLIANCES 

Phone 398-3757 

    For sale—lespedeza seed, red clov=- 
er seed, few bushels of Chesapeake 
Clover seed, seed potatoes, garden 
seed and Scotts Products. Taylor’s 
Hardware, 398-3291. 3t b 3-20 

DON'T GET UP NIGHTS 

It takes just 39¢ and 12 hours to 
start relief—or your money back 
at any drug store. When functional 

  

  

  kidney disorders cause getting up 
nights, scanty flow, burning, back- 
ache, leg pains, dizziness use easy=- 

to-take BUKETS 4-day treatment. 
Acts fast to increase and regulate 
passage. NOW at Clendening Phar- 
macy. 

3t b 3-20 exp. 

FOR SALE 
Newly Overhauled 

FARMALL “H” 

Cultivators to Fit 

2 - 14” BOTTOM PLOWS 

  

HAVE YOU HEARD ABOUT 
THE NEW LOW-COST 

BUDGET 
MASTER 

FAMILY HOSPITAL PLAN? 

  

  

CULTIPACKER ® It hel h 
; : ps pay hospital- 

3 Section Spring Tooth Harrow ical jical bills. I 

DISK | 

Excellent Condition idl with Bow Jou on 

BOB McNALLY  tionwide policy. 
Call after 4 p.m. 398-8897 J :     OUTTEN'S INSURANCE 

SERVICE 
  

  

| CARD OF THANKS 
CARD OF THANKS 

I wish to thank my relatives, 
friends and neighbors for the beau- 
tiful flowers, cards and visits while 
I was a patient in Milford Hospital 

HARRINGTON — DELAWARE 
    

     ano since my Yetur home Le Your MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY 
indness will never be forgotten. 

MRS. ELIZABETH BULLOCK wench Home Office: Columbus, Ohlo 
-6 exp. 

A NEW [DEA FOR A NEW ERA | 

PHONE 398-3276 

ATIONWIDE       

  

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

Sealed proposals will be received 
by the State Highway Department of 
the State of Delaware at the office 
of the Director of Operations (Room 
202) in the Highway Administration 
Building in Dover, Delaware, until 
2:00 P.M,, E.S.T.,, March 17, 1964, and 
thereafter shall be publicly opened 
for a contract involving the follow- 
ing approximate quantities: 

CONTRACT NO. 64-01-0600 
SIGNAL INSTALLATION & 

REPAIRS 
STATEWIDE 

INSTALLATION AND 
ALTERATIONS TO SIGNALIZED 

INTERSECTIONS 
(PREQUALIFICATION HAS BEEN 
WAIVED FOR THIS CONTRACT) 
COMPLETION DATE: JUNE 30, 1964 
COST FOR CONTRACT DOCU- 

MENTS - $5.00 
150 Ft. 4” Bit. Fiber Pipe Under 

New Pavement or in Sodded 
Trench 

250 Ft. 4” Bit. Fiber Pipe Under 
Existing Pavement 

1,200 Ft. 2” Galv. Conduit Under 
New Pavement or in Sodded 
Trench 

2,100 = Ft. 2” Galv. Conduit Under 
Existing Pavement 

1,300 Ft. 1%” Galv. Conduit Under 
New Pavement or in Sodded 
Trench 

1,600 Ft. 1%” Galv, Conduit Under 
Existing Pavement 

20 Ea. Conduit Junction Wells 
6 Ea. Installation of 6’ Detector 

Encasements in Existing 
Pavement 3 

3 Ea. 6’ Traffic Signal Detector 
Encasements in EXisting 
Trench 
Ea. Removal of 6° Detector 
Encasements from Existing 
Pavements 

Ea. M. Cabinet Base 
Ea. Aluminum Pole Base 
Ea. Steel Pole Base 
Ea. Pedestal Base 
Ea. Oversize Base Mounted 
Cabinet Base 
Ea. Non-compensated Lane 
Type Magnetic Detector 
Encasement 

% % % kk 

Attention is called to the Special 
Provisions in the proposals, the spe- 
cifications and the Contract Agree- 
ment. : 

Minimum wage rates have been 
predetermined by the Department of 
Labor and Industrial Relation of the 
State of Delaware and are set forth 
in the advertised specifications. 

The employment agency for this 
contract shall be the Delaware State 
Employment Service whose offices 
are located at 801 West Street, Wil=- 
mington, 135 South Bradford Street, 

(VL
) 

pt
 

GU
 
0
0
0
0
 

  

Dover, and North Race Street, 
Georgetown. 
Performance of contract shall] 

commence and be completed as spe- 
cified. 
Monthly payments will be made, 

for ninety (90) percent of the con- 
struction completed each month. 

Bidders must submit proposals 
upon complete forms as provided by 
the Department for bidding purpos- 

  

salesman,’ 

  

  

| NOTICES | 
  et ma— e 

NOTICES | 
  

es. 
Each proposal must be accom- 

panied by a surety bond or certified 
check to the amount of at least ten 
(10) percent of the total amount of 

the proposal. 

The envelope containing the pro- 
posal must be marked ‘Proposals for | 
The Construction of 
Contract No.————". 

The contract will be awarded or 
rejected -within thirty (30) ‘days 
from the date of opening proposals. 

The right is reserved to reject 
any or all bids. 
Prospective bidders may obtain 

contract documents from the High- 
way Department Office, Third Floor, 
Administration Building, Dover, Del- 
aware, at the prices indicated for 
each contract. Additional copies of 
proposals only may be obtained at a 
cost of $2.00 per copy. Contract 
Documents need not be returned and 
no refunds will be made. 
Make checks payable to the Del- 

aware State Highway Department. 
Address all request for plans and 

proposals to E. A. Davidson, Director 
of Operations. 

DELAWARE STATE 
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT 

BY: N. Maxson Terry, Chairman 
E. A. Davidson, Director of 

Operations 
Dover, Delaware 
February 25, 1964 

State Highway 

  

"PUBLIC SALE 
Of Valuable 

REAL ESTATE 
Store Equipment 

Having decided to discontinue my 
retail operation of groceries and 
meats, my wife and I will sell at 
auction all of our stock, equipment 
and Real Estate at our place of 
business located in the town of 
Bridgeville, Delaware. (signs will 
be posted) 
SATURDAY, MARCH 14, 1964 

12 Noon Sharp 
Rain or Shine 

REAL ESTATE 

  

All those certain pieces, parcels 
or tracts of land described as fol- 
lows, to wit: 

All that certain piece or parcel 
of land situated, lying and being 
in the Town of Bridgeville, Sussex 
County, Delaware, beginning for 
the metes and bounds thereof on 
Main Street at the Northeast corner 
of ‘a’ loti of . H. Messick’s and 
runs North 24 degrees East 81 feet 
thence North 33 degrees West 100 
ft. to lot of G. H. Baker, thence 
South 37 degrees West 130 ft .to a 
stake thence with a division fence 
part way South 62 degrees East 
113% feet to the place of begin- 
ning and ‘containing 11,130 square 
feet of land be it the some more 
or less, with all improvements - 
House with 4 bedroom, bath, kit- 

| chen, dining and living rooms along 
with an attached store, 60 ft. x 
40 ft. and two back rooms 20 ft. x 
14 ft. each, part of which is new 
construction. 

This property is in a good loca- 
tion for any king of Retail Business 
being a corner property and close 
to a residential area. 

STORE EQUIPMENT 
Philco 2 H.P. air conditioner, 

Hamilton milk shake machine, gas 
sandwich grill, Frigidaire refrig- 
erator, 2 National adding ma- 
chines, McCoskey cash register, 
Smith-Corona cash register, Huss- 
mann double duty 10° meat case 
with 1% horse motor, 12° double 
duty meat case with new 3; horse 
motor, Punacle 8 vegetable case 
with 3% horse motor, Howard 6’ 
stainless steel frozen food case, 
Frigidaire 10° freezer, Walk-in 
Box, 6’x12’ with new twin motors, 
2 Dayton scales, Hobart stainless 
steel meat slicer, Hobart electric 
stainless steel meat grinder with 1% 
horse motor, Hobart electric meat 
saw, Hobart stainless steel stake- 
master, Pepsi Cola cooler, Coca- 
Cola cooler, Pepsi Cola can cooler 
dispenser, some groceries and 
many articles too numerous to 
mention. Most of the above equip- 
ment is either new or just like 
new. 
TERMS OF REAL ESTATE: 

20% of the purchase price will be 
paid on day of sale; balance to be 
paid within 30 days at which time 
a good and sufficient deed will be 
conveyed. If the purchaser fails to 
comply with these terms, the per- 
centum paid on day of sale will be 
forfeited. The owners reserve the 
right to accept or reject any and 
all bids. 
TERMS OF EQUIPMENT: Cash, 

day of sale. 
EMERSON and MYRTLE HARPER, 

Owners 
Auctioneer: C. J. Carroll 
Dover, Del. 

734-5848 2t b 3-13 exp. 
  

NOTICE OF REDUCTION 
OF CAPITAL 

oF 
TOM GLOOCR CHEVROLET, INC. 
Pursuant to the provisions of Sec- 

tion 244 of the Delaware General 
Corporation Law, notice is hereby 
given that the capital of the above 
corporation has been reduced from 
$142,150.03 to $137,380.92 by (a) the 
transfer of $1,669.10 of its capital 
surplus to earned surplus, which 
amount was originally transferred 
thereto from earned surplus; and 
(b) the redemption for retirement 
of 31 shares of the outstanding 168 
shares of Class A stock. A Certifi- 
cate of Reduction of Capital was 
filed with the Secretary of State of 
Delaware on February 13, 1964 and 
on the same date a certified copy 
thereof was left with the Kent 
County Recorder of Deeds for the 
completion of the record in that off- 
ice, all in accordance with the pro- 
visions of said Section 244 of the 
Delaware General Corporation Law. 
TOM GLOOR CHEVROLET, INC. 
By Thomas W. Gloor, Sr. President 

3t 3-6 ‘exp. 
    

NOTICE OF REDUCTION 
OF CAPITAL : 

oF 
ZEIGLER-HARRIS CORPORATION 

Pursuant to the provisions of Sec- 
tion 244 of the Delaware General 
Corporation Law, notice is hereby 
given that the capital of the above 
corporation has been reduced from 
Seventy-Seven Thousand Five Hun- 
dred Dollars ($77,600) to Seventy 
Thousand Dollars ($70,000) by re- 
ducing (in conjunction with appro=- 
priate action under Section 242 of 
the Delaware General Corporation 
Law) the par value of the seventy- 
five thousand (75,000) issued and 
outstanding shares of common stock 
having a par value of Twenty Cents 
($0.20) per share to Ten Cents 
($0.10) per share. A Certificate of 
Reduction of Capital was filed with 
the Secretary of State of Delaware 
on February 13, 1964 and on the 
same date a certified copy thereof 
was left with the Kent County Re- 
corder of Deeds for the completion 
of the record in that office, all in 
accordance with the provision of 
said Section 244 of the Delaware 
General Corporation Law. 
ZEIGLER-HARRIS CORPORATION 
By Andrew G. Galef, President 

Arnold Seidel, Secretary 
3t 3-6 exp. 

2t 3-6 exp. 

  
| W. Killen, deceased, and in part with 

  

TRUSTEE’S SALE 
Of Valuable 

REAL ESTATE 
Trustee will expose to sale by 

way of public auction or vendue on 
the Oscar Hill Home Property, in 
South Murderkill Hundred, Kent 
County, Delaware, on the north side 
of the public road leading from Kil- 
len’s Mill to Reeve’s Crossing, on   WEDNESDAY, MARCH 18, 1964 

at 10 0’Clock A. M. 
The Following Described 
Estate, to-wit: 

Real 

Parcel #1. George W. Hill property 
fronting on dual State Highway, 
U. S. Rt. #13, containing approxi- 
mately 77 acres tillable land and 
approximately 77 acres woodland, 
and more particularly described as 
follows: 

All that certain tract, piece or 

  | NOTICES | | NOTICES | 
  

NOTICES | 
ighteen and one-half degrees West 

thirty-six and one-tenth perches to 
a” corner in W. T. Bradley's line; 
thence with said Bradley line North 
seventy and three-quarters degrees 
East forty-eight and eight-tenths 
perches to the place of Beginning, 
containing and laid out for eleven 
(11) acres and eighteen (18) square 
perches of land, be the same more 
or less; 

AND being the same lands and 
premises which were conveyed unto 
George W. Hill by deed of Ernest F. 
Killen and Sarah A. Killen, his wife, 
dated January 22, 1935 and of record 
in the Recorder of Deeds Office, in 
and for Kent County and State :of 
Delaware, in Deed Record Book R, 
Volume 14, Page 178 etc. 

Parcel #4. Oscar Hill property on 
the south side of the public road 
leading from Masten’'s Corner to 
Law’s Church, containing approxi- 
mately 63 acres tillable land and 
approximately 14 acres scrub, more 
particularly described as follows: 

All that certain farm or tract of 
land situated in Mispillion Hundred, 
Kent County and State of Delaware, 
on the south side of the public road 
leading from Masten’s Corner to 
Law’s Church and on the west side 
of the public road leading from the 
aforesaid road to the Harrington- | 
Frederica road, bounded on the east 
and south by lands now or formerly 
of Robert Emmett Raughley and J. 
Harry Raughley and on the west by 
lands now or formerly of Nelson 
Jerread, and containing seventy- 
seven (77) acres of land, be the same 
more or less; 

AND being the same lands and 
premises which were conveyed unto 
Oscar Hill and Emily Elizabeth Hill, 
his wife, by deed of William E. Hill 
and Almina Hill, his wife, dated 
April 5, 1950 and of record in the 
Recorder of Deeds Office, in and 
for Kent County and State of Dela- 
ware, in Deed Record Book V, Vol- 
ume 18, Page 375 etc. Subsequently, 
upon the death of Emily Elizabeth 
Hill during the year 1956, the said 
Oscar Hill became seized in fee and 
in severalty of said lands and pre- 
mises. 

Parcel #5. Oscar Hill Home Place, 
on the north side of the public road 
leading from Killen’s Mill to Reeve’s 
Crossing, containing approximately 
75 acres tillable land and approxi- 
mately 6 acres of woodland, more 
particularly described as follows: 

All that certain farm or tract of 
land, together with the improve- 
ments thereon erected, situated in 
South Murderkill Hundred, Kent 
County and State of Delaware, lying 
on the north side of the public road 
leading from Killen’s Mill to Reeve’s 

parcel of land ,together with the { Crossing and bounded as follows: on 
improvements thereon, situated in 
Mispillion Hundred, Xent County 
and State of Delaware, adjoining 
lands now or formerly of John Ben- 
son, lands now or formerly of J. 

s napp, lands now or formerly 
of Frank Abbott, lands now or for- 
merly of James Barcus and lands of 
others, the metes and bounds, cours- 
es and distances whereof are as fol-' 
lows: 
BEGINNING at a boundary stone 

for J. W. Knapp’s and A. Raughley’s 
land four perches from the center of 
road and running thence South 
thirteen degrees and five minutes 
West seventy-four and five-tenths 
perches; thence South two degrees 
and ten minutes East thirty-five 
and three-tenths perches to a stake 
in an old stump, a corner for Raugh- 
ley and Butler land; thence North 
eighty-nine degrees and thirty minu- 
tes West two hundred and twenty 
perches to a corner near the line 
of the railroad; thence North four- 
teen degrees and twenty minutes | 
East one hundred and nineteen and 
seven-tenths perches to a stone, a 
corner for John Benson’s land in 
the line of Haze lot; thence South 
fifty-four degrees and thirty min- 
utes Kast forty-one perches to a 
stone; thence North twenty-four de- 
grees East six perches; thence South 
eighty-eight degrees and forty-five | 
minutes East seventy-three and 
eight-tenths perches to a stone; 
thence North two degrees and forty- 
five minutes East eighty-four and 
five-tenths perches to the center of 
the road leading to “Piney Siding”; 
thence down the center of said road 
South eight degrees East eighty- | 
four perches to the center of the | 
cross-roads leading one to Frederi- | 
ca and the other to Rice’s School 
House; thence down the center of 
said road South ten degrees East 
sixty-two and five-tenths perches to 
the place of Beginning and said to 
contain one hundred seventy-eight | 
Sores of land, be the same more or 
ess; 
AND being the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed unto | 
George W. Hill by deed of Sarah 
H. Lister and Charles C. Lister, her 
husband, dated March 31, 1903 and 
of record in the Recorder of Deeds 
Office, in and for Kent County and 
State of Delaware, in Deed Record 
Book T, Volume 8, Page 45 etc. 
EXCEPTING, however, from the 

above a parcel of twenty (20) acres 
conveyed by George W. Hill and 
wife to Jacob Postles by deed dated 
March 11, 1911 and of record in the 
aforesaid Recorder’s Office in Deed 
Record Book B, Volume 10, Page 
284 etc.; and a parcel of one and 
one-half (1%) acres conveyed to 
Levin B. Wright by deed dated Feb- 
ruary 15, 1921 and of record in said 
Recorder's Office in Deed Record 
Book Z, Volume 11, Page 258 etc.; 
and a parcel of three (3) acres con- 
veyed to George W. Hill, Jr. and 
Viola E. Hill, his wife, by deed dated 
May 4, 1932 and of record in the 
aforesaid Recorder of Deeds Office 
in Deed Record Book E, Volume 14, 
Page 248 etc. 

  

  

Parcel #2. George W. Hill property 
on the south side of the public road 
leading from Killen's Mill to Reeve’s 
Crossing, more particularly describ- 
ed as follows: 

All that certain piece, parcel or 
tract of land, together with the 
improvements thereon, situated in 
South Murderkill Hundred, Xent 
County and State of Delaware, on | 
the south side of the public road. 
leading from J. W. Killen’s grist 
mill to Reéve’s Crossing and is’ 
bounded on the south by Murder- 
kill Branch, on the east by lands’ 
now or formerly of William T. 
Bradley and lands formerly of 
George W. Killen, and on the west 
by lands now or formerly of S. A. 
Creadick, to-wit: BEGINNING at a 
corner in the public road leading 
from John W. KiHen’s grist mill to 
Reeve’s Crossing Delaware R. R. and 
in a line of lands now or formerly 
of William T. Bradley; thence with 
the said Bradley line in part and in 
part with lands formerly of George 

lands now or -formerly of William 
T. Creadick a nearly straight line 
back to Murderkill Branch; thence 
with said Branch in a westerly di- 
rection, in its several courses and 
distances, about forty-six perches to 
a corner in said Branch, a corner 
for other lands formerly of William 
H. Creadick which were conveyed 
to Alfred C. Creadick and now or 
formerly, of Samuel A. Creadick; 
thence by line of lands now or for- 
merly of Samuel A. Creadick two 
hundred and twenty perches to a 
corner in the center of said public 
road hereinbefore mentioned; thence 
with said public road North seventy- 
four degrees East forty-six perches 
to the place of Beginning, contain- 
ing sixty-three acres, be the same 
more or less; 
AND being the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed unto 
George W. Hill by deed of William 
H. Creadick and Emma M. Creadick, ! 
his wife, dated September 17, 1912 
and of record in the Recorder of 
Deeds Office, in and for Kent County 
and State of Delaware, in Deed Re- 
sotd Book I, Volume 10, Page 283 
etc. 

  

  
Parcel #3. George W. Hill property , 
lying south of but not adjoining 
the road leading from Killen’s Mill! 
to Reeve’s Crossing, more particular- 
ly described as follows: 

All that certain tract, piece or par- 
cel of land situated in South Mur- | 
derkill Hundred, Kent County and | 
State of Delaware, and lying on 
the west side of a public road lead- : 
ing from Masten’s Corner and Fre- 
derica road to Murderkill Creek 
Branch, which road crosses the head | 
of Boone's Mill Pond and is known | 
as the George W. Killen road, ad- 
joining lands now or formerly of | 
W. T. Bradley on the north and 
south and other lands of George W. 
Hill on the west, the metes and | 
bounds, courses and distances where- ! 
of are as follows, to-wit: BEGIN- 
NING at a stone on the east side of | 
the above described road, a corner 
for lands now or formerly of W. T. 
Bradley and in line of lands now or 
formerly of George W. Killen; 
thence with said Killen land South 
nineteen degrees and thirty minutes 
East thirty-six and four-tenths 
perches to a corner in said road; | 
thence by a line South seventy-one 
and one-half degrees West forty- 
nine and four-tenths perches to a 
corner; thence by another line North 

  

the north by lands formerly of Sarah 
A. Lister; on the east by lands now 
or formerly of Samuel G. Bradley; 
on the south by the aforesaid pub- 
lic road and on the west by lands 
now or formerly of Nathan F. 
Raughley, and containing eight-one 
(81) acres of land, more or less; 
AND being the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed unto 
Oscar Hill by deed of Georgiana 
Creadick, widow, et al dated April 
20, 1926 and of record in the Re- 
corder of Deeds Office, in and for 
Kent County and State of Delaware, 
in Deed Record Book Z, Volume 12, 
Page 249 etc. 

Parcel #6. Oscar Hill property lying 
on the north and south sides of the 
public road leading from Masten’s 
Corner to Spring Branch and on the 
west side of the public road leading 
over the head of Killen’s Mill Pond 
to the Harrington-Frederica road, 
more particularly described as fol- 
OWS: 
All the following tracts of land 

situated in South Murderkill Hun- 
dred, Kent County and State of Del- 
aware, described as follows: 

(A) All that certain piece or par- 
cel of land and premises, with im- 
provements, situated in South Mur- 
derkill Hundred, Kent County and 
State of Delaware, adjoining lands 
formerly of John Creadick and 
lands now or formerly of John W. 
Hall and others, lying on the north 
side of the public road leading from 
Masten’s Corner to Spring Branch, 
and containing thirty-two (32) acres 
and eighty (80) perches of land, be 
the same more or less; 

(B) All that certain piece or par- 
cel of land and premises situated in 
the Hundred, County and State 
aforesaid, lying on the south side of 
the public road leading from Mas- 
ten’s Corner to Spring Branch, ad- 
joining lands now or formerly of 
William T. Creadick, lands formerly 
of Rachel Killen and lands of others, 
and containing twenty-six (26) acres 
and forty (40) square perches of 
land, more or less; 

(C) All that certain piece or par- 
cel of land situated in the Hundred, 
County and State aforesaid, lying 
on the west side of the public road 
leading over the head of Killen’s 
Mill Pond to the Harrington-Fred- 
erica road, adjoining lands formerly 
of Rachel Killen, lands of the late 
George W. Hill and lands of others, 
containing twenty-eight (28). acres 
of land, be the same more or less; 
AND being the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed unto 
Oscar Hill and Emily Elizabeth Hill, 
his wife, by deed of Samuel G. 
Bradley and Susie D. Bradley, his 
wife, dated September 22, 1943 and 
of record in the Recorder of Deeds 
Office, in and for Kent County and 
State of Delaware, in Deed Record 
Book K, Volume 16, Page 469 etc. 
Subsequently, upon the death of 
Emily Elizabeth Hill during the 
year 1956, the said Oscar Hill be- 
came seized in fee and in severalty 
of said lands and premises. 

Parcel #7. Oscar Hill property front- 
ing on the dual State Highway U.S. 
Route #13, with dwelling, outbuild- 
ings, trailer and roadside market 
thereon, more particularly described 
as follows: 

All the following tracts of land 
situated in South Murderkill Hun- 
dred, Kent County and State of Del- 
aware, as follows: 

(A) All that certain tract, piece or 
parcel of land and premises, with 
improvements thereon, situated in 
South Murderkill Hundred, Kent 
‘County and State of Delaware, lying 
‘on the west side of the dual State 
Highway, U. S. Route #13, leading 
from Felton to Harrington and on 
the east side of the former public 
road leading from Rice's School 
House to Harrington, the metes and 
bounds, courses and distances 
whereof are as follows: BEGINNING 
at the middle of the intersection of 
the two public roads at Rice’s School 
House; thence running with the mid- 
dle of the former public road lead- 
ing towards the said State Highway 
North eighty-two degrees East fifty- 
seven and five-tenths perches to a 
corner in the middle of the said 
road at the west edge of the said 
State Highway; thence running with 
the west edge of said State Highway 
with the curve thereof, about South 
three degrees West thirty perches; 
thence South seven and one-half de- 
grees West one hundred and sixty- 
one and three-quarter perches to a 
corner in the west line of the said 
highway, in the middle of the stream 
of the head waters of Murderkill 
Creek; thence running up said 
stream, in a westerly direction, 
about fifteen perches to a corner in 
the middle of said stream and in the 
middle of an old public road; thence 
running with the middle of said old 
public road North six degrees West 
one hundred and seventy-six and 
one-tenth perches to the place of 
Beginning and containing forty- 
three and five-hundredths acres of 
lands, be the same more or less; 

(B) All that other certain tract, 
piece or parcel of land situated in the 
Hundred, County and State aforesaid, 
lving on the east side of the .dual 
State Highway, U. S. Route #13, 
leading from Felton to Harrington, 
and on the south side of the old 
public road leading from Rice's 
School House to Frederica, the metes 
and bounds, courses and distances 
whereof are as follows: BEGINNING 
in the middle of the said public 
road in the east line of said State 
Highway, running with the middle 
of said public road North eighty- 
two degrees East thirty-six perch- 
es to an angle therein; thence North 
seventy-four degrees East thirteen 
and one-tenth perches to a corner 
in the middle of said road for lands 
now or formerly of Samuel Cread- 
ick; thence running with said Cread- 
ick lands South seven and one-half 
degrees Bast forty-six and two- 
tenths perches; thence running with 
line of lands hereinafter described 
as (C) North eighty-two and one- 
half degrees West fifty-six and two- 
tenths perches to a stake in the 
east line of said State Highway; 
thence running with the east line 
of said State Highway, with the 
curve thereof, about North three 
degrees Fast thirty perches to the 
place of Beginning. and containing 
twelve and six one-hundredths acres 
of land, be the same more or less; 

(C) All that other certain tract, 
piece or parcel of land situated in 
the Hundred, County and State 
aforesaid, lying on the east side of 

the dual State Highway, U. S. Route 
#13, leading from Felton to  Har- 

!rington, and more particularly de- 
| scribed as follows: BEGINNING at 
a stake in the east line of said 
State Highway at a corner for (B) 
above described; thence running 

with tract (B) South eight-two and 
one-half degrees East fifty-six and 
 two-tenths perches to a stake in 
1line of lands formerly of Samuel 
| Creadick; thence running with said 
Creadick lands South seven and one- 

| half degrees East thirty and nine- 
| tenths perches to a stake; thence 
| running North eighty-two and one- 
| half degrees West sixty-four perches 
ito a stake in the east line of said 
| State Highway; thence running with 
{ the east line of the said State High- 
way North seven and one-half de- 
grees East thirty perches to the 
place of Beginning and containing 
eleven and twenty-seven one-hun- 

| dredths acres of land, be the same 
more or less; 
AND being the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed unto 
Oscar Hill and Elizabeth Hill, his 
wife, by deed of Amelia Alexander, 

| widow, dated January 30, 1946 and 
of record in the Recorder of Deeds 
Office, in and for Kent County and 

i State of Delaware, in Deed Record 
‘Book G, Volume 17, Page 97 etc. 
| Subsequently, upon the death of 
| Elizabeth Hill during the year 1956, 
{the said Oscar Hill became seized 
jin fee and in severalty of said lands 
‘and premises. 

EXCEPTING, however, two small 
tracts of land, one containing 3.163 
acres and the other containing 0.045 
acres, conveyed to The State of 
Delaware for highway purposes. 

{ Parcel #8. Oscar Hill property lying 
on both sides of the back road from 
Felton to Harrington, containing 
approximately 92 acres tillable land 
and approximately 103 acres of 
woodland, and described as follows: 

All that certain farm or tract of 
land, with improvements thereon, 
situated in South Murderkill Hun- 
dred, Kent County and State of Del- 
aware, and lying on both side of 
the back road leading from Felton 
to Harrington, adjoining lands now 
or late of J. Frank Rice, lands now 
or late of James Townsend, lands 
now or late of William Parkus, lands 
now or late of Henry Austin, lands 
now or late of Earl Remus and lands 
of others, containing one hundred 
ninety-five (195) acres of land, be 
the same more or less; 
AND being the same lands 

premises which were conveyed unto 
Oscar Hill and Emily Elizabeth Hill, 
his wife, by deed of Gilbert J. Mere- 
dith and Cora V. Meredith, his wife, 
dated January 9, 1937 and of re- 
cord in the Recorder of Deeds Off- 
ice, in and for Kent County and 
State of Delaware, in Deed Record 
Book B, Volume 15, Page 47 etc. Sub- 
sequently, upon the death of Emily 
Elizabeth Hill during the year 1956, 
the said Oscar Hill became seized 
in fee and in severalty of said lands 
and premises. . 
EXCEPTING, however, 44,100 sq. 

ft. of land conveyed by Oscar Hill 
and wife to John Perry and Mabel 
Perry, his wife, by their deed dated 
March 28, 1946 and recorded in the 
aforesaid Recorder's Office in Deed 
Record Book N, Volume 17, Page 
265 etc. and 5.35 acres conveyed by 
Oscar Hill and wife to The State of 
Delaware by their deed dated No- 
vember 10, 1949 and recorded in said 
Recorder’s Office in Deed Record 
Book V, Volume 18, Page 18 ete. 

TERMS OF SALE 
On the day of sale purchasers will 

be required to pay to the Trustee 
twenty (20) per cent of the purchase 
price and shall, on or before April 
18, 1964, pay to the Trustee at 329 
South State Street, Dover, Delaware, 
the balance of said purchase price. 

The percentage paid on day of 
sale will be treated as part of the 
purchase price if other terms of sale 
are complied with, otherwise, it will 
be forfeited for non-compliance and 
treated as liquidated damages. 

Trustee reserves the right to re- 
ject any and all bids for ten (10) 
days after the date of sale. 

HAROLD SCHMITTINGER, 
TRUSTEE 

AUCTIONEER :BURT WILLIS 
t. b 3-13 exp. 

Executer’'s Sale 
Of Valuable 

Personal Property 
Executor will expose to public 

sale on the Oscar Hill Home Pro- 
perty, in South Murderkill Hundred, 
Kent County, Delaware, on the north 
side of the public road leading from 
Killen’s Mill to Reeve’s Crossing, on 

TUESDAY, MARCH 10, 1964 
at 10 O0’Clock A.M. 

The following farm machinery and 
equipment: 

Tractors—1 Oliver 77; 1 Oliver 70 
with 4-row cultivator; 1 Farmall M; 
1:.Massey-Harris 33 with 4-row cul- 
tivator; 1 Farmall A with 1-row cul- 
tivator, pickup 16” plow and disc; 1 
Massey-Harris 101 Jr. with 2-row 
cultivator; 1 Grain Drill; 1 Rotary 
hoe 4-sections; Set 3-bottom 12” 
International plow; Set 2-bottom 14” 
Massey-Harris plow; 3 Sets 2-bottom 
International plows; 3 Sets 8-ft. 
Disc; 1 Set 10-ft. Disc; 1 4-section 
drag harrow and several odd sec- 
tions; 1 David Bradley side rake; 1 
Case elevator with gasoline motor; 
1 4-section spring tooth and 1 3- 
section spring tooth harrow; Several 
walking plows and cultivators; 1 4- 
row International corn - planter; 4 
‘Farm wagons; 2 Corn bodies; 2 Mas- 
sey-Harris 6-ft. Combines; 2 New 
Holland balers; 1 John Deere Lime 
drill; 1 New Ideal Spreader; 1 Mas- 
sey-Harris 8-ft. Mower; 1 Weed 
sprayer for tractor; 7 lots old iron; 
Lot new lumber and some used; Lot 
of pipe and fittings; 1 Well drive 
and sand pump; Several small and 
large block and falls; 1 Clipper grain 
fan; I Power saw with 11 P, 
motor; Several can hooks, log chains, 
axes, hand saws, hoes, shovels and 
forks; 1 Emery stand for grinding 
plow shares; Several small emery 
stones; 2 wood laves; 2 sets pipe 
dies; Set of bolt dies; Electric mo- 
tors; 6 wooden planes (antique); 
Some bundles of baling twine; 2 
Seeders for tractor; Several oil 
drums; 1 Set Large Milkers; Be- 
tween 175 and 200 bundles Asbestos 
siding (new); 1 Corn sheller; Several 
lots of bolts and nails; 1 Gig saw on 
mount; Lot of wrenches and ham- 
mers of all kinds; 2 large drive 
belts; 1 Cement block maker; 1 Drill 
press; 1 Planter Jr. garden seeder, 
and other miscellaneous items; 

1 1949 Chevrolet Stake Body 1%- 
ton truck 

1 1962 Chevrolet 4-door Bel-Air 
(12,000 miles) and ; 
The following household goods: 

1 Unico freezer; 
washing machine; 2 Kitchen cab- 
inets; 2 Small white porcelain cabi- 
nets; 1 Kelvinator Refrigerator; 
Toaster; Several chairs and tables; 
1 Duo-Therm oil heater; 1 Desk; 1 
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Kitchen wood stove; 1 Chunk stove; 
Several stands; 1 Side Board; 2. Floor 
lamps; 2 Desk lamps; 1 Hamilton 
22-cal. pump rifle; 2 Medicine cabi- 
nets; 4 iron bed frames; 4 Bureaus; 
1 old wood trunk; 1 old hall coat 
stand; 1 Couch; 1 Day bed; 1 wooden 
cabinet; 1 Electric clock; 1 Book- 
case and several books; 1 4-burner 
Perfection gas stove and other 
articles too numerous to mention. 

TERMS OF SALE: CASH 
RANDALL HILL, 
Executor of the Estate 

f of Oscar Hill, deceased 
HAROLD SCHMITTINGER, 
Attorney for Estate 
BURT WILLIS, AUCTIONEER 

2t 3-6 exp. 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

Sealed proposals will be received 
by the State Highway Department 
of the State of Delaware at the off- 
ice of the Director of Operations 
(Room 202) in the Highway Admin- 
istration Building in Dover, Dela- 
ware, until 2:00 P.M., E.S.T., March 
17, 1964, and thereafter shall be 
publicly opened for contracts -“in- 
volving the following approximate 
quantities: 

CONTRACT NO. 64-02-803 
DUMP TRUCKS WITH ONE-WAY 
SNOW PLOWS, CONTROLS AND 

ATTACHMENTS : 
SUSSEX COUNTY 

5 Ea. Dump Trucks with One-Way 
Snow Plow, Controls and Attach- 

  

ments 

Minimum Dump Truck Re- 
quirements: i 

Engine: 6 Cyl. (V6 or V8 
Acceptable) 

Gas, 400 Cu. In. 
Front Axle: Heavy Duty, 

9,000 Lbs. 
Rear Axle: 18,500 Lbs., Double 

Reduction 
G.V.W.: 26,500 Lbs. 
Wheel Base: 142” 

Less Allowance for Five (5) 
Trade-ins 

The above Trade-ins may be in- 
spected at the Gravel Hill Highway 

. Yard, Sussex County, on March 11, 
1964, between the Hours of 8:00 A. 

iM. and 4:00 P.M., E.S.T. 
PEETT 
  

CONTRACT NO. 64-02-S04 
TWO-DOOR SEDANS \ 

STATEWIDE 
Ea. Two-Door Sedans 
Minimum Requirements: 

Engine: 6 'Cyl., 220 Cu. In. 
Wheel Base: 116” i 

Less Allowance for Twenty-Five 
(25) Trade-ins Y 

The above Trade-ins may be in- 
spected at the Delaware State High- 
way Department Yards at Christi- 
ana, . Dover, and Georgetown on 
March 11, 1964, between the Hours 
of 8:00 A.M. and 4:00 PM, BEST 

* 

CONTRACT NO. 64-02-9007 ro 
TRACTOR WITH BROOM 

~~ KENT COUNTY 
1 Ea. Tractor with Broom J 

Minimum Tractor Requirements: 
Engine: 4 Cyl, Gas, 34° E 
Type: All purpose utility or in- 

dustrial tractor capable 
of operating side mount- 
ed mower, broom, or lift | 
type rotary mower 

Attention is called to the Special 
Provisions in the proposals, the spe- 

  

  

Siflnstions and the Contract Agree- 
ment. ; 

Performance of contract shall 
commence on date of Notice to Pro- 
ceed and be completed as specified. 
. Payment will be made for deliver- 
ies upon presentation of triplicate 
billing certified to by the Depart- 
ment. 

Bidders must submit proposals up- 
on complete forms as provided by 
the Department for bidding pur- 
poses. 

Each proposal must be accom- 
panied by a surety bond or certified 
check to the amount of at least ten 
(10) percent of the total amount of 
the proposal. 

The envelope containing the pro- 
posal must be marked “Proposal for 
State Highway Contract No.———."”’ 

The contract will be awarded or 
rejected within thirty (30) days from 
the date of opening proposals. 

The right is reserved to reject 
any or all bids. 

Prospective bidders may obtain 
contract documents frqm the High- 
way Department Office, Third Floor, 
Administration Building, Dover, Del- 
aware, upon payment of two dollars 
($2.00) for eact set. Contract Docu- 
ments need not be returned and the 
above payment will not be refunded. 
Make checks payable to the Del- 

aware State Highway Department. 
Address all request for plans and 

proposals to Ernest A. Davidson, 
Director of Operations. 

DELAWARE STATE : ¢ 
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT 

BY: N. Maxson Terry, Chairman 
E. A. Davidson, Director of 

Operations. ; 
Dover, Delaware ; 
February 25, 1964 

2t 3-6 exp. 

NOTICE OF REDUCTION 
OF CAPITAL 

OF : 
TRENT OLDS-CADILLAC.BUICR, 

I . 

Pursuant to the provisions of Sec- 
244 of the Delaware General Cor- 
poration Law, notice is hereby given 
that the capital of the above cor=- 
poration has been reduced from 
$69,143.40 to $64,208.45 by (a) the 
transfer of $734.95 of its capital 
surplus to earned surplus, which 
amount was originally transferred 
thereto from earned surplus; and 
(b) the redemption for retirement 
of 42 shares of the outstanding 362 
shares of Class A stock. A Certifi- 
cate of Reduction of Capital was 
filed with the Secretary of State of 
Delaware on February 17, 1964 and 
on the same date a certified copy 
thereof was left with the Xent 
County Recorder of Deeds for the 
completion of the record in that off- 
ice all in accordance with the pro- 
visions of said Section 244 of the 
Delaware General Corporation Law. 
TRENT OLDS-CADILLAC-BUICK, 

  

: INC. 
By Donald E. Deichmann, President 

3t 3-6 exp. 
  

NOTICE 

In pursuance of an order of H.. 
Clifford Clark, Register of Wills, in 
and for Kent County, Delaware, dat- 
ed February 27 A. D. 1964 notice is 
hereby given of the granting Letters 
Testamentary on the estate of James 
H. Latchum on the 27th day of Feb- 
ruary A. D. 1964. All persons hav- 
ing claims against the said James 
H. Latchum are required to exhibit 
the same to such Executor within 
nine months after the date of the 
granting of such Letters, or abide 
by the ‘law in that behalf, which 
provides that such claims against 
the said estate not so exhibited shall 

1 Kelvinator . be forever barred. : 
James L. Latchum, Executor 

of James H. Latchum, Deceased. 
H. Clifford Clark : 

3t 3-20 exp. 
  

  

Qualified men needed for 

Position 

Chief Engineers 

Water Tenders 
Firemen 
A.B. Seamen 

Town Hall     
POSITIONS NOW OPEN FOR 
CAPE MAY-LEWES FERRY 

First Asst. Engineers 
Second Asst. Engineers 

Interviews will be conducted 

on Monday, March 9 and 16 
between 9:00 A.M. and 3:00 P.M. 

LEWES, DELAWARE 

Yeu may alse write or telephone for 

Applications and Information to the 

DELAWARE RIVER AND BAY 
AUTHORITY 

Administration Bldg., P.O. Box 71 

Telephone: OLympia 6-6604 SHE 

ithe following job ranges: 

Monthly Rate 

$651.86 
539.67 
485.10 
321.38 
303.19 
303.19 

  

New Castle, Del.   
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Dash of Herbs 
Adds New Treat 

Salt and pepper are standard 
seasonings, but ever since the 

time of Columbus, men have 

searched for new ways to enhance 

the taste of food. In their travels 

they searched for the treasure of 

tropical spices, and the wealth of 

kings sometimes balanced on 

their ability to return with the 

fragile, perishable leaves. 
Today, gourmet cuisine is set 

apart by its masterful touches of 

seasoning. But the subtle flavor- 

ing of the very finest cuisine can 

be duplicated in your own kitch- 

en. Creating new tastes for old 

favorites—meat, vetegables, soups 

and breads—isn’t difficult when 

herbs and spices become a reli- 

able part of your fod preparation 

tools, Janet Coblentz, foods and 

nutrition specialist at the Univer- 

sity of Delaware, recently told a 

gourmet interest group of the 

Wilmington area Newcomers 

Club. 
Although there are only so 

many foods around, the number 

of ways to vary them could keep 

- you busy for a lifetime. Spices 

and herbs are used to enhance 

the natural flavor of the food, 

never to disguise it, she related. 

Start out on your first few 

ventures with herbs and spices 

by following recipes which have 

been well tested. When experi- 

menting, said Miss, Coblentz, a 

good rule of thumb is to start 

with one-quarter teaspoon of a 

spice or herb. It is easier to add 

another small amount than to be 

faced with the problem of over- 

seasoning. 

Almost any of the herbs can be 

‘used interchangeably or blended 
together in recipes. Thyme, sav- 

ory, marjoram, basil or bay leaf 

can be used to vary stuffings. 

Basil, with its delicate flavoring, 

is often favored for egg dishes, 

but there is no reason why you 

couldn’t try it in soups, with le- 

mon on fish, or crumbled and 
sprinkled on tomato slices. 
Herbs can be blended with but- 

ter or bread and biscuit dough 

when French bread, heated with 

garlic and butter, has lost its 

novelty. 

Replacing butter on cooked ve- 

getables, herbs have extra divi- 

dends for those on low fat and 

salt-free diets. The psychological 

need for salt is not as great when 

other seasoning is there to take its 

place. 

Herbs are the leaves of plants 

which grow north of the tropics, 

while spices come from tropical 

~ plants. 

After picking, herbs are perish- 

able and need to be used quickly 

to be at their aromatic best. Some 

women who grow plants on kitch- 

en window sills have found it 

profitable to keep a few pots 

planted with rosemary, thyme, 

basil, marjoram, sage and pars- 

ley, Miss Coblentz said. Need a 

pinch of something? Pinch it 

yourself. But don’t forget to 

crush your fresh-grown flavor- 

ing as you use it, to get its full 
benefit. 

When buying a packaged spice 

or herb, learn to look for strength 

and color. A fresh, rich color and 

~ pungent aroma that rises to meet 
you mark highest quality, Miss 

Colbentz noted. Since they grad- 

ually lose color and flavor, you 

get no bargain when you buy a 

large quantity in a bag. Smaller, 

tightly sealed containers are best 

for the average homemaker. Fre- 

quent replenishment assures you 

of best quality for cooking. 

Spices and herbs should be 

stored in a cool, dry place, never 

right over or too near the range. 

Once containers are opened, herb 

flavor begins to wane. If they 

are properly stored, the few ounc- 

~ es of herbs in tightly closed con- 

tainers retain good flavor and 

color for several months. 

Herbs tend to lose flavor a lit- 

tle faster than most spices, but 

they are used in greater amounts. 
If you buy them in leaf form 

and crush them as you use them, 

they will keep their flavor long- 

er. Ground spices should be re- 
~ placed within six months, while 

whole spices keep their flavor 
almost indefinitely. 

~~ Whole spices, said Miss Cob- 
lentz, are especially useful in 

dishes which cook a long time, 

such as stews. They should be 

added at the beginning of the 

cooking period to extract their 

full flavor and aroma. Add 

ground spices and herbs about 15 

minutes before serving. In un- 

cooked dishes, such as salad dress- 

ing, fruit juices or cottage cheese, 
the spice or herb mixture should 

be left standing for several hours 

to develop maximum flavor. 
No one can say how much of 

any spice or herb you will pre- 

fer to use—no one but you and 

those who will eat what you pre- 

pare. Since the pungency of each 

seasoning differs, and its effect on 

different foods varies, there is no 

hard-and-fast rule for the perfect 
~ amount. 
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Armed Forces 
Notes 
Army Capt. Samuel M. Simp- 

son, son of Mr. and Mrs. Chaun- 

cey O. Simpson, 140 Evergreen 

Drive, Dover, and other members 

of the 30th Medical Group parti- 

cipated in field training -exercise 

MED DELTA which ended Feb. 

12, in Karlsruhe, Germany. 

During the exercise medical 

units, under simulated battle con- 

ditions, performed all phases of 

medical duties involved in the 

transportation and treatment of 

casualties from battlefield to hos- 

pital. 

Captain Simpson, assigned to 

Headquarters of the group’s 52d 

Medical Battalion, entered the 

Army in October 1961 and arriv- 
ed overseas in July 1963. 

The captain is a 1949 graduate 

of Dover High School and a 1953 

graduate of Springfield, (Mass.) 

College. 
  

Army Specialist Five Nelson 

V. Harris, 26, son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Isaac P. Harris, Felton, and other 

members of the 25th Infantry Di- 

vision’s 69th - Armor, are partici- 

pating in Exercise HIGH TOP II, 

a five-week training maneuver 

in Hawaii. The exercise is sched- 

uled to end March 6. 

The men of the 69th Armor 

moved from the Island of Oahu 

to the rugged lava beds of the 

volcano Mauna Loa, on the Island 

of Hawaii, for the live-fire and 

combined arms training exercises. 

Specialist Harris is a gunner in 

Company B of the 69th Armor’s 

1st Battalion stationed at Scho- 

field Barracks, Hawaii. 

He entered the Army in 1956 

and was stationed at Fort George 

Meade, Md., before his assignment 

at Schofield Barracks. 

Harris is a 1955 graduate of 
William Henry High School in 
Dover. 

His wife, Doris, is with him in 
Hawaii. 

  

Army Pvt. Otis R. Harmon, son 

of Mr. and Mrs. Otis W. Harmon, 

Ellendale, and other members of 

the 1st Armored Division, Ft. 

Hood, Tex., participated in a 

combined arms exercise conduct- 

ed at Ft. Polk, La., Feb. 12. Four 

hundred soldiers of the division 

underwent training at Ft. Polk for 

two weeks in preparation for the 

realistc training exercise. The 24- 

year-old soldier, a member of 

Company B, 1st Battalion of the 

divison’s 6th Infantry, entered the 

Army June 1963 and completed 

basic training at Ft. Jackson, S. C. 

He attended W. C. Jason High 

School, Georgetown. 
  

Second Lieutenant James 8S. 

McClain, son of Mrs. Juanita M. 

McClain, of 2 E. Milby St., Har- 

rington, has completed his first 

solo flight in the T-37 jet trainer. 

He is undergoing United States 

Air Force pilot training at Webb 
AFB, Texas. 

Lieutenant McClain, who re- 

ceived his commission through the 

Air Force Reserve Officer Train- 

ing Corps program, will receive 

the silver wings of a pilot upon 

graduation from the year-long 

flying training course. 

The lieutenant earned B.S. 

and M.A. degrees from West Vir- 

ginia University. 
  

Army PFC Howard H. Piper 

Jr., whose parents live at 506 

Truitt Ave., Milford, and other 

members of the 25th Divisions | 

35th Infantry, are participating 
in Exercise HIGH TOP II, a five- 

week field training maneuver 

which began early in February in 

Hawaii. 

Piper is an ammunition bearer 

in Company C of the 35th In- 

fantry’s 1st Battalion stationed at 

Schofield Barracks, Hawaii. 

He entered the Army in March 

1962, completed basc training at 

Ft. Dix, N. J., and was stationed 

at Ft. Gordon, Ga., before his 

assignment at Schofield Barracks. 

The 20-year-old soldier is a 1962 

graduate of William Henry High 

School in Dover. 
  

Fire Company 

Report 
Th regular March meeting of 

the Harrington Volunteer Fire 

Company was held Monday eve- 
ning with 35 members present. 

Paul Clendaniel and Samuel 

Layton were elected to member- 

ship. 

Delegates to Kent County Fire- 

men’s meeting in Leipsic, Wed., 

March 18 are Donald McKnatt, 

Melvin Wyatt, Tom Brown. 

President Neeman appointed 

the following officers and com- 

mittee chairmen to lay plans for 

the 44th annual Delaware Volun- 

teer Firemen’s Association Con- 

vention to be held here Sept. 10- 
11-12: general chairmen, Paul 

Neeman, Douglas Mills; secretary, 

Albert C. Price; treasurer, Dale 

V. Dean; publicity committee, 

William H. Outten, chairman; 

housing committee, Robert Tay- 

lor, chairman; parade committee, 

Walter Messick; refreshment com- 

mittee, Harold Fry and Russell 

lades, co-chairmen; entertainment 

committee, Melvin R. Wyatt, 

chairman; program and advertis- 

ing, Donald McKnatt, chairman. 
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Merit Scholarship 
Test Set for 
March 10 

Eighty-four students at Har- 

rington High School plan to take 

the 1964 National Merit Scholar- 

ship Qualifying Test, E. A. Rut- 

ledge, corrdinator of Pupil Per- 

sonnel, announced this week. 

The test will be administered at 

the school at 9 a.m. Tues., March 

10. All students who wish to be 

considered for Merit Scholar- 

ships to be awarded in 1965 

should take the test at that time. 

The qualifying test is a three- 

hour examination of educational 

development. The test is the first 

step in the tenth annual com- 

petition for four-year Merit Scho- 

larships provided by the National 

Merit Scholarship Corporation 

and by sponsoring corporations, 

foundations, colleges, associations, 

unions, trusts, and individuals. 

The number of scholarships 

awarded in any year depends up- 

on the extent of sponsor partici- 

pation. In 1963, 1528 Merit Schol- 

arships were awarded; 951 were 

provided by 179 sponsors and 

577 by the Merit Corporation. 

There are 4119 Merit Scholars at- 

tending 425 colleges in the cur- 

rent academic year. 

The test scores of students who 

are examined in March will be 

reported to their schools before 

May 15. The scores are used by 

counselors in many high schools 

to help students make decisions 

about college attendance and field 

of study. Many students who do 

not expect to win a scholarship 

take the test in order to learn 

more about their individual 

strengths and weaknesses in the 

areas measured by the test. 

Some 14,000 semifinalists, the 

highest scorers in each state, will 

be named early next fall. Names 

of semifinalists are published in a 

booklet which is distributed to 

all colleges and to other sources 

of financial aid for undergradu- 

ates. Further, their names and 

test scores are sent to the colleges 

they express an interest in attend- 

ing as their first and second 

choices. The order of preference 

ils not shown. 

An additional 35,000 students, 

selected on a national basis, re- 

ceive Letters of Commendation 

for their high performance on the 

qualifying test. These students are 

considered for special awards 

made through the Merit Corpor- 

ation, and their names and test 

scores are also sent to their first 

and second choice colleges. 

Each semifinalist will be asked 

to take a second examination. 

Those who repeat their high per- 

formance will become finalists in 

the merit program. Winners of 

Merit Scholarships will be select- 

ed from the finalist group on the 

basis of school records and re- 

commendations, test scores, extra- 

curricular activities, leadership 

ability, and accomplishments out- 

side the classroom. Each finalist 

is awarded a certificate of merit 

attesting to his outstanding per 

formance. _ : 

The scholarship stipends are 

based on financial need. The mini- 

mum award is $100 and the maxi- 

mum is $1500. The average stip- 

end awarded to freshman Merit 

Scholars in 1963 was $796 annual- 

ly, or $3184 for the four years of 
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college. Each scholarship consti- 

tutes a form of educational in- 
surance, since the stipend may be 

increased at any time if the stu- 

dent’s financial situation changes 

during the four-year term of the 

scholarship. 

Supplementary grants are us- 

ually made to the colleges that 

the scholars attend. 

Older Pigs Do 
Not Need 
Iron Injections 

A University of Delaware ani- 

mal husbandryman has caution- 

ed swine growers not to inject 

  

| pigs with iron after they are 

three weeks old. 

John Shropshire, extension 

livestock specialist at the Univer- 
' sity, says midwestern meat pack- 

ers are finding traces of inject- 

able iron compounds in the hams 

of market hogs. He says this indi- 

| cates that swine producers are 

injecting iron compounds into 

their hogs within 30 to 60 days 

| prior to sending them to market. 

Shropshire says that not only 

is this practice quite expensive, 

but it is also ineffectve. There 

has been no research work to 

date that indicates any benefit 

from injecting pigs with iron 

after they reach three weeks of 

age. 

A common and beneficial prac- 

tice among swine growers is to 

inject very young pigs with iron 

compounds. This is done between 

two days and two weeks of age. 

Iron injections are necessary be- 

cause sows’ milk lacks the iron 

needed by young pigs for rapid 
growth . ; 

  

Shropshire cautions producers 

to read and follow the instruc- 

tions on the label prior to inject- 

ing pigs with iron compounds. 
  

Mrs. Thomas H. Willin 

Mrs. Elizabeth W. Willin, 89, 

widow of Thomas H. Willin, 

died Saturday in Deer’s Head 

State Hospital, Salisbury, after 
a long illness. 

A native of Wicomico County, 

she lived most of her life in the 

Federalsburg area. Her hus- 

band died in 1944. 

She is survived by four 

daughters, Mrs. Dallas Boyce, 

and Mrs. Samuel Mackert, both 

of near Federalsburg, Mrs. Katie 

M. Austin, of Harrington., and 

Mrs. Darrell Wheatley, of Sea- 

ford.; three sons, Thomas J. of 

Federalsburg, Clarence of Sharp- 

town, and Elwood of Wilming- 

ton; 16 grandchildren and 22 
great-grandchildren. 

Services will be held Friday 

afternoon at the Frampton Fu- 

neral Home, Federtalsburg.   

      

Pattern Fitting Clinic 

Do you know your correct pat- 

tern size? Or do you have trouble 

finding a pattern that fits you 

well when you sew? Miss Janet 

Reed, Extension Clothing Special- 

ist with the University of Dela- 

ware, will be in Dannemann’s, 

Rodney Village Shopping Center, 

Dover, March 13 and 14th: 

The best indication of pattern 

size is to try on a basic pattern 

and compare sizes and figure 

types. Miss Reed will have a kit 

of basic patterns from girls size 

8 to women’s size 44 and 24%. 

Basic patterns from two pattern 

companies will be used so a com- 

parison of fit between brands will 

be possible. 

Miss Reed, assisted by Marion 
MacDonald, 4-H agent and Katie 

Thomas, home economics exten- 

sion Agent, will be in the store 

Friday, March 13 from 2 to 5 p.m. 

and 6 to 9 p.m. and Saturday, 

March 14 from 12 noon to 5 p.m. 
You may stop in at any time to 

try on the basic patterns and dis- 

cuss any fitting or alteration prob- 

lems you may have. 
  

Appliance Repairs 

Money invested in servicing ap- 

pliances is part of the overall 

cost of household equipment. Ap- 

proximately 10 per cent of the 

total cost of each major piece of 

equipment should be budgeted to 

cover servicing costs each year, 

notes Katie Thomas, Kent county 

home economics extension agent. 

She says automatic and multi- 
purpose units may need more re- 

pairs because they have more 

working parts, and thus a great- 

er chance of breaking down. 

Getting good repair service for 

your household equipment begins 

with buying, relates Mrs. Thomas. 

Before buying, select a reliable 

‘|'dealer, understand your guaran- 

tee coverage, and check the avail- 

ability of local repair service. 

When difficulty develops, be 

sure all controls are properly ad- 

justed. Check the fuse box and 

electrical, water and gas connec- 

tions to the appliance to be sure 

your troubles don’t stem from 
one of these. 

When calling for service, have 

the essential facts about the ap- 

pliance on hand—the model num- 

ber, the date of purchase and 

installation, and the dealer’s and 

manufacturer’s names. Describe 

the problem to the serviceman as 

clearly as possible to help him 

  

  

PROMPT TV 2 

Antenna Repairs 
Complete Stand Alone Towers 

SALES and SERVICE 

EARL BUTLER 
398-3395       

  

DOVER, DELAWARE   on 

THURSDAY EVENING 
7:30 P.M. ; 

MARCH 12, 1964 

If you need feeders be sure to attend. 

JT J CC J CJ J CB CJ DD 

SIF NCC CN SC J J DD I RJ © 

FEEDER SALE 
at the 

C. J. CARROLL AUCTION CO. 
Phone 734-5848 
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Delaware State Fairgrounds 

WEDNESDAY, MARCH 11 

AMCHEM PRODUCTS, 

MBLER, PENNSYLVANIA 

INC. 

730. P. M. 

  

Kent Home Doings come prepared with the tools and 

an estimate on the cost of the re- 

pair, or a rate on the call to check 

the appliance. 

If you are careful to use your 

appliances according to the direc- 

vided, Mrs. Thomas reminds 

homemakers, you will have less 

need for repairs. 

L.0O.0.M. News 
The nominating committee of 

the Harrington Moose Lodge will 

meet at 8 p.m. March 12 to nom- 

inate officers for the next term 

which will begin on the first 

week in May. 

  

On the nominating committee 

are the following: Governor Ted 

Ivory, Jr. Governor Franklin 

Coke, Prelate Richard Wilson, 

treasurer Willard Butler, secre- 

tary John Seamans, Trustees Dale 

Sullivan and Bill West, five past 

governors, Jabes Jopp, Merrill 

Vanderwende, Benny Moore, Wat- 

son Shew, Tom Carr; five mem- 

bers, C. E. McWililiams, aHrvey 

Passwaters, arold Vingard, Bill 

Scott and Earl Yoder. 

Clothing was donated to our 

clothing bank during the month 

of February by the following: 

Mrs. Grace Moore, of New Castle; 

Mrs. Garnett Motter, Mrs. Leon 

Wix, Mrs. Franklin Swain and 

Mrs. Henry White, all of Harring- 

ton. 

  
  

  

PROMPT 

TV SERVICE 
DEL - MOR - TV CO. 

Harrington-Milford Road 

422-8534     
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PETER PAN 

Diaper Service 
MAKES A WONDERFUL 

GIFT 
Salisbury, Md. PI 9-6603 

  

    
DELAWARE'S 

OLDEST 

BANK 

All deposits insured up to 

$10.000 by the Federal Deposit 

[nsurance Corporation 
    

  

tions the manufacturer has pro-| 

  

A trap shoot will be held on 

parts he will need. If possible, get' Sunday afternoon, March 8, at 1 

p.m. at the Moose home. 

Combined Choirs to 
Sing Contata 

The combined senior choirs of 

St. Stephen’s Episcopal, Asbury 

and Trinity Methodist Churches 

will sing the cantata “The Last 

Words of Jesus” by Rob Roy 

Peery at a Lenten Musical Serv- 

ice this Sunday evening, March 

8, at St. Stephens’ Episcopal 

Church, beginning at 7:30 p.m. 

Soloists will be Mrs. Quay Rice, 

Mrs. William Kramedas, sopranos; 

Mrs. James Neeman, alto; Ar- 

  

SL Aiea 

FRIDAY, MARCH 6, 1964 
  
  

thur Hoffman, tenor, and Alfred 

Mann, bass. The organist will be 

Miss Sarah Moore, and the di- 
rector, Melvin Brobst. 

Participating clergy will be the 

Rev. Quay Rice, Sr., the Rev. 

Olin Shockley, and the Rev. 
Charles Poukish. 

Following the service a social 

hour will be held in the Parish 

Hall sponsored by the Women of 
St. Stephen’s with Mrs. Robert 
Baynard as hostess. 

The public is cordially invited 

to attend this Lenten Musical 

which is the third annual pre- 

sentation of this type of program. 
  

SHOP AND SWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS   
  

  

NAVY 

  

  
    

lr ~ 

February 19, 1945, Admiral Nimitz prepared a new 

drive to attack Iwo Jima which lay in the path of 
the superfortresses that winged their way over 

Tokyo. After heavy shelling by large United States 

naval forces the allies moved on to Okinawa and 
the very threshold of Japan, It looked as if it would 
take a long drawn out campaign to conquer the 

mainland, so the allies elected to drop the new 

atomic bomb on Hiroshima and Nagasaki forcing 
the Japanese to sue for peace on board the battle 
ship MISSOURI September 2, 19435. 

see your NAVY recruiter 

  

  

  Your Blue Cross 

and Blue Shield protection 

‘—nothing outweighs its importance 

: to your family’s security. 

Taking up residence in a new 
neighborhood in Delaware? Let 

Blue Cross and Blue Shield know 
your new address promptly. 

Relocating outside the state? 
Transfer your protection right away. 

It’s as easy as a phone call to your 
nearest office to find out exactly 
what to do. You can take your 

Blue Cross and Blue Shield with 
you. In fact, they could be your 

first and best friends in your 

new community. 

MOVING? 

  
Well, here's one more thing to remember 

  

This member is glad she remembered! 

Mrs. Evelyn Graham of Blackbird, a 

Blue Cross member for 25 years, has 

2 out of 3 Delawareans prefer 

DELAWARE BLUE CROSS AND BLUE SHIELD 
Group Hospital Service, Inc. 

Main Office: 908 West Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19899 

Wilmington OL 8-2441/Dover 736-6431/Milford 422-9570/Seaford 629-9465 

taken her protection from Wisconsin, 
to Florida, 

Today, Mrs. Graham happily 

“attests to the plan’s mobility and 
importance. “I was recently in 
Kent General Hospital in Dover 

for 47 days,” says Mrs. Graham. 
“I couldn’t believe Blue Cross and 
Blue Shield covered so much of my 

doctor and hospital bills. Moving 
so many times, I was often tempted 
to drop my coverage. I sure am 

glad I always kept it.” 

to Indiana, to Delaware. 
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school facility in town has been 

acreage, while last year it was 40 

rendered me just about this time 

- moted a benefit dinner among all 

. ment measures. The total farmer 
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FENCE TALK 
With George Vapaa 

«Progress is made by people 

who care enough to disagree”. 

Think about it. The statement was 

made at the Testimonial Dinner 

for Archie Feagan, principal at 

the Harrington High School, by 

Dr. J. Edward Legates, a former 

student of some distinction as an 

international authority on gene- 

tics. 

But this was one of the friend- 

liest and most heartfelt testimoni- 

al affairs we have seen. The eve- 

ning started very quietly with 

over 340 people sitting down to 

dinner. Herman C. Brown, law- 

yer alumnus, presided as toast- 

master and gradually brightened 

things up. The honored guest was 

treated to a great deal of ribbing 

about his yardstick disciplinary 

measures. He was presented with 

an inscribed 12 foot “yardstick” — 

whereupon he commented “They 

are making everything bigger 

these days”. Chuck McNally, a 

sophomore, sparked his presenta- 

tion with ths remark: “I have the 

distinction of being the only boy 

Mr. Feagan calls “Suzy”; for as 

most of the audience recalled, in 

appropriate occasions students 

were invariably addressed as 

“Suzy” or “John”. The assembled 

guests presented an inscribed 

floor clock for his retirement 

home in North Carolina. 

The audience was enthralled 

with Archie’s rebuttal. As a 

friend of his for the past 25 

years, I've never heard him give a 
better talk. He saluted two town 

leaders who were recognized with 

dinners in recent years: Dr. Wil- 

liam T. Chipman and Mr. Jacob 

C. Messner, former school super- 

intendent. He noted that every 

replaced in the last 30 years. The 

school has been accredited regu- 

larly ever since the program start- 

ed. Many visionary programs 

were attempted long before they 

became standard for many 

schools. I knew of no school other 

than Harrington with an electric 

organ 25 years ago. He called for 

broadened programs designed to 

hold and appeal to all youngsters 

until they graduate from high 

school, a minimum job require- 

ment in most cases today. 

A teacher’s wealth is his contri- 

bution to molding his students for 

living in society. He can look 

back on those former pupils and   
reflect with pain or pleasure, “I 

had something to do in shaping | 
John or Suzy”. Our Harrington 

folks are a community like too 

few others. They say thank you 

frequently and mean it sincerely. 

Here is a final personal public 

thanks to Archie for a favor he 

over 20 years ago. The Russians 

were attackng my ancestor coun- 

try the Finns, a much smaller 

nation. There was a call for war 

relief aid—medical supplies, food, 

clothing and the like. Archie pro- 

the local civic clubs, and several 
hundred dollars were raised and 

presented to the Finnish ambassa- 

dor. 

Here indeed is Archie Feagan, 

a public servant whose code has 

been civic service. 

  

The ASC signup for the 1964 

feed grain program is progressing 

at a rapid pace. This came today 

from Lister Hall, office manager 

of the Kent County office. 

The signup runs through March 

27. 

Lister said that the program is 

basically the same as last year, 

but there are two improvements 

for 1964 worth noting. These are: 

Number one - a feed grain far- 

mer may divert as much as 50 per 

cent of his total feed grain base 

per cent.   Number two - each acre divert- 

ed will be at the highest Pass! 
when a producer diverts 40 per 

cent or more of his feed grain 

base. 

ASC Office Manager Hall said 

that applications by farmers may | 

be filed in the county office. Off- 

ice hours Monday through Fri- 

day are 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 
  

ACP helps advance watershed 

protection. The backbone of any 

watershed program is the timely 

establishment of need conserva- 

tion practices on farmland within 

a drainage area says Russell C. 

Bowdle, chairman, Kent Agricul- 

tural Stabilization and Conserva- 

tion County Committee. 

He points to the Agricultural 

Conservation Program (ACP) as 

a help to make an organized 

watershed program possible and 

to speed up necessary land-treat- 

ACP investment in practices car- 

ried out on more than 113,000 

farms in these watersheds under 

the 1962 Agrcultural Conservation 

Program (the last program for 

which complete figures are avail- 

able) amounted to more than $40 

million. This is a national figure 
of course. 

“The importance of watershed 

programs for entire river basins 

or small upstream tributaries is 
recognized more every day,” the 

chairman comments. “Such pro- 

from floods and erosion and from 

the siltation of streams and re- 

servoirs, and better and more ac- 

cessible recreational facilities.” 

On-farm land-treatment mea- 

sures, according to the chairman, 

stabilize the watershed and pro- 

tect the reservoirs from siltation 

and flood damage. Legislation 

authorizing organized watershed 

program underscores the import- 

ance of such land treatment by 

providing that Government assist- 

ance may be approved for such 

works of improvement as reten- 

tion reservoirs unless the farmers, 

ranchers, and woodland owners in 

the area agree to carry out ade- 

quate recommended soil-conser- 

vation measures and proper farm 

plans. 

‘The chairman says that ASC 

County Committees give careful 

consideration to applications for 

ACP cost-share assistance in 

watershed program areas. In the 

Upper Nanticoke Watershed in 

this county, six farms participat- 
ing in the 1963 Agricultural Con- 

servation program carried out the 

following significant land-treat- 

ment measures: Enduring cover 

10 acres, application of liming ma- 

terials on 50 acres and nearly 7000 

linear feet of open ditch drainage. 

In the Marshy Hope Creek Water- 

shed the participation was as fol- 

lows; Enduring cover on 6 acres, 

application of liming materials on 

637 acres. Temporary cover on 

1028 acres and nearly 17 thousand 

linear feet of open ditch drainage. 
  

Programmed farming triples 

profit. Data are accumulating on 

the results farmers may obtain by 

using linear programming on 

their farms. In four years, one 

North Carolina farmer rose from 

a net income of $2,400 to $7,600. 

Assisted by the Cooperative Ex- 

tension Service, he developed a 

farm plan in 1959 and completed 
the shift in four years. 

Linear programming takes into 

account the farmer’s resources 

and restrictions for various com- 

binations of crop and livestock 

enterprises. From an analysis of 

the information, a program is se- 

lected which will yield optimum 
net returns. 

  

A new “dryeraton” process of 

drying corn has been’ developed 
by USDA and Purdue University 

scientists. It is a combination of 

aeration and drying. Still under 

study, the process shows promise 

of reducing damage in artificially 

dried corn and at the same time 

increasing the drying capacity of 

continuous-flow batch dryers. 

Overheating shelled corn dur- 
ing drying, or removing the mois- 
ture too fast, can increase break- 

‘age in handling, impair the mill- 

ing properties of corn, and in- 
crease its susceptibility to molds 
and insect damage during storage. 

Accidental Death 
Rates Reduced 

Substantial progress has been, 
made in reducing accidential 
death rates in Delaware in the 
past ten years, the Delaware 
Safety Council reported recent- 
ly. 

Richard H. McMullen, presi- 
dent, declared that progress in 
Delaware has exceeded the nat- 
ional experience. 

The death rate to which Me- 
Mullen referred is the number 
of accidental deaths per 100,000 
population. The Delaware Saf- 
ety Council and the National 
Safety Council have computed 
the rates. McMullen said a 39 
per cent reduction was exper- 
ienced in Delaware from 1953 
through 1962 (with a further re- 
duction in 1963). 

Limiting the comparison to the 
10-year period of 1953-62 in- 

conclusive because national fig- 
ures are available for those 
years, McMullen said the nat- 
ional reduction in the Delaware 
rate was 13 per cent—one third 
the magnitude of the reduction 
achieved in Delaware. 

Accident figures frequently 
used by the Delaware Safety 
Council deal with numbers of 
deaths or accidents without re- 
gard to the population. The 

  

' death rate figures in the pres- 

lent compilation relate the num- 

ber of deaths or accidents with- 

out regard to the population, 

McMullen pointed out. 

In 1953, the first year of the 

decade under consideration, 

there were 272 accidental deaths 

in Delaware and the death rate 

was 77.1 per 100,000 population 

as compared with a national rate 
of 60. 

In 1962 the number of acci- 

dental deaths in Delaware was 

lower—222—although the popu- 

lation was higher, and the rate 

was only 47.3. The national rate 
had come down to only 52.2. 

Conceding that the death rate 
figures are only approximate be- 

cause the population figures are 

estimates except in census years, 

McMullen said the figures still 
are ‘solid indications for solid 

progress in preventing accidents. 

We are still having too many 

accidental deaths, but it is very 

encouraging to know that the 

combined efforts of industry, the 

police, the schools, and a great   grams—in addition to the direct 

agricultural benefits— result in 

water, less damage and expense 

number of individuals and 
groups, coordianted by the Del- 

‘aware Safety Council are 
more adequate supplies of clean achieving notable success in a 

long, uphill battle.” 
I   

Agriculture Offers 
Opportunities 

To Many People 
You don’t have to live on a 

farm—or even near one—to be 

eligible for a career in the broad 

field of agriculture. Approximate- 

‘ly 100 Delaware high school stu- 

dents and their counselors wera 

"panies need college graduates 

| trained to understand their prob- 
{lems and meet them with work- 
‘able solutions. Research for new 

and better ways to bring products 

'to consumers must be done by 

'men in these positions. Technical 

and practical approaches have to 

be combined for profitable re- 

| sults. 

| Agriculture looks to 

for new machinery and 

research 

equip- 
told this at Careers Day in Ag- ment, new developments in food 
ricultural and Biological Sciences 

on Saturday, Feb. 29, at the Uni- 

versity of Delaware. 

The field of agriculture is so 

large today that its needs have 

expanded beyond the limits of 

the farm and now extend into 

many other forms of business. In 

fact, the students were told, agri- 

culture is the largest single in- 

vestment of 200 billion dollars. 

Dr. William E. McDaniel, dir- 

ector of resident instruction and 
dustry in America with an in- 

chairman of the department of 

agricultural economics, told the 

assembly that college graduates in 

agriculture are most often em- 

ployed in allied fields which sup- 

ply agricultural producers with 

commodities such as feed, chemi- 

cals, fertilizer, machinery and 

power. Agricultural financing in- 

stitutions are also employing an 

increasing number of School of 

Agriculture graduates. These in- 

dustries and institutions, along 

with marketing firms, are em- 

ploying over one-half of the 

graduates from the School of Ag- 
riculture. 

Jobs in agricultural and biolo- 

gical sciences call for knowledge 

of engineering, chemistry, plant 

and animal pathology, entomolo- 

gy, genetics, plant and animal nu- 

trition, soils and economics. The 

college programs are planned to 

give the student a broad under- 

standing in many areas, and spe- 
cific training in his selected field. 

As examples of jobs in agri- 

cultural production, Dr. Paul P. 

Burbutis, assistant professor of 

entomology, named animal pro- 

duction, plant production, con- 

servation and recreation as em- 

ployment opportunities. 

Services which graduates of ag- 

ricultural schools can give to 

those who produce food and fiber 

include veterinary medicine, pest 

control, construction, machinery 

service, landscape architecture, 

management, communications and 
banking. 

Distributing farm products has 

grown to be almost a 30 billion 

dollar a year business, Robert L. 

Bull, food marketing specialist 

science, feeding, breeding, disease 

control, processing, and market- 

ing. Agricultural scientists are 

active in new areas of radioactive 

elements, radiation, electronics, 

solar energy, and the wonder 
drugs. Opportunities for jobs are 

found in industry and universities 

as well as the U. S. Department 

of Agriculture, state Ralph P. 

Barwick, assistant professor of 

agricultural education. 

Biological sciences, Dr. G. Fred 

Somers, chairman of the depart- 

ment of biological sciences, ex- 

plained, seed to explain the fun- 

damental processes of living or- 

ganisms. Using the improvement 

of one crop as an example, Dr. 

Somers showed biological science 

in action. He stated that the grow- 

er needs a knowledge of vegetable 

crops, plant breeding, soils and 

soil technology, agronomy, horti- 

culture, marketing and process- 

ing. In addition, Somers indicated, 

the production of a successful 
crop depends on plant physiology, 

botany, microbiology, entomolo- 

gy and genetics—all phases of the 

biological sciences. 

With the success of the 1964 Ca- 
rees Day, Dr. McDaniel, chairman 

for high school students will be 

continued in future years. 
  

Mrs. R. L. Coulter 

Mrs. Clara Coulter, 87, widow 

of Robent Lee Coulter, of Green- 

wood, died Thurs.,, Feb. 27, at 

Nanticoke Memorial Hospital. 

She was a native of Georgetown 

but had lived in Greenwood for 

56 years. She wias a member of 

Grace Methodist Church, of 

Greenwood. 

She is survived by four sons, 

Robert Lee, William and Thomas, 

of Greenwood, and Woodrow, of 

Wilmington; five daughters, Mrs. 

Clara Lybolt, of California; Mrs. 

Julia Appleman, of Bloomsburg, 

Pa., Mrs. Mable Young of Bethle- 

hem, Pa., Mrs. Rose Grambrill, of 

Philadelphia, and Mrs. Virginia 

Francisco of Atlantic City, and 

14 grandchildren.   
of the event, said ‘the program 

4-H News 
‘With Marion MacDonald 

Chicks, pigs and talent are the 

talk around 4-H clubs this month. 

Members wishing to participate in 

the Feeder Pig program must en- 

roll by March 9th. In this event 

members raise two feeder pigs 

from the first week in April until 

the last of July. Experience is 

gained in management practices, 

responsibility toward an animal, 

feed and care practices. The finals 

occur during the Delaware State 
Fair when the 4-H’er participates 

in showmanship and fitting con- 

tests, and the pigs are then sent 

to market. 

Fifty baby chicks will find their 

way into homes throughout Dela- 

ware the 23rd or 24th of March. 
Members wanting to participate 

must enter by March 13th through 

their 4-H club agent or FFA ad- 

visors. Hatcheries throughout Del- 

aware donate these chicks, along 
with the sponsorship of many ser- 

vice clubs. Management practices 

are learned in this project. Feed, 

water and ventilation are just a 

part of the total process of rais- 

ing chicks. This is quite evident at 

the finals when all contestants 

have seven birds on display. Par- 

ticipants are urged to follow sug- 

gestions sent out in weekly news- 

letters. To gain knowledge in both 

these programs members are en- 

couraged to try new practices or 

improve on ones in use. 

Talent show entries are arriv- 

ng daily. Individual members en- 

tered in this March 14 event are: 

Jimmy Charles, Jerry Charles, 
Kevin Charles, Whiteoaks; Bill 
Davis, Fox Hall; Mary Boone, 

Dover Diamonds and Karen 

Brown, Houston Cardinals. Club 

groups entered are: Kent County 

Blue Hens, Dance Routine; West- 

ville, instrumental; Whiteoaks, 

pantomine; Oak Grove, skit; Har- 

rington Sunshine, son act; Farm- 

ington, vocal trio; Westville, in- 

strumental duet; Whiteoaks, vocal 

group; Kent Light Horse, playlet. 

Other entries are expected to ar- 
rive this week.   

Oak Grove Blue Hens invited 

parents to a dessert meeting this 

past week. Mary Grampp, presi- 

dent conducted the evening do- 
ings. Fred Stites repeated his 

public speaking entry, Patty 

Stites reported on the contest re- 

sults. The evening concluded with 

slides showing activities the mem- 

bers had been participating in 

during the past years. Club lead- 

ers are. Mr. and Mrs. Chris 

Grampp. 

Saturday, March 7 will find the 

State Links gathered at the Capi- 

tol Grange for a covered dish 

supper starting at 6:30 p.m. 4- 

H’ers will join the group at 8 p.m. 

for a state wide square dance. - 

George Grampp and his family 

of Oak Grove are becoming very 

interested in the birdlife around 

their new home. George carries 

the “Know Your Bird” project 

and is learning to identify many 

Delaware birds. This is a project 

any 4-H’er can carry. All yards 

can include a bird feeder and 

learning to understand our wild- 

life is to appreciate the beauty of 

nature. The Delaware Fish and 

Game cooperates with 4-H on this 
project. 
  

New Wheat 
Standards Mean 
Better Markets 

Secretary of Agriculture Or- 

ville L. Freeman sald recently 

the U. S. Department of Agricul- 

ture will modernize official U. S. 

standards for grades of wheat as 

an important step to increasing 

dollar sales of wheat in overseas 
markets. 

The new standards become ef- 

fective June 1. Secretary Free- 

man said they will: 

—Improve the competitive po- 
sition of U. S. wheat in world 
markets. 

—Help combat increasingly re- 

strictive trade policies in some 

areas, particularly the Common 

Market. 

—Enable the Commodity Credit 

Corporation to better guarantee 

  

  

kindly understanding, 

  

IMPRESSIVE 

Impressive service, with considerate and 

that is committed to our care. 

marks every service 

  

with the University of Delaware,| Funeral services were held at} 

stated. = Advertising, banking, |the Fleischauer Funeral Home (0 ] 3 : > uneral 
equipment and packaging com-| Sunday afternoon. Homes 

: MILFORD FELTON J I OC JN BR [4a J CC : on 422-8091 “— SH’ > 284-4548 

Felton, Delaware 

SIMPLER 
Lumber & Coal Co. 

“Anything to Build Everything” 
284-4554 

  

  

RANDALL H. KNOX, Sr. 

Sales Associate 

Frederica—Phone 335-5696 
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ARNOLD B. GILSTAD 
HARRINGTON, Del. 
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ERNEST R 

INSURANC 
AUGHLEY 
E AGENCY 

Complete Service For Your 

[Insurance Needs 
Harrington, Del. Phone 398-3551 

  

                        

  

          

  

the quality of grain owned by | the improvements in marketing 
the public. 

—Provide substantial taxpayer 

savings in the export subsidy pro- 
gram. 

—Strengthen the price of wheat 

for the farmer who grows quality 
wheat. 

In general, the new standards— 
based on narrower ranges of tol- 

erance for each grade—will mean 

less foreign matter and dockage 

rin American wheat than in the 

  

past. Quality factors of weight, 

soundness and cleanliness can be 

more readily and more precisely 

measured today than in the past. 

Current standards have too great 

a tolerance within grades to pro- 

vide a reliable basis for judging 

soundness or cleanliness. 

Secretary Freeman noted that 

the changes in grade standards 

vere made only after conferences 

with wheat industry representa- 

tives, a study of competitive con- 

ditions in world markets by a! 

joint government-iindustry team, 

and four public hearings around 

the country. 

The standards by which the 

quality of wheat is measured are 

established by the U.S. Depart- | 

ment of Agriculture. The original 

standards for wheat were estab- 

lished in 1917. The last previous 

revision was made in 1957. 

Over the years, better equip- 

ment and better methods have 

allowed farmers to improve the 

cleanliness of U. S. wheat deliv- 

ered at country points and re- 

ceived at terminal markets. But 

complaints that the standards 

have failed to keep pace with 

practices have been increasing. 

‘Repeated suggestions in recent 

years of the need for improve- 

ment in grade standards led to a 

series of conferences with the 

| Department of Agriculture, wheat 

producer, trade, and processor 

‘groups and organizations. The 

conferences led to the drafting by 
'U.S.D.A. of a series of proposals 

for improvement of the standards. 

| The new standards will go into 

effect June 1, 1964—allowing the 

90-days notice that is required af- 

| ter publication in the “Federal 
Register.” 

  

  

Mrs. George B. Vincent 
| Mrs. Jane F. Vincent, 59, Far- 

| mington, wife of George B. Vin- 

cent, died Saturday night in Mil- 

ford Memorial Hospital. 
| A widely known 4-H Club lead- 

er, Mrs. Vincent was a member 

of the 9th District Democratic 

| Women’s Club and the Farming- 

‘ton Volunteer Fire Company, 

| Auxiliary. 

In addition to her husband, she 

is survived by seven children, 

George W. of Harrington, Donald 

B. of Pocomoke City, Md., Ray- 

‘mond F. of Greenwood and Janet, 

James, Helen Ann and Kenneth 

Vincent ,all at home; two broth- 

ers, Roland Faulkner, of Kenton 

and Conrad Faulkner, of Wilm- 

ington; two sisters, Mrs. Carey 

Faulkner and Mrs. Samuel Lisa- 

koff, both of Wilmington, and five 
grandchildren. 

Service were held Wednesday 

afternoon at the J. Millard Cooper 

Funeral Home, Harrington. 

  

  

      

   
   
   
   
    
   
   
       

   

      

  

   

          

    

  

   

      

* Prompt re- 

pairs save 

money, too. 

* All work is. 

guaranteed. 

* And we use 

only top qual- 

ity parts! 

398-3700 
Northbound   

Bumper to bumper, over and under, we check 

your car thoroughly and right what’s wrong. 

Then, we check again to make double-sure! 

FRY’S AMERICAN 
Harrington, Del. 

Lane U. S. 13 

  

minum finish preve 

measurements). 

For Galvanized 

Garbage Gan 

(No. 1320) 

  

  
    
     
Only $2.65 For No. 1 
Rural Mail Box 
Made of durable steel. Alu- 

1814” X 614” X 714” (inside 

  

25” high. 1714” diameter. 
Sturdy and durable. Gives 
long, ‘rust-free service, 

  

  

    

All 
7 

  

   

(No. UTB-4) 

nts rust. 

  

  

® Only $4.65 For 
: 50 Ft. Burst-Proof 

e 1/2 Inch Hose 
@ This plastic hose is reinforced 

with tire-cord. Extra strong 
and tough. Non-kinking, 

® (No. PLT-5314) 

3-DAY SPECIAL! 
Friday, Saturday, Monday Only 

Unico Shovel 
A great buy. Rugged and 
durable for heavy work. 
Long 48” handle. Quality 
high-carbon steel, heat- 
treated for extra 
strength. Rolled shoul- 
ders. Hardwood handle. 

  

Frees 

Regularly $2. 

SPECIAL 

$1.79 

Only $1.50 
For 3/4 Pint 
“‘Rainbow’’ Pump Oiler 
Just press thumb trigger. 
Precision mechanism sends 
forth uniform, measured 
stream of lubrication. 

‘“Frozen’’ Parts 
Automatically 
—0Only $1.21 Pt. 
Liquid Wrench frees metal 
parts “frozen” by rust, corro- 
sion, scale, paint, varnish and 
gum. Just squirt it on, 
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See Your Southern States Agency Now! 
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SPORT 
KEITH 8. BURGESS — Sports Editor 

3 y , thi ’s state meet at the Uni- 

Louis Starkey Wl de Deleware Bonniwell 

No. 1 Grappler 

         

  

THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL, HARRINGTON, DELAWARE 

|Harrington Downs 
Greenwood In 
Finale, 65-60 

Harrington High ended" its 

basketball season in the same 

'manner that it started—with a 
| victory. The Lions defeated 
Greenwood 65-60 after losing to 

the same team the night before. 

The victory enabled the locals to 

climb out of the cellar and dead- 

lock Delmar for fifth place in the 

   

   
   

   
    

      

   

      

     

  

   

  

  

‘had to wrestle at St. Andrews and 

In Mat Tourney 
| finish first, second or third. In 

| this tourney last year the local 

Louis Starkey and Jim Cain, of 

-the Harrington High wrestling 

team won individual champion- 

ships and Starkey was voted the 

Most Outstanding Wrestler award 

in the third annual Delaware In- 

dependent Wrestling Tournament 

held at St. Andrew’s School, Mid- 

dletown, Friday and Saturday. 

Downstate schools made an im- 

pressive showing as 
Millsboro, Dover Air and Harring- 
ton, all Helopen Conference 

Delmar, | boro, to enter the 

| boy won the 120 pound division. 

‘To further complicate matters he 

came up with blood poisoning in 

lan arm in addition to the sore 

‘knees. Anyone with less courage 

land determination would be in 

‘bed but Bonniwell was third in 
the state meet in 1963 and wants 

another crack at Delaware’s best. 

| He decisioned Jerry Campbell, 

| Delmar and Allen Hudson, Mills- 
final round 

against the powerful Warren Hof- 

' fecker, of St. Andrews. Hoffecker 

schools, won six titles out of 12 has pinned the Blue Hen Confer- 

in competition with six upstate 

schools. 

Harrington had only ten wrest- | 
lers but brought home five medals 

as Cain and Starkey took top hon-| 

ors in the 120 and 180 poun 

(127) captured second places. Da 

Adams (103) finished third as he 

won three out of four matches, 

losing only to the division win- 

ner, Alibie Forwood of A. L Du- | 

Pont. Forweod, an experienced 

gripster, was 95 pound champion 

last year. 

Bonniwell and Greenly were 

beaten in the final round as Frank 

Glazier’s Lions surprised by 

qualifying four wrestlers for the 

finals. 

~ Starkey pinned Artuner, of 

Sanford Prep, for the second 

year in a row, as he started his 

march to the coveted “Most Out- 

standing” award. Lou then took 
< on the most superbly built wrest- 

ler in the hall, in the person of 
Paul Camp, of A. I. DuPont. 

Camp had about ten pounds on 
Starkey, who should be wrestling 
in the 165 pound class instead of 

180. The huge upstater was sec- 

ond in the state championships 

last year. The pair fenced for the 

first two minute round, without 

goining to the mat. Starkey lost 

the toss of the coin and started 

the second round on the bottom. 

"He “come from there” as thel 
saying goes and reversed his ri- | 

val for a 2-0 lead. The Lion held! 
Camp down for the rest of round 

two and more than half of the 

final wound before Camp turned 
the tables to tie the score at 2-2. 
In overtime Starkey again lost the 
toss of the coin and had to start 

underneath. Again he reversed 

Camp for a 2-0 lead. Camp escap- 

ed from Starkey for one point 

with second left but the damage 

was done and the second-seeded 

~ Wilmington lad was beaten 2-1 by 

the third-seeded farm boy. 

Against topseeded Angus Davis, 

of the host St. Andrew’s team, 

Starkey played it close to the 

vest and took a 5-1 verdiet. Louis’ 
~ record for this season now shows 

14 victories and no defeats at 180 

pounds and one loss to Gary Yan- 

ta, of Delmar, at 165 pounds. 

Yanta, who was pinned twice by 

Starkey, has since left Delaware. 

At 165 pounds Starkey would be 

a cinch for state champion honors. 

At 180 he has a fair chance but 

will give away up to 12 pounds 

per match. 

Jim Cain pinned Cajmar, of 

Sanford Prep, decisioned Rocky 

Klotz, of Millsboro, and then out- 

pointed Carl Carroll, of Dover 

Air 4-0 to reach the finals. In the 

Henlopen tourney at at Delmar 

Carroll pushed Cain to the limit 

‘before yielding on a referees’ de- 

cision. 

In the finals the second-seeded 

Harrington lad faced Barry Sab- 

loff, of St. Andrews, who had up- 

set top-seeded Dick Rathmell, of 

A. I. DuPont. Sabloff took Cain 

down for a 2-0 lead but Jim re- 
versed him to tie things up just 

before the buzzer. Cain lost the 
- toss 10 start round two but re- 

versed Sabloff again for a 4-2 

lead and maintained control of 

the red-clad grappler for the rest 

of the test. Cain has won more 

than 20 matches this season, while 

losing only two. Both of these 

losses were in December before 

Jim hit his stride. He now has a 

string of 17 straight victories and 

has won titles in three tourna- 

ments. 

- Dave Greenly has won 15 of 17 

bouts. Like Cain he is a sopho- 

more and has three years in 

which to grab off a state cham- 

pionship. Both could make it in 

that time as they work hard and 

never give up. 

Greenly opened his tourney 

activity by pinning Trumbo, of 

Dover Air, and then handed out 

more of the same to Klank, of 

Sanford Prep. Karpinski, of A. 1. 

DuPont was the next victim 

bending the knee 3-2 in overtime. 

In the finals Saturday night, 

David dropped a decision to Mar- 

shall Schell, of Tatnall. 

George Bonniwell’s last two or 

three weeks have been periods of 

frustration for the hardy 127 

pounder. George opened his sea- 

son with 12 straight victories but 

injured both his knees in separate 

accidents and was held to a draw 

at Easton. In order to qualify for 

ence champion, George DeShields, 

of De La Warr this season and 

appears to be the man to beat for 

No. 1 in Delaware. Hofecker had 

plenty of trouble with the sore 

q | Bonniwell and held only a 4-3. 
s | - . . . 3 

classes, respectively. Dave Green- | lead until a reverse in the last 

1 95 d George Bonniwell i 
Yo) an y 6-3. If the Harringtonian can re- 

| cover from his ailments in the 

five seconds widened the gap to 

next two weeks, we may see an 

upset in the state title test. 

Dan Adams, 

lost to champion Forwood, then 

School and took a 6-5 verdict over 

third-seeded Bill Schawn, of Dov- 

er Air. 

Upwards of fifty Harrington- 

ians raised the roof wenh the an- 

nouncer stated that Starkey had 

won the big trophy, for the local 
fans felt that an upstater, any 

upstater, would grab the prize. 
The Lions have developed sev- 

eral outstanding wrestlers the 

past three years and can be proud 

of the five boys, who have quali- 

fied for the state meet. Facilities 

for wrestling are limited at H.H.S. 

At St. Andrew’s the Lions saw 

five or six wall-to-wall wrestling 

rooms. Said a local boy, “Gee, 

they’ve got better mats on the 

walls than our mats at home. 

Felton Edges 
Rebels In Doubl= 
Overtime, 60-58 

The Green Devils, of Felton 

High survived a king-sized scare 

are Selbyville Tuesday night and 

finished their regular season un- 

defeated. The Devils will play the 

Eastern Division titlists from 

Lord Baltimore for the conference 

championship at John M. Clayton, 

Dagsboro on Friday night. 

The Rebels kept the pressure on 

  

from behind on Dave Wood's 

field goal to send the game into 
overtime. Selbyville also scored 

first in both of the overtime peri- 

ods to keep the eventual victors 

scrambling all night. Wood drop- 

ped two foul shots for the victory 

margin. 
Basketball fans in this lower 

Kent County area look for Felton 

to bounce back against Lord Bal- 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

only newcomer 

[in the Lion medal-winning quin- 
| tet, pinned Maloney of Delmar, 

Felton as the Devils had to come! 

Bonniwell, David Greenly and 

Glazier, coach. Price Photo. 

Felton Wallops 
Delmar, 78-43 

Felton drew closer to an un- 

defeated season by crushing Del- 

mar 78-43 for win No. 15. Only 

bar the way to a clean sweep. 

The game with the latter team 

will be for the Henlopen Confer- 

ence championship and will be 

| played tonight at John M. Clay- 

ton School at Dagsboro. 

Jim Blades led the Green De- 

vils against Delmar with 25 

points. Dave Wood, Bill Barr and 

| decisioned Freeman of Friends | pi} Green combined for 33 more 

      
  

  

tallies. 

FELTON GG. F P 

Blades «= 1 3.25 

Wood 5 1 11 

Barr 5 j Se 1 | 

Green’ aul 4 3 11 

Réible lini 2 3 7 

Todlew i... 1 4 6 

Clark inl 1 1 

Wyatt 1 0 2 

McClellan. 0. 1 1 3 

Noculiy: Lin 0 1 1 
30°13 '78 

DELMAR G F P 

Elliott: © an 2 0 4 

Mullen... oh an 1 1 3 

Powell bisa ad 2 7 11 

Sehmann: =e 0 bu 7 1 15 

Creep =n. =. 00 vo 2 0 4 

Highlander ........._. 2 0 4 
17 9 43 

Felton = 15 26 19 18—78 

Delmar ..._.. 8 4 12 19—43 

Greenwood Beats 
Harrington, 62-52   

In the first of two games on 

| successive nights between the 
.two clubs, Greenwood capitaliz- 

ed on accurate foul shooting to 

defeat Harrington at Greenwood 

on Monday night. The Lions had 

a 21-19 edge in field goals. 

Greenwood outscored the locals 

lin each of the first three periods 

and were nosed 16-15 in the final 

stanza. The Foresters needed one 

more point by Duane Anthony to 

put all five starters in double 

figures as Drew Clendaniel had 

116, Dave Henry 14, Buell Schulze 

12, and Julian Woodall 11. 

Glenn Smith and Bill Adams 

split 22 points right down the 

middle for Harrington. 

      
  

  

  

  

  

  
MEDAL WINNERS in the Delaware Independent Wrestling 

Tournament. (L. to R.): Louis Starkey, Jim Cain, Geo:ge 

Dan Adams. Back row, Fiank | 

Selbyville and Lord Baltimore’ 

  

| Felton Sports 
Banquet Tomorrow 

Edward F. Maley, line coach at 

the University of Delaware, will 

| be the guest speaker at the Feél- 

|ton High School annual Athletic 
| Award Banquet this Saturday 

| evening. More than a hundred 
| students and adults will attend 
the dinner to be held at the 

Treadway Inn to honor Felton 

athletes. 

Awards will be presented to 

both boys and girls on fall and 

winter sports teams as well as to 

cheerleaders. 

The Henlopen Conference wes- 

tern division trophy for boys’ 

basketball will be presented by 

Sidney B. Collison, vice-president 

of the Conference. The Green 

Devils are undefeated this year 

and will meet Lord Baltimc.e for 

the Conference title tonight at 

John M. Clayton school. Felton 
fans are hoping for a victory and 

an undefeated season. 

SABIN VACCINE 

{Continued irom Page 1) 

  

State Board of Health Office, 

800 West St.; and Academy of 

Medicine, 1925 Lovering Ave. 

SUSSEX COUNTY — Milford 

Fire Hall, Georgetown Fire 

Hall, Lewes Fire Hall, and Sea- 

ford Fire Hall. 3 

“The response to the polio 

immunization program earlier 

this winter indicated that many 

Delawareans, perhaps as much 

as half of the population, still 

have not received the Sabin 
vaccine,” Dr. Stroud said. “In 
contrast to Philadelphia in 

which clinic attendance dropped 

off after the d{irst clinic, the 

numbers of persons attending 

Delaware clinics increased with 

each successive immunization. 

“This indicates to the Medical 

Society the desire on the part of 

many citizens to take advantage 

of this opportunity for protect- 

ion of themselves and their fam- 

ilies. It also indicates that 

thousands of persons have had 

part but not all of the doses in 
the series.” 

He emphasized that all threes 

types are necessary for com- 

plete protection. 

TELEPHONE CO. 

(Continued from Page 1) 

telephones, bell chimes, and 
home interphones. Residence 

extensions now number 60,300 

and 789% of residence service 
is on an individual line basis. 

The company’s payroll for 

1963 amounted to $8,925,000, the 

president notes. In addition, the 

Diamond State Company and 

its supplier, the Western Elec- 

tric Company, purchased $3 mil- 
lion worth of materials, prod- 

ucts and services from 850 Del- 

aware firms and individuals. 

The number. of telephones in 

service in Delaware increased 

by 11,900 in 1963 to the year- 
end total of 249,866. The daily 

  

average of calls originated: by 

Delaware customers rose by 
44.000 to an average of 1,053,000 

calls a day. 

In 26 of Delaware's 43 cen- 

tral offices, the number of cus- 

tomers on multi-party lines is 

now limited to four and the 

same improvement will be ef- 

fective throughout the state by 

mid-1965. This three $1 mil- 

lion program was jointly con- 

ceived by The Public Service 

Commission and The Diamond 

  

Western Division of the Henlopen 

Conference. Each club finished 

with records of three victories 

and thirteen defeats. 

Harrington took a 33-22 half- 

time lead. The Foresters out- 

scored the Lions 38-33 in the sec- 
ond half to draw within five 

points at the final gun. : 

Bill Adams racked up 22 

points in his final game in Blue 

and Gold livery. Barry Fry tal- 

lied 18 though playing on a bad 

ankle. Jose Torres and Wayne 

Collison added 10 and 8 points re- 

spectively. Fry, Torres and Colli- 

son wound up their scholastic 

cage careers, too. 

| 
| handled the Lions since Coach 

Bill Smith was confined to his 

home by illness. , 

Dave Henry, Duane Anthony, 

and Julian Woodall led the For- 

esters with 17, 16 and 14 points, 

  

  

  

  

  

  

respectively. Woodall had sev- 

eral baskets from outside. 

GREENWOOD G F P 

Henry 5 ng 

Breeding ............... 0 4 4 

Clendaniel > 1 2 4 

Anthony .-......... 4 8:18 

Woodall... 0... i. 7 0 14 

Schulze 0... l.. 1 3 5 

18°24." 60 

HARRINGTON G F P 

Adams 8 6 22 
Fry-. 7 4 18 

Black ed 0 2 

Collison =... i x 3: 2 8 

Smith 2 1 5 

Torres 5 0: 310 

26. 13 . 65 

Greenwood 11: 11 (20 18—60 

Harrington 17 15 18 15—65 

Col. A. W. Adams 
Gets Guard Post 

Three of the Delaware Army 

National Guard’s top officers ex- 

changed jobs and 11 units re- 

ceived new commanders in a ser- 

ies of officer reassignments ef- 

fective Sunday. 

The reassignments are part of 

the Guard’s new career develop- 

ment plan for officers. Under it, 

each officer is given an opportuni- 

ty to command at various points 

in his advancement through the 

commissioned ranks, as well as to 

perform in a variety of staff 

assignments. 

In the top level shifts, Col. 

Albert W. Adams, of Harrington, 

becomes commander of the 160th 

Artillery Group, Dover, in place 

of Col. Kenneth C. Madden. 

Col. Madden, who lives in Sea- 

ford, become executive officer of 

the 261st Artillery Brigade, Wil- 

mington, replacing Col. Jerome D. 

Niles, Jr., of Middletown. 

Col. Niles becomes the new 

chief of the Air Defense Tactical 

Operations Section of the Bri- 

gade, the post previously held by 

Col. Adams. 

In civilian life, all three offi- 

(cers are in the educational field. 

Col. Madden is superintendent of 

schools for the Seaford Special 

School District; Col. Adams is 

superintendent of schools for the 

Harrington Special School Dis- 

trict, and Col. Niles is in the pub- 

lic health education division of 

the United State Public Health 
Service. 

New unit 

  

commanders and 

  

  

  

Webb’s Ford & 
Mercury, Inc. 

Milford, Delaware 

Phone 422-8071 

  

A Safe Place to Buy 

NEW and USED 

Cars ard Trucks 
  

Delaware’s ONLY Ford & 

Mercury dealer, has on hand, 
at all time, at least 100 New & 

Used Cars to choose from. All 

  

  

    
        {    
     

  

timore Friday night and bring Han INGTON Jy 2 > 

the league title to the Western Fry 4 1 9 

Division for the first time. Garey 1 0 9 

Bill Green was high scorer at! Brack 3 3 9 

Selbyville Tuesday night with 20 | Collis on Te i ae 3 0 8 

points. Wood had 14 and Jim!|mp oo a 9 0 4 
Blades contributed 11. SMR. ae 4 3% 11 

FELTON GC EF  .P 21 10 52 

Blades 3 5 I1l\GREENWOOD Gg rr 
Wood 6 2 14 Henry 4 6 14 

Barr 38 Melendoniel ocho aig 16 
Green 8 4 20 Anthony: + 2 5 9 

Ludlow Bi i SE 0 0 0 | Schulze HA ANE 5 2. 12 

Reible 2 ne 6 Woodall... i. 4 3-11 
22:16 60 19 24 62 

yur G F Plyarington 6 15 15 16—52 
nt ; 2 7: Greenwood 11 17 19 15—62 

ee 6 3 15] HENLOPEN CONFERENCE 
Bunting... 0... 2 } 5 STANDINGS 

Mumford...) .~ 0 0 0 
Westie io sii ro 6 2 14| Official Henlopen Conference 

22 14 58! Basketball Standings as of March 

2, 1964. 
Felton... 17- 9-11-13-2-8—60 
Selbyville .._ 12-11- 8-19-2-6—58 EASTERN DIVISION 

mm ————— BOYS Ww L 

John M. Clayton ...._... 12 4 

Jaycees End Lord Baltimore _.._... 12 4 

= Selbyville ". .. . .... 7 8 12-3 Cage Season  |Sclbvvill Sie 
Jim Hawpe’s junior varsity |Milton - 6 10 

basketball team ended their sea-|Rehoboth 6 10 
son with a 27-23 victory over 

Greenwod at Harrington. The i ri > L 

Lions won twelve games and lost Lord Baltimore sel 1 4 

three this winter. Sclbyville oo... 9 4 

Against Greenwood, Harring- John M. Clayton HR ” 3 

ton reserves played most of the Milion.. = +. & 4 11 

last period. Sam Knox led the Rehoboth 1 13 

way {to victory with 15 pointe" "7 7 1 BW 

Ellis Myer, Marshall Hatfield and WESTERN DIVISION 

Dean Manges threw up a defen-| BOYS Ww L 
sive screen that Greenwood found |*Felton 15 0 

almost impenetrable. Bridgeville 2... 11 4 

John Greenhaugh and Xnox|Dover Air Force 9 6 

were the leading scorers for the {Greenwood ___ 3 1) 

season. The first six players are’ Delmar 3 13 
sophomores and will probably be | Harrington 2 12 

on the varsity in 1965. GIRLS w L 

SCORING G F Pi*Delmar::.. on 0 11 4 

Greenhaugh 63. 29 155 Bridgeville 2... 8 6 

Knox 60 29 149 Dover Air Force 8 6 

Hatfield oe: 00: 0 40 +23 103 Harrington... 0 on 5 8 

Myer 35 12.82 Felton 4 10 
(Manges... J. wu. 2%.::12 66: Greenwood. Lf. 2 11 
Motter -........... ... 10 5 25 *Divisional champions 

  

State Company. financing done through - Low- 
Low - Bank Rates — We also 

7 NT have one of the best equipped 

KCEA CONVENTION Service Departments and Body 

(Continued from Page One) Repair Shops on the Eastern 

tion. Mrs. Blanchard, president of Shore. 
NEA during 1961-62 was a guest 

of the organization during Ameri- Specializing in 
can Education Week. 

The youth of our country are 

our most important resource and 

it is the aim of the KCEA to see 

that this resource is developed to 

the fullest. What we make of our 

youth today is’ what America will 
be tomorrow. : 

Bear Front End Alignment 

with all New Equipment 
  

Open Nightly until 9 P.M. 

Closed Sunday 

Webb’s Ford 
& Mercury Inc. 

Milford, Del. 

  

BE WISE — ADVERTISE 

SHOP AND SWAP       IN THE WANT ADS         

Richard Black and Glen Smith 

are the main holdovers for 1965. perience and better prepare them 

Jim Hawpe and Frank Glazier | for promotion and duty in higher 
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their units are: : 
Capt. Irvin ‘H. ‘Carty; Jr., Hg. 

and Hq. Detachment, Wilmington; 

1st Lt. Charles D. Cartwright, 

Hq. and Hq. Btry, 1st AW Bn, 

198th Artillery, Greater Wilm- 

ington Airport; Capt. Donn De- 

vine, Btry D, 1st AW Bn., 198th 

Artillery, Greater Wilmington 

Airport; Capt. Earle E. Worthing- 

ton, Hq. and Hq. Btry. 2nd AW 

Bn., 198th Artillery, Milford; 

Capt. James E. Turner, Jr., Btry 

A, 2nd AW Bn., 198th Artillery, 

Dover. 

Also Capt. Richard W. Searles, 

Hq. and Hq. Battery; Capt. Edwin 

D. Vale, Btry C; and Capt. Eugene 

E. Miklasiewicz, Btry D, all of 

the 4th AW Bn., 198th Artillery, 

Greater Wilmington Airport and 

Smyrna; Capt. O. E. Trivits, 101st 

Public Information Det., Wilming- 

ton; Capt. Layton E. Timmons, 

1049 Transportation Co. (Army 

Aircraft Heavy Maintenace and 
Supply), Greaer Wilmington Air- 

port; and 2nd Lt. William T. Ash, 

6th Det. (Aerial Target), 198th 

Artillery, Lewes. 

Along with the changes in 

commanders, 39 other captains 

and lieutenants received new as- | 

signments to broaden their ex- 

level command or staff positions. 

COUNCILMEN 

(Continued from Page 1) 

  

to a complaint, but would not 

make a general patrol of a com- 

munity. Under state law, dogs 

are supposed to be confined, or 

under immediate control of the 

owner, from March to September. 

Chief of Police David Peter- 

son suggested trading in the 

police car. Vice Mayor Hitchens 

suggested the matter be brought 

up at the April meeting. 

FERRY CONTRACTS 
(Continued from Page X) 

to a representative of Parsons, 
Brinckerhoff, Quade and Doug- 

las. 

Other bids for Cape May 

work ran as follows: Carl E. 

Widell and Son, Cherry Hill, N. 
J., $767,400.00; Rudolf Mickel and 

Sons, Inc, Vineland, N. J, 

$797,728.20; Buckley and Co, 

Inc., Philadelphia, $822,433.50; 

Ole Hansen and Sons, Co., Fleas- 

antville, N. J. $836,796.70; John 
D. Lawrence, Inc., Westville, N. 

J., $845,244.08 and Edward H. 

. Ellis and Sons Co., Inc., Cherry 

Hill, N. J., $851,723.40. 

There were four bidders on 

parent low bid going to New- 

ark Construction Co. at $284,- 
099.00. The consulting engin- 

eers’ estimate was $249,000.00. 

Other bids were Seaford 

Construction Co., Seaford, Del., 

$288,896.18; Delaware Roads Co.,   
and Sons, Inc., Vineland, N. J. 

| $308,810.30. 
| In the absence of Director | 
William J. Miller, Jr., bids were 2 

| opened by Bridge General Man- 

l ager Frank J. Horty, assisted by 

J. C. Whiteman of the engin- 

eering firm. No contracts will 

be awarded until they are stud- 

ied further by Miller and his 

staff, it was announced. 

DOVER DIST. WSCS 
(Continued from Page 1) 

  

sula Conference on the boards of: 

Ministerial Training and Qualifi- 

cation and of Christian Social 

Concerns.   
Mrs. Sigurd S. Swenssen, minis- 
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« DELAWARE 
  

Weeknights 2 shows starting at 7 P.M. 

Sat. cont. from 2 P.M. — Sun. 2 & 8:15 P.M. 

  

        

NOW thru. TUES, 

Special matinee Friday at 2:00 P.M. 

MARCH 10th. 

        

  

  

  

  

WALT DISNEYS 3 
NEWEST ANG MOST HILARIOUS ALL-CARTOON FEATURE pA ; 

- ( 1S 
of @ i n Be add mart 7 Fo focal 
FY a Ls Ng Tl aie SET BLE SN 

TECHNICOLOR® ©1953 Walt Disney Productions.» dn ne if 

WED. MARCH 11th. thru. SAT.,, MARCH 14th. 

a COLUMBIA PICTURES presents 

‘Jello |emmon, 2 
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the Lewes work, with the ap-| 

Mt. Pleasant, Middletown, Del., | 

$297,239.90 and Rudolf Mickel | 

service. Mr. Keene 1s the writer |g 
of “Think It Over”, a spiritual 

reading for the Journal Every !§ 
Evening. He serves in the Penin- |g 
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ter of music, at the Mt. Olivet oh 

Church, will be guest soloist; Mrs, 

Ralph Lewis, St. John’s Church, 

Seaford, will be at the organ. 

Everyone is invited to come and 

spend time together in prayer 

and meditation for the purpose of 

having their spiritual life streng- 
thened. The program theme: Our 

Spiritual Need for Today, was 

planned by the Committee on 

Program with Mrs. Donald Shel- 

er, District vice president, as 
chairman. 

BIRTHS 
BEEBE HOSPITAL, LEWES 

Feb. 25: 

Georgetown, a girl, Linda Marie. 
Feb. 28: 

Mr. and Mrs." Ward D. Murray, 

of Selbyville, a girl, Barbara 

Ann. 

  

  

. Cleaninz Hints 

Send for your FREE | 

spotting guide and car- = 

pet care booklet." 

Write to HALLETT'S, 

P. 0. Box 24, 

5 Dover, Del. 
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WANTED 
MUSKRATS up to $2.00 
BLACK RATS 25¢ extra 
GINSENG up to $23. per 

ib. 
Highest Prices all other furs 

PROMPT PAYMENT 
LIBERAL GRADING 

Write for free copper trap 
tags 

SHIP TO 

SINGER 
FUR COMPANY 
Peelskill, New York 

Est. 1889 

  
‘DRIVE TO’ | YOUR BIG THEATRE   

  

  

Roofers — Painters — Tile & 

Carpet Layers — Carpenters — : 

All Rushing to Complete the § 

Renovation of Movie Center in 

time to usher in the New Spring § 

Festival of Coming Hits, 

  

And Look at this — Get Ready to 

Bring the Family 

| THURSDAY - FRIDAY - SATUR- 

DAY, MARCH 5 - 6 - 7 

{ 

  

    

  

  

Walt Disney. 

YELLOWSTONE 
i i y gol 

    
| — plus — 

| 

 @slessed by BUENA VISTA Distribution Co., tnc. ©1963 Walt Disney Produz.ees 

Regular Prices — All Children     

Must Pay This Show Only. 

  

    
      

    
            
    

i. We print forms for 
»t every business need 

Le? us design and print te 

perfection the forms that will 

suit your business to a ¥. On 

anything from a label to @ 

letterhead, get our sugges 

tions and estimates, 

   

The Harrington Journal 
PHONE 398 - 3206 

OF I 0 OOOO OAR BEEP 2 OC Ed Ga GO 0 OE OR 

i 

SUNDAY, MARCH 8 

Ome Day Only 

JERRY LEWIS] 
FAB-U-LEWIS fun 
for the whole family! 

  

     
  

  
        

, fH WALL 

Regular Prices — All children 

under 12 vrs. FREE if with par- 

ents. 

Prnasion A PARAMOUNT RELEASE 
  

  

THURS.-FRI.-SAT.-SUN., 

MARCH 12 - 13 -14 -15 

COLOMBIA [: SNE” Pel [emmon, 
pests © Uneepehe [© yamgam ioe 

N yummy COLORS 

  

  

— Plus — 

Sonny Liston vs Cassius Clay 

World's Championship Fight 

Pictures       

QUR   
  

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Garris, of 
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