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Deadline For 

are: Owensby Brothers of Wil- 

mington, $36,628.90, $3,000; J. G. 

Ward & Sons, Wilmington, $38,- 

700, $1,795; Web Construction 

Co., Dover, $48,430, $1,400 and J. 
Roland Diashiell & Sons; Inc., of 

Salisbury, Md., $552,329, $2,242. 

® 

State Fair 

  

Entries Set 
The deadline for submitting en- 

tries for exhibits at the 49th 
annual State Fair is Monday. 

George CC. Simpson, general 
manfager, said the number of 

entries received so far is run- 

ning about the same as last year. 
He said he did not know how 
many were in, however. 

“We get about 80 per cent of 
them the last two days,” Simp- 

son said. “Everyone waits until 
the last minute.” 

The fair in Harrington is July 
26 to Aug. 3. 
  

Mrs. William H. Wright 

Mrs. Effie M. Wright, 82, wife 
of William H. Wright, of R.D. 3, 
Harrington, died Thursday, June 

13, at Milford Memorial Hospital. 

Besides her husband, she is 

survived by a son, Maurice W. 

Wright, Harrington; two daugh- 
ters, Mrs. Mary Taylor, Harring- 

ton and Mrs. Pauline Pierce, Wil- 

mington; a brother, Harry Tor- 

bert, Greenwood; two sisters, 
Mrs. Emma Clifton, Lewes and‘ 

Mrs. Annie Willey, Greenwood; 

12 grandchildren and 15 great | 
grandchildren. 

Mrs. Wright was a member of 
Bethel Methodist Church and its 
WISCS of Andrewwville. 

Funeral services were held on 

Sunday, June 16 from the Mec- 
Knatt Funeral Home, Harrington. 

Rev. John Taylor, pastor of 

Bethel Church officiated. Inter- 
ment was at Hollywood Ceme- 
tery, here. 

  
    

County Firemen to 

Meet at Houston | 

Kent County Firemen’s Asso- 

ciation will meet at 7:30 p.m. 
Wednesday, July 17, at Houston. 

® 

Russell “Rusty” Jack, son of 
Mr .and Mrs. Harry Jack is ex- 

pected home tomorrow on leave 

after serving a year in Vietnam. 

    

  
      

program is made possible by the 1€arly Friday morning when a 
department of Delaware Ameri- 

can Legion Auxiliary and all nec- 

essary expenses are taken care of 

through. the American Legion 

Auxiliary. Mrs. Kenneth Aiken, 
Unit No. 7 C.K.R.T. Post, Amer- 

ican Legion Awuxiliary, is the lo- 

cal representative for this pro- 

gram. The local American Legion 
auxiliary is to be commended for 
making it possible for two senior 

high school girls to have this 
worthwhile opportunity. 

® 

Mental Health 
Facilities Comply 
With Civil Rights 

All facilities of the Delaware 

department of mental health are 

operated in compliance with Title 

VI of the Civil Rights Act of 

1964 which assures the full range 

of services without discrimina- 
tion of any kind. 

This policy, it was pointed cut 

by Dr. Albert L. Ingram Jr. 

mental health commissioner, has 
been in force for several years 

and was put in writing for all 

directors, superintendents land 
staff aides in a memorandum of 
April 28, 1965. 

The memorandum states: 

“It is and will remain the pol- 
icy of the Delaware department 

of mental health, in the opera- 
tion of the several facilities un- 

der its jurisdiction, to furnish as 

available those services for the 

treatment and care of the men- 
tally ill and mentally retarded 

to any person in accord with his 
individual requirements. 

“Specifically, no person is de- 
nied such services, excluded from 

benefits ,or in any fashion dis- 
criminated against for reasons 

of race, color or national origin. 

“This policy will govern such 

additional facilities and services 
as may from time to time become 

the responsibility of the depart- 
ment.” 

Welch Reunion 

  

  

'To Be Held 
Sun., June 30th 

The 14th annual reunion of 

Jacob and Ann Killen Welch will 
be held the Sunday, June 30th, 

from 11 until 4 p.m. at Wheeler’s 
Park, Harrington. 

All descendants please try to 

come. Let's make this the big- 

gest one yet! 

‘that individuals experience? 

truck ran into it broadside. 
Mrs. Richard Baker was pro- 

ceeding southwest on Delaware 

avenue extended when it was 

struck broadside by a truck, 

driven by David Martin, entering 
the thoroughfare from Raughley 
Hill road. 

Mrs. Baker was taken to Mil- 

ford Hospital and treated for a 
broken collarbone and lacera- 

Martin was tried in Court 6, 

on a charge of operating a vehicle 
with insufficient brakes and 

fined $10 and costs. 
  

America Must 
‘Grow Up’ 

Do nations 

pains? Are the 
have growing 

problems and 
crises a nation experiences as it: 
emerges into new status in the 

world akin to the growing plains 

There is reason to believe so. 

Nations, after all, are merely a 
collection of people who, having 

left the primitive stage, have de- 

veloped a cohesiveness and some- 

what orderly sense of direction. 
Society clucks its tongue over 

the 16-year-olds who marry; be- 
fore long the husband is out with 

the boys again, racing cars and 

drinking and the young wife 

parks the first born with its 

grandparents while she enjoys 
her own childish pursuits. 

The psychologists say, “They 
just weren’t ready to accept adult 
responsibilities.” 

As nations and empires go, the 

United States is very young. His- 

torians may look back and call 

year. Wilder is presently paid’ 
$12,000. 

He said that by raising his sal- 
ary, higher salary rates could be 

set for all commission employes. 

Wilder said that at present, 

commission employes must have 
among the highest professional 

requirements of any state agen- 
cy. 

[ 

Anyone Interested 

In Our Youth 
The scheduled and publicized 

meeting of parents of the youth 

‘who attend canteen dances at St. 
Stephens church was held on 

June 20th. Raymond McCready 

whs appointed to the parents 
committee. 

The total attendance at this 

meeting was but ten persons. The 
attendance at the dance on Tues- 

    

As mentioned before, 

dances cannot be held without 
moore cooperation from parents. 

Chiaperones are needed, espe- 
cially men chaperones, in the 

summer months and should be 

at the church at 7 p.m. on the 
dance nights . 

It is suggested that the youth 

who attend the dances urge their 
parents to take their turns as in- 
formed chaperones. To become 

informed call Mrs. Richard Wil- 

these 

musical performance. 

($100), 

further inofrmation.   
cafetorium. A play, the Broad- 
way comedy “Barefoot 

Park” written by Neil Simon 
and staged by the Kent Theatre 

day, June 25th, was approximate-! Guild, will be presented in the 
1 ly 80. auditorium of the high school. 

In case of rain ,any performance 

scheduled for outdoors will be 
held in the junior high school. 

The program for the Milford 
summer arts festival is as fol- 
lows: 

July 7 7 p.m.—“Barefoot in the 

Park” Kent Theatre Guild, Mil- 
ford high school auditorium. 

July 14 4 p.m.—Cubbage Bell 

Choir of the Dover Wesley Meth- 

odist Church and clothesline art 
exhibit at Parson Thorne Man-   son. (398-8735) or Robert Hollo- 

way (398-8787) or Mrs. Thomas 
Clendening (398-3683), well in 

advance of the dance night you 

are sceduled as it is impossible 

to give this information when 

you arrive on dance night.   us a “prodigy” among nations. 

The second world war sky-rock- 
eted us into a place of world 
prominence which we have not 

yet learned to handle. We got 

“married” to world responsbility 

long before our individual and 

collective psyche was ready for 

it. 

The majority of people in the 
United States, even though many 
are reasonably well educated, 

cannot abscrb the concept of 
“world leadership.” A man can 

understand the necessity for 
feeding his family and defending 

his home, but in the simple life 

feeding his family was shooting 

a squirrel or battling troops on 

yonder hill who were lobbing 

shots on to his roof. 

Broadening that perimeter of 
(Continued on Page 5) 

  

Rouse Makes 
Dean’s ' List 
At U. of D. 

Robert Rouse, son of Mrs. Elsie 

Rouse ,who is in his third year 
of college at the University of 

Delaware, has again been placed i 

on the Dean’s list. Robert is ma- 
joring in agricultural business. 
During the past year he has also 

acted: as counselor in his dormi- 
tory. 

On July 6, he will begin a six- 
week R.O.T.C. training at Indian- 
town Gap, Pa. 

Rouse will attend an agricul- 
tural meeting in Nebraska, Sept. 

1. After that, he and friends will 

motor tour through Wyoming.     y A 

sion. 

July 21, 4 pm.—“Enter the 
Young” contemporary music 

quartet at the Parson Thorne 
Mansion. 

July 28, 4 pm.—Two classic 

film comedies at the junior high. 

August 4, 4 p.m.—Two classic 

film comedies at the junior high. 

August 11, 4 pm.—Kent Com- 
munity Orchestra concert and 
operatic favorites, Leon Donovan, 

baritone, Ruth Gardner, piano, at 
the junior high. 

August 18, 4 p.m.—Dover Ba- 
roqeu Ensemble and Jazz Trio at 
the junior high. 

August 25, 4 p.m.—“Sing Out 
Delaware” the Up With People 

chorus from Wilmington at the 
Parson Thorne Mansion. 

Check your local newspaper 

each week for more detailed 
information and to be certain of 

the time and place of each event. 
Announcements will also be giv- 
en on local radio stations . 

The Milford summer arts fes- 

tival is a first for Delaware—   come and bring your friends. 
hes 

of these events will combine a 

clothesline art exhibit with the 

. Letters have been mailed to a 

great number of artists in New 
York, Virginia, Philadelphia and 

Baltimore as well as nearby 

areas inviting them to partici- 
pate in the art exhibit. There 

will be prizes awarded to first 

second ($50), and third 
($25) place winners in the show 
as well as ribbons in the usual 

. categories. Any artist who has 
not received a letter and is in- 

terested in exhibiting may con- 
tact Catherine Acko at Evergreen 

Lane in Milford or 422-9265 for 

The other events, with one ex- 

ception, will be held in the air 

conditioned junior high school 

in the 

bonds up to $3.5 million to pay 
the bonuses. 

The commission will accept 
written requests for applications 
for the bonuses at its office at 
1224 King st, Wilmington. The 
application forms are expected 
to be ready in a few days. 

Walter Elterrich of Smyrna! 
has been named the commission 
chairman by Terry. At its meet- 
ing Tuesday, the commission 
named Leon deValinger its sec- 
retary. 

DeVialinger also Serves as ex- | 
ecutive director. Thomas Brand 
of Wilmington was named depu- 
ty executive director and acting 
secretary. 

It was also announced that the 
commission plans to open offi- 
ces in Georgetown and Dover in 
the near future. 

  

Leg. Hall Again 

Open to Public 
Legislative Hall is once again 

open to the public on weekends 
and holidays, Samuel L. Shipley, 
director, Delaware State Devel- 
opment, announced today. Con- 
tinuing from now through Sep- 
tember, the Capitol building will 
be open 10 am.-4 p.m. Saturdays 
and holidays, and 12-4 p.m. on 
Sundays. 

The reason for this opening is 
to allow residents of the “First 
State,” as well as tourists, to visit 
the seat of government and ob- 
tain travel information. For many 
families and visitors this will be 
the first opportunity to tour Leg- 
islative Hall outside of regular 
hours. 

The Development Department, 
through a special appropriation 
by the Legislature, will staff 
Legislative Hall with two guides 
to greet and escort visitors thru 
the building. The guides will also 
provide the public with highway 
maps and literature directing 
them to other historical and rec- 
reational facilities in Delaware. 

Included in the tour will be 
the Senate and House Chambers, | 
and Delaware’s Hall of Heroes. 

All offices will be secured and 
entrance will be restricted to the 
main door on the West side of 
the building. No children will be 
admitted unless accompanied by 
an adult. 

For further information con- 
tact the Delaware State Develop- 
ment Department, 455 The 
Green, Dover, Delaware 19901.   

“Decline of agricultural open 

space in two-thirds of Delaware 

is of mounting concern to all who 
desire a balanced urban and rur- 
al environment,” says Vaughn. 

Less than one-third of Delaware, 

this in lower Kent and Sussex 

counties, have cropland harvest- 

ed and pasture acreage at least 
equal to that of 1930. 

Effective programs to preserve 
agricultural lands are now under- 

way in several urbanizing states, 
he adds. 

For information on Delaware’s 

agricultural land preservation 

programs, write to Gerald F. 

Vaughn, University of Delaware, 

Cooperative Extension Service, 

Agricultural Hall, Newark, 19711 
or call 738-2511. 

® 

Delegates to 
Boys’ State From 
Harrington 

The Boys State delegates from 
Harrington, Bruce Jester and 
James Calloway, attended the 

31st annual Delaware Boys State 

sessions in Dover from Sunday, 
June 16th, through Friday, June 
21st. The program was spon- 

sored by the American Legion 
Department of Delaware and 
headed by Dr. Park W. Hunting- 
ton, department chairman and 
director. 

The members of Boys State 
were housed at Wesley College 

in Dover. Sessions were divided 

| between Lgislative Hall and the 
College. During the week they 
spent most of their time in the 
House debating their stands on 
controversial issues. They sat 
with members of the Houses dur- 
ing regular legislative sessions. 

The junior legislators intro- 
duced many bills in the House. 
Those passed incgluded: The low- 

ering of the voting age to 18, the 
bill requiring motorcycle riders 
to wear helmets, legalized abor- 
tion, state supported kindergart- 

ens, state subsides for experimen- 

  

tabled or not passed included: 
Forced sterilization of all women 

who have had more than two il- 
legitimate children and a pro- 
posal that would have permitted 
narcotic addicts to use drugs 
in special state narcotic centers. 

On Friday morning a joint ses- 
sion of Boys State was held in 
Legislative Hall where Governor 
Charles L. Terry Jr. talked be- 
fore the Boys State members.     

1 

tal housing projects. Those bills | a 

cessed include asparagus, green 

beans, lima beans and vegetables 
for stew. 

Individual farmers who leased 

lands to the company or “who 
grow crops under annual con- 

tracts for processing by the Lib- 
by plant are being notified per- 
sionally. 

The other Delaware unit, we 
Wyoming, will Dot be aftested. 

Predicts Higher 
'68 Corn Prices 

  

average corn price of $1.10 per 

T. McAllister, extension farm 

management specialist at the 

four cents lower than the April 

price and a few cents less than. 

the price at harvest. : 
Low prices have been very 

farmers to sign larger amounts 
of corn land into the Feed Grain 

says McAllister. 

With virtually all of the 1968 
crop planted, assuming normal 

weather conditions, it appears 
that corn production will be less 

in 1968 than last year. This year’s 

explains. But there are still four 

and a half to five hundred mil- 
lion bushels to be added to our 

(Continued on Page 5) 

Earl L. Scott 

  

was a suicide, state police at Do-. 
ver said Tuesday. 

Police said the victim was vis- 
iting a brother in Star Hill, near | 

Dover, when he went into anoth- 

stomach with a shotgun. He died 
at 9::07 pm. at Kent General 
Hospital. 

Surviving are his wife, Mrs. 
Gloria Scott; a son, Earl Jr. and 

a daughter, Norma Jean, all at 
home; three sisters, Mrs. Caro- 
line Manlove and Mrs. Dorothy 
Abrams, both of Star Hill and 

Mrs. Marian Harris of Camden, 

Hill, William and Paul both of 

Dover, and Wallace of Felton. 
Services for Mr. Scott were 

held Thursday night at the Stev- 
enson Funeral Chapel in Dover. 
Interment was in Sunset Memor- 
ial Gardens, Dover.   
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University of Delaware. This was 

program. than they did last year, 

crop should just about equal cur 
domestic and export needs, he 

The gunshot death of Earl L. 
Scott, 29, of Harrington, Sunday 

er room, and shot himself in the 

Delaware farmers received an 
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bushel in May, according to W. 

discouraging and have caused : 

and four brothers, Robert of Star is
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daily Monday thru Saturday at 5 

~ be advertised by Playland. The 

which are held every Sunday, 

which are kept immaculaet by an 

attendant on duty at all times, 

and Friday nights, for only $2.50 

(which is optional) you can ride 

all rides as many times as you 
care and also play miniature golf 

ness. He was 65. 

a Mrs. Simon Sharp and Mrs. Roy 

Mrs. Harold Brenneman of Hous- 

~~ Ont.,, and Sarah of Harrington; 
two sons, E. Truman and Buddy, 

ternoon from the Greenwood 

be omitted and suggests dona- 

| ~ Greenwood and Everett of Dover, 
three daughters, Mrs. Pearl Hop- 

Cemetery, Harrington. 

close friend. 

- deepest sympathy to Mr. Garnet 
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Summer Officially 
Started June 21, Playland 
Starts Its Daily Schedule 

Playland Amusement Park . . . 

65th Street, Ocean City, Mary- 

land, is now on its seven day 
weekly schedule. The park opens 

p.m. and Sundays and holidays at 

1 pm. Many new attractions and 

special events have been added 

to Playland for this season, two 
in particular are the exciting new 

Turnpike Ride and the thrill of 

‘thrills Scrambler Ride. 

Especially for a family day of 
fun . . . and basket picnics, Play- 
land has inaugurated community 

days at its Park, which is to be 
held on Sundays during the sum- 
mer. Many of the towns of Del- 

Mar-Va are already booked. 

Watch the newspapers for the 
dates and Sunday schedule for 

various communities which will 

feature of these community days 

will offer children as well as 

adults to ride any and all thirty 

thrill rides at Playland as often 

as you wish, including the play- 
ing of miniature golf from the 

‘hours 1 pm. to 7 p.m. for a one 

price ticket of only $1.50. Plenty 

of Free picnic tables, with all 
new modern and tiled rest rooms 

makes Playland ideal for a Sun- 
day afternoon family picnic and 
day of fun. Free admission to 
‘Playland and plenty of free auto 

parking at all times. 
Playland’s increasingly popular | 

one price nights will continue 
this summer every Wednesday 

at Del-Mar-Va’s million dollar 
amusement park . 

® 

"Eli C. Schrock 
Eli C. Schrock, a Greenwood: 

‘area farmer for more than 40 

years, died in his home near here 

Saturday night after a short ill- 

  

Mr. Schrock, born in Mary- 
land, operated a large, diversi- 

fied flarm from his home on the 

Milford-Greenwood Highway. 
Surviving are his widow, Mrs. 

Lucy B. Schrock, seven daughters 

Mast, both of Harrington, Mrs. 

Thiomias Tennefoss of Greenwood, 

‘ton, Mrs. Roy Eby of Gordonville, 
Pa., Mrs. Lester Kehl of Hespeler, 

“both of Harrington; three broth- 
ers, Enos of Greenwood, Harvey 

of Harrington and Ezra of Clar- 

ence Center, N.Y.; two sisters, 
"Wis. Vernon Zehr of Bridgeville | POR 
and Mrs. Alvin Mast of Green- 

wood; 28 grandchildren and two 

great-grandchildren. 
Services were held Tuesday af- 

Mennonite Church, with intern- 
“ment in church grounds. 

The family asks that flowers 

tions to the Laurelville Church 

center for Retarded Children at 

Mount Pleasant, Pa. Arrange- 

ments were handled by the J. 
Millard Cooper Funeral Home, 

110 E. Center #*. Harrington. 

. Harold P. Outten 
Harold P. Outten, 76, died Sat- 

‘urday at his home at 711 N. Wal- 
~ nut St., Milford. 

He was a retired Greenwood 

area farmer. 

He is survived by his widow, 

Mrs. Georgianna S. Outten, a 
guest at the Messick Nursing 

‘Home, Harrington; three sons, 

Lester of Claymont, Alvin of 

  

kins of Milford, Mrs. Roberta 
Dill of Bridgeville and Mrs. Lou- 
is Milbourn of Greenwood; 17 

grandchildren, and a great-grand- 

27 Teachers From 
D.S.E.A. to 
Attend Conference 

More than 27 Delaware teach- 

ers will leave the state next week 

en route to Dallas, Texas. Fred 

Thomas, DSEA president, an- 
nounced today that these educa- 

tors will be official delegates to 
the 106th annual convention of 

the National Education Associa- 
tion (NEA). A total of 12,000 del- 

egates are expected at the con- 

vention which will see the last 

vestige of teacher conservatism, 

predicts NEA president, Braulio 
Alonso, former high school prin- 

cipal from Tampa, Florida, who 

was among the 30,000 educators 

who submitted their resignation 

in February. 

“It is the delegates who set the 
course for the 1.1 million mem- 

ber organization,” Fred Thomas, 

DSEA, stated. “The decisions 
made in Dallas will enter into 

every classroom in the country.” 

The 12,000 delegates will brace 

for what may be an even more 

troublesome year in 1968-69, af- 

ter a year of involvement in more 

teacher militancy than public ed- 

ucation in America has ever seen 

before. 

Some controversial issues to be 

decided this year include: 

—Action on the findings of 

the Special NEA Task Force on 
Urban Education and Human 

Rights. 
—Rsolutions supporting lower- 

ing the voting age to 18. 

—Strengthening bilingual edu- 

cation. 
—Long range stratgies and 

more effective tactics for dealing 

with troubles in education wher- 

ever and whenever they occur. 

At the opening session the ev- 

ening of Juliy 2, Braulio Alonso, 
praesident, NEA, will address the 

assembly. The Delaware delega- 
tion will also hear Dr. Sam Lam- 

bert deliver his first annual re- 

port as executive secretary. 
The Delaware delegation will 

be led by Fred Thomas, president, 

with, Chet Elder, assistance exec- 

utive secretary, as staff consult- 
ant. 

Official delegates from Dela- 

wiare are: 

Representing DSEA: Frederick 

Thomas, Lewes; Mrs. Viola 

Thomas, Wilmington; John Gra- 
den, Smyrna; Raymond Koelker, 

New Castle; Chet Elder, New 

Castle, Philip Dahlinger, Stan- 

ton; Mrs. Betsy Domke, Freder- 
ica; Mrs. Bertha Johnson, Middle- 

town. 

Representing New Castle Coun- 
ty: Mrs. (Christine Driscoll, New 

Castle; Miss Madylon Heal, Wil- 

mington; William B. Keene, New- 
ark; Eugene Bouchard, Wilming- 

Representing Stanton: Earl 

Eshleman, Stanton. 

- Representing Wilmington: ‘Wil- 

liam A. Richey, Wilmington. 

Representing Newark: Donald 

Schreck, Russell Grimm, Mrs. 

Thelma Thompson, Miss Mary 
Keppler, Mrs. Margery Northrop, 

Nework;. 

Representing Kent County: 

Willard Hickman, Milford; Leon- 
ard Hill, Milford; Dr. Howard 
E. Row, Dover. 

Representing Sussex County: 

Mrs. Cora Selby, Laurel; Mrs. 
Alma Smith, Seaford; John Sarik, 

Lewes; Thomas Swin, Seaford; 

Louis Cober, Georgetown; Helen 
Cober, Georgetown. 

George E. Glynn, NEA Direc- 
tor, Delaware, ex officio; Dr. Mu- 

riel Crosby, Wilmington, ex offi- 
cio. 
  

Livestock Prices 
(All Prices PER CWT. unless 

otherwise noted) 

Veal Calves — Choice $34 to 

$41, mostly $36; medium to good 

$25 to $33.50, mostly $30; rough 
and common $20 to $24, mostly 

$24; monkeys $20 to $39, mostly     child. 
~ Services were held Tuesday af- | 

ternoon at the McKnatt Funeral 
Home, 50 Commerce St., Harring- 

ton. Interment was in Hollywood 

  

Farmington 
Mildred Gray 

Miss Terry Bowman would like 

to wish Paul Bender Jr. a safe 

trip to Kansas City, Kansas where 
he and his family will make 
their new home. Paul was a 

freshman classmate of Terry’s at 

Greenwood: high school and a 

The community extends their 

Vendable and family in the death 

of his mother. 
Mr. and Mrs. Louis Slater and 

family spent last week visiting 

relatives in West Virginia. 
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Andrew 

were entertained Sunday at a pic- 
nic near Milford by his two 

daughters and families. 
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Seibert and 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Kubek were 
Sunday guests of Mr. and Mrs. 

Wesley Ewing at their summer 

home on the Nanticoke river. 
Mr .and Mrs. Wm. Messick at- 

tended a cook out and business 

meeting of the executive commit- 

tee of the Delaware Quarter 

Horse Association Wdnesday 
night at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 

$32. 

Lambs — Medium $21 to $28, 

mostly $26; common $15 to $20, 
mostly $16. 

Cows-slaughter — medium to 

good $18 to $21.25, mostly $19.50; 

common $15.25 to $17.75, mostly 
$16.50; canners and cutters $12 

to $15, mostly $14. 

Steers — Common to medium 
$21 to $26.50, mostly $24.50; light 
steers $22 to $37, mostly $25. 

Feeder Heifers — Dairy type 

$17 to $23, mostly $21; beef type 
$19 to $25, mostly $22. 

Feeder Heifers — Dairy type 
$17 to $23, mostly $21; beef type 

$19 to $25, mostly $22.00 
Slaughter Heifers — good to 

choice $19 to $23, mostly $21. 
Bulls - over 1000 lbs. — chicice 

$22 to $27.75, mostly $26.50.; 500 

to 1,000 Ibs. — choice $19 to $26.75 
mostly $23. 

Straight Hogs (good quality)— 
120 to 170 lbs. $17 to $20, mostly 

$19.50; 170 to 240 lbs. $19.50 to 
$22.50, mostly $22.50; 240 Ibs. 

$16 to $22.50, mostly $21.50. 
Sows (good quality) — 200 to 

300 lbs. $14 to $20, mostly $16; 
300 to 400 lbs. $14 to $18, mostly 

$17; over 400 lbs. $13 to $15, 

mostly $14.50. 
Boars (good quality) — Under 

350 Ibs. $14 to $20, mostly $16.50; 
over 350 lbs. $13 to $14.75, most- 

ly $14.50. 
Shioats — medium to good $14 

to $20, mostly $16.   Wm. Smith Jr. in Townsend. Feeder Pigs (6 to 12 wks. old) 

— Choice $10 to $14, mostly 

$12.50; medium to good $6 to 

$9.50, mostly $9. 

Horses and Mules—Work type 

$50 to $70, mostly $60 per head; 
butcher type $35 to $45, mostly 

$40 per head. 

Live Poultry - Heavy breeds— 
Fowl .70 to $1.30, mostly $1.10; 

roosters .50 to $1.10, mostly .70. 

Light breeds —Bantam Chickens 
.10 to .50, mostly .40. 

Robbits — Large breeds $1.50 
to $2.70. mostly $1.60; small 

breeds .90 to $1.40, mostly $1.20; 
Young Rabbits .50 to .85, mostly 

65. 

Eggs — Ungraded, mixed .30- 
44 per dozen; pullet 12-29 per 

dozen. 
Miscellaneous Produce — String 

Beans .90 to $1.10 per Ys bu; Rasp- 

berries, .45 per pt. 

St. Stephen's 
Episcopal 
Church News 

Friday, 8:30 a.m. Special Dio- 

cesan Convention at All Saints 

Church, Rehoboth Beach. 
Sunday, 9:30 a.m. Holy Com- 

munion and sermon; 10:30 a.m. 

coffee hour. 

Monday-Friday 11:15 Morning 

devotions on WTHD, Milford 

Tuesday, 7:30 p.m., Holy Scrip- 
tures class; 7:30-11 p.m. canteen 

dance, 

Wednesday, 7:30 p. m. Heal- 

ing services; 8:30 p.m. Harring- 

ton community agency meeting. 

Today the Episcopal Diocese of 
Delaware is meeting in special 

convention at All Saints Church 

in Rehoboth for the purpose of 
electing the seventh Bishop of 

Delawiare. In addition to the Vic- 

ar, St. Stephen's is sending two 
delegates, Mrs. Tom Clendening, 

Mr. George Thompson with Mrs. 

Robert McNally and Mr. Gran- 
ville Hill as alternate delegates. 

This coming Sunday at the ser- 

vices of divine worship the vicar 
will bless at the altar, fourteen 

new crosses for the fourteenlaco- 

lytes of St. Stephen’s. The cross 

is part of the vestment of an aco- 

lyte. The new crosses were ord- 

ered by Mr. Clyde Perry, director 
of acolytes of St. Stephen’s, and 

is the well known Celtic design. 

Mr. Perry and his faithful corp 
of acolytes are to be congratu- 

lated on their splendid service to 
St. Stephen’s. At present there 

are 14 lactive acolytes: John 

Winkler, Chuck Hurd, John Ken- 

ney, Quay Rice, Jr., Jimmy Cal- 

loway, Bill Winkler, Gene Price, 

Chris Mertz, Billy Smith, Ricky 

Mertz, Joe Nored, Bob, Nored, 
Curtis Pitts, Tim Roe. 

This coming week the vicar 

will broadcast on the morning 
devotion hour from WTHD in 

Milford at 11::15 a.m. each morn- 

The Delaware State Fair is 

less than a month jlaway. Those 
that can help at St. Stephen’s 

food booth are asked to contact 

Mrs. Quay Rice 398-3834, or to 
see her on Sunday after the 

church services. Soup containers 

  

  

for all who will be able to make 
soup for this project. 

are available from the kitchen !   

, Of Local Interest 
Mrs. Wiliam Hearn 

Mr. Doug Marlowe of Free- 
mont, N.C., and Mr. Wayne Aus- 

bon of Greenville, N.C. spent sev- 
eral days with Jack Abbott and 

family and visited Philadelphia 

and Washington. D.C. 
Mr .and Mrs. Michael Makovec 

celebrated their fiftieth wedding 

anniversary on Sunday. Many 

friends and relatives visited 

them. 
Mrs. Jack Dill attended fa con- 

ference on Diagnosis and Proba- 

bility of Speech. and Hearing 
Handicaps at the Howard John- 

son Motor Lodge, Newark, for 

four days last week. 
Mrs. W. W. Sharp spent Thurs- 

day with her friends, Mrs. C. F. 
Freed and Mrs. Frances Mann- 

ing of Reading, Pa. who are 
spending a vacation at Ocean 

Clty, Md. 
John Lombardo of Ft. Liauder- 

dale, Fla., age six years, flew by 

himself on a jet plane which 

took two hours and five minutes 
and was met by his grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Welch at 
Friendship airport in Baltimore 

on Saturday. John will spend 

the summer. 
Mr .and Mrs. Tom Peck and 

son spent Sunday with friends 

at Broadkill Beach. Mrs. Peck 
and son will spend this week 

there. 

Jack Abbott spent several days 

with college friends in Suffolk 

and Williamsburg, Va. 
Arnold Gilstad has returned 

home after visiting his mother 

and other relatives in Wisconsin. 
Susan Greenhaugh, Candace 

Peck, Diane Harrington, Debbie | wag 

Aiken, Tillie Kukulka, and Cin- 
dy Kohel spent last week at the 
Konnesy cottage in Rehoboth. 

Mrs Sarah Dill is a patient in 

Milford Memorial Hospital. 

Trinity United 
Methodist Church 

Church school at Trinity Unit- 
ed Methodist Church, Harring- 

ton, will be held this Sunday at 
10 a.m. 

Morning worship will be con- 

ducted by the pastor, William J. 

Garrett, at 11 a.m. Melvin Brobst 
organist, will play “Prelude” by 

R. Diggle as the prelude and 
“Air” by Handel as the postlude 

music. Miss Kathy Miller will 

sing “A Prayer for Today” by 
Frederickson. The altar flowers 

will be furnished by members 
of the O.U.R. Class. Ronald Wood 
is acolyte, : 

The vacation Bible school will 
close this Friday, June 28th, with 
a program in Fellowship. Hall, 

at 7:30 p.m. Certificates will be 
awarded to the children for at- 
tendance. Every one is invited. 

BIRTHS 
In Beebe Hospital, Lewes 

June 10, Mr. and Mrs. Harvey 
Franklin Dukes III, of George- 

town, a boy, Daniel Parker. 

June 12, Mr. and Mrs. Garland 

Granville Messick, of Millsboro, 
a girl, Julia Ann. 

June 17, Mr. and Mrs. Richard 

Douglas Messick, of Millsboro, a 
girl, Denise Marie. 
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SELL AND INSTALL 
Linoleum — Kitchen Carpet — Ceramic Tile 

COMSTOCK’S 

PHONE 422-9851 

—_po— 

i MARY CARTER PAINTS 

2 GALLONS 

Milford, Del. 
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to us. 

398-3700     Put Your Car in the 

Nothing is overlooked, everything is checked thorough- 

ly, repaired expertly . . . when you bring your car 

FRY’S AMERICAN 

Northbound Lane U.S. 13 

\ 

Experts . . . 

Harrington, Del. 
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would: be announced. Mrs. John- 

Sussex Toastmistress 
Club No. 1635 Celebrates 
First Birthday 

Sussex Toastmistress Club No. 
1635 celebrated its first birthday 

Monday night at Dilliard’s Res- 

taurant, Seaford. Guests were 
Toastmasters Ernest Wright, Sea- 

ford and George Ellegood, Laurel, 

who were instrumental in help- 

ing Toasmistress off to a good 

start. Each commended the ladies 

on the fine progress during the 

year. 

Mrs. Betty Johnson, Seaford, 

graced dinner and during dessert 

Mrs. Frances Shaffner, George- 

town, introduced by President 

Miss Anna Lee Derrickson, Har- 

rington, acted as topic mistress. 

Her topics were “Where does 
middle age begin”? “A word to 

the wise is sufficient”, and An 

alert consumer.” Minute respon- 

ses were made by Mr. Wright, 

Mrs. Jean Cranston, Seaford and 

Mrs. Nettie Ziegler, Bridgeville. 

Annual reports were given by 
President Derrickson, club rep- 

resentative, Mrs. Billie ; James, 

Seaford; Mrs. Isabell Drugash, 

Seaford, on council and inner cir- 

cle meetings; Miss Shaffner on 

Chester council meeting and 40 

& 8 American Legion dinner rep- 

resentations. 

An invitation to the club to 

attend the wedding of a club 
member, Miss Barbara Nero, Lau- 

rel, June 29th 2 p.m., at Our Lady 

of Lourde Church, Seaford was 
read. 

Toastmistress Mrs. Billie James 

called upon Mr. Ellegood to 

speak. Hight lights of his talk 

“Good Publicity” and ‘“Per- 
sonal Contact” were keys to a 

prosperous growth of a club. 

Officers installed by Mrs. Dru- 

gash were president, Miss Fran- 

ces Shaffner, Georgetown; vice 

president, Mrs. Billie James, Sa- 
fored; secretary, Mrs. Ann Spicer 

Seaford; treasurer, Mrs. Betty 

Johnsson, Seaford. 

Mrs. Drugash. used for her 
theme “A Circle With a Hub and: 

Members as Spokes and Rims of 

a Wheel.” 

For the ceremony a beautfully 
arranged floral piece of red and 

white darnations and baby breath 

surrounding a center candle was 

used. The installing officer lit 

this candle and a smaller candle 

fastened by white satin ribbon 

was lit by each officers forming 

the “spokes”. The rim was other 

members of the club symbolic of 
a free running organization 

around its hub, the president. 

Miss Shaffner announced the 

next meeting would be held. in 
the fall at the University of Del- 
aware substation, Georgetown, on 

Monday, Sept. 9th, 8 p.m. where 
programs for the ensuing year | 

  
son will be in charge of refresh- 
ments. 

Miss Shaffner extended an in-   

vitation to Toastmasters Club to 
meet with Toastmtsress at sub 

station on October 14th, 8 p.m. 

with a speaker from each club. 
Mrs. James and Miss Shiaffner in 

charge of refreshments. 

Newly elected treasurer Mrs. 

Johnson reminded members that 

dues were to be in no later than 

July 15th. 
  

Senior Center 
News 
Monday, June 24 was a busy 

day. The program committee met 
in the morning to formulate plans 

for July activities. After lunch 
the ceramics greenware was re- 

ceived and distributed to mem- 
bers. The director assisted those 
interested in sewing while the 

aide conducted the bingo game. 

Tuesday's picnic was called 

off due to predicted rainy wea- 
ther and the day was spent on 

sewing and personal projects. 

Sewing and ceramics will be the 
main activities for Thursday but 

Tuesday, July 2 will be another 

fun day. There will be a picnic 

at Killen’s Pond. Like to join us? 
Call the Center for details and 
transportation. : 

We are glad to welcome three 
new members to our Center: Mrs. 

Helen Collins, Rev. Leah Cole- 

man of Harrington and Mrs. Co- 
ra Stevens of Burrsville. This 

makes a total membership of 76. 

The Harrington Center will be 
in charge of the State Fair booth 

on Thursday, August 1st. Come 

down to the Center and miake 

an item to exhibit or volunteer 

to assist with the booth on Thurs- 
day. 

We are sorry to report that 

Nina Smith, Viola Jacobs, Fran- 
ces Harrington, Linda Layton, 

Lucy Knipper and Ethel Stubbs 
are still unable to join us at the 

Center due to continued poor 
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health. Drop in to see them or 
send a card to cheer them up. 

We do hope they will all soon be 
back with us. 

Over 170 Attend 
4-H Conference 

More than 170 teen-age youths 
visited the University of Dela- 

ware campus for the 47th annual 

State 4-H Conference this past 

weekend, according to state 4-H 
leader James O. Baker. 

Theme of the conference, which 

opened Friday afternoon, was 

“Excellence in 4-H Work and 
Everyday Living.” The program 

was designed to help delegates 
gain a broader understanding of 

individual citizenship responsi- 

bilities and opportunities and to 
help them evaluate present 4-H 

programs and recommend new 

directions for the future. 

Featured speakers at the week- 

end session included Henry 

Schriver, a member of the Ohio 
House of Representatives; Uni- 

versity of Delaware Extension Di- 
rector John Murray; Kirby 

Krams of the Delaware Youth 
Services Commission; © Edward 

MpcFlaul, personnel consultant 
from Chicago; and Karl E. Kils- 

holm, a member of the Iowa 
House of Representatives. High- 

light of the conference was 
“America Our Heritage,” a mu- 

sical program by the Carroll 

  

  

County (Md.) 4-H chorus. 

Special guests at the confer- 

ence included exchange delegates 

from three nearby states. George 
A. Nicholson Jr., Detour, and 

Bonnie Lynn Buckey, Grantsville, 
representing neighboring Mary- 

land while Cathy Schwab, Rin- 
goes, and Sandra Stiles, Black- 

wood, represented New Jersey. 

Delegates from West Virginia 

were Elizabeth Snyder, Charles 
Town, and George E. Tabb Jr. 
Kearneysville. 

Delegates to the conference 

lived in University dormitories 
over the weekend and were giv- 

en the opportunity to use many 
of the University’s recreational 

facilities during scheduled peri- 
ods. : 

Special events at the confer- 

ence included the annual banquet 

in the Rodney Room of the Stu- 
dent center followed by a dance. 
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every business need 

let us design end print to 

perfection the forms that will 

suit your business to a 7. On 
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LANCASTER BRAND 

SIRLOIN STEAKS 
INSPECTED BEEF! 

  

LANCASTER BRAND... 

100% U.S. GOV'T. 

LEAN SMOKED 

PICNICS 
Wels - 3 1 

6108 1b Avg. 
oy 8 [ef 3 0 TAR: B= 3 

FIRESIDE SKINLESS 

FRANKS 
2-1b. QQ-< 

99 
MARKETS 

  

SAVE 4¢ . . . BEVERAGES 

Bala Club 
ALLELAVORS 

LUNCHEON MEAT 

Hormel Spam 
SAVE 4 

  

pkg. 

FANCY MEDIUM 

SHRIMP 
Syo° 

lb. 
WHOLE or HALF, FULLY COOKED 

Semi Boneless Hams . ... 69° 
LEGS or BREASTS 

RED 
RIPE   PET RITZ 

PINK or WHITE FROZEN 

Seneca Lemonade --. 

WIL vo 
*1,000 
Play Acme’s 

xciting Game. 

  
      WHOLE 

each 

DECK 0':=" 
MOREY 
FUN TO PLAY! 
EASY TO WIN! 

Quartered Fryers ......37 

WATERMELONS 
89 

e5......... 3 
14-01. 
pies 

6-07. 
can 

THIS oy WORTH 

50 Jie STAMPS 
with your purchase of 

any LANCASTER BRAND 

ROUND, RUMP or i 

EYEROAST | 
Limit One Per Family Please. 

Ofer Expires S¢ Sat., ty June 29, Joos. 

“THIS COUPON \ WO | RTH 

30s 
5-b.bag FLORIDA 

POTATOES 
Limit One Per Family Please. 

Offer Expires Sat., June 29, 1968. | 

99° 

HANOVER 

SAVE 3¢   

REGULAR OR 
THIN LINE 

Farmdale Drinks4 

Kraft Mayonnaise : 69 

Pork & Beans ...2 

Reynolds Wrap 2 

12-02. 
cans 85° 

$100 

49 

12 
1-qt., 

14-02. 
cans 

12-02. 

1-b., 
12-02. 
cans 49 

59 
J 

25-ft. 
rolls   

  

KRAFT’S 

Velveeta Cheese 2..98¢ 

SAVE 10° SUPREME 
. BUTTERMILK 

  c 

THIS COUPON WORTH 

| 30 Jyh 
with your purchase of a 

1-1b. pkg. 

LANCASTER BRAND 

BOLOGNA 
Limit One Per Family Please. 

Offer (Explees Sat. June 29, Ios. 

“THIS COUPON. WORTH 

20 Ju 25, STAMPS | 
with your purchase of any 2 

loaves SUPREME FRESH ! 
i VIENNA BREAD 1 ANGEL FOOD CAKE 

Limit One Per Family Please. 
Offer Expires Sat., June 29, 1968.   

3: 

50 bys 
with your purchase of 
3-lbs. or more FRESH 

| CHICKEN PARTS 
Limit One Per Family Please. 

Offer Expires Sut, June 29, 1968. 

THIS S COUPON WORTH 

20 SH stamps 
with your purchase of 

one VIRGINIA LEE 

Limit One Per Family Please. 
, Offer Expires Sat., June 29, 1968. 

loaves 

THIS COUPON WORTH 

GREEN 
STAMPS 

GREEN 

FRESH, LARGE 
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LOIS MAUREEN RILEY — Daughter of Mr. and Mrs. T. Gustavus 

  

  

   
BOERS x A : GION 
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Riley, Dorman 

Street, who was graduated recently from the School of Nursing of Peninsula General 
Hospital, Salisbury. She is in the top row, fourth from the left. 

    

Felton 
Mrs. Walter Moore 

The Sunday morning friendly 

greeters at the Felton United 

Methodist church were Mrs. 

Thomas L. Kates and Mrs. El- 

wood Fisher, 

Rev. Charles M. Moyer’s Sun- 

day morning message was “Prac- 

tice of Prayer.” Special music 

was a trumpet solo by Peggy 

Kates accompanied at the piano 

by Cathy Adams. 

The proceeds from the annual 

street fair were $1,371.00. 

The pastor’s vacation will be 

from Wednesday, June 26th to 

July 10th. If anyone needs pas- 

toral service during this time 

Rev. George Bishop of Frederica 

will be available. 

This Sunday, June 30th, Rich- 

ard Adams, layman, will be the 

guest speaker. Special music will 

be by Jane and Susan Roland. 

On Sunday, July 7th, Rev. Hugh 

Johnson will be guest speaker 

at the three charges. 

The Sunday school picnic will 

be July 14th. Rev. Charles Trader 

will conduct the services at the 

picnic. Rev. Moyer will ~be at 

the Felton service as usual on 

Sunday morning of the picnic. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roland Neemian 

and Mr. and Mrs. William Pas- 

key, Jr. last Tuesday and Wed- 

nesday attended the Maryland 

state firemen’s convention at 

Ocean City, Md. Mr. Neeman is 

president of the Delaware fire- | 

men’s association. 

Bill Killen who has been a! 

patient in the Delaware hospital, 

‘Wilmington, has returned home.’ 

Last week visitors of Mr. and 

Mrs. Joseph Crockett were Mr. 

and Mrs. Clifton Jones, Miss Ed- 

ith Frederick, Mrs. Elneta Grier 

and Mrs. Calvin Turner, all of 

Wilmington. 

Michael Price and Larry Hat- 

field were delegates from the 

Felton high school at boys’ state 

at Wesley College, Dover. 

Mr and Mrs. Calvin Turner of 

Wilmington spent the week end 

with Mrs. Turner's brother, Ed- 

ward Everett. 

Saturday evening guests of 

Mrs. Vergie Carlisle and flam- 

ily, Pat and Gene were Mr and 

Mrs. Henry Deumler of Wilming- 

ton. 

Mr .and Mrs. Harold Hatfield 

and children, Laura and Marc of 

Mt. Tabor, N.J., spent Friday and 

Saturday with his parents, Mr. 

and Mrs. Charles Hatfield. 

Mrs. Nelson Hammond attend- 

ed a coffee at ‘the Dinner Bell 

Inn, Dover, Saturday, given by 

Mrs. Joseph Satterfield Sr. in 

honor of her daughter-in-law,, 

Mrs. Joseph M. Satterfield Jr. 

of Dover. 

Mr .and Mrs. Calvin Berge and 

children, Bill and Becky of Ft. 

Worth, Texas, spent a week re- 

cently with Mr. Berge’s parents, 

Mr. and Mrs. George Springer [thers and sisters that a child may 
and other relatives. 

Mrs. Lillie Blades was Sunday 

dinner guest of her daughter, 

Mrs. Lynn Torbert and Mr. Tor- 

bert. 
Mr .and Mrs. J. W. Alcorn of 

Cedar Crest, Wilmington, visited 

Mrs. Alcorn’s brother, James 

Blades, a patient at the Milford 

Memorial Hospital, Milford, on 

Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Bishop 

of Greensboro, Md. were Thurs- 

day visitors of Mrs. Pearl Delong 

and Mr. and Mrs. Richard Delong 

and daughter, Nanette. 
Mrs. J. Harold Scharbinger re- 

cently entertained at a bridge 

luncheon for her house guest, 

Miss Margaret Downes of New 

York state. 
Mr .and Mrs. Dorsey Hammond 

and daughter, Melissa, of Newiark 

were Friday over-night guests of 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wil- 

liam D. Hammond. 
Mrs. Wilma Wood ' of Harring- 

ton, spent the weekend at Lewes 

Beach with Mrs. Barratt Simp- 

ler. 
Mr .and Mrs. Albert Warren 

and family were at their home | 
in Lewes Beach for the weekend. 

Mrs. Grace Turner spent the | standards? 
weekend at Lewes Beach with. 

her son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. | 
Terry Turner. 

Mrs. Ethel T. Case of Rehoboth 
Beach, is a patient in the Beebe 

Hospital, Lewes. 

®   

BE WISE — ADVERTISE 

SHOP AND SWAP 

. IN THE WANT ADS 

« washing facilities. Is there a camp 

Unemployment is said to be 

one of America’s most serious 
problems. It is also listed as a 

prime cause of city rioting. But, 

to what extent is unemployment 
truly a’ problem? The inconsis- 

tency of the sizeable total of un- 
employed persons and many em- 

ployers urgently needing persons 

to fill jobs has plagued us for 

some time.   
In a recent issue of the St. 

Louis Post-Dispatch an editorial 
cartoon pictured a pair of hands 

hlandcuffed by the chains of un- 

employment. The cartoon was 

captioned, “Let My People Go!” 

The same issue of the news- 

paper contained over 600 help 

wanted advertisements. The jobs 

offered ranged from dishwashers 

to executives. Many of the adver- 

tisements wanted several workers 
and some of them wanted many 

workers. In all, thousands of jobs 

were unfilled. Several offered to 

positions. Wages on many of the 

jobs offered were in the higher 

than average range. 

The true problem seems to be 

not a lack of employment but 

train unskilled workers for the; 

  why there is still unemployment 

when so many jobs go begging.   
underlying a great amount of un- 

| employment is thlat persons who 

{do not have the 
| person’ s welfare at heat have in 
{too many instances led him to 

hellieve. it is below the dignity of 

man to labor with his hands. He 

i has been told it is more dignified 

to live off public welfare than to 
earn an honest living by honest 

more profitable in mlany instan- 

ces. 
Neither unemployment, nor 

the riot problem, will be solved 

until we return to the truth that 

it is not below man’s dignity to 
labor but is, in fact, to his cre- 

dit. 
A person who is busy making 

  

Pick The Right 
Camp 

Pick your child’s summer camp 

to fit his personality. The time 
is past when parents chose a 

camp because the neighbor’s child 

went there, says Mrs. Mary Kel- 

ler, extension home economics 

agent for New Castle county. 
Some children will do well in 

a competitive situation, others 

will enjoy indivdualized camps. 

Special interest camps might ap- 

peal to the gifted child, while Y- 
camps , scout camps and 4-H 

camps give a more rounded ex- 
perience. 

The co-ed camp could supply 

the experience of substitute bro- 

Jack at home. On the other hand, 
a boy with two or three sisters 

may have a real need for boys 
camp. 

Camps range from rough sim- 
plicity to country club exclusive- 
ness; but the good ones need not 

be expensive. Children prefer a 
warm, friendly atmosphere to 
luxurious equipment. Or, you 

don’t have to send your young- 
sters awlay, adds Mrs. Keller. Day 

camps offer a wealth of experi- 

ences and are just as worthwhile 
as the boarding camps. 

But how dq you choose the 
best camp? 

Some states regulate sanitation 

and health facilities, but Mrs. 
Keller suggests that you check 

water supply, plumbing and 

nurse, competent waterfront per- 

sonnel, and a dietician? Ask 

for a sample week’s menu and a 
program schedule. 

A camp is no better than its 

director. An interview with the 
director, says Mrs. Keller is the 

best clue to the quality of the 

camp. What is his camp philoso- 

phy? How does he choose his 

staff members? What are his   
A good place for wliosed 

camp information is the Ameri- | 

can Camping Association. Many 

| camps will send, for the asking, 
| catalogs and brochures about 

| their camp. For 4-H camp infor- 

i mation, contact your county 4-H 
agent. 

Picking a camp is no mail or- 

der proposition, concludes Mrs. 
Keller. Take the time to choose 

| Wisely. 

labor. And, indeed, it has become : 

  | 

High Unemployment 
While Jobs Go Begging 

a living for himself and his fam- 
ily does not have time to riot or 

protest. In fact, he has nothing 
to protest about. 

We suggest some of the billions 
of dollars being doled out which 

results in encouraging many per- 

sons not to work be used to get 

them to work. That will go far in 

solving three problems: the un- 

employment, the lack of workers 

for jobs now open and the riot 

problem. arrensburg (Mo.) 
Daily Star-Journal 
  

Remove Clippings 
To Improve Lawn 

Give your lawn a healthy, well 

groomed look this summer by 

removing grass clippings imme- 

diatately after mowing, says Dr. 

William H. Mitchell, extension 

agronomist at the University of 
Delaware. 

Contrary to popular belief, 
clippings do not make a lawn 

green and fertile, he explains. In 

fact, they may actually harm the 

grass. Clippings left on the lewn 
may add to the accumulation of 

thatch, the dead material around 
| grass roots. This, in turn, inter- 

We think a significant factor eres with air and water move- 

‘and help 

  | ment and encourages disease. 

A thick layer of thatch may | 

from reaching the soil, says Mit- 
chell. Under these conditions, 

grass will grow poorly and will 

i probably become brown and un- 

attractive by midsummer. 

Clippings may be particularly 
serious early in the season when 

grass is making active growth. 
If the grass is unusually tall be- 

' Lincoln. 

——— 

fore mowing and if clippings are | 
overly thick, they may even 

smother the grass. 

To prevent an over accumula- 
tion of thatch, attach a tray or 

bag to your lawn mower to 

catch clippings, advises Mitchell. {+ 
If grass is exceptionally tall and 

the bag fills rapidly, it may be 

easier to rake the lawn after 

mowing. 

Use clippings as a mulch in 

your flower or vegetable garden 

and around ornamentals, he adds. 

This will conserve soil moisture 
promote vigorous 

growth. Spread clippings evenly, 

taking care not to apply a heavy 

layer that might prevent water 

from reaching the soil. 

If your lawn has already de- 

veloped a dense layer of thatch, 

remove it immediately. In most 
areas, thatch removal tools may 

be rented at a nearby hardware 

or garden center. This implement 
has vertical cutting blades which 

move thatch to the surface to 

be raked and removed. Thatch, 
like clippings, may be used as a 

mulch. 

Thatch remowvial should be done 

when grass is growing vigorous- 

ly, says Mitchell. For bluegrass 
and fescue lawns, the best time 

is in the spring or late summer. 

In bermuda and zoysia, thatch 
should be removed in early or 
midsummer. 
  

Kent General | 
Hospital Notes 

Admission 

John Myers, Frederica 

Connie Reed, Felton 

Dorothy Hutson, 

Oliver Johnson, Harrington 

Louise Tatman, Felton 
Darlene Smith, Harrington 

Discharges 

Josephine Rash 

Connie Reed 

Births 

To Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Smith, 

Harrington, boy 
  [ 

Isaac P. King 

Isaac P. King, 73, of Green- 
wood, died Saturday night at the 

State Home at Smyrna after a 

long illness. 
King, a retired farmer, was the 

husband of the late Rosa A. King, 

unemployed ; prevent rain or irrigation water who died in 1960. ; 

He is survived by his son, Don- | EE Er 

ald R. of Greenwood; a brother, 
Oscar; and a sister, Mae, both of 

Services were held Wednesday 
afternoon at the Fleischauer Fu- 

neral Home in Greenwood with 

interment at St. Johnstown Cem- 

etery. 
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Delaware Food 
Market Report 

by Anne Holberton 

In this election year, barbe- 

cues are especially appropriate. 

Did you know as far back at 

George Washington's time barbe- 
cues were held as political ral- 

lies? Why not plan a barbecue 

for the Fourth of July and watch 

how your family rallies around 
an easily prepared pork roast, 

glistening with barbecue sauce 

as it whirls on a rotisserie. The 

meat will be delicious and the 

conversation will no doubt be 

stimulating as politics will cer- 
tainly be discussed. Pork sup- 

plies are expected to be fairly 

liberal during the month of July, 

although there will be a seasonal 

decrease from what we have had 

in recent months. 

The entire month should be 

one for the whole family to en- 

joy. This means the cook too is 

entitled to a vacation from some 

of the kitchen chores. Since July 

will be designated at national 

barbecue month, plan now to 

take advantage of the month’s 
liberal beef supply and make 

meat time part of the summer 

The hot dog, a symbol of easy 

eating, will be paid homage by 

the national hot dog month ob- 

servance. Hot dogs and cold cuts 

will be in abundance to meet the 
demand: of summer's fun meals. 

Turkey supplies continue to be 

large, and what is better than 

turkey salad served in a crisp 
lettuce cup when temperatures 
solar and appetites wiane. 

Harvesting of locally grown 
vegetables hit full swing in July. 

Prices are usually near their 

seasonal law and quality is tops. 
As you shop during the month, 
check lettuce, 

peppers, tomatoes, potatoes, cu- 

cumbers, carrots and onions— 
all are likely to be quite reason- 
ably priced. 

» Peaches are to be the leading 

fruit for July as production in 

three leading southern states will 

be nearly double this year. New 

Jersey begins harvesting during 

The plum crop is forecast at 12 

per cent larger than last year 

and: prices are already beginning 

  

SCOTT'S 
Furniture, Inc. 
Bridgeville, Delaware 
Bridgeville 302-337-8274 

JACK S. REDDEN 
Salesman 

398-3304 
Call After 6 P.M. 

ce 

beets, cabbage, 

July and a good crop is expected. 

  

definite change during July. Wa- 

termelon production is also up 

during July include blueberries, 

apricots, cherries, lemons, lime 

and canteloupe. Fresh fruit prices 

are expected to decline in re- 

sponse to the larger supplis. 
The picture remains bright at 

the egg counter, as supplies con- 

tinue heavy and prices reason- 
able. July production is expected 

to be only slightly below the rec- 
ord output of last year. 

An Old Disease . 
Vanity 

“Wherefore are these 

hid ?”’—Shakespeare. 
People have. been asking that 

question since the days of the 

medicine men who concealed 

their methods of artifice from 

‘tribal men. 

Periodically attention is direc- 

ted to the manner in which pub- 
lic officials as individuals or as 

groups become obsessed with the 
idea that public business can be 

transacted with more efficiency 
if publicity about it is discourag- 

ed. 
Executive sessions are some- 

times referred to as “sub rosa” 
which derives from an ancient 

custom of hanging a rose over 

the council table to indicate all 
present were sworn to secrecy. 

Those who have had experience 
with public officials using the 

gimmick of discouraging publici- 

ty will agree that most of the 

public business transactions by 

this method are better labeled 

“open secrets” because, as these 

are defined, they become pieces 
of information generally known, 

but not formally announced. 

  

things 

er a star-chamber session, offi- 

cials the next morning in their 

contacts with fellow citizens for- 
get about the hanging “rose” and 

blab about what they have done 
the night before in the public 

interest. All this in confidence 

and off the record, you know! 
Thus a secret becomes every- 

body’s secret before long. 

; fi ; on ; oe 

to edge down a bit. Look for a| 

this year. Other fruits to look for \cret about what they did several 

The reason for this is that aft- | 

  

  

SHOP AND SWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS 

Call     
398-3206 

   
  

  

If any public protest is raised 

about such methods, officials tell 

constitutents there is nothing se- 

months ago. It was done at a spe- 
cial session and transcribed offi- 
ciaaly on the minutes. 

In the long run, seldom is any- 

thing gained by an imposition of 

secrecy regarding public miat- 

ters. Infrequent occasions arise 
when delayed reports may be 

beneficial, but the trouble here 

is that the participants who see 
the need for muted publicity 

can’t keep their mouth shut more 

than 24 hours. In more than one 
public body there have been in- 

stances of this gab business fol- 
lowing executive sessions. 

Someone asks why citizens 
elected to public office become 

afflicted with the mania for dis- 

couraging publicity about their 

action relating to public business. 

The only explanation we can 

offer is that they come in con- 
tact with a virus which weakens 

their resistance and causes them 
to become victims of bumptious, 

   
   

  

You know, the kind of vanity 
that under-teenage children in- ; 
dulge in: Tg RA 

“I know something you don’t 
know!”—Sedalia (Mo.) Democrat 

® 

Mrs. Robert Peterson 5 

Mrs. Sadie M. Peterson, 67, of 4 
nelar Frederica, died Monday at 
Milford Memorial hospital ii 

a brief illness. 5 

She was the wite of Robert 2 
Peterson. 

Other survivors include ree 
daughters, Mrs. Betty Storey =. : 

Leipsic, Mrs. Lorraine Moyer of 

Bowers Beach and Mrs. Kathryn 
Greenfield of Loring Air Force 
Base, Maine; a foster son, George 

Boone of Smyrna; 15 griandchil- 
dren; two great- -grandchildren; 

two sisters, Miss Lillian Moore 
of Pottstown, Pa., and Mrs. Eliz- 

abeth Thompson of Wyoming, and 

a brother, Leslie Moore of Rising 

Sun. 
Services were held yesterday 

afternoon at the Trader Funeral 
Home, Dover. Interment was in 

  

  mundane vanity. Odd Fellows Cemetery, Camden. 

  

SILVER - 
WATCHES - 

10 Commerce St. 

HARRINGTON JEWELERS 
CRYSTAL - 
DIAMONDS - 

WATCH & JEWELRY REPAIRS 
Phone 398-3866 

CHINA 
GIFTS 

Harrington, Del. 

  

ARNOLD B. 

Office 398-3551 

Sales - REAL ESTATE - Service ; 

HARRINGTON, DEL. 

Telephones: 

50S 

GILSTAD 

  

  INSURANC 
Complete 

ERNEST RAUGHLEY 
3 AGENCY . 

Service For Your = * 3 
Insurance Needs | 

Phone wea 

    
  

MODELS 
LOW Ng 

We Have Any Size In Stock For Immediate 

No Down Payment 
We Service 

STORE HOURS: (9 to 6 
By Apointment — 

> $109% 
Delivery 

EASY TERMS 
Everything We Sell 

except Friday — 9 to 9) 
Anytime) 

GERARDI BROS. 
3 Locations to Serve You 

HARRINGTON 
398-3757 

FEDERALSBURG 
754-2841 

DENTON 
479-1626   
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/ ‘Business Directory 
. For Your Convenience to Find Products and 

Dependable Service from these Reliable Merchants 

  

  

BANKING 

  

    

  

  

_.  @ Travelers   ® Savings Accounts 

® Safe Deposit Boxes 

FIRST NATIONAL BANK 

    

    

  

   

    

  

   

SERVICES | . 

FULL BANKING SERVICE | 
® Checking Accountsg 
® Bank by Mail Cheques 
® Personal Loans 

Salmon’s 

FURNITURE ~~ 3 

PHILCO APPLIANCES a E 
2 3 Miles South on Rt. 13 el 

    

    

       

    

        

Furniture Sore. 

  

  

f Harrington iC 

Commerce St. es of FDIC. 398-3232 HARRINGTON, DELAWARE Phone 398-8557 

BUILDING MATERIALS | GAS SERVICE 
  

     

  

Harrington Lumber 
& Supply Co. 

Fuel Oil — Building Materials 

    

   
    

PROTANE GAS 

Fast — Clean — Economical 

The Protane Corporation 

   

   

  

    

    
   

     

  

     

  

“Friendly Service Always” 

LEGGETT’S 
Department Store, Inc. 

MILFORD 

N.E. Front St. 422-9641 

      

      

   

   

        

  

“The Fashion 

S. Walnut St. 

  

Emanuell 
Lovelerman St. 

Store of the Eastern Shore” 

DOVER 
MILFORD 

  

“Nationally advertised 

Loockerman St. DOVER   Emanuell 
MEN’S and STUDENTS’ SHOP 

Milford Sumpinst Center MILFORD 422-7357 

brands” 

736-1479 

   
    
   

      

    

   

     
   

734-5886 | 
422-5792 | 

General Contractors : " 
 Hossiungton, Dilavidre Phone 305.3242 130 Commerce St. 393-3263 Harrington 

| CLOTHING MOBILE HOMES 

New and Used 

US. 13 - Harrington 

D&R Trailer Sales, Inc 

   

      

   
   

   

    

    

   

MOBILE HOMES 

398-3418 
  

  

  

  

  

  

PHARMACY Ta 

CLENDENING’S 
Quillen’s Shopping Center 

   

  

   

  

   

    

    

    

   
    

First Aid 

Products 

Harrington, Del. 
  

FARM EQUIPMENT 

  

  

TAYLOR & MESSICK, INC. 

  

   

        

    

            

He 
FN J) 

  

  

    
  

JOHN DEERE am 
TRACTORS and IMPLEMENTS RETR (os 

QUICK SERVICE ae . Lo 
ernon Rad. 398-3729 Harrington 

PRINTING a 
FOR SPECIAL PRINTING, SEE US FIRST 

THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL
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~ Poems from Paradise Pastures 

By W. Cliff Miller 

In these days when we are so terribly concerned about 

draft dodging and juvenile delinquency, let us hear what 

James Howard, 17-year-old senior of Salt Lake City, 

wrote after he visited the tomb of the unknown soldier at 

Arlington: 

“You lie in your cold grave—triumphant in death be- 

cause you died a free man, and I wonder what tribute 

can I pay to you—a patriot who loved freedom and country 

‘enough to forfeit life and name on a foreign battlefield? 

I would thank you—but words of thanks cannot penetrate 

    

the grave. I would weep for you—but tears can neither 

stir your body nor warm your still heart. 

I would comfort you as a brother—but brotherhood 

cannot surmount the obstacle of eternity. 

I would show you the free land you helped to save 

—but your vision is blocked by the curtain of death. 

So I will offer you the one tribute that makes your 

death meaningful and my life worthwhile. 

I will honor your memory by pledging myself to those 

ideals for which you fought 
~ freedom, the love of liberty, 

and died — the defense of 

and a peaceful future. 
Thus will your death enrich my life, thus will my 

actions honor your unknown 

So let us not forget the price, 

name.” 

~ Nor lightly hold the sacrifice, 
Of earnest, daring Yankee boys, 
Living their lives and earthly joys, 

And all they ’ere held dear to them, 

That we might profit in the end. 

  

A Farewell Letter 
From Beth 

As my days here in i] 

ton come to a close I feel like | 
telling you some of the thoughts 

that went through my mind the, 

other day. It’s only natural to 

look back to the beginning now 

that the end is almost here. It has 

been a wonderful year and a] 
great experience. I remembr my 

first days last August, days as 

hot and damp like I never ex- | 
perienced them before. The, 
change from the rather slow pace 
of Europe to the rather fast pace’ 

of the USA was drastic but ex-' 
citing. Slowly I began to make 

friends and began to fit in with 

my new family. Everybody was, 
‘so friendly and patient with me 
that this fitting in was rather 
easy. At the beginning of Sep- 

tember school started; a very 

confusing experience to meet new 

people all day long and to con- 

centrate in a foreign language. 

The first weeks were very hard 

but I kept looking forward and 
one day I made the great discov- 

ery that I actually was thinking 

in English. Since that day my 

German got way back in my 

mind and it will need some prac- 
tice when I get home. A 

As 1967 came to close my days 

got busier with speeches, meet- 
ings and school activities all over 

the state of Delaware. Life began 

to become miatural and I discov- 
ered that people aren’t to differ- 

ent over here. There might be 
small differences that are caused 

by the way we were raised but 

basically we are the same all ov- 
er the world. This experience I'll 

never forget. Our AFS motto ex- 

presses my thoughts the best: 

“Walk together, talk together, 

all ye people of the earth, then 

and only then, shall ye have 
peace.” 

We walked and talked togeth- 

er this year and as I said part of 
my heart will always stay here 

in Harrington for Harrington has 
become my second home. 

I'll soon cross the ocean once 

~ more but the memories of this 
year will remain forever. I hope 

I'll be able to keep in touch with 
miany of you in the years to come 

and some day I'll be coming over 

to visit you all again. 

Now I'd like to thank everyone 
in the community for their 

friendship, especially the AFS 

chapter, the faculty, the class of 

’68 and last but not least of all 

my American family. They have 

been the best foster family there 

ever had been and they have done 
more for me than I ever can ex- 
press in words. 

I'll be leaving June 29 to tour 

the USA for three weeks and af- 
terwards the SS Waterman will 

bring about 700 of us back home. 
Farewell, 

always yours 

Elsbeth Amsler 
Muehlegasse 29 

4800 Zofingen 

Switzerland 

doors will be wide open for you 

and besides that: Switzerland is 

beautiful! 
  

The Day Taxes 
Were Abolished 

The day taxes were abolished 

dawned with a brilliant sunrise. 

There was excitement in every 
household. A great weight had 

been lifted. No more income tax- 
es, real estate taxes, excise tax- 

es, luxury taxes, sales taxes, sur- 

taxes, movie ticket taxes, inherit- 

ance taes. No taxes to die. 

“Hurry up, or youll be late 

for school,” said mothers all over 
the country. 

“Isn’t any,” beamed millions of 

youngsters. “Teachers told us 

yesterday that public schools 

wiouldn’t run any more. Isn’t that 

fun!” 

There was a sound of a crash 

at the corner. 

“Accident! Accident!” shouted 

the children, grabbing jackets to 

run down and see. 

It was a bad one. The traffic 

lights on the corner, all traffic 

lights in town were not operating. 
No squad car came — no police 

on the job, no tax money to pay 

them. No ambulance arrived — 
no funds for it. 

When the children and their 

mother came back to finish 

breakfast, the excitement of the 

first day without taxes was be- 
ginning to bite back. No sooner 

were they in the house than 

there wias a shout from two hous- 

es away. 

“Fire,” yelled Mrs. 

“Help!” 

Since there would be no fire- 

men arriving—the taxless com- 

munity couldn't employ such 
men or equipemnt — the John- 

son house burned down to the 

basement. y 
Meantime, the men of the com- 

munity who worked downtown 

were fuming. Traffic had snarl- 

ed hopelessly because the traffic 

lights were out there, too. When 

they did get to the office, no 

mail was delivered. Until the 
postage rates could be tripled, 

there wasn’t enough money to 

pay everybody in the department 

which always operated at a de- 
ficit that taxes had to make up. 

The hold up artists thought the 

taxless day fine. No police to 
interfere. It wis like the wild 

west, with the sheriff off on va- 

cation. Help yourself at gunpoint. 

- By lunchtime, there was frus- 

tration. 

Griandpa’s Social Security 

check didn’t come—and wouldn't 
any more. No taxes to raise the 

money. The man tossed out of his 

job, when the company moved to 
another state, couldn’t get unem- 

ployment payments. That fund 
hiad quit, too. 

The University was silent. Not 
a class, not a teacher, janitor, 

dean, librarian, or even the wo- 

man: who made the gelatin des- 

sert with the canned fruit in the 
Student Union. 

It was great to buy gasoline 

Johnson. 

  ~ P.S.—Be sure to take a trip to 
Switzerland pretty soon. The 

minus the eleven cent tax on 

every gallon. But the prospect 

‘of no new highways, no mainten- 
ance on the current ones, brought 
a feeling of uneasiness. 

In the plants across the state, 

layoffis went into the tens of 

thousands of workers. For all de- 
fense spending — tax supported 

—had stopped. No more astro- 
nauts, no more missiles, no warn- 

ing radar, no Army, Navy, Ma- 
rines, Coast Guards. Some of 

the unemployed, of course, were 

quickly put to work digging 

wells and installing septic tanks. 

It was delightful, that day, to 
thing that all of the sounds of 
state legislatures would be still- 

ed. No speeches, no committees, 

no lobbying. The state capitals 
would become ghost towns. 

And in Wiashington, the whole 

show wias permanently cancelled. 

Back to their home states came 

the men and women of Congress. 

No laws. The Supreme Court 
hung up their robes. No deci- 

sions. The man who runs the ele- 

Bay-Bridge Tunnel | 
Bluefish Start 
Biting Soon 
When summertime comes to 

Chesapeake Bay, the bluefish 

there beg to be caught! 

Sound like a fish story? It is, 

but it’s a true one. 

Last summer, according to Cap- 

tain Billy Williams, manager of 
Sea Gull Pier, the 625-foot fish- 
ing pier built out from the Ches- 

apeake Bay Bridge-Tunnel three 

and a half miles off shore, two 
fishermen caught 85 bluefish in 

one night. “The fishermen could 

hardly bait their hooks fast 
enough to keep those fish hap- 

py,” he reports. 

Since there is no limit to the 
number of fish that can be caught 

the record of 85 will probably be 
broken this summer. More and 

more fishermen, intrigued with   vator in the Washington monu- 
ment locked up his cab and left. 

At dinner that night the fami- 
ly that had been so excited in 

the morning was in near panic. 

What if their house should catch 
fire? How were the youngsters | 

to get a public school or state 

university education? What if 

prowlers were suspected and no 
police could be called? 
And what of next summer? 

The prospects of the beauty of 

the parks turning into untended 

weediness, the cry for help from 

the wiater at a public beach now 
with no life guard? 

The day taxes were abolished 
ended very differently from the 
way it had begun. 

In chiaos.—Minneapolis Tribune 
  

Sixteen Years Ago 
Friday, June 27, 1952 

The second annual Kiddies Day 
picnic will be held Wed., July 9, 

at Wheeler's Park, it was an- 

nounced this week by Chosen 

Friends Lodge, Independent Or- 

der of Odd Fellows, sponsor of 
the event. 

The first diesel-electric loco- 

motives, in regular use on the 

Delmarva division of the Penn- 

sylvania Railroad, put in their 

appearance at 2:33 a.m., Saturday 

when two 1600-horsepower units 
arrived from Wilmington with 
Passenger Train No. 469. The 
same units returned at 5:46 p.m., 

the same day with Passenger 

Train No. 4554 bound for Wil- 
mington. Locomotive numbers 
were 8473 and 8474. 

The gravel has been hauled but 
further work on the city’s new 

parking lot awaits the, arrival 
of a grader, Jehu Camper, mem- 
ber of the Lion's Community Bet- 
terment group, said. The lot is 
on Hanley Street in the rear of 
Quillen’s Apartment. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chipman Minner 
and Miss Irene Brown spent Sun- 
day at Tolchester Beach. 

Mr. and Mrs. Preston Moore, 
Ronald and Peggy Jean, visited 
Myrtle Beach, S.C., and Charles- 
ton, S.C. They also visited Cpl. 
John Minner at Camp Gordon, 
Gia. 

S/Sgt. Linwood Kates, of the 
Third Armored Cavalry, has re- 
ceived his discharge fraom Camp 
Pickett, Va. He is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Kates. 

The Rev. H.B. Sellers, Metho- 
dist minister-journalist, and long- 
time student of the alcohol prob- 
lem, will deliver a special address 
at Felton Methodist Church, 
Wednesday at 8 p.m. 

Reese B. Harrington, of Reese 
Theatre, has returned after an 
extended stay at a Wilmington 
hospital, and is again taking some 
part in his business interests. 

Funeral services for Solomon 
Roland Ford, 83, of Canterbury, 
were held Saturday in the Berry 
Funeral Home, Felton. The Rev. 
Grier Baker, pastor of Pilgrim 
Holiness Church, officiated. 

Mr .and Mrs. Harry IL. Boyer, 
50 Commerce St., celebrated their 
25th wedding anniversary Thurs- 
day. 

  

Robert Lee Johnson 

Robert Lee Johnson, 36, of 
Coleman street, died Monday af- 

ternoon in Milford Memorial 

hospital after a short illness. 

He was a horse groom in Har- 
rington. 

He is survived by his mother, 
Mrs. Edith Johnson of Harring- 

ton; two brothers, William T. of 

Harrington and Curtis W. of 

Chester, Pa.; and six sisters, Mrs. 

Virginia Benson, Mrs. Marian 

Anderson, Mrs. Delema Smith, 

Mrs. Edith Harris, Mrs. Lucille 

Mosley and Mrs. Gloria Jean 
Scott, all of Harrington. 

Services will be Saturday aft- 

ernoon at 2 at Metropolitan Meth- 
odist Church, Harrington. Friends 

may call Friday night at the 

McKnatt Funeral Home, Harring- 
ton. Interment will be in Wil- 

liamsville Cemetery, near Hous- 
ton. 
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the idea of saltwater fishing 

from a stationary base instead of 

a rolling boat, are fishing from 

the pier. However, space is as 
plentiful as fish; the pier ac- 
commodates more than 500 fish- 

ermen at one time. 

Blue fish start biting off Sea 

Gull Pier, Williams says, around 
June 15 and they don’t let up 

until mid-September. 

for three sizes of bluefish, two 

of which are caught from the 
pier. These are “tailor blues” 

which weigh about a pound and 

are generally caught at night, 

when they come near the surface 

for a look at the bright lights of 

‘the Chesapeake Bay Bridge-Tun- 

nel, which stretches across thel 
mouth of the Bay like a 17.6- 

mile- long rhinestone necklace. 

The second kind of Dbluefish 

that abounds in the waters off 

the pier is a “snapper blue,” 

weighing = from one to four 

pounds. The third member of the 
species, called simply a “blue,” 

weighs from four to 25 pounds 

and is rarely seen closer than 15 

to 20 miles out in the ocean. 

The length of bluefish waries 

with the weight. A one-pound 

“tailor” may be 14 inches long, 

while a three-pound ‘snapper,” 

a real “rod buster,” may have 

to sportsmen. 
The largest “snlapper blue” ev- 

er caught from Sea Gull Pier 

weighed three and a half pounds 

and measured about 21 inches. 
Other fish that are frequently 

caught near the pier during the 

summer months include flound- 
er, croaker, spots, grunts, rock- 

fish and black and red drum. 

The latter run to tremendous 

size. The largest ever caught off 

Sea Gull Pier was a 48 pound 

“monster.” 
Sea Gull Pier is built out from 

one of the Bridge-Tunnel’s four 

man-made islands. The island al- 

so has a well-equipped coffee 
shop and snack bar. Both the 

pier and the coffee shop are open 

around. the clock from May 1 to 

September 30. For the conven- 

ience of patrons without tackle, 

it may be rented at the pier. 

Bait can also be purchased. Tack- 

le rental runs $1 a day for chil- 
dren, $2 for adults with depos- 

its of $10 to $15 respectively. 

Bait runs from fifty cents up, de- 
pending on quantity and kind. 

Nio license is needed for salt wa- 

ter fishing. 
Fishermen using the Bridge- 

Tunnel’s Sea Gull Pier pay only 

a one-way toll, $4, for car and 

driver (plus 85 cents for extra 

passengers 6 years of age and 

over) and $1 for fishing. Once on 
the pier, there’s no time limit. 

The fisherman can stay there all 

day . . . and all night, too, if he's 

a real avid angler. “It’s much 

cheaper to fish from Sea Gull 

Pier than to rent a boat,” the 

capflain points out. “In the Vir- 

ginia Beach area, a small out- 

board rents for $10 a day.” There 

is no parking charge for parking 

at the Pier and more than 300 
spaces are available. 

Although fishing off the Pier 

hours are during flood tides or 

ebb tides, Williams says. 

The Bridge-Tunnel not only 

offers motorists a chance to try 
their fishing luck without leav- 

ing the highway, but it provides 

an added boon for fishermen who 

do their traveling in trailers. 

Vehicles using the Bridge-Tun- 
nel can carry two 20-pound ca- 

pacity flanks of I,C.C.-approved 

compressed cooking or refrigerat- 
ing gas if the tank walves are 

completely shut off and if the 

tanks are securely attached to 
the vehicle. The tanks can be 

full, partally full or empty. Lar- 
ger flanks can be carried if they 

are emptied and purged, and if 

the driver has a certificate to 
that effect from a recognized 

gas hlandling company. Many 
tunnels ban all vehicles carrying 

compressed gas, or insist that 

tanks be drained of gas and 

purged. 
The Chesapeake Bay Bridge- 

Tunnel is almost halfway be- 

tween Wilmington, N.C., and 

Wilmington, Del. Here are some 
of the approximate distances 

from Sea Gull Pier to popula- 

tion centers in the East: 
Wilmington, N.C., 280 miles; 

Elizabeth City, N.C., 45 miles; 

  
' Roanoke, Va., 245 miles; Rich- 

| York during the blackout.” 
The Chesapeake Bay is famous ; 

mond, Va., 105 miles; Petersburg, 
Va., 95 miles; Appomattox, Va. 

| 150 miles; Charlottesville, Va., 

160 miles; Philadelphia, Pa., 254 
i miles; Salisbury, Md. 120 miles; 
| Dover, Del., 165 miles; Wilming- 

ton, Del., 215 miles. 

Fishermen who plan to stay 

overnight, can find ample accom- 

modations either on the Eastern 
Shore, at the Bridge-Tunnel’s 

northern terminus, or in the Vir-: 

| ginia Beach-Norfolk area, south 

of the Bridge-Tunnel. 

Our Combat GP's 
Air Force Sgt. James E. Price, 

Jr. of Easton, who is stationed 
at Da Nang, recently sent his 

parents an article which appear- 

ed in the service newspaper, 

Stars and Stripes. i 

The article, written by Lt. R. 
L. Kellymeyer, reads as follows: 

A soldier returning home from 

Vietnam will find that people 

can’t yet point the country out 

on a map, can’t guess the num- 

ber of weekly casualties there, 

can’t figure out who the enemy 

is, and can’t understand what it’s 

all about except they guess free- 

dom is involved. 
“You think Vietnam is bad?” 

a state-sider will grin. “Brother 

you should have been in New 

  

  
  

“Too bad you're home,” anoth- 

er adds grimly. “Traffic’s terri- 

ble.” 
“Lia Drang?” a third will say. 

“Nothing. You should’a seen the 

Battle of the Bulge. Now that 

was real war.” 
Vietnam is still a pop art od- 

rity 12,000 miles away. 

The public worries more about 

living with a possible tax in- 

crease. Officials worry about liv- 

ing with world opinion. The GI 

worries only about living. 

In his world there is nightly 
blackout and mortar traffic. It’s 

alive with booby traps that can 

blow his legs or his life to shreds. 
It’s occupied with an enemy and 

an ally that look exactly alike. 

He would give a month’s pay 

for a sound sleep. 
And 10 years of his life for a 

night at home. 
He is not a bit player in a com-   

grown to 22 inches. Either way, in an international 

a bluefish is a lot of fish and|and not 12,000 miles away but 
a lot of fun to catch, according ; 

is good all the time, the best] 

ic opera conflict, not the trump 
card game 

as near as the muddy and bloody 

pictures in the newspapers. 
Moreover, he is usually a very 

young American citizen in a hell 

of a fix. The average age of a 
combat GI in Vietnam is 18%. 

But what a man he is! 

A pink-cheeked, tousled-haired, 

tight muscled fellow who, under 

normal circemstances, would be 

considered by society as half- 

milan, half-boy, not yet dry be- 

hind the ears, a pain in the em- 

ployment chart. 
But right now, he is the beard- 

less hope of free men. 
He is for the most part unmar- 

ried and without material pos- 
session except for possibly an old 

car at home and a transistor ra- 

dio here. 
He listens to rock ‘n’ roll and 

the 105mm howitzers. 
He hjas learned to like beer by 

now because it is cold and be- 

cause it is “the thing to do.” He 

smokes because he gets free cig- 
arettes in his C-ration package 

and it is also the thing to do. 
‘He still has his trouble spell- 

ing, and writing letters home is 

a painful process. But he can 

break down a rifle in 30 seconds 

and put it black together again 
in 29. He can describe the nom- 

enclature of a fragmentation gre- 
nade, eyplain how a machinegun 

operates and, of course, utilize 

either if the need arises. 
He obeys now, without hesita- 

tion. But he is not broken. 

He has seen more suffering 

than he should have in his short 
life. He has stood among hills of 
bodies and he has helped to con- 

struct those hills. 
He has wept in public and in 

private, and he is not s¥amed) 
  

in either place, because his pals 
have fallen in battle and he has 
come close to joining them. 

And he has become self-suffi- 

cient he hlas two pairs of fatigues, 

wiashes one and wears the other. 

He sometimes forgets to brush 
his teeth, but not his rifle. 

He keeps his socks dry and 
his canteen full. He can cook his 

. own meals, fix his own hurts and 

mend his own rips—material or 

mental. 

He will share his water with 

you if you thirst, break his ra- 

tions in half if you hunger, split 

‘his ammunition if you are fight- 
ing for your life. 

He can do the work of two 

civilians, draw half the pay of 

one and find ironic humor in it 
all. He has learned to use his 

hands as a weapon and his wea- 

pon as his hiands. He can save a 

life or, most assuredly take ome. 

Eighteen-and-a-half years old. 

What a man he is . . . already. 
—FEaston (Md.) Star-Democrat 

Collective 
Bargaining On 
The Farm 

The farms of America are the 

most successful producing farms 

in the world and in all history. 
The world envies this produc- 

tion. 

And here at home we call it 
“the farm problem.” 

There. is a problem involved— 

the farmer is not getting as much 

a return on his production as he 

should have. 

In a recent widely quoted edi- 

torial on the subject the Wash- 

ington (D.C.) Post had this to 
say: 

A very well qualified panel of 

economists has reported to the 

National Planning Association 

that collective bargaining by ag- 
riculture is not a very hopeful 

method of improving farm pric- 

es and profits. 
Many proponents of this prac- 

tice have hoped it might cut the 

spread between farm prices and 

consumer prices, but the commit- 

tee found that although food pro- 

cessing profits were high in a 

few branches “in most fields” 

they were “below the average 

for the economy as a whole”. 

The distinctions between labor 

and agriculture explain some of 
the panel’s doubts. They think it 

much harder for farmers to 

withhold crops than for workers 

to withhold labor. They see a 

bargain that raises prices pulling 

more products into market. They 

dan discover no simple means of 
deciding who will hold back com- 

modities in surplus that resem- 

bles the simple seniority rule on 

who will hold back labor. It is 

  

Expel the Rioting Students - 

Across this nation there are 

young people anxious to get into 

college in order to get an educa- 

  

may diminish the capacity of this 

country and other commodity 

producers to meet a rising de- 

mand for food and fiber that is 

going to be induced by the popu- 

lation explosion. If collective bar- 

gaining will not work, the farm- 

ers are justified in asking the 

National Planning Association 
and its experts: “What will?”— 
Mexico (Mo.) Daily Ledger 

Emer ime 

Mrs. Bessie H. Handloser 
Mrs: Bessie H. Handloser, 69, 

of Bridgeville, died Wednesday 

afternoon in Milford Memorial 

Hospital, after a short illness. 

She was a former resident of 

the Greenwood area. After the 

death of her husband, William 
Handloser last year, she moved 

near Bridgeville. : 
She is survived by one son, 

William H. Handloser, Bridge- 

ville; two daughters, Mrs. Violet 

Williamson, Bridgeville and Miss 

Rose Handloser, formerly of 
Bridgeville, mow a missionary 

with the World Mission, Kansas, 

City, Mo.; four grandchildren; 

two sisters, Mrs. Janey Day and 

Mrs. Edna Tindall, both of Har- 

rington; and one brother, Nor- 

man Morgan, Georgetown. 

Funeral services will be held 
tomorrow morning at 11 o'clock 

at the Fleischauer Funeral Home, 

Greenwood, where friends may 

call from 9to 11 Saturday morn- 
ing. 

Interment will be in St. Johns- 
town Cemetery, Greenwood. 

o   
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And Professors Who Encourage Them 
tion. 

And across this nation are some 

young people in college deter- 
mined to disrupt the education 

process at too many colleges. 

The ‘answer seems obvious: 
We need more college presi- 

dents with enough guts to kick 

out the college rioters and let in 

the young people who want an 
education. 

However, that is not the whole 
answer. 

There are a lot of college pro- 

fessors encouraging the rioters. 

Well, they ought to be booted, 
100. 

And the do-gooders will be 
shocked. 

What do you mean: kick out 

the rioting students and their 

professors? Don’t you believe in 
the right to protest? 

Yes, we believe in the right to 
protest. 

We are now protesting the riot- 
ing at colleges. 

Anyway, after the rioters are 

kicked out of colleges, they can 

go right on protesting and miarch- 

ing and growing beards and 

smoking pot if they please. 

And the other young people 

who are interested in getting a 

college education can go on about 

the business of preparing for a 

still higher order of citizenship. 
—Mexico (Mo.) Daily Ledger   
  

   

                        

Mohawk-Megee 

Wall to Wall Carpeting 

Inlaid Linoleum 

Expertly Installed 

Gerardi Bros. 
Harrington 398-3757 

Federalsburg 754-2841 

Denton 479-1626 

  

  pointed out that farmers have 

been opposed even to the man- 

datory controls of various Fed- 

eral programs most closely re-, 

sembling the sort of scarcity that 

might be induced by collective 

bargaining. ; 

What the panel is really saying 

is that no one has yet discover- 

| 

1 ed a way to give the farmers, dis- 
persed, diversified and disorganiz- 

ed as they are, bargaining lev- 

ers to match those of labor and 

industry in an economy of secar- 
city prices. Not only American 

farmers, but farmers and produc- 

ers of raw materials everywhere 

find themselves at a disadvan- 

tage in a world where everybody 
else has better control of supply 

and therefore of prices. It is this 
marketing disadvantage that is 

contributing to the disparity be- 

tween rural and urban standards 

of living and preventing a better 

urban-rural population balance, 

Collective bargaining might not 
work for agriculture, but the 

search. for some equivalent 

should continue. The present in- 

equality in economic rewards, as 

between industrial and agricul- 
tural producers, ultimately may 

produce dislocation of a very se- 

rious kind. In the long run, it 
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cation to the “little man” i 

the facts. 

the state. There were 15 

ator Reynolds duPont of 
“not voting.” 

“oh, well, he doesn’t have 
rest home anyway.” 
worry about those people w 

has yet to become law. 

phant has not changed his 

sion and at frequent other 
it was Democratic concern 

legislative record reflects 
the man who would serve 
ficing yours. 

terest in the well being of 
decades of steady progress   your friend know that his 
the Democratic Party.   

    

51 
STOKE) 

WALESby   
    

Republicans would have you believe that their dedi- 

and the bill needed 14 votes to pass. 
cluding all of the Democrats present. 

Those it failed to get were represented by the ma- 

jority leader, Senator Eugene Bookhammer of Lewes 

who “took a walk” and the President Pro Tem, Sen- 

   

s sincere and reliable. 

But a situation that developed in the General As- 

sembly early Friday morning is more illustrative of 

A bill was before the Senate to make bond funds 

available for the construction of nursing homes in 
Senators in the Chamber 

It got 13, in- 

Greenville, who answered 

It prompted the appropriate remark from one source, 
to worry about going to a 

And apparently he isn’t going to 
ho do. 

Another illustration of Republican dualism came on 

a resolution to prevent state directors of the Farmers’ 

Bank from borrowing funds from the bank. The 
same Republicans who paid lip-service against dual 
job-holding were most reluctant to prevent a conflict 
of interest in the bank situation and the resolution 

What it boils down to is that the Republican ele- 
appearance since the hide- 

bound indifference he demonstrated during the depres- 
times in our history when 
and vitality that got our 

state and country moving in the right direction. 

Republicans say they like the “little man”, but their 
no such position. Beware 
his own interest by sacri- 

When you go to the polls on election day cast your 
ballot for the men and women of the Democratic 
Party who have demonstrated their concern and in- 

all citizens through many 
for all mankind. And let 
own interest also lies with 
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All ads in this column must be 

RATE SCHEDULE 
paid for in advance. This is the 

only way in which orders will be accepted for want ads. No ad 

order accepted for less than $1. If you have an ad which you 

want inserted, count the words (name and address included), 
and multiply by the number of times you want the ad to run. 
Send that amount with the advertisement. 

  One Insertion, per word 

Repeat Insertion, per word 

\ With Black Face Type & CAPITALS, per word 
Classified Display, per column inch 
Public Sales, per column inch 

Card of Thanks, Memorial, per line 

— 4 cents 

3 cents 

5 cents 

$1.25 

$1.50 

15 cents 

  

  

  

(Minimum $1.50) 
Legal Advertising, per. col. inch 

Accounts of bakes, dinners, 

are considered as advertisements. 

$2.10 
rummage sales, entertainments 

If you charge, we charge. 

  

  

BE WISE — ADVERTISE 
SHOP AND SWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS 

  

Wallpaper, new patterns just ar- 
{ved.—Taylors Hardware, spr-azn) 

tf 3-25 

  

I 
  

~~ SERVICES 

Butler's TV Service 
EMERSON TV - COLOR 

Uomplete Antenna Sales & Service 

EARL BUTLER 

Harrington, Del. 
tf 3-18 

  

  

  

  

  
New and used mobiie homes and 

trailers. Your best deal with full 
let-up from a dependable dealer. 
HIGH POINT MOBILE HOM £ 
SALES, U.S. 113 & 113A 3 miles 
north of Frederica, Delaware. 
Telephone 3365-58186. tf 4-16 

  

For Sale—Blank oninnskin, four 
pieces, with three pieces of carhon, 
assembled in sets. Dimension, Six 
3%. Good for pencil or typewriter. 
Cost 5¢ each, regardless of quautity. 
The Harrington Journal tf 
  

We buy and sell used Furniture. 
Harvey's Bargain Center, Harring- 
lon-Milford Road, Phone Ch 1. 

3 tf 10-15 
  

  

LINOLEUM ~— Cushioned and 
regular, in three widths 6-9 and 
12 ft. Argo Linoleum Co.,” Milford 
422-8431. tf 5-12 

S For sale—Envelupes—100 plain 
$ 3/4 env. $.76; 100 window 6 3/4 
env. $.85; 100 No. 10 env. $1.00. The 
Harrington Journal office. tf 

WALLPAPER and PAINT—Large 
selection in stock. Argo Linoleum 
Co., Milf rd 422-8431. tf 5-12 

PEN". EL SIGN PENS FOR SALE 
—49¢ each. The Harrington Journal. 
Phone 398-3206. tf 

  

  

  
For sale—New Hoover steam and 

dry ‘iron. Call 398-8827. tf 12-8 

For Sale — Collegiate trombone 
by Holton, $155.00; 2 doors, 80x 
327x134” $5.00 each; 1 set double 
doors  847x367x13,” — $10.00. Call 
398-8820. tT 

For Sale 
gravel. Frank 
5132. 

  

  

  

and 
335- 
5-10 

House for sale — 5 rooms and 
bath down, 2 rooms partially fin- 
ished upstairs. Rt. 13, 4 miles below 
Harrington, $10,000. 398-8675. 

2t 6-28 exp. 

Topsoil, 
Porter, 

— sand, 
Phone 

itt 
  

  
  

OAKCREST LAWN 

ORNAMENTS 

Bird baths, flower pots, statu- 
ary items, benches. Open 

7 days — Wholesale or Retail. 
Killen’s Pond Houston 
Road. 

Phone 398-3949       

  

FORD TRUCK—For sale with 
200 bu. grain body, Oak, V8 flat 
head, very low milage, new paint, 
new 10-ply tires, excellent condi- 
tion throughout, licensed, ready to 
80, cheap. C. Bradley Steele, Sr, 1 
mi. east of Felton, Del. No. 12 high- | 
way. 7/5.'b 

FOR RENT | 
For Rent—Bungalow with heat, 

dining room, kitchen, back porch 
bathroom, bedrooms, living room, 
(enclosed), 
hook up for automatic washer, also 
garage, 53 Clark St. Available July 
1, Phone 398-8331. 2t 6-28 exp. 

  

  

  
Mobile Home Space for Rent— 

Approximately one acre with shade 
trees, near Harrington. Water and 
electricity. Phone 398-3471. 

2t 6-28 exp. 

For Rent—Apt. 4 rooms and bath. 
Furnished. 114 Dorman St., Phone 
398-3575. 2t 7/6 

HELP WANTED | 

  

  

  

Work in Comfort 

Air-Conditioned Plant 

0) 34 30 INTC 28) 7 

Experienced single needle, 

| overlock and blind stitching 

sewing machine operators. 

ALSO BEGINNERS 

] Mfg. — Shirts-Blouses-Dresses 

I Paid Vacation - Bonus 

Insurance 

Equal Opportunity Employer 

NEW ERA SHIRT COMPANY 

Harrington 398-3227   
  

A RAWLEIGH DEALER is never 
laid off. If you are looking for a 
steady weekly income of $150-$200 
or more. Write P. E. Bless, P. O. 
Box 818, Chester, Pa. 19013 for de- 
tails about a recent opening in 
Kent County. 4t 6-28 exp. 

DEMONSTRATE TOYS & GIFTS 
—PARTY PLAN Work now ‘til 
Christmas - High Commissions. Call 
or write ‘“Santa’s Parties”, Inc, 
Avon, Conn. 06001. Telephne 1-203- 
673-3455. 2tb 6-28 exp. 

WANTED—Male clerk, hardware 
store and lumberyard. Experience 
desired, but not necessary. Must be 
good at figures. Harrington Lumber 

and Supply Co. Phone 398-3241. 
: tf.b 6/21 

Wanted Mature, middle aged 
woman to live in to supervise three 
daughters, 11, 13 & 14. Very light 
house duty. Weekends off. Rodney 
Village area. Call 734-2902 after 9 
in evening to arrange interview. 

2t 7/5 

  

  

  

MATURE FARM machinery me- 
chanic. Top salary commensur- 
ate with experience. Fringe ben- 
efits. Phone 284-9288 for interview, 

tb. T/b 

SERVICES 
CUSTOM WELDING, Any location. 
Arc and acetylene. Contact Charles 
Pearson, near Masten’s Corner, 284- 
9162. tf 5-24 

  

  

  

front porch (screened), y 

SCHREIBER 

Heating & Plumbing 
FREE ESTIMATES 

Hot Water & Hot Air Systems 

Clarence (Pete) Schreiber 

Owner 

Call Harrington 398-3656     
  

  

IXXXXXXXXXXXIXXIXIIIIIIY 

ANTHONY GALLO 
Electrical Wiring, Heating 

Insulating & Air Conditioning 
SALES & SERVICE 

(Electric Heat, Hot Water & Hot 

Air Systems) 

Phone: 398-8481 

(If no answer call 398-3600) 
XXXXXXXXXZIXXX . « 

CARD OF THANKS | 
mn pn ate 

    

  
  

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to thank everyone for 

their kindness shown to us during 
the illness and loss of our wife and 
mother, Mrs. Effie Wright. Thank 
you for the beautiful cards and 
flowers, the beatuiful sympathy 
bouquets and food sent to our 
homes. We wish to thank Dr. Addis 
and Dr. Deyhle, Mrs. Steele, Mrs. 
Melvin, Mrs. Warrington, the Har- 
rington ambulance, and the many 
nurses and nurses’ aides of Milford 
Memorial Hospital for their won- 
derful “care.” We "glso*want to" ex- 
press our appreciation to Rev. Tay- 
lor for his visits and prayers. 

Wm. H. Wright and Family 
1t 6/28 

IN MEMORIAM | 
IN MEMORIAM 

In sad and loving memory of my 
husband, Ernest Hammond, who 
passed away June 27, 1963. 

  

Little did he think when leaving 
home, 

He would return no more, 
And leave me here to mourn; 
I do not know what pain he bore, 
I did not see his die, 
I only know he passed away, 
And I could not say good bye. 
Sad and sudden was the call 
Of one dearly loved by all. 
It was a. bitter grief 
And a shock so severe, 
To. part with one I loved so dear. 

Sadly missed and never be for- 
gotten by wife 

  

  

ELSIE 
1t 6/28 

7 

NOTICES 

Free Kittens—All males. Call 398- 
8372. . 1t 6/28 
  

+ Creditor’s Sale 

Personal Property 
By virtue of the power conferred 

on The Peoples Bank of Harrington, 
a corporation of the State of Dela- 
ware, by a certain Chattel Mort- 
gage made the 20th day of May A 
D. 1965 by and between James E. 
Hutson and Charlotte M. Hutson, 
his wife, Mortgagors, and The Peo- 
ples Bank of Harrington, a corpor- 
ation of the State of Delaware, 
Mortgages securing a loan upon 
the following personal property up- 
on which default has been made in 
the payment, The Peoples Bank of 
Harrington, a corporation of the 
State of Delaware, pursuant to the 
terms of the aforesaid Chattel 
Mortgage has seized the following 
personal property which will be 
exposed to Public Vendue, on the 
8th day of July A.D. 1968 at eleven 
o’clock in the a.m. on a lot belong- 
ing to James E. Hutson and Char- 
lotte , M. Hutson, his wife, located 
on the southern limits of the Town 
of Harrington adjacent to the Del- 
marva Power and Light Company 
substation on the east side of 
County Road #314 known as the 
Harrington-Farmington Road, 33rd 
Representative District, Mispillion 
Hundred, Kent County, State of 
Delaware: 

1963 G.M.C. Trac 
SHE 

1958 Tractor 
SHFA19926 

1963 Chev. Tractor 
#3T823P101336 

1957 

19523 

1953 

tor 
7009-N40425 

Intl. 

G.M.C. Tractor 
S#632X1864 

White Tractor 
SH#H425667 

G.M.C. Tractor 
SHHCR621-2277 

1957 Fruehauf S/Trl. 
SH#EFW 112429 

1955 Brown S/Trailer 
S# 855670 

1951 Fruehauf S/Trl. 
SHFW62480 

1956 Trailmobile 
S#31032-01643 

and other trucking Equipment too 

numerous to mention. 

Seized pursuant to the terms of 

the aforesaid Chattel Mortgage as 

the property of James E. Hutson 

and Charlotte M. Hutson, his wife, 

and will be sold for cash by The 

Peoples Bank of Harrington, a cor- 

poration of the State of Delaware. 
THE PEOPLES BANK 

OF HARRINGTON 

Harrington, Delaware 
19952 

2t 1/5 
  

NOTICE OF REDUCTION OF 

C APITAL 
OF 2 

MANDY WILLIAMS OLDS, INC. 

Notice is hereby given that a 

ertificate of Reduction of Capital 

Ce Section 244 of the General 

Corporation Law of the State of 

Delaware, in which it 1s certified 

that the capital of this corporation 

is reduced by the amount of $104,- 

053.02, was filed in the Office of 

the Secretary of Sees 9% the Sete 

( laware on une ) 2 

2 NDT WILLIAMS OLDS, INC. 

: Williams, By: Emanuel K brestdent 

1t 6/28   

[ 

    

  

Classified Rates | 
CREDIT SERVICE 

A bookkeeping of 

25¢ will be made for all 

Classified Ads not paid in 

advance and an - additional 

charge 

charge of 25¢ for each 30 days 

bills remain unpald. 

RATES ARE NET 

[ NOTICES = | 
NOTICE 

State Distributors, Inc., a corpor- 
ation of the State of Delaware, pre- 
sently licensed by the Delaware Al- 
coholic Beverage Control Commis- 
sion as an importer of beer in the! 
State of Delaware, conducting busi- 
ness from 717 East Fourth Street, 
Wilmington, Delaware and trading 
as All State Beer, hereby intends to 
file an application with the Dela- 
ware Alcoholic Beverage Control 
Commission for a license to also 
conduct business as an importer of 
beef in the State of Delaware from 
a warehouse located on the easter- 
ly side of U.S. Rt. 13, three miles 
north of Harrington, Delaware, R. 
D., Harrington, Delaware. 

3t 7-5 exp. 

PUBLIC SALE 
LOCATION: The Bessie Hargadine 

Estate in Felton, Delaware on Main 
& Church Streets across from Fel- 
ton Methodist Church. 

SATURDAY, JUNE 29, 1968 
11:00 A.M. rain or shine | 

Spi ANTIQT BIS 

pinning wheel, small Tilt-To 
Table, Umbrella Stand, Drop Look 
Mahogany Table, 2 Brass Beds, Sec- 
retary Desk, several Lamps, 3 Caned 
Rockers, Roll-Top Desk, Dovetailed 
Desk, several Cane Chairs, several 
Crocks, Mantle Clock, old Wall 
Clock, Brass Jardinier, Stone Crocks, 
Inlaid Sideboard, 3 Table Bells, Tea 
Cart, 3 Doll Babies, Wicker Baby 
Carriage, Wicker Baby Stroller, 3 
Blanket Chests, Chest of Drawers, 
set of China, Vases, Picture Frames, 
Dishes, Silverware, Iron Pot, Pew- 
ter, Brass Bucket, Hall Hat Rack 
with Mirror, ete. 

FURNITURE 
Chair and Sofa, Davenport, Book- 

case, Wing-Back Chair, Hall Table, 
Round Oak Table and 5 Chairs, 
Philco Refrigerator, Sewing Ma- 
chine, Gas Stove, Vacuum Cleaner, 
several Rugs, Clothes Tree, com- 
plete Bedroom Suite, several Chests, 
several Bureaus, several Lamps, Pots, 
Pans, Dishes, Barrels Mirrors, Hand 
and Garden Tools, ete. 

Terms: Cash Day of Sale 
Administrator 
LEVIN WRIGHT 

      
    

  

  

Auctioneer: 
Clarence T. Scuse Jr. 

653-7530 
Lunch Will Be Served 

2t 6-28 exp. 

SHERIFF'S SALE 
Of Valuable 

REAL ESTATE 
By virtue of a writ of Venditioni 

Exponas, for the sale of land to 
me directed, will be exposed to pub- 
lic sale by way of public vendue 
on the premises lying on the east 
side of Church Street in the Town 
of Bowers, South, Murderkill Hun- 
dred, Kent County, State of Dela- 
ware, 0 

TUESDAY, JULY 9, 1968 
at 10:00 A. M. Daylight Saving Time 

All that certain lot, piece and 
parcel of land with improvements 
of a two story frame dwelling and 
frame garage erected thereon and 
lying on the east side of Church 
Street in the Town of Bowers, 
South Murderkill Hundred, Kent 
County and State of Delaware, ad- 
joining lands on the north of John 
Moyer, on the east by lands now 
or formerly of Dorothy Miller 
Thompson, and on the south by 
lands of Ida Johnson and Willis 
Davidson, and further described as 
follows: 
BEGINNING at ‘a stake now set 

along the east side of said Church 
Street, said street being 20 ft. wide, 
and said stake being a corner for 
lands and premises of Willis David- 
son, and being distant 303.5 ft. 
north of the center of the concrete 
pavement (street pave) of Main 
Street when measured along the 
east side of said Church Street 
therefrom; thence running along 
the east side of said street, N. 42° 
30’ W. a distance of 50 feet to an- 
other stake set along the east 
street line, a corner for lands of 
John Moyer; thence turning and 
running therewith N. 49° 30’ E. a 
distance of 193.5 ft. to a corner post 
in line of lands of the said Thomp- 
son; thence turning and running 
therewith S. 41° E.-a distance of 111 

ft. to a corner post for said Thomp- 

son lands and lands of Tda Johnson; 

thence turning and running with 

the Johnson lands S. 46° 15° W. a 

distance of 115 ft. to a corner for 

lands of the said Johnson and lands 

of the said Davidson and lands of 

others; thence turning and run- 

ning with the Davidson lands N. 

42° 80’ W. a distance of 72 ft. to 

a post at a corner for the David=- 

son lands; thence turning and run- 

ning therewith S. 49° 30’ W. a dis- 

tance of 79 ft. 3 inches back to the 

place of beginning, and containing 

an area 16,690 sq. ft. of land, be 

the same more or less; 

AND BEING the same Ipnas 00d 

yremises which were conveye 

Prema Herbert D. Robbins and | 

Dorothy S. Robbins, his wife, by | 

deed of Flossie Davidson and Willis 

Davidson, her husband, bearing date 

September 26, 1946, of record in the 

Office of the Recorder of Deeds, in 

and for Kent County and State 

of Delaware, in Deed Record Book 

S, Volume 17 at Page 92. 

EXCEPTING, However, 10,940 sa. 

ft. of land conveyed unto John I. 

Moyer and Lorraine E. Moyer, his 

wife by deed of George W. Moyer 

in Deed Record Book X, Volume 

29 at Page 412 and dated Septem- 

  

- 

ber 3, 1964. ; 

Improvements thereon being 2 

two story frame dwelling an 

frame arage. 
ons of Sale: 20% day of sale 

| alance on Monday, August 5, 

Se subject io confirmation 

the Superior Court. : 

Dad and taken in execution a 

the property of John J. Moyer an 

orraine T. Moyer; and John J 

a Sr. and Lorraine T Mayors 

Hxecutors of the Last Will o 

George W. Moyer and will be sold 

by WILLIAM PASKEY, JR. 
Sheriff 

Sheriff’s Office 
Dover, Dolatare 
June 5, 19 ot TEexh. 

  

SUMMONS IN DIVORCE 

AA HE SUPERIOR COURT 

OF THE STATE OF DELAWARE 

In And For Kent County 

No. 126 Civil Action, 1968. 

Theresa, R. Donald Plaintiff, 

VV. 
arold C. Donald Defendant. 

ER SUMMONS IN DIVORCE 

THE STATE OF DELAWARE. 

To The Sheriff of Xent County: 

Are Commanded: 

Yor summon the above named de 

fendant so that, within 20 days aft- 

er service hereof upon defendant, 

exclusive of the day of service. for 

fendant shall serve upon Nicholas   : LEN an 

° Rodriguez, Esq. plaintiff's a 

De, whose address is 414 South 

State Street, Dover, Delaware, an 

i to the complaint. 

BO roTYy upon LT copy 

hereof and of the complaint. 

If the defendant cannot be served 

personally, to publish this process 

i | NOTICES | bo NOTICES 
  

as required by statute. 
FRANK R. HAYES 

Prothonotary 
Dated June 4, 1968 

To The Above Named Defendant: 

If this summons is served per- 
sonally upon you, then, in case of 
your failure, within 20 days after 
such ‘service, exclusive of the day 
of service, to serve on plaintiff's 
attorney named above an answer to 
the complaint, the case will be 
tried without further notice. 

If personal service is not made 
upon you and if this summons is 
published as required by statute, 
then, in case of your failure, with- 
in 20 days from service by publica- 
tion of this summons, to serve on 
plaintiff’s attorney named above an 
answer to the complaint, the case 
will be tried without further notice. 

ANK R. HAYES 
Prothonotary 

bt 7-5 exp. 

ALIAS SUMMONS IN DIVORCE 
IN THE SUPERIOR COURT 

OF THE STATE OF DELAWARE 
In And For Kent County 

No. 72 Civil Action, 1968. 
CATHERINE LOUISE MELTON, 

b/n/f 
NICHOLAS H. RODRIGUEZ 

Plaintiff, 
Vv. 

JOHN THOMAS MELTON Defendant. 

ALIAS SUMMONS IN DIVORCE 
THE STATE OF DELAWARE. 

To The Sheriff of Kent County: 
You Are Commanded: 

To summon the above named de- 
fendant so that, within 20 days af- 
ter service hereof upon defendant, 
exclusive of the day of service, de- 
fendant shall serve upon Schmit- 
tinger & Rodriguez, Attys. plain- 
tiff’s attorney, whose address is 
414 S. State St., Dover, Dela. an 
answer to the complaint. 

To serve upon defendant a copy 
hereof and of the complaint. 

If the defendant cannot be serv- 
ed personally, to publish this pro- 
cess as required by statute. 

FRANK R. HAYES 
Prothonotary 

Dated June 6, 1968. 
To The Above Named Defendant: 

If this summons is served per- 
sonally upon you, then, in case of 
your failure, within 20 days after 
such service, exclusive of the day 
of service, to serve on plaintiff's at- 
torney named above an answer to 
the complaint, the case will be tried 
without further notice. 

If personal service is not made 
upon you and if this summons 1s 
published as required by statute, 
then, in case of your failure, with- 
in 20 days from service by publica- 
tion of this summons, to serve on 
plaintiff’s attorney named above an 
answer to the complaint, the case 
will be tried without further no- 
tice. : FRANK R. HAYES 

Prothonotary 
bt 7-12 exp. 

ALIAS SUMMONS IN DIVORCE 
IN THE SUPERIOR COURT 

OF THE STATE OF DELAWARE 
In And For Kent County 

No. 117 Civil Action, 1968. 
Mary J. Jansky Plaintiff, 

  

  

Vv. 
William F. Jansky Defendant. 
ALIAS SUMMONS IN DIVORCE 

THE STATE OF DELAWARE. 
To The Sheriff of Kent County: 

Your Are Commanded: 
To summon the above named de- 

fendant so that, within 20 days aft- 

er service hereof upon defendant, 

exclusive of the day of service, 

defendant shall serve upon William 
H. Vaughn, Esq. plaintiff’s attor- 
ney, whose address is 507 South 

State Street, Dover, Delaware, an 
answer to the complaint. i 

To serve upon defendant a copy 
hereof and of the complaint. 

If the defendant cannot be served 

personally, to punish, this process 
ired b statute. 

Bs goon FRANK R. HAYES 
Prothonotary 

Dated May 24, 1968 
To The Above Named Defendant: 

If this summons is served Dper- 

sonally upon you, then, in case of 

your failure, within 20 days after 

such service, exclusive of the day 

of service, to serve on plaintiff’s 

attorney named above an answer to 

the complaint, the case will be tried 

without further notice. 
If personal service is not made 

upon you and if this summons 18 

published as required by statute, 

then, in case of your failure, within 

20 days from service by publication 

of this summons, to serve on plain- 

tiff’s attorney named above an an- 

swer to the gomplaini, ihe Sans will 

jed without further notice. 

Hef triod FRANK R. HAYES 
Prothonotary 

5t 6-28 exp. 

SHERIFF'S SALE 
Of Valuable 

REAL ESTATE 
By virtue' of a writ of Levari 

Facias, for sale of land to me di- 
rected, will be exposed to public 
sale by way of public vendue at the 
front door. of the Kent County 

Court House, Dover, Kent Coun- 
ty, State of Delaware, on 

WEDNESDAY, JULY 10, 1968 
at 10:00 A.M. Daylight Saving Time 

AT), that certain lot, piece or 
parcel of land with the buildings 
thereon erected. situated in East 
Dover Hundred, Kent County and 
State of Delaware, and known as 
Lot No. 6, on the Plan of Capitol 
Green, Section 2-A, as said Plan is 
of record in the Office of the Re- 
cording of Deeds, in and for Kent 
County, Delaware, in Plot Book 3, 
Page 124, and being more particul- 
arly bounded and described in ac- 
cordance. with a survey made by 
Charles C. Brown, Registered Land 
Surveyor, dated August 11, 1955, as 
follows, to-wit: 
BEGINNING at a point on the 

Southwesterly side of River Road, 
at sixty feet wide, said point being 
in the division line between Lots 
Nos. 5 and 6 and distant forty feet 
measured North sixty-five degrees 
West along the southwesterly side 
of River Road from a point of 
tangency at the Northwesterly end 
of a twenty-five feet radius junc- 
tion curve joining the Southwester- 
ly side of River Road with the 
Northwesterly side of New Castle 
Avenue at fifty feet wide; thence 
from said point of beginning South 
twenty-five degrees West along 
the division line between Lots Nos. 
5 and 6 one hundred thirty feet to 
the boundary line of Capitol Green; 
thence thereby and along the 
Southwesterly side of a ten feet 
wide easement for drainage and 
utilities North sixty-five degrees 
West fifty-two feet to the division 
line between Lots Nos. 6 and 7; 

thence thereby North twenty-five 

degrees Bast one hundred (thirty 

feet to the Southwesterly side of 

River Road; thence thereby South 

sixty-five degrees East fifty two 

feet to the point and place of be- 

oinning. Be the contents thereof 
what they may. 

AND BENNG the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed to 

Herman D. Tucker and Leonia 

Tucker, his wife, by deed of Wood- 

row W. Postle and Mary L. Postle, 

his wife, dated July 1965/and re- 

corded in the office of the Recorder 

of Deeds in and for Kent County at 

Dover, Delaware In Deed Book B, 

olume 24. Page 170. { 

VB me HOWEVER, to certain 

restrictive covenants, conditions, 

easements, reservations and agree- 

ments as contained and more par- 

ticularly referred to in the afore- 

said deed. NE 
Improvements thereon being a 

white frame bungalow wlth Car- 

ort. 

b Terms of Sale: 20% day of sale 

and balance on Monday, August 5, 

1968. Sale subject to confirmation 

by the Superior Court. ) 

Seized and taken in execution as 

the property of Herman D. Tucker 

and Leonia Tucker, his wife and 

will be sold b 
WILLIAM PASKEY, JR. 

  

Sheriff 

Sheriff's Office 
Dover, Delaware 
June 6, 1968. 

3t 7-5 exp.   

SHERIFF'S SALE 
OF VALUABLE 

REAL ESTATE 
By virtue of a writ of Levari Fa- 

cias for he sale of land to me 
directed, will be exposed to public 
sale by way of public vendue on 
the premises on the South side of 
Commerce Street, in the City of 
Harrington, Kent County, State of 
Delaware, on 

MONDAY, JULY 8, 1968 
10:00 A. M. Daylight Saving Time 

ALL. THAT Certain lot, piece or 
parcel of land and premises situat- 
ed in the City of Harrington, Kent 
County and State of Delaware, ly- 
ing and being on the South side of 
Commerce Street in said City and 
is bounded on the North by land 
now or formerly of Ella Fleming, 
on the East by a sixteen (16) foot 
alley, on the south by another al- 
ley and on the West by the afore- 
said Street, be the contents thereof 
what they may be; the improve- 
ments thereon being a two story, 
double dwelling house and other 
buildings and being designated as 
Lot No. 23 on a Plot of Lots known 
as Wolcott's Addition to the Town 
of Harrington; said Plot being of 
record fin the Recorders Office at 
Lover in Book N, Volume 8, Page 
477; and 
BEING the same lands and pre- 

mises which were conveyed unto 
James Edward Hutson and Char- 
lotte S. Hutson, his wife, by deed 
of Frank Allen Cain and Anne C. 
Cain, his wife, bearing date the 29th 
day of May, A.D. 1959, and record- 
ed in the office of the Recorder 
of Deeds at Dover in and for Kent 
County and State of Delaware, in 
Deed Record Book C, Volume 22, 
Page 104. 

Improvements thereon being ‘a 
two story, double dwelling house 
and other buildings. 

Terms of Sale: 20% day of sale 
and balance on August 5, 1968. Sale 
subject to confirmation by the Su- 
perior Court. . 

Seized and taken in execution as 
the property of James Edward Hut- 
son and Charlotte S. Hutson, his 
wife and will be sold by 

WILLIAM PASKEY, JR. 
Sheriff 

Sheriff's Office 
Dover, Delaware 
June 18, 1968 

3t 7-5 exp 
  

Administratrix 
Sale 

OF VALUABLE 

Real Estate 
By virtue of an order. of ‘the 

Orphans’ Court of the State of Dela- 
ware, in and for Kent County, there 
will be exposed to sale and public 
auction or vendue. at the front door 
of the First National Bank of Har- 
rington, Harrington, Kent County, 
Delaware on 

SATURDAY, JULY 15, 1968, AT 

10:30 O’clock in the Morning EDST 

The following described real estate, 
to-wit: 

PARCEL 1. ALL that certain lot, 
piece or parcel of land and prem- 
ises situated in Mispillion Hundred, 
Kent County and State of Delaware, 
and lying along the public road 
leading from the Town of Harring- 
ton to Brownsville in the Hundred, 
County and State aforesaid, and 
adjoining lands mow or formerly 
of William Layton, lands now or 
formerly of James Breeding, lands 
now or formerly of 
Hobbs, lands now. or formerly of 
Layton, lands now or formerly of 
James Outten and lands of others, 
and said to contain 200 acres of 
land, be the same more or less. 
AND BEING the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed unto 
M., & Lumber Co. by deed of 
William A. Berry, Jr., Administra- 
tor of the Estate of Frederick L. 
Teigeler, deceased, which deed bears 
date of 6th day of September, A. D. 
1957 and was recorded on the same 
date in the Office of the Recorder 
of Deeds, in and for Kent County 
and State of Delaware, at Dover, 
Delaware; 

PARCEL 2. ALL those three sev- 
eral tracts, pieces or parcels of 
land and premises lying adjacent 
to each other, and now forming one 
farm or tract of land <citucted in 
Mispillion Hurdred, Kent. County 
and State of Delaware a-d lying 
on. the ee~t s'de of, but off ~f the 
public —onad leading from Hickman 
to Burrsville, and bounded as fol- 
lows: On the North bv lards of 
Fred Tiegler and by lands of George 
Rafdden. on the Bast by lands of 
Fred Tiegler, on the South by lands 

if Martha Wceotters. and on the 
West by the Delaware and Mary- 
land State line, and containing in 
the aggregate one hundred and fif- 
teen and one-half (115 1/2) acres of 
land, be the same more or less; 
AND BEING the same lands and 

premises which were conveyed unto 
Edith Hobbs, by Deed of Mary B. 
‘Morris, single woman, bearing date 
the Twelfth day of December, A. 
D. 1924, of record in the Office of 
the Recorder of Deeds, in and for 
Kent County and State of Dele- 
ware, in Deed Record Book Q Val 
12, Page 380. 

Said sale of valuable real estate 
to be free and clear of all encum- 
brances. 

The administratrix will make re- 
turn of sale on the 19th day of July 
AD. 1968, at 110:00:in the fore= 
noon. 

TERMS OF SALE 
20% of the purchase price will be 

reauired to be paid to the under- 
signed on the day of sale and the 
balance of the purchase price to 
he paid on or before 10:00 AM on 
the 19th day of July, A.D. 1968, at 
the office of Brown & Brown, at- 
torneys for the administratrix, 43 
The Green, Dover, Delaware. The 
percentage paid on day of sale 
will be treated as part of the pur- 
chase price if other terms of the 
sale are complied with, otherwise 
it will be forfeited for non-com- 

pliance and treated as liquidated 
damages. 

By Order of the Orphans’ Court 
CARL TF. PRETTYMAN, 

Clerk of Orphans’ Court 

& Brown 
Sarah S. Hobbs 

the Hstate of 

Brown 
Attorneys Jor J 
Administratrix of 

Everett L. Hobbs 3t 7/12 

AMERICA MUST 
(Continued from Page 1) 

  

family protection to fighting in 

a land several thousands of miles 

away simply is beyond his ability 

to conceive. The draft card bur- 

ners, the war protestors, the de- 

serters to Sweden may basically 

be saving their own hide, but if 

they could envision the larger 

picture, would their actions be 

different? ? 
The intellectuals, the peace-at- 

any-pricers, especially those in 

political life, would like to be in 
places of power in the greatest 

nation in the world but even they 

seem to have an attitude toward 

what that really encompasses. 

Their anti-administration attacks 

in regard to the Vietnam war are, 

primarily, stepping stones up- 

ward (they hope) in their politi- 

cal careers. 

If we make pledges to help 

people in all parts of the world, 

Nathaniel | 

  

we must live up to them, or jeo- 

pardize our status as a strong and 

respected nation. If 16-year-olds 
miarry, they must live up to their 
vows or their marriage disinte- 

grates. 

We don’t know when the minds 
of Americans, collectively, will 

accept the awesome and terribly 
expensive job of being thrust into 

a mature role so early in our 
national life. But unless we do, 
unless we try to understand crisis 
after crisis and the root of riots 

in the streets, we will lose our 
balance—and on the world scene 

there «are no grandparents who 
will protect our interest until we 

grow up.—Cartaret (N.C.) News- 
Times 

® 

’68 CORN PRICES 

(Continued from Page 1) 

  

already large stocks. 

Before we harvest a single 

acre of the 1968 crop, approxi- 

mately one and a quarter billion 

bushels of corn, most under CCC 
loan, will be in storage, says 

McAllister. This is in spite of 

larger export shipments in 1968 
and a slight increase in the 

amount of corn in animal feed- 

ing. 

All things considered, it ap- 

pears that corn prices will be low 
again this fall, he predicts. But 
they’ll probably be five to seven 

cents higher than in 1967. 

When I Was 
Young... 

The younger generation gets 

tired of hearing of the hardships 

their parents or others had to 

endure “when they were your 
age.” The following is a tongue- 

in-cheek sort of thing found in 

a recent copy of the Des Moines 

Tribune and written by Glary 
Liautens: 

“Every generation likes to 

boast about the hardships it en- 

dured while growing up. 

“My father tells me about walk- 

ing seven miles to school over a 

bumpy road in 35-below temper- 

atures. I cut my walk to four 
miles and even smoothed out the 

road a bit. 

“But what 

  

about today’s 

youngsters? What will they have 
to say to future geenrations? 

“Let's move ahead to 2008. To- 

day’s teenagers are grandfathers, 

and this is how they will describe 
those grim days of 1969 when 

! they were young . . . 

“Boy, (he will begin) you kids 
don’t know you're alive. Back 

in 1968, when I was your age, 

you couldn’t just hop on a con- 
veyor belt and go to school. 

“We had to drive! Yes, sir. 

Drive. Everybody had two cars 

in those days and you'd: have to 
get one out of the garage, warm 

it up and maybe, drive 3 or 4 

miles to school. 

“I’m not exaggerating. It might 

take 20 minutes — if the traffic 

wias bad. We didn’t have rocket- 
ships, space belts and machines 

that transmit you from one place 

to another in 12 seconds. 

“When we got up in the morn- 

ing, we had chores. We had to 

turn up the thermostat on the 
oil furnace or adjust the controls 

on the air conditioners. One of 

us always had the job of loading 

the dishwasher and picking up 

the milk at the front door. 

“If we didn’t do it, nobody else 

would do it for us. We didn’t 
have robot butlers. If it snowed, 

we had to hire somebody to sho- 

vel the snow and work the snow- 
blower. They didn’t work by 

themselves. 
“You think it’s awful if you 

go to a party and have to be back 
by next September. Well, let me 

tell you . . . back in 1968 there 
was none of that. 

“If we took a girl out, we had 

to have her home by 5 or 6 a.m. 
or there was hell to pay, espe- 

cially if it was a school hight.   
  

Appliance Service 
by Factory-Trained 

Technicians 

Prompt and Efficient 

Gerardi Bros. 
Harrington 398-3757 

Federalsburg 754-2841 

Denton 479-1626 
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“We weren't wild, like you 
kids. We had motorcycles, smok- 
ed pot, drank beer — and 
were content. i 

“And just look at the way the 
modern generation dresses — in 
cellophane. It’s disgusting. | 

“Your grandmother wias a top- 
less waitress and, let me tell you, 

she didn’t traipse around the way 

the girls do today. She had stand- 
ards. That’s why the marriage 
has lasted. 

“I'm glad I've at least got my 
memories — the way we went 

behind the embassy and burned 
our draft cards, the protest sings, 
the Easter vacations at Fort Lau- 

derdale. og Ll 
“Kids today don’t have good 

times like that any more. I guess 
those days are gone forever.” 
—Madrid (Iowa) Register-News 
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COMMERCIAL 
PRINTING 

Have Been Doing It For 45 Years. . . Most Week- Li : 

ly Newspapers Usually Do Commercial Printing 

. .. It Oftentimes Means the Difference Between 

Oleo or Butter on Their Bread . . . On Occasions 

People Have Said, “We Didn’t Think You Could 

Do This Job, So We Let the Whoozit People Do It 

. . . Unless You Are An Expert on Printing, Let 

Us Decide What We Can Do . . . If You Are An 

Expert, Come In: Maybe We Have a Job For You 

. .. See Us Fer a Price On Wedding Invitations - 

Announcements - Tickets - Salesbooks - Enve- 

lopes - Chances - Sale Bills - Multiple - Forms 

Snap - Easy Sets - Brochures - Booklets - Busi- 

ness Cards - Letterheads - Statements or Bill- 

heads - Programs - Circulars - Direct - Mail 

Material. 

If You Need Printing, Buy It Now and, For 
Economy, Buy In The Largest Quantity Possible 

-Certain Types and Colors of Paper Are Hard 

To Get and Are Getting Scarcer All The Time 

Get Yours While The Getting Is Good. 

The Harrington Journal f 
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It's a snap! Make is snappy! 
The little fastener used on cloth- 
ing has added to our language. 

great convenience—easy to at- 

tach and quick to fasten. 
~The snap is making a comeback 

~~ and being used on coats and 

suits instead of a button where 
an inconspicuous closing is need- 

nh ad, 
A small snap will not take 
~ much strain so a larger, stronger 

one must be used. Then that shi- 
ny metal shows. 
~~ Borrow a trick from the cou- 
 turrier and cover the snap with a 
circle of lining fabric. Cut two 
circles twice the size of the dia- 

meter of the snap and make a 
ye row of gathering stitches around 

the raw edge of the circle. Put 

the socket side of the snap face 
“down in the center of the circle 
and draw up the gathering thread 

    

   

  

    
      

    

    
   

    

    

     
    

    
    

   
   

   

    

needle as you sew. 
Which side goes on top? Sew 
~ the flatter part of the snap—the 
one with the ball or stud—on 

the top side of the garment. The 

thicker socket is sewed on the 
lower part of the garment. 

i Another couturier touch you 

can borrow—use a hanging snap 
at the top of the zipper neckline 

placket instead of a hook and 

eye. Fasten the socket part of the 

snap to the right side of the 

neckline on the under side of 

the dress. Sew the ball part to 

the left side of the neckline thru 

threads by covering them with 
 buttonhole ' stitches. 
~ You can also use a hanging 

snap at the shoulderline of dress- 
es to keep lingerie straps in place. | 
  

Don’t Lower 
Standards 
Deficiencies of schools in poor 

‘neighborhoods are too often ag- 
 gravated by a widespread belief 

+3 i that the intellectual capacity of 

fey poor kids is too limited to allow 

much education. Consequently, 

these schools are often turned in- 

to sociological laboratories man- 

~ ufacturing born losers. 
The U.S. Office of Economic 

Opportunity has produced an in- 
teresting study which shows that 

the current reliance on education 
as a cure for social inequities and 

even racial problems is a badly 
outdated theorly based on the 

country’s experience with immi- 

grants of two generations ago. 

~~ Hardly a big city in America 

has escaped the mania for low- 

ering standards in schools attend- 
oh kids. The minale © : ; ys, SKILLED IN THE USE OF MANY HAND N\/Ae 0 
ed nl 2. gin This week I'm at College Park, Phone AND POWER TOOLS, THIS TECHNICIAN | “ep co 

Scho ny Maryland, for a county agents | LITERALLY BUILDS AND MAINTAINS HIS ~ evably loses any possibility for 

stimulating the latent curiosity 
of average kids in their most re- 

ceptive years. oo 
It is no accident that some of 

the very brightest students in 

  

FENCE TALK 
with George K. Vapaa 

The best vegetable garden in 

Kent county. Who has it? And 

for a change your county agent 

is looking for two different kinds 

— one managed by an adult, 

and then one prepared by a 

youth. 

Nominations must be called in- 

to our Kent county extension of- 

fice by July 5. We hope to pic- 

ture and publicize the most 

unique, attractive and best cared 

for vegetable garden that is 

nominated. It need not be large. 

This is an opportunity to call 

attention to the good efforts of a 

neighbor or friend that you think 

should be recognized. 
* * * 

Coming soon—three programs. 

1. Fish pond management dem- 

onstration to feature fly casting. 

Tuesday, July 9, 7 p.m. Place to 

be announced when we complete 

derson, our Sussex agent, says 

it’s a fine tour. 

Woo-eee! And then the Fair 

will be upon us! 
ES * * 

Over 27,000 pounds of wool 

were collected and graded at the 

annual wool pool held at the Del- 

aware State Fairgrounds accord- 

ing to Mrs. Don Concilio. She 

serves as treasurer of the Dela- 

ware Sheep and Wool Associa- 

tion. 
Wool pools are unique as a 

method of marketing. Farmers 

know what their price will be 

ahead of time. The successful bid- 

der brings his truck to the pool— 

or trucks as the size of the pool 

may warrant. 

The wool is graded and weighed 

as it is delivered to the pool and 

then put into large sacks before 

lodaing onto the buyers truck. 

The average price this year is 

42 cents per pound at the pool. 
Had the farmer sold at the farm 

or to a transient buyer, he prob- 

ably would have received 25 

cents per pound. The reason for 

the higer price is the ‘advance 

grading and the large quantity 

on a single delivery. 
Earl Rambo of Houston is the 

wiool pool manager. The pool is 
usually held the third Saturday 

in June of each year. It’s a kind 
of picnic for the farmers because 

Earl has plenty of help and 

equipment to do a good job. Some 
of us can still remember the trials 

of that first pool over 10 years 

ago! 
* * * 

Please be patient with your 

county agent for a couple of 

weeks. He’s going to be away at 

school for several days. 

training conference. We will be 

examining the prioblems of rap- 

idly urbanizing areas: mass media 

techniques, area approaches to 
let us specialize a bit in subject 

matter and cover more ground, 

    

Pench Blossom 
4-H Club News 

Since our May meeting we op- 

erated a booth at the Milford 

hospital fair earning $105.83 for 

the hospital. 
The State Reddy Food contest, 

held at the Delaware State Fair, 
had Karen Newnom, Linda New- 

nom, Robin Cahall and Robin 
Hill representing our club. They 

did a good job on such a hot day, 
but did not receive 1 of the top 

3 prizes. 

In the electric exhibit held the 
same day our club exhibit entit- 

third prize of $15.00. Seven Peach 

Blossom boys entered individual 

exhibits. L.ee Mesibov and Ron- 
nie Bramble earned first prize 

of $8.00; second prize winners of 
$5.00 were Gary Baker and Kev- 

in Baker, Steve Mesibov and El- 

mer Freeman. 

Delmer Freeman won third 

prize of $3.00. Our thanks to Mr. 

in advance. We were pleased to 
have Becky earn the title of 

“1968 Princess.” Her court was 

Joy Gooden of Fox Hall and 
Nancy Webb of Westville. 

Congraulations to Philip Mesi- 
bov on being selected as one of 

Delaware’s two representatives 

youth camp, July 1-6. 
Eleven girls judged in foods, 

clothing and foods preparation 
on June 21st at Magnolia school. 

Don’t forget fair entries due 

July 1st. 
  

Kent County 
+ Stanley L. Ogden III, Flour- 

town, Pa.,, and Joanne S. Hart, 

Dover. 

Chancy L. Flint, Dover, and 

Ruth E. Emory, Dover. 

John W. Voshell, Dover, and 

Dorothy M. Ratliff, Dover. 

Chlarles H. Clough, Jr., Wyom- 
ing, and Betty A. Morris, Wyom- 

ing. § 
Jimmy A. Brown, Smyrna, and 

Thelma J. Sterling, Cheswold. 
Henry J. Miller, Dover, and 

Melissa Mast, Dover. 

William J. Lloyd, Dover and 

Carole D. Carroll, Felton. 
John H. Tyre, Smyrna, and 

Margaret I. Foster, Clayton. 
Ronald L. Virdin, Peipsic, and 

Marie L. Whedbee, Leipsic. 

Robert J. Hewlett, Newark, 

and Ruth A. Sieluff, Dover. 

Christine McAllister, oDved. 

led “Motors for Muscles” won! 

to attend West Virginia's older 
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NDEA Institute 
Participants 
Selected 

  

  

| erary criticism to be held at the 

| University of Delaware from 

June 24 to August 2. 

ware, Pennsylvania, Maryland 

and New Jersey. 

All will return to their class- 
rooms to give their students in- 

I sights into concepts and critical 

| approaches to literature that have 

i been developed since the 1930s. 

This year’s institute is the 

fourth held at the university. 

| Previous summer sessions have 
dealt with composition, litera- 

ture, poetry and the teaching of 

language. 

Institute participants from Del- 

Gemmell M. Bruner, 24 Fairway 
rd., Apt. 2-A, Newark, Christiana 

Sr. H. S.; Mrs. Eleanor T. Dill, 

109 Simea Liane, Apt. 6, Wilming- 

ton, Henry C. Conrad H. S.; Har- 
| vey C. Fenimore, Jr., Kings Hwy. 
S.W., Apt. 4, Dover, Dover H. S.; 
Susan M. Flynn, 318 Hampton rd., 

Wilmington, William Penn H. S.; 

Mrs. Marian G. LeMaster, 2704 

! Boulevard rd., Apt. 101, Wilming- 

ton, Brandywine H. S.; James C. 

Mervine, R. D. 2, Hararington, 
Dover H. S.; Clifford P. Towe, 

313 South Cass st., Middletown, 

Middletown H. S.; Patricia L. Va- 

  
  
liam Ruth, O.S.B. (Wilk), 803 S. 
Broom st., Wilmington, St. Eliz- 

abeth’s H. S.; and Mrs. Eleanor 

D. Williamson, 138 Delaware av., 

Laurel, Laurel H. S. 

Participants from Pennsylva- 

nia include Sherill A. Edwiards, 

102 Terwood rd., Willow Grove, 

Upper Moreland Sr. H. S.; Mar- 

garet DM. Farne, 55540 West 
Sedgewick st., Philadelphia, Si- 

mon Gratz H. S.; Sister Marie 

Hubert, IH.M. (Kealy), 440 Chew 

 st., Allentown, Central Catholic 

JH. S.; Margaret G. McLaughlin, 
| 87 S. Lansdowne av., Lansdowne, 

Lansdowne-Alden H. S.; Charles 

T. Natoli, 947 N. 12th st., Read- 

ing, Pottsgrove Jr.-Sr. H. S.; The- 

odore R. Wialter, 11 Philips Lane, 

| Newtown Square, Springfield 
Twp. Sr.-H. S. x 

Participants from Maryland in- 

| clude Robert H. Hazel, Jr., St. 

  
Donald Thomas III, Dover, and ' Augustine’s rd., Chesapeake City, 

‘North East H. S.; Mrs. Alga S. 

  

  

    

        
   

FAMILIES WE'VE SERVED : 

The opinions expressed by the families we 

have been privileged to serve are among 

I our most valuable assets.           
  

    

    

Jackson, 616 Dennis st., Salis- 
"bury, Worcester H. S.; David R. 
: Johnson, RFD 1, Box 43, Havre 

de Grace, Havre de Grace H. S 
' Albert A. Starner, Routh 2, Box 

: ' 285, Ridge rd., Baltimore, Over- 

Participants have been select-' lea Sr. H. S.; and Rilla M. Whit- 

ed for the NDEA Institute in lit- ten, 7206 Lanark Rd., Baltimore, 
' Riseing ‘Sun H. S, 
{ Participants from New Jersey 

include John P. Casey, 49 Steph- 
Dr. Franklin B. Newman, insti- | €nville Parkway, Edison, Bridge- 

tute director, said that applicants, Water-Raritan H. S. - West; Rob- 
have been selected from Dela-'ert E. Fennell, Bari dr., Ledge- 

‘wood, West Orange H. S.; Mrs. 
Susan M. Hewitt, 2 East av., 

Woodstown, Woodbury H. S.; 
Mrs. Bonia 'R. Rettman, Frank- 

lin Arms Apts, 42, Chestnut av., 

& Brewster rd., Vineland, Vine- 
land Sr. H. S.; and Mrs. Jean R. 

Shoemaker, 26 Lakeview dr., Al- 
loway, Woodstown H .S. 
  

Mrs. 

clock mass. 

daughter, Mrs. 

in Oxford, Md. 

week. 

Rehoboth on Wednesday. 

——— 

Of Local Interest 
Pearl Hanson ‘will hold 

open house next Sunday, June 

the Rt. Rev. John A. Corrigan 

former priest of St. Bernadette’s. 

A buffet supper was held. The 
conference ended with a five .o’ 

Sgt. and Mrs. Wm. Gillette and 

Margaret Saun- 
ders and Mrs. Oscar Gillette were 
the guests on Sunday of Mr. and 

Mrs. Wayne Leinsz and family 

Miss Ruth Carpenter of Port 
Penn, Del., was the guest of Miss 

Alice Hearn for several days this 

Severtal ladies of Harrington 

of Frederica at luncheon and 

bridge at the Dinner Bell Inn in 

Gloria Lynn Dill recently cele- 

brated her thirteenth birthday. 
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Around Home 
with Jean H. Cranston and Mrs. 

Jr., Mrs. William Jones Sr., 
and Mrs. Nelson Jones visit Mr. 

Donald Jones 

  

. daughters last week. 
Almost any kind of stored food 

is apt to become infested with   
lowed. The foods which are most 

commonly infested are cereals, 
flour, raisins, dry dog food, pow- 
dered milk, corn meal, cake mix- 

es and nuts. Because these insect 

pests can move from one box to 

another in the cupboard, it’s a 
good idea to check these prod- 

ucts periodically and immediate- 

ly eliminate any infestations. 
To get rid of infestations, lo- 

cate all of them and discard or 
destroy by burning. Insecticides 

are of little help in protecting 
against these pests. In any event, 

Don’t put insecticide on the food 
nor in food containers. 

If you are interested in identi- 

fying the most common insect 

pests of stored food in our state 

Bradley 

Mrs. 

afternoon. 

Mr. Harry Selders 
! S \ home Saturday from the Milford 
insect pests if enough time is al- premorial Hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Laurence Tatman 

{ Mr. Donald Tatman, Mr. Oscar 

recently visited Mrs. 
Barbara Saulsbury. 

Louder 

granddaughter Amy called to see 

Mrs. Florence Wialls on Saturday 

Vincent 

  —either call the extension office, 

  

o'clock, Rev. John Taylor, pastor. 
Sunday school at 9:55 o’clock, 

Mr. Maurice Wright, superin- 

tendent; Mrs. Lester Collison, or- 
ganist. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elver Ryan at- 

tended the 25th wedding anmni- 

versary of Mr. and Mrs. Ralph 
Workman of Dover last Satur- 

day evening. : 
Mr .and Mrs. Wiallace Ryan 

and family gave a cook out on 

Sunday afternoon in honor of 
Mrs. Ryan’s mother’s birthday, 

Mrs. Marie Shultie and also Mrs. | 

  

  

omy.   
® - 

736-1448, or write to us, P.O. Box | Honor AA A 

Mr. 

and 

returned 

and 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Jackson of 

Wilmington recently visited their: 
sister Mrs. Russell Brown. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Messick | Seaford Du Pont Co. nylon plant 

and daughters, Becky, Rita and Thymsdey, dune 20. Doovh was at 
Rachell visited Mr snd. Mirs. Al-, tributed to a heart attack. 

ton Breeding and family on Mon- | 
day evening. 

Mr .and Mrs. Earl Griffith wvis- 
ited Mr Jand Mrs. Ray King at 

Riverdale on Sunday afternoon. , 

by Secretary of Agriculture Or- 
ville Freeman to over 70 Dela- 

wareans who helped administer 

the nation’s first farm program 
over 30 years ago. The Agricul- 

tural Adjustment Act, adopted in 
1933, established production con- 

trols designed to relieve the tre- 

mendous agricultural surplusses 
of the depression and to funnel 

additional income into the econ- 

Two ASCS employees were al- 

so honored at the banquet. Paul 

B. Hastings, chairman of the Del- 
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STEAMPOWER . .. THE MOVING FORCE OF 
THE NAVY'S HUGE FIGHTING SHIPS 
STARTS WITH THE BOILERMAKER. 

TREMENDOUS STEAM BOILERS, KNOWING 2772 
THE SHIP'S SAFETY AND EFFICIENCY ARE” 
IN HIS HANDS. |     

  § 777% 
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le hole only, leaving a thread o y > : Wallace Ryan birthday. ‘aware ASCS State Committee, ’ 
o. S hole gh > r > > to reach | he day the wool is delivered. . : 4 - lente, 614 Lehigh rd., T-1, New- were the guests of Mrs. John| Mr. and Mrs. William Jones] presented a 25 year pin and cer- sure you i 

3 the socket. Strengthen the long Buyers bid on the total offering Marriage Licenses ‘ark, Elkton Sr. H. S.; Sister Mir-|Darby and Mrs. Joseph Gerrow t 

  

tificate to Elmer W. (Jim) Baz- 
zel, program specialist at the 
ASCS state office. 

Mrs. Emma P. Mellvaine, chief 

clerk at the Kent county ASCS 

office received a similar award 
from Kent county ASC Commit- 

tee Chlairman J. Heyman Roosa. 

Featured speaker at the ban- 
quet, sponsored by the ASCS 

| committee, was Dr. George Wor- 

' rilow, vice president for univer- 
| sity relations, University of Del- 
aware. 

.~ 

Arthur G. Smith 
Arthur George Smith, 41, col- 

lapsed and died at work at the 

  
  

Mr. Smith, a polymer control 

operator at the plant, lived at 
1405 Laurel Highway, Seaford. 

He wias a veteran of World War 

II and had been employed at the 
: Du Pont plant for 18 years. He 
1 

| was a member of the Gethsemene 

  ton, and two sisters, Mrs. Calra 

Milley of Glenside, Md., and Mrs. 
Mary Simpson of Harrington. 

Services were held Sunday af- 

ternoon in the Watson Funeral 

Home, Seaford, with interment 

in the Blades Cemetery. 

  

      

    
    

        

      
      
    
    
    

      

    
    

      

      
    
    

      

        
  

        

        
      

BULLETIN: 

How to make 

  

never run out 

of heating oil 

ET US KEEP TRACK of your 
fuel supply for you. 

No more running out. Ne 
more last-minute calls for oil 

Everything is automatie. 
We compute your rate of fuel 
consumption based on the 
weather. Using the degree. 
day method, we can accu- 
rately predict how much oil 
you will use and when you 
will need more. 

‘When time comes for more, 

our truck appears at your 
home—well before you run 
low. No need to phone. No 
bother. We handle everything 

for you. 
There is no charge for this 

special service. And you'll be 
getting Shell Heating Oil for 
top burner performance. Call 

us today for details. 

OERN Hp 
+ ™n 

Ralph E. Butler 
SHELL DISTRIBUTOR 

398-3462     
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these schools are among the first |, \g wavs of improving the living EXE 5 4 2% 

~ to drop out. Tying a sharp Kid), 000 ment, 
i, ow LE od er ey Next week I'll be at Marysville, 1 

: 

J spirit. Preoc tio: : ht i : d > dey x ee 3 Soren ol ey od. ie looking = % i CC Y Homes GM Once you take a really close look at this '68 Impala Custom Coupe, chances are 
: os it ap |l@Wn research station. Whic » ou won't care what other people’s 1969's ar ing to look like. ? : ation Stamey Jom ® Jot of | minds me. Dr. William Mitchell, se yo hye er peop e going to look like. But we'll tell 

E Tide 0 ducation. : : : MY s rs educa. | Our extension agronomist at the eo MILFORD «= > FELTON a oF BcELENGH This particular model—with its formal *“notchback” roof line—is the most 
Sore etait on: 1 going fo University of Delaware, is plan- 422-8091 284-4548 popular one we build. Which means it's by far the most popular '68 anybody 

have to rethink its priorities, ex- 

 amining the wisdom of spending 
the least amount of money on 
kids who need the best that ed- 

ucation has to offer. There is al- 
ways a larger proportion of un- 

~der-achievers among the poor 

but that should never be an ex- 

~ cuse to short change the majori- 

en 1 
The focus of our efforts to aid 
the disadvantaged child should 

  

gallon is gone, she will have 

$49.20 in the bank and $12 to 

start business again. 
If you live ten years and con- 

tinue to buy booze from your 
wife and then die with snakes in 

your boots, your wife will have 
$37,750.40 in the bank. This is 
enough for her to bury you de- 

ning a turf demonstration for the 

Delaware State Fair. Look for it 
near the wiater tower when you 

go. 
Most people find that your 

county agent doesn’t spend much 

time in the office anyway. The 

job is not there. Just leave your 

name and problem with the sec- 
retary and we'll get together as 

soon as possible. Our telephone 

number is 736-1448. 
  

Sunday, July 7, at 8 a.m. the 
Methodist Men. 

Plans are being made to have 

a lay witness mission in Asbury 

United Methodist Church No- 

vember 8, 9 and 10, 1968. Mrs. 
Earle Nelson and Mr. Mark Wil- 

ley have been appointed Git 

chairmen. Mr. Jack Birsch of 

Virginia Beach, Virginia, will be! 
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(B® We have any size in stock for immediate delivery 
\ 
  

No Down Payment EASY TERMS 
We Service Everything We Sell. 

STORE HOURS: (9 to 6 except Friday — 9 to 9) 

(By Appointment — Anytime) 

builds. Which means (and this is an open secret around Detroit these days) some 
other cars are going to look a lot like it in "69. 

Frankly, we're kind of used to being borrowed from this way by now. Whether 
it's styling, riding comfort or just plain painstaking workmanship, we know that 
putting you first keeps us first. And we can’t blame other carmakers for wanting 
to caich up. 

But meantime the thing for you to do is drop down and have a talk with your 

Chevrolet dealer now. Great as our styling looks on this '68 Impala, we can’t 
promise it’s going to look so good on a '69 something else. 

Happening now at your Chevrolet dealer’s, a tremendous explosion 
of extra buying power. Only the leader could make it happen. 

Save on popular V8 engines, automatic transmissions, whitewall tires—and more. Just take a look at these 
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accentuate excellence, not self- . : five bonus savings plans. Then see your Chevrolet dealer. 

pity or cultural geprivation, oa Asbury United Bonus Savings Plan 1 Any Chevrolet or Chevelle with 200-hp Turbo-Fire V8, Powerglide and whitewalls, place to Beg d I I Methodist Church Bonus Savings Plan 2 Any Chevrolet or Chevelle with 250-hp Turbo-Fire V8, Powerglide and whitewalls. 
Se % A > Small price Bonus Savings Plan 3 Any big Chevrolet with 250-hp Turbo-Fire V8, Turbo Hydra-Matic and whitewalls. and elementary level. To con 1d Chirch School. Cla P ’ 
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cently, buy a house, bring up the 

children, marry a decent man 

and forget she ever knew you. 
—Mediapolis (Iowa) New Era 

1 . 

SHOP AND SWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS 

the coordinator. Twelve com-: 

mittee chairmen will be apoint- | 
ed soon with the members of 
each committee. Lay witnesses i 

will come to Asbury in Novem- | 

ber from several surrounding 

states. 

GERARDI BROS. 
3 Locations to Serve You 

FEDERALSBURG 

754-2841        
HARRINGTON 

398-3757 
DENTON 
479-1626 The Chevrolet Impala Custom Coupe     
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Local Dairymen 
Honored 

William W. Vanderwende of R. 

D. 2 Bridgeville, Del., was judged 

District 12 most outstanding 

young Dairy Cooperator for 1968, 

in a young dairy cooperator con- 

test conducted by Inter-State 
Milk Producers’ Cooperative, of 

Philadelphia, Pa. 

District 12 director Ellwood B. 
Gruwell, Felton, Del., announced 

that his young cooperator ap- 

peared with other district win- 

ners June 20, in Downlington, Pa. 
Twenty-three young dairymen 

participated in a program for the 

selection of top young dairy flar- 

mers, who are members of Inter- 

State Milk Producers’ Coopera- 

tive. 

Wilbur Seipt, of Lansdale, Pa. 

president of Inter-State, wel- 

comed this unique group of dai- 

rymen. 
Dr. James E. Honan, general 

manager, discussed the Coopera- 

tive’s marketing program. 
J. Lin. Huber, chairman of the 

Pennsylvania Milk Control Com- 

mission, wias the main speaker on 

the young dairymen’s program. 
Mr. Huber briefed the young 

milkmakers on the history of co- 

operatives and the role of milk 

control in future marketing pro- 
grams. 

The six finalists selected were: 

Asa C. Cadwallader, Salem, N.J.; 

H. Wallace Cook Jr., Elkton, Md.; 

Thomas P. Ensor, Street, Md. 

William: P. Moore, Chatam, Pa.; 

Daniel H. Schlegel, Oley, Pa. and 
William W. Vanderwende, of 

Bridgeville, Del. As panel mem- 

bers, these men discussed topics 
from linear programming to how 

to get the non-members to be- 

come active cooperative leaders. 

Crime Continues 

Sharp Upward 
Trend 
According to figures made 

available through the FBI's Uni- 

form Crime Reports and released 

by Attorney General Ramsey 

Clark, serious crime in the Unit- 

ed States continued its sharp up- 
ward: trend recording a 17 per 

cent rise nationally for the first 

three months of 1968 when com- 
pared to the same period in 1967. 

FBI Director J. Edgar Hoover 

pointed out that each crime clas- 

sification used in the national 

Crime index showed substantial 
increases. Crimes of violence as 

@ group recorded an 18 per cent 
increase with murder up 16 per 

cent, forcible rape 19 per cent, 
aggravated assault 13 per cent 

and robbery 24 per cent. Prop- 

erty crimes as a group climbed 

16 per cent with burglary up 15 

per cent, auto theft 17 per cent 
and larceny $550 and over in 

value 19 per cent. 
According to the FBI director, 

the large cities with over 100,- 
000 inhabitants experienced an 

average increase of 17 per cent, 

suburban areas 16 per cent and 

the rural areas 10 per cent. When 

viewed by geographic region, 

the Northeastern States reported 

a 21 per cent rise, the North Cen- 

tral and Southern States each 

registered a 15 per cent increase 

and the Western States an over- 

all crime increase of 16 per cent. 
The FBI director called par- 

ticular attention to the contin- 

  

ued sharp increases in the crimes | 

of violence. He specifically com- 

mented on the sharp increases in 

robbery, considered by many to 

be the bellwether of crime. Na- 

tionwide, according to Mr. Hoov- 
er, armed robbery where any 

weapon was used rose 26 per 
cent and aggravated assault with 

a firearm increased 23 per cent 
during the first quarter of 1968 

over the same period in 1967. 
® 

Hickman 
X Mrs. isaac Noble 

Call to worship Sunday morn- 

ing at Union Methodist Church 
10 a.m., Rev. John E. Taylor, pas- 

tor. Sunday school for all ages 
11 am. Paul Gustofson, super- 

intendent. 
Mr. Gary Bilbrough of Denton 

is visiting with his brother in 

law and sister Mr. and Mrs. Ed- 

die Breeding . 
Mr. and Mrs. Dawson Fearins 

and Dorothy of Denton, were a 
recent Monday evening guest of 

his mother Mrs. Jesse Fearins. 

Mr .and Mrs. David Messick 

of rural Greenwood were recent 
Sunday evening visitors of Mrs. 

Ella Breeding. 

Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie Fearins 

of Ellendale were Wednesday 

supper guests of Mrs. Jesse Fear- 
ins and Saturday evening guests 

were Mrs. Willie Fearins and 

her house guests Mr .and Mrs. 

Frank Black of Lynnwood, Pa. 
Mr .and Mrs. Wilmer Nagel 

and Dale of Federalsburg were 
Sunday afternoon guests of her 
mother Mrs. Grace Noble and 

Mr. and Mrs. Woodrow Passwia- 
ters were Sunday evening guests. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Wilson 

and Richard Lee and Mr. Isaac 

Wilson of Williston were Sun- 
day dinner guests of Mrs. Jesse 

Fearins. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Bowdle of 

Seaford were guests one day last 
week of his mother Mrs. Carrie 

Bowdle. 

  

|Armed Forces 

News 
Army Private First Class Wil- 

liam A. Burge, 20, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Raymond A. Burge, Route 
4, Dover, Del., was assigned May 

31 as a combat engineer in Com- 

pany D of the 9th Infantry Divi- 
sion’s 15th Engineer Battalion in 

ViVetnam. y 
  

Interior Communications Elec- 

trician Third Class Richard L. 
Webb, USN, 21, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. William H. Webb of Route 

2, Milford, Del. is serving aboard 

the attack carrier off the coast of 

Virginia. 
His ship recently hosted a flam- 

ily day cruise when more than 

4000 friends and relatives were 

aboard. 

The Forrestal just finishd a 

month cruise to Caribbean waters 
during which t mi teiet TA OO 

during which time it underwent 

training with the fleet training 
group at Guantanamo Bay. 

Following the family day cruise 

the Forrestal will spend three 

weeks in the Jacksonville, Fla., 
area. 

  

Army Private First Class Jef- 
fery L. Masten, 20, son of Mrs. 

Elizabeth A. Masten, 15 S. New 

st., Dover, was assigned June 1 

to the 44th Signal Battalion’s 
Communications Center Com- 
pany near Long Binh, Vietnam, 

as fa teletype repairman. 
  

Army Specialist Four Warren 
L. Brooks, 25, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Emerson Meredith, Routh 4, 

Milford, was assigned June 8 to 

the 97th Transportation Company 

near Cam Ranh Boy, Vietnam, as 
a seaman. 

Specialist Brooks’ wife, Caro- 

lyn, lives at 17 Sunset Lane, Mil- 

ford. 
  

Marine Second Lieutenant Geo. 

M. Pfeiffer Jr., 24, son of Mrs. 

Bess Nutter of Paradise Alley, 

Felton, and husband of the for- 

mer Miss Mary E. Ennis of 1013 
S. Monroe, Vandalia, Mo., is help- 

ing to provide communications 

while serving with the Seventh 

Communications Battalion at Da- 
nong, Vietnam. 

His battalion is a unit of the 
First Marine Division. 

  

Keep Cows Cool 
There isn’t much worry about 

keeping cool this time of year, 

but before too long people will 
be mopping their brows. 

Cows are less fortunate unless 

they belong to a thoughtful far- 

mer who keeps up on research. 

USDA workers cooperating 

with the University of Missouri 
have found that by keeping a 

cow’s head cool she will increase 
milk production by a sizeable 
amount. 

They claim that it is too cost- 
ly to air condition complete dairy 

barns, but that it is not too ex- 

pensive to put the cows neck and 

head in an enclosure and air 

condition it and let the remain- 

der of the barn stay at outside 
temperatures. 

As temperatures were raised 
and lowered, production respon- 

ded accordingly. There must be 

something to keeping heads of 

herds cool. — Farmland News, 
Archbold, Ohio 

  

Dissent Must 

Be Lawful 
Governor Hearnes of Missouri 

in a recent speech defined dis- 

sent and spoke out against those 
who falunt the laws of our so- 

ciety. The Press agrees with the 
governor when he said: 

We must not tolerate the de- 
cline of dissent into lawlessness. 

The dictionary definition of 
dissent is “to have a difference of 
opinion.” 

A difference of opinion does 
not logically evolve into obscen- 
ity, defiance of both written and 
natural laws or the desecration 
of our nation’s flag. Neither is 
dissent a synonym for witless 
mobs or senseless violence and 
destruction. 

The handful of people who 
protest the war by burning our 
flag or by sending supplies to the 
enemy, and the handful of peo- 
ple who protest poverty and ra- 
cial discrimination by burning, 
looting and killing, should not 
bother to claim that they are on- 
ly exercising their right to dis- 
sent. 

The rest of the nation just 
won’t accept that line of rea- 
soning. 3 

It is reasonable that the fathers 
of the present younger genera- 
tion cannot understand the flag 
burners and the draft card burn- 

ers and those who demonstrate 

with violence. Those fathers were 
drafted into World War II, they 
fought and suffered and many 

saw their friends die. 

Let us remember that the right 
to dissent is one of the guaran- 
tees for which these men died 
during World War II and let us 

pray that we deserve and merit 
so precious a gift. — Carthage     (Mo.) Press 

|ion on June 30, the last Sunday 

  

2s Anne Clifton and Miss Dor- 

Greenwood 
By Pat Hatfield 

Mennonite News 

Our sympathy to the family of 
Eli Shrock, who passed away at 

his home on Saturaday evening. 

Funeral services were on Tues- 

day at the Greenwood Mennonite 

church. 
The John Mishlers were in 

Kentucky to visit last week end 

and to bring home their daugh- 

ters who taught in Bible school 

there. 
Our good wishes go with Em- 

ory Miller who will be in school 

at Greenville, N.C., for the sum- 

mer, and to his wife and girls 
who will be with her parents in 

Goshen, Ind., during this time. 
Miss Geiser is teaching in sum- 

mer school in Greenwood this 

summer. 
  

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Workman 

recently called on Mr. and Mrs. 

Raymond Brown of Harrington. 

The Lester Workmans were 

Saturday evening dinner guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Baker of 

Vienna. 
Many of our readers will re- 

member the Rev. Robert E. 

Green who was a former pastor 

here, serving the Greenwood 

charge. He has now retired from 

the ministry and is now living 

with his wife, Cora, at 329 Cam- 

den avenue, Whitlock Apart- 

ments, Salisbury, Md. Rev. Green 

has been hospitalized but is now 

recuperating at home. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Davis and 

daughters, Cindy and Anjanette 

and Mrs. Allison Davis have re- 

cently returned home from a trip 

to Roanoke to visit the Rev. and 
Mrs. William A. Davis and son, 

Shaun, and the Gary Davises 

went on to Florida to attend the 
graduation exercises of Mrs. Da- 

vis’ sister. 
Weekend guests of the Jacob 

Hatfields were Mr. and Mrs. 
Dovid Keith of New Castle and 

Mr. Gary Bolinger of Lewisburg, 

Pa. 

Mr. J. Addison Porter of Poto- 

mac, Md., was a week end visitor 

at the home of Mrs. Edna Hayes 

and Miss Grace Porter. 

Miss Grace Porter spent last 

weekend in Media, Pa., and at- 

tended the testimonial dinner for 
the Media high school principal, 

John XK. Barrall. 
Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Draper re- 

mind all those interested to re- 
member the Draper family reun- 

in June. 

Mrs. Walter Mills, who is a 

patient in Nanticoke Memorial 
hospital, is much improved at 

home again. 
The Rev. Everett Isaacs of Jowa 

will be the guest speaker at the 

Greenwood Methodist church at 

the 11 a.m. service. 
Drew Bowman, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. William Bowman, spent the 

weekend with his grandmother, 
Mrs. Delema Smith. Jimmy 

Smith and Robert Hughes of Bal- 
timore joined them for Sunday 

dinner. vi 
At last week’s Kiwanis Club 

meeting, the guest speaker, Mr. 

George Webb of the RE.A., was 

introduced by program chairman, 

Lion Laird Kratz. Mr. Webb told 

us many things about R.E.A., its 
growth and its service to the 

community, and its deep desire 

to better that service. 
®   

Houston 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul McKnatt of 

Milford and Mr .and Mrs. Alfred 

Myers of Greenwood were din- 

ner guests Sunday of Mrs. Mae 

Vioshell. 
Little Tracey Simpson of Cam- 

den, Del. spent the week end 

with her grandparents, Mr. and 

Mrs. Frances Simpson. 

Mr .and Mrs. John Shoupe and 
children of Hixson, Tenn., spent 

last week visiting her parents, 

Mr sand Mrs. Russel Hayes, and 
her grandmother Mrs. Lucy 

Hayes. 

Mr .and Mrs. Lou Shine and 

daughters Patty Jo-Ann and Sal- 

ly from Silver Spring, Md. are 
spending this week with her fa- 

ther, Mr. Willie Clifton. 
Mr, and Mrs. Kenneth Pretty- 

man and children from Seaford 
entertained at Blair's Pond at a 

belated father’s day picnic in 

honor of their fathers, Mr. Wal- 

ter Paskey and Mr. Edwin Pret- 

tyman on Sunday. 
Mr. and Mrs. Garrth Clifton 

and sons Chucky and Chip and 
Mrs. Alice Bairns from Wilming- 

ton Manor were entertained at 

dinner Sunday by their aunts, 

    
othy Wooters. 

Mrs. Everett Manlove has re- 

turned home from West Redding, 
Conn. where she spent some time 
visiting her granddaughter Linda 
while her parents Mr. and Mrs. 
William Manlove attended the 

graduation of their son Dawid, 

from the University of Georgie 
in Athens, Ga. 

Rev. and Mrs. John A. Gil- 

more and son Gregory spent a 
few days recently with her par- 
ents Mr .and Mrs. W. Shockley 

Daugherty. 
Daniel W. Capehart arrived in 

Frankford, Germany, on Thurs-- 

day, where he will be stationed 
for the next three years. He re- 

this writing and “may soon be | 

Smile As You 
‘Drive By 

traffic hazzards involved in 
drive-in banking and the moral 

hazards involved in drive-in mo- 

vies, but we face with some 
fears the latest 

drive-in viewing of the remains. 

The idea of an Atlanta morti- 
cian to display his customers in 

6-foot window boxes for the in- 

spection of those who are in too 
much of a hurry to attend the 

funeral is almost the last word 

in drive-inning. It isn’t the ulti- 
mate because, now and then, 

someone get born in public. It 

only happens by accident, how- 

ever, not by intent. Most people 

would prefer to be born private. 

We won't have must to say 
about it later, but while we can 

we would like to reject the idea 

of doing an “Alas-{Poor-Yorick” 

act in an undertaker’s display 

window. It would be intolerable 

to be propped up under six feet 
of glass (no typographical error 

intended) for the benefit of peo- 

ple who are too lazy to come to 
our funeral. 

The fact that the window box 

will have wall-to-wall carpeting 

is no inducement. We couldn’t 
use it anyway. 

If worst comes to worst, as we 

have found it usually does, we 

have one final, dying request. 
Display us, if necessary, under 

the friendly sign we saw in front 

of a filling station the other day. 
It said: 

“If you can’t stop, smile as you 

drive by.” — Des Moines (Iowa) 
Register 

Eorihvorns Silent 

Soil Mixers 
The earthworm is a silent, 

nearly - inconspicuous mixer. 

Earthworms pull leaves down in- 

to the soil and carry inorganic 

material to the surface, producing 

an overall mixing action. 

As a result of this ability of 
theirs, research scientists are ex- 

perimenting with using the earth- 

  

worm to return Ohio’s stripmined , 

land to more productive uses, ac- 

cording to Dr. John Vimmerstedt, 
research forester with the Ohio 

Agricultural Research and De- 

velopment Center, Wooster. 

Spoil material on stripmined 

land is made up of rock frag- 

ments and lacks organic matter. 

In order to re-establish vegeta- 
tion on spoilbanks, fast-growing 

trees like black locust and Euro- 
pean alder are planted. 

Vimmerstedt reports that the 
trees do relatively well on the 
mineral soils. However, decaying 

leaves remain on the surface. 
Some method of mixing the or- 

ganic material into the spoil min- 

erals is needed for more rapid 

soil formation. : 

This is where the earthworms 
come in. This is the experiment 

under study. It’s effectiveness re- 
mains to be seen. 

Is it too farfetched to wonder 

if earthworms could be taught to 
take the place of cultivators in 

corn and bean fields? Perhaps 
this could start another agricul- 
tural related business, that of 

raising trained earthworms, gu- 

aranteed to keep soil well mixed 

with organic matter.—Farmland 
News, Archbold, Ohio. 

  

  

PROMPT 

TV SERVICE 
DEL - MOR - TV CO. 

Harrington-Milford Road     
  

We have learned to accept the 

development, 

    

‘Announce Faculty, Advice on Wills 
Appointments | 

The University of Delaware’s 
College of Agricultural Sciences 

anounces the creation of a de- 

partment of plant science, effec- 
tive July 1, according to Dean 
William E. McDaniel. 

The new department will in- 
crease coordination, teamwork 

and efficiency in teaching, re- 

search and extension programs 

in plant pathology, agronomy 

and horticulture, says McDaniel. 

This will enable the college to 

provide students with a more in- 

tegrated plant science curricu- 
¢ Jum 

Chairman of the newly formed 
department will be 48-year-old 

‘Dr. Merle R. Teel. Teel received 
his bachelors and masters degrees 

from th Univrsity of Nebraska 
and was awarded his doctorate at 
Purdue University. In his new 
position, Teel’s primary responsi- 

bilities are direction of teaching 

and research in plant science. 
Before coming to Delaware, 

Teel served as an associate pro- 

fessor at Purdue University, vis- 
iting professor at Cornell Uni- 

versity and as a teacher and prin- 

cipal at Nebraska elementary 
schools. 

Teel, who has written more 

than 25 plant science publications 
is a member of the American So- 

ciety of Agronomy; Soil Science 

Society; Crop Science Society; 
and a director of the American 

Forage and Grassland Council. 

Also appointed to the new 

plant science faculty is Dr. 
Wayne Kussow, 29, a native of 

Green Bay, Wisconsin. 

Kussow received both his griad- 

uate and undergraduate degrees 
at the University of Wisconsin. 

Before coming to Delawlare, he 

was an assistant professor of 

soils at the University of Wiscon- 

sin and worked on the Universi- 
ty’s USAID program at the Uni- 

versity of Rio Grande do Sul, 
Brazil. 

During his two years in Brazil, 

Kussow was responsible for es- 

tablishing programs in soil sci- 

ence and plant nutrition. He also 

conducted soil calibration exper- 

iments for phosphorus, potassium 
and lime on several Brazilian 

crops including rice, corn, wheat, 

soybeans and clover. 

In his new position, Kussow 
will teach and do research in 

soils and crop fertility. 
® 

Of Local Interest 
Mr. and Mrs. Russell J. Knaub 

  

| have moved from Bridgeville to 
316 Wiener ave., the former resi- 

dence of Mr .and Mrs. Kenneth 

G. Aiken who have moved to 

Seaford. Knaub is a teacher in 

Greenwood school. 

Friends of Mr. and Mrs. John 
F. Camper are invited to attend 

an open house on July Tth from 

2-4 p.m. in honor of their golden 

wedding anniversary. 
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  I ——r 
Er ———————1 

  

  

  

p ———_—— ll i 
-———————— 

EE oh -_A ie =:   

ones at home depend- 
ing on you. Nationwide 
insurance rates recog- 
nize this, and you get   
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snp 
a a break. And if you 

own two cars—an 

even bigger one. Join 
the safest drivers in   

  

  

  

  ——==— America. Phone: 
    cently returned from Vietnam 

where he spent ninteen months. 
  

OUTTEN’S 
N ATIO NWi ) = Insurance Service 

Commerce St. 
Harrington 398-3276 

Nationwide Mutual insurance Company Home Office: Columbus, Ohle   

No will is of any value and no 
one dan execute its terms if it 

cannot be found, or its contents 

proved after the maker’s death. 

After you have your will 
drawn, your lawyer will give 

you the original unless you wish 
him to retain it for safe keeping. 

He will usually keep a confirm- 

ed copy for his files, one for the 
executor and perhaps give you 

an extra copy. Where, then, do 
you keep the will? 

If the orginal will is lost, it 

may be possible to have one of 
the copies probated. But this can 

be both a costly and time-con- 
suming proposition. So what can 

you do to safeguard the original? 
You certainly don’t want to 

keep it around the house. That 

may happen to be the absolutely 
worst place for safekeeping. 

There is no one “best” place. 
If you keep it in your safe depo- 

sit box, your wife or other inter- 

ested parties may have a prob- 
lem getting into it immediately. 
Legal steps may have a problem 

getting into it immediately. Le- 

gal steps may have to be taken 
first. If there are last-wish in- 

structions in the will, such as de- 

tails of the funeral, they may 
be found too late. 

Here are a few suggestions: 

1. You and your wife can rent 

separate safe deposit boxes. You 

keep her will and she can keep 
your will. : 

2. You can leave the original 

with your lawyer and keep only 

a copy. : 

3. If you name a bank or trust | 
company as executor or co-execu- 

tor, a sealed copy of the will can 
be left with them. 

4. The law provides that you 

may deposit your will, securely 
sealed, with the ‘judge of your 
county probate court for safe- 
keeping. — Amery (Wis.) Free 
Press 

  

SHOP AND SWAP 

IN THE WANT ADS 

PHONE 398-3206 
  

  
heating hills 
got your back up? 

OUR BUDGET PLAN 
smooths out the 

humps in heating 
bills by spreading 
payments over ten 

months. No carrying 

charge either. Call 
us today. 

Harrington Lumber 

& Supply Co. 

HARRINGTON, DEL. 

Phone 398-3242 

WE GIVE 

S&H GREEN STAMPS 

  

| OIL HEAT | 
  

Poverty Can 

Be Expensive 
We are told there is a federal 

policy against govenment agen- 
cies using the mail to distribute 
information to people who have 

not asked for it. Like so many 

rules it seems to be honored more 
in the breach than in observance. 

Consider the Office of Econo- 
mic Opportunity, pentagon of the 

war on poverty. The OEO has a 

special privilege allowing it to 

mail to any postal patron any- 
thing it wants—especially big, 

high cost brochures telling of its 

glories, prepared by 46 press ag- 
ents. This is just part of the near 

$75 million a year which Cali- 

fornia Congressman Charles M. 

Teague of Ojai reports is being   

spent annually by the administr: fe io 

tion on promotional mailings. 
There’s an old quip that one 

thing money can’t buy is pover- 
ty. It can certainly promote it, 

though.—Sanger (Calif.) Herald 

One More a 

Statistic "= 
While you're trying to measure 

the nature and meaning of our 

involvement in Vietnam, here’s a 
fact to keep in mind. 

More people have been 

(by communist terrorists) t: 

to vote in South Vietnam 

they have been killed by our 
bombs in North Vietnam. 
—MecLean County (Ky.) News 

  

  

  

TALK 
by VINCE MAILE 

TELEPHONE 

Your telephone manager in Dover 

  

in Dover. 

  

Delawareans. 

convenience. 

    

easier. 

Hook in Smyrna.   
  

- Suggestion: see The First State first. 

Interested in history? The 
Strand in New Castle holds some 
of the best preserved early 
American homes and public 
buildings. Or cast an admiring 
eye at the Old State House 

Before you go anywhere, call ahead for 
reservations. And be sure to keep in touch | 
by TELEBARGAIN with the folksback home, | 
for a truly carefree vacation. : 

For resort lovers, Sussex County 
is a treasure trove. The famous 
Rehoboth and Bethany beaches, | 
among others, provide recre- 
ation to delight vacationers. 

Get a kick out of country fairs? 
Don’t miss the State Fair at 
Harrington . . . draws thousands 
of out-of-staters as well as 

While you drive, look for outdoor phone ; 

booths spotted along the highway for your 

Vistas? The swift flow of the | 
Brandywine Creek fosters 

beauty enough along its banks 

Credit cards make keeping in touch even 

For hunting—or just watching 
—wildlife abounds at Bombay 

And on and on. Delaware is alive with places to | 
see and enjoy. This summer try it on for size. 

@ Diamond State Telephone a 

    

to captivate anyone. 

  

      
  

  

HARRINGTON 
398-3757   Model RS21P08 — Bisque White 

  

WE SERVICE EVERYTHING WE SELL. 
STORE HOURS: (9 to 6 except Friday — 9 to 9) 

GERARDI BROS. 
3 Locations to Serve You 

FEDERALSBURG 

754-2841 

A HANDFUL OF EXCITEMENT 
THE ESCORT* : 
BY WESTINGHOUSE 
AM RADIO — WATCH ~~ 
FLASHLIGHT — LIGHTER 

e All-in-one miniaturized coms 
bination fits in purse or pocket 
e “Solid State” AM radio e 
Handy miniature flashlight e 
Swiss-made, shock-resistant, 
dust-proof watch with non- 
glass crystal ¢ Cigarette lighter 
automatically turns ““off/on®’ 
with opening or closing of 
spring cover Built-in re- 
charger plugs into AC outlet — 
2 “AA" nickel cadmium bat- 
teries included e High impact 
styrene case e Detachable car- 
rying strap « 336" H x 4%" 
Wx 13%"D. 

*Patent Applied For 

(By Appointment — Anytime) 

     

       

  

DENTON 
479-1626 
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% and gave him the pole position. 

of Wilmington was third in the 

  

~~ retire the side and preserve a 

In Tri-State 880 
est official half mile of his ca- 

him to be nosed out in the most 

won a district crown and thus 

~ ers were the survivors of some 

~ 300 entrants in the three-state 

area . 
~ Wetherhold’s 2.05.1 winning 

former from the Pottstown, Pa. 

2.03.7, compared to a 
2042 Had the Pottstown lad| Willis, 3b 
been boxed in instead of Weth- )J. Vaughn, ss 

with a sub 2.03 clocking. Mean- 
while, the rest of the field, in- 
cluding those who effectively 

~ three yards between them. 

Turner, two sprint newcomer, 
~ finished fourth of 21 teams with 
a clocking of 51.8 seconds. Don 

; Parker and John Shulties were 

"in the senior (16-17). 220 but was 

think. Remember that such ecit- 

STANDINGS (Juee 25) 
: W L 

Tigers 8 0 
~ Orioles 2 4 

0 6 

  

FRIDAY, JUNE 28, 
  

  

KEITH S. BURGESS — Sports Editor 

I dd Bd Cad rd 7 2d L277 Ad Eid de ddd iid didi ddd 

Harrington, Smyrna-Clayton Split 

    

  

In Big League Play 
- Harrington Big League entry 

gained a split at Smyrna-Clayton 

on Sunday afternoon. 
~ Any time a team can break 

even with the powerful upstat- 

ers, it is time to heave a king- 

sized sigh of relief. The locals 
were outhit 20-4, a 5 to 1 ratio, 

. yet came home showing one win 
and one loss on the season. 

~ Jack Redden’s sixth inning sin- 
gle cost Smyrna hurler Dave Cox 

a no-hitter in the opener, which 

was won 8-0 by the host team. 

Howard Brown was touched for 
12 hits in defeat. 

Loose play by Smyrna-Clay- 

ton helped Harrington to a 5-1 

lead in the nightcap. The losers 
then tallied three times off start- 
er Harold Jump in the final inn- 

ing, but Jack Redden came in to 

5-4 Harrington triumph. 

Wetherhold 2nd 

  

Chris Wetherhold ran the fast- 

reer at West Chester, Pa. last 
Saturday, but the bad “racing 
luck,” that has plagued him in 

the important races this season, 

was still present. This caused 

important half mile he has ever 

competed in, the middle Atlantie 
junior olympics 880 yard run. 

Every competitor at West Ches- 
ter was a chlampion, who had 

qualified to enter this regional 

meet. Wetherhold as Delaware 
state champion was competing 
against the winners of 20 other 
races held in New Jersey and 

Pennsylvania. These 21 half-mil- 

in the"Delaware state meet 

' the fastest of the 21 races 

He took the early lead but had 
the misfortune to be boxed in 

on the first lap, by slower rivals, 

who it turned out were going 
nowhere. Meanwhile a 2.07 per- 

pacers track club was cruising 

along in the lead. The Harring- 
ton lad had to waste valuable 
energy to fight his way out of 

the box and get back in conten- 

tion. 
He drew even with the Penn- 
sylvanian but couldn't quite 
match the latter’s finishing kick. 

The locals were outhit 10-3 as 

Redden, Jump and John Wink- 

ler hit safely. 
Jerry Cagle, a track star at 

Harrington high, stole several 
bases during the afternoon. In- 

cluded in his thefts were two at 

‘home plate. 
Tuesday night at 6:30, the lo- 

cals will host Seaford. The tilt 

will take place on the Moose 
diamond or at Harrington high 

school. 

  Chris was clocked officially in 
t of 

erhold, we feel that the Harring- 
tonian would have won easily 

ruined Wetherhold’s chances, 
were many yards down the track, 
as the front-running duo crossed 
the finish line with only two or 

To illustrate the class of these 
two 15-year-olds, Jay Laughlin 

16-17 year-old division 880, with 

a clocking only one second bet- 
ter than Wetherhold’s. Laughlin 

is the fastest half-miler in Dela- 

ware scholastic history. 

Harrington's Junior (12-13) 

440 relay team, which won the 

Delaware State title, although 

using Mike Davis and George 

‘the experienced hands on the 

quartet. 

Shulties placed sixth in the 

junior broad jump 

Tolbert Harris did not place 

timed in 23.9 seconds, his fastest 
furlong ever. 

~ Harrington’s first venture into 
age--group competition on a 3- 

state level, ended quite well, we 

ies as Philadelphia, Wilmington, 

Harrisburg, York, Lancaster, 

Trenton and Camden, N.J.,, etc, 
were represented. This is quite 
different than competing against 

the likes of Felton, Greenwood, 
Bridgeville, we can assure you. 

In deality, Wetherhold was sec- 
ond of some 300 boys and Shul- 
ties was sixth of probably 400 or 

500 competitors. The 440 relay 
boys finished ahead of an esti- 

mated 200 such units. 
  

Minor League 
Baseball News 
RESULTS 

Tigers 7 - Yankees 3 
Tigers 12 - Orioles 3 

Orioles 2 - Yankees 0 

  

FIRST GAME Zealand Challenge with horses 

HARRINGTON drawn from the free-for-all 
AB R H | ranks. 

Cagle, ss 9 0 Oy ® 
Smith, 2b T= 00 

Molter, cf 300 Pony Races 
Redden, 3b 3.0. 1 

Winkler, 1b 3 0 o Results 
oe ix : 2 ; Wednesday night the Harring- 
Coulbourne. > 12 1 o ofton Pony Raceway had the most’ 
I Brown Ie 1 0'0 ponies so far this year. We hope 

H Br or 1 0 to have more coming on the fol- 
: Wb lowing Saturday afternoon and 

20 0 | Wednesday nights. There will be 

SMYRNA-CLAYTON [recing on July 4 
AB R Don’t forget to come out to 

D ing. 1b 3 1 the pony races at Moose home. 

Vaughn 1b 10 Races start at 1::30 on Saturday 
Tovies go 3 9 'and 6:30 on Wednesday nights. 

R. i cf 1:00 Free ea AT 

Arment, 3b 3 0 2; First Race 

Sin 58 : : 0’) Miss Sappho (S. Rattray) 
Willis %b ? 1 0 12, Pepper's Boy (A. Dickerson) 

C. Everett, 2b 31.3 2 Pople Ory (2. Logos) 
Stump, 2b 0 0 0 S d Roce 
Watson, 1f 21 3 Boon 
Sudles. If i100 1. J. M. (N. Melvin) 

A 4 2. Miss Dixie Diamond (B. Min-' 
dams, rf 173 0 her) 

Mast, rf 1.0 ply De : 
Vodwerks, © 30 1 : ping Faven Dottie (N. Cohee) 

Cox, p 311, SS pin 

30 in 1Z 1. Charlie (B. Legates) 
. 2. Sandy (N. Adams) 

Herrington 00000000 5 yrorie Mille Flash (B. Min- 
Smyrna-Clayton 5 2 0 0 0 1 x—8 nor) 

wk iw fo \ 

SECOND GAME bi Bs Th as 
HARRINGTON AB R q 1. Black Magic (E. Cohee) 

Cacti 8 1.20 2. Princess (E. Kibler) 
8 ? ' 3. Seven Lizabell (T. Kemp) 

Smith, 3b,p 3 20 Time: 2 13. 

Motter, cf 4 0 0 f Race 

Redden, 2b 4 0. Fins J Bani 5 o p 1 Ohara (D. Edwards) 
N 2 If 0 0 po 2 Blazer (E. Tripp) 
Sewemen 3. Chipper T (N. Thompson) 
Black, ph 1 0 0 Time: 1:39 

Coulbourne, If 1.00: a2 Sixth Rae 
Hurd, rf Loot 4 Ou, = 
W i h 10 0 1. Dizzy Dean (N. Thompson) 

hi hp , | o o 2 Miss Cindy Lee (E. Voshell) 
INST, XL 3. Bill Beaver (J. Minner) 

Jump, p 3 0 1'mime: 2:01 
= = TT Seventh Race 

. 1. Starlight urple Ci ival . (J. SMYRNA-CLAYTON i! Star lin e Comal. 
Poli In i 4 ite Patchie (N. Cherry) 
aylor, | 3. Billy Boy (D. Gonce) 

Hughey rf 1.0.0 Time: 2:06 

Arment, p : ; 2p) Jan (T. Millman) 
Cake wg Ap Dusty T. (E. Tripp) 

Smoky T. (C. Thompson 
Watson, 1f 3 1.9 > ll ( Peon) 
Cc. Everett, 2b 3.0 1. Ninth Race 

Stump, 1b 2 : 4 1. Lucky Handover (Davis) 
Sudler, pr . 5 2 Eds Star Dust (E. Clother) 
R. Everett, cf 3 2 3. Stoney Boy (R. Coverdale) 
Bartholomew, c 1:0 0 Time: 1.30. 

Vodvarka, c 2:00: Tenth Race 

— 7 77 1. Miss Lucky Lady (E. Kibler) 

: 29 4 8 5 gnowball (N. Cherry) 
Herrington 00102025 3 ginger Cookie (Millman) 
Smyrna-Clayton 1 0 0 0 0 0 3—4 Time: 1:36. 

B d ig Eleventh Race 
ran ywine 1. Holly K. (H. Kemp) 

2. Windy (L. Moore) 

Raceway News |s Buster (R Dean) 
Time: 1:53. 

Wilmington, Del. — Cardinal Twelfth Race 

Bruce, Ardrossan, Alto Brigade,|1. Peggy 

Brian’s Way and Pride of Hano-|2. Bayside Elizabeth (J. Frazer) 

earlier this year, and the immor- 

| tal Cardigan Bay, who looks cer- 

tain to be the first harness horse 
in history to win a cool million 

bucks. 

Although New Zealand horses 
have had better success than 

their Australian counterparts in 
the past, the Aussie representa- 

tives are better than ever this 
season. Ardrossan, Cardinal 

Bruce and First Lee are among 

those who have performed with 

distinction. 

Strangely enough, very few 
Anzac trotters have mad the 

grade here, mainly because there 

are very few trots conducted 

down-under for freshmen and 

sophomores. But according to all 

reports, a couple of surprise trot- 

ters soon could hit these shores 

and wow the fans just as Cardy 
has done for years. 

Brandywine Racing Secretary 

Joe DeFrank is still hoping to 
program an All-Australian-New 

    

  ver all have something in com- 
mon. Each is a strong down-un- 

with great success at Brandywine 

Raceway this season. 

Of course, this is only wa frac- 

tion of the long and impressive 

list. Anzac horses are being im-!. 

ported to the United Statees in 
unprecedented numbers, and 

many . are finding the finely 

boned Wilmington half-mile oval 

to their liking. 

Brian’s 'Way, co-owned by Phil- 

adelphia sportscaster Jim Leam- 

ing and Stanley Dancer, set the 

fastest time of the meet to that 
point when he clocked an im- 

pressive 2:01.3 triumph on May 

16. 

Since then, Happy Songster, 
Aust Southern Silver, Lyndhurst, 

Brilliant Rose, Balladeer N., Scot- 
tie Scott and Stewart Hanover, 

among others, consistently finish 
in the money at Brandywine for 

their jubilant owners. 
Australian and New Zealand 

standardbreds are noted for their 

hardiness. Down-under sulkies 
are much heavier, the standing 

start is utilized, and better class 

horses are handicapped from 12 

to 120 yards behind the rest of 
the field. 

Ex-New Zealand champ Cardi- 

gan Bay was forced to resume 

his record-smashing money win- 

ning spree here because he con- 

sistently was “handicapped out” 

of any chance to win in his home 
country. 

Time: 1:50. 

SECOND HEAT 
der pacer who has performed | First Heat 

1. Pepper's Boy (A. Dickerson) 

2. Miss Sappho (S. Rattray) 

3. Dusty (E. Wright) 

Time: 2:41. 
Second Race 

1. Fine Haven Dottie 
2. Miss Kelly (D. Edwards) 

3. J. M. (N. Melvin) 
Time: 2:20. 

Third Race 

1. Willy Wind (E. Kibler) 

2. Charlie (B. Legates) 

3. Merri Mills Flash (B. Minner) 
Time: 2:19. 

Fourth Race 

1. Black Magic 

2. Princess( E. Kibler) 

3. Seven Lizabell 

Time: 2:12. 
Fifth Race 

1. Blazer (E. Tripp) 
2. Ohara (D. Edwards) 

3. Ebel Handbell 

Time: 1:39%. 

Sixth Race i 

1. Dizzy Dean (N. Thompson) 

2. Miss Cindy Lee (E. Voshell) 

3. Bill Beaver (J. Minner) 
Time: 2:04. 

Seventh Race 

1. Starlights Purple Carnival (J. 
Frazier) 

2. Billy Boy (D. Gance) 

3. Patchie (N. Cherry) 

Time 2:05. 

Eighth Race 
1. Jan 

2. Billy Win (W. Welch) 

3. Silver Boy (T. Kemp)   
Dancer’s biggest successes have 

been with Cardinal King, a New   
Yankees ; 

Zealander who won three $50,000 

invitationals in a row at Yonkers 

  

3. Silver Boy (T. Kemp) 
| Time: 2:03. 

9, 10, 11 and 12th race were 
called off due to the rain. 

f 

_{ named. 

THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL, HARRINGTON, DELAWARE 

SATURDAY AFTERNOON 

FIRST HEAT 

Firset Race 

1. Princess (E. Kibler) 

2. J. M. (N. Melvin) 

3. Mr. Ed (J. Cohee) 
Time: 2:21. 

Second Race 

1. Blazer (E. Tripp) 
2. Ohara (D. Edwards) 

Time: 1:39. : 

Third Race 

1. Charlie (P. Legates) 

2. Seven Lizabell (T. Kemp) 

3. Sandy (N. Adams) 

Time: 2:06. 

Fourth Race 

1. Candy T. (E. Tripp) 

2. Miss Lucky Lady (E. Kibler) 

3. Silver Bay (T. Kemp) 
Time: 1:57. 

Fifth Race 

1. Merri Mills Ebonite (D. Ed- 
wards) 

2. Lighting (F. Hudson) 

3. Miss Bonnie (J. W. Adams) 

Time: 2:19. 

Sixth Race 

1. Red Feather (H. Meyers) 

2. Berdie B. (W. Lord) 

shell) i 
Time: 2:02. 

Seventh Race 
1. Bell’s Star (Charlie Buck) 

2. Holly K. (H. Kemp) 

3. Little Duke (C. Morris) 
Time: 1:51. 

SECOND HEAT 

First Race 

1. J. M. (N. Melvin) 
2. Princess (E. Kibler) 

3. Mr. Ed (J. Cohee) 

Time: 2:20. 

Second Race 
1. Ohara (D. Edwards) 

2. Blazer (E. Tripp) 
Time: 1:42. . 

Third Race 
1. Betty Lou (F. Hudson) 

2. Charlie (P. Legates) 

3. Sandy (N. Adams) 
A Time: 2:08. 

Fourth Race 

1. Miss Lucky Lady (E. Kibler) 

2. Snowball (N. Cherry) 

3. Candy T. (E. Tripp) 
Time 1:59. 

Fifth Race 
HL. Lighting (F. Hudson) 

2. Merri Mills (Ebonite) 

3. Miss Bonnie (J. W. Adams) 
Time: 2:20. 

Sixth Race 

1. Berchie B. (W. Lord) 

2. Red Feather (H. Meyers) 
Time: 2:08. 

Seventh Race 
1. Holly K (H. Kemp) 

2. Bell's Star (Charlie Buck) 
3. Little Duke (C. Morris) 

Time 1:54. 

First Kid’s Race 
1. Charlie (B. Legates) 

2. Silver Boy (P. Kemp) 

3. Playboy (D. Legates) 

Second Kid’s Race 
1. Ohara (Donnie Edwards) 

2. Blazer (Donna Edwards) 
Time: 1:43%. 

Ladies’ Race 

1. Blazer (C. Edwards) 

2. Ohara (D. Schrieber) 
Time: 1:46. 

- ®   

3. Bill's Little Nuggett (E. Vo- i 

! the last two meetings will be 

| The new 7:30 starting time, |and Austin Thomas, Temperance- § 
which Laurel president and gen- | ville, Va. Each have 28 horses in 

| eral manager Richard H. Hutch- | tow. 
ison introduced on Monday’s in- 

Ocean Downs 
Raceway News 

Ocean Down Raceway at 

Ocean City kicks off its 20th sea- 

son of racing Wednesday night, 

July 3 and over one quarter icf a 

  

be given out during the 42 nights | 

of racing. 

horses this year will surpass any- 

thing the track has had in at! 
least the past ten years. 

With Ocean City and the other 

resort areas going into what ap- | 

pears to be the biggest summer 

season on record, Ocean Downs 

is expecting to keep pace. 

The track now has completed 

its two-year plan of converting 

‘its colors from the original (1949) | 

|     
dyellow and blue to white and 

| blue. The racing strip has been | 

: resurfaced with approximately 

500 tons of stonedust from Penn- 
sylvania. 

For the first time, Ocean 

Downs will offer the Exacta form 

of wagering. Racing fans will 
have the opportunity to select in 

advance two horses that will fin- 
ish first and second. The Exacta 

will be offered in the fifth and 
ninth races. Exacta payoffs often | 

reach into the hundreds of dol- | 

lars and have been made popular j 

at nearby tracks such as Har- 

rington, Georgetown and Rose- 

croft Rlaceways and all over the 
country. 

This year’s meeting will cover 

nine weeks, ending August 31. 

There will not be any racing on 

Monday nights and none on Tues- ; 

day, July 9 and 16. 

Thousands of dollars have been 
layed out for improvement for 

horsemen. The four blacksmith 

shops have been re-built, ceramic 

tile put down in the horsemian’s 

toilet building, shower walls tiled 

land considerable painting dome. 

The two leading drivers who 
won the thousand dollar checks 

  
  

  
j back. John Amato, the 1966 win- 

| ner, and Richard Lee Ring, Salis- 

| bury, last year’s winner, will be 

Every six days, the three leading 

drivers flor that period will get 

million dollars in purses are to | 

Board Chairman J. C. Robinson Taylor & Maik 
said yesterday that the quality of | 

fighting for the big money again. | 

Racing will start at 8::30 each 

augural card for the first time, | evening and the Daily Double 

| seems to have been unanimously 
approved by the fans. | 

will close at 8:20. 

@ 

Senior League 
Baseball News 
RESULTS 

Peoples 4 - T & M 3 

Porters 12 - T& M 7 

STANDINGS (June 25) 

  

  

  

WwW L 
Porters 7 3 

Peoples 5] 5 

First National 4 4 

3 7 

Laide League 
Baseball News 

RESULTS 

Lions 11 - Moose 3 

| Legion 7 - Rotary 0 

Rotary 8 - Moose 7 

Legion 7 - Lions 5 

STANDINGS (June 25) 
WwW L 

Legion 8 2 

Lions 7 5 

Rotary BH Ki 
Moose 2 8 

Little League Tag Day raised 

a record $207.37. The Harrington 

Little League wishes to thank 
all contributors and everyone 

who helped in any way to make 

this fund drive such a rousing 

success. 

‘The Readers 
Really Want... 

All newspaper people take a 

lot of punishment about the con- 

tent of their newspaper. Every- 

one wiants something different in 

print. Just for fun, a Montana 

editor recently ran a ‘poll’ of his 

readers, and these are the sub- 

pects the readers said they would 

like to see printed moct oftan: 

1. My name. 

  

  

0 AY YAY. UA  DIA\BAP: 

INSTALLATION .. 

All Types of Antenna 

Repair Work 

Gerardi Bros. 
Harrington 398-3757   

cash awards. 

The two largest stables will wi] 
those of W. J. Briney from Iowa ! 

Federalshurg 754-2841 

Denton 479-1626 

| 

| 

  
  

  

  

2. A front page article showing 
how crooked. the city govertenent : 

is most of the time. 
3. My wife’s name. 

4. A feature article showing 25 

ways on how to cheat on income 

tax forms. 

5. My kids’ names. 

6. A local news items about | 
the affair my neighbor is having. 

7. A classified ad offering a 
new home for sale for $4,000. 

8. More news about lawbreak- 

ers. 

9. Less news about lawbreak- 

ers. I was picked up last night 
and I should not have to pay a 
fine. 

10. An editorial condemning 

high school teachers for being 

too liberal with “F’s”. 
11. A wedding picture of the 

groom instead of the bride when 

he is more handsome than she   
I 

r 

is pretty. : 
12. A sports picture of me 

when I bowled 183. 

13. More advertisements on 

things that merchants are giving 

away. 

14. A front page spread about 

the deadbeat who lives across the 
street from me who just had his 

car repossessed. 
15. A front page picture of my 

neighbor being hauled out of the 

bar by his wife. 
16. Forget the one about the 

car, I just got word from the fin- 
ance company that they're com- 

ing after my car.—Diboll (Tex.) 
Free Press 

® 

— ADVERTISE 

  

BE WISx® 

Shop and Swap—In the Want Ads 

PHONE 398-3206 

  

XX XXIII XXXXXS   

   
1 SWAPPED FOR 
IT THROUGH THE 

XXX 

     

  

  0000900009000 0000000000000000000000000000000000000 

  

Make your day off pay off at 

Delaware 
NEW! THE “QUINELLA"... 

  

Park 
5th & 9th races 

or 

¥ THRU AUG. 10 

POST TIME 1:30 

  
  

  
Laurel Raceway 
News | 

Laurel Raceway harness fans 

hiave three more exciting nights 

of racing here before the Route 
One plant, Maryland’s pioneer 
harness track, closes 

full week of a 42-night stand, 

which includes August 10. : 
Headline events on tonight's 

(Thursday) card are the main | 

division of the Reading Futurity 
for two-year-old pacers, and the 

two-year-old filly trot. 

three-year-old trotters move in- 

to the spotlight in the main divi- 

sion of the Reading, while the 

two-year-old filly pacers will 
share the limelight. 

John Phillips, Laurel’s direc- 

tor of racing, as promised, also 
has a $2,000 preferred trot and 

a $3,500 invitational pace slated 

for tomorrow night. Saturday, it 

will be the Reading futurity pace 

for three-year-olds in both the 

filly and main division. The big 

Saturday card also offers a $2,- 

500 preferred pace and a $4,500 
invitational pace. 

Last season’s Reading futuri- 

ties were won by: Chief Butler, 

main division (2:02.1); Tiffany, 
filly pace (2:04.3); Fashion Hill, 

colt trot (2:06.4), and Jostle, fil- 
ly trot (2:09.4). The three-year- 

old divisions were taken by: Em- 

ber Hanover, main division 
(2:03); Vesta’s Dream, filly pace 

(2.05.2) ; Faybill, colt trot (2:04.2) 

land Flying Cloud, filly trot 
(2:074). 

Some of the most powerful 
stables in the nation have nomi- 

nations for this year’s Reading 

futurities, long considered the 

backbone of Liaurel’s racing sea- 
son. 

Billy Haughton has 18 two- 
year-olds and seven three-year- 

olds named in, while Stanley 

Dancer has 11 freshmen and 
three-year-old Lux Hanover en- 
tered. Stanley’s brother, Vernon, 

has six two-year-olds and a sim- 

ilar number of sophomores en- 

rolled, while the consistent Gray 
brothers have eight two-year- 

olds and mine three-year-olds 

Fans got their first look at the 
ever-popular, fast-stepping At- 

lantic Seaboard Circuit Pacers 

out its first 

_ Tomorrow night (Friday), the | 

Quality Guaranteed 
OPEN 8 A. M. to 10 P. M. 

   at Low Prices 
bd Day 

    
  

BEAT THE HEAT 

  

   
BUTT 
PORTION 

Center Cut 

Kraft’s Pizza 
153} oz. 

ROASTS or SLICES 

WHOLE or HALF 

YANKEE MAID 

up to 
1Y/y bs. 49°, 

$11 

69°. 
  

“Del-Mar-Va Lous” BURRIS 
CHICKENS - 

93° 1; 
No Waste, Boney Backs, Necks, Etc. 

CHOICE PAK 

  

Mix with Cheese 
Box — with 

12 oz. Can Pepsi — FREE 
Entire Pkg. 
ONLY - 29° 

  

JFULLY COOKED HAMS 
SHANK PORTION up to 5 lbs. :39¢ 
  

Oscar Mayers 
Mendota FRANKS 

   
   

2 Ib. 
pkg. ay 

  

2 oz. Jar 

   79° 
  

MARS 

  

  
1 1b. 
pkg. 

KRAFT 
HMALLOWS 

29° 

  

    

    

  

5 1b. 
bag 39° 

kiNGsForD CHARCOAL BRIQUETS    

  

am Ib. wir 1 

  

PENN-RAD Charcoal 

295° 

  

     
    

  

i Fluid 

er |: k 
  

His ideas are the sa 

Great opportunities 

You can always tell a well informed man— 
me as yours. 

come to those who make 
the most of the small ones. 

Nothing is waste that leaves a memory. 

The rest of the paid advertisement is devoted to FOOD FOR THOUGHT— 

EARL QUILLEN, JR. SAYS: DID YOU KNOW 
The first man to tear a t 
was undoubtedly the father of a teenager. 

A man must have a certain amount of intelli- 
gent ignorance to get anywhere. | 

People who jump at conclusions often frighten 
the best ones away. 

   

     
    

    

elephone book in half 

    here opening night and there will 

be two more chances to see them   when the crack A.S.C. field re- 
turns here op» July 5 and 19. 

QUILLEN'S DAIRY MARKET 

  

Harrington, Del. Dorman St. PHONE 398-8768 
Open EVERY Day of the Year 

| 8:00 AM. — 10:00 P.M. 

  

— For Your Convenience 

SALE RUNS 

JUNE 27-28-29 

      

  

(We reserve the right 

to limit quantities)        

  

  

  
  

  

  

 


