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THE FACES OF HERITAGE DAY - Some were made up as the Harrington 
Janecees offered everyone the chance to “Be a Clown”.... 

Sixty-Sixth Year, No. 13, September 16, 1981 

....Others were serious as they took the time to demonstrate crafts such as corn 
husk weaving....... 

Published Every Wednesday at Harrington, Delaware 

Heritage Day Draws A Crowd 
Harrington's third annual Heritage 

Day was deemed a success by Greater 

Harrington Historical Society Presi- 
dent, Ken McKnatt who said he was 
pleased with the results. No actual 
crowd count was made, but he estimat- 
ed the festivities attracted about as 
many visitors as last year. This was 
despite competition from the climax of 
the Lewes 350th anniversary celebra- 
tion and the Nanticoke Indian Pow 
Wow as well as other events through- 

out the state the same day. 
Profits realized by the Historical 

Society and other local organizations 
have yet to be totaled. 
Keynote speaker for this year's 

Heritage Day was Grace Welch whose 
address evoked a number of memories. 
For the benefit of those who have have 
missed it, a copy of her speech “Do You 
Remember...."” follows this article. 
Look for Heritage pictures on page 7. 

Do You Remember? 

by Grace C. Welch 

I do not possess the eloquence of those 
with whom Ishare this program today. 
Therefore, I shall not endeavor to fill 
the bill as “speaker”--rather I shall 

[Continued on page 2) 

Harrington City Budget - Anyone Concerned? 
If any Harrington residents are 

concerned about how the city will 
spend the approximate $81,133 it 
expects to receive for the 1981-82 fiscal 
year, it was not evident at Monday 
night's council meeting. The first hour 
of the session had been designated as a 
public hearing on the use of the 
revenue sharing funds. But the only: 
citizen to show was a Mrs, West who 
came with questions about the city's 
trash collection. 
With the end of the fiscal year 

approaching, the City Council has yet 

to approve a new budget. At least one 
more workshop session is planned 
before the next regular Council meet- 
ing which will be on Monday, October 
12. That date has also been designated 
as a public hearing on the entire 
budget. 
One budget question aroused the 

wrath of a Council member as it was 
mentioned that the Harrington Public 
Library would be about $300 over its 
$4500 budget before the end of the 
fiscal year. The Council voted to 
authorize City Manager Norma Short 

WB Teachers Sign Contract 
BRIDGEVILLE-It was announced at 
Monday night's regular meeting of the 
Woodbridge School Board that the 
teachers in the Woodbridge School 
District had accepted a two year 
contract with the District, which 
meant salary increases ranging from 
12% to 47%, in some cases, for the 
teachers. The bargaining over contract 
covered a period of 6 months. Accord- 
ing to Mrs. Pat Piassik, President of 
Woodbridge Education Assoc. (WEA) 
the teachers are happy with the terms 
and we got what we bargained for.” 
The teachers got the money package of 
$202,000 overall, but each teacher will 
lose approximately $100 in order to 
hire one teacher back who was 
R.I.F.(ed) (Reduction In Force). 
The teachers met with the adminis- 

trators headed by David Winiski 
starting last school year meeting 
together during school hours. “I think 

this played a big part in coming to 

terms so easily,” said Mrs. Piassik. 

Other points in the contract were a 

$5,000 life insurance policy, extra duty 
pay, which refers to coaching duties, 

three agriculture teachers received 

compensation for certain duties, per- 

sonal days are unclarified and teacher 
evaluations are now the subject of 
complaint procedures, which comes 

under board policy as opposed t¢ being 
written into the contract. On the other 

hand, teachers did not receive course 
reimbursement, “but everyone is hap- 

py...and the second year of the 
contract will continue with another 
12% increase in salaries,” said Mrs. 
Piassik. 
The teachers were represented by 

chief negotiator Brian Bushwaller from 
Delaware State Education Association 
(DSEA), Walt Gilefski, Nora Waller, 
Pat Piassik, Kathy Boyd and Karen 
Hutchison. 

to spend the extra money, but not 
before some angry words from Ray 
Gagne who felt the library was being 
singled ou for undue attention. Gagne 
pointed out the fact that the police 
department and city office are also 
over budget, by several thousand 
dollars and wondered why the Council 
should pick on the library. 
The explanation that the library's 

$4500 had been made as a special 
limited appropriation did not satisfy 
him, and he cast the lone dissenting 
vote on the motion. 

-Lease Question- 
The Harrington City Council came 

prepared Monday night to sign another 
routine two-year lease with the fire 
company for use of the building which 
serves as City Hall. But a small 
surprize was in store for them. The 
two-year contract was dated to run 

from September until December 31, 
1981, and it turned out that the words 
“two-year” and not the date were in 
error. When fire company secretary, 
Ray Blanchette, who turned up for the 
signing procedure, said he was sure the 
company intended to have the lease 
termination date December 31 of this 
year, the Council felt it might be 
getting a subtle message. 
Blanchette said he was sure the fire 

company would give the Council ade- 
quate notice if it ever asked the city to 
move its headquarters. 
But Council members decided it would 

be better to sit down with representa- 
tives of the fire company before signing 
anything. If the fire company plans any 
future expansion at its present location 

[Continued on page 3] 

Woodbridge Basics School Dedicated 
After more than a year of controversy 

and hard work, the Woodbridge School 

District last Friday dedicated its new 
“Basics School” as Principal Nancy 

- Cullen and new P.T.A. President 
Joyce Wilkinson presided over ribbon 
cutting ceremonies attended by the 
school’s entire K-6 enrollment of 321 
pupils as well as a host of parents and 
school officials. 
In a brief address, Mrs. Cullen said 

the Woodbridge Basics School is based 
on a number of beliefs in children, their 

FARR ORR, 

But will it fly?- Students at Woodbridge Basics School learn there is truth in 

teachers and their parents. The school 
expects children to be good and to 
earn. It stresses a strict disciplined 
atmosphere and high academic expec- 
tations with promotions from grade to 
grade based on mastering minimum 
skills. 
Mrs. Cullin said both parents and 

students have rights as well as respon- 
sibilities. Parents have the right to 
know what is going on at the school and 
with their children. For this reason, 
the program also emphasizes regular 

  
Burns’ line “the best laid plans of mice and men...” as they attempt to launch 1,000 
balloons in a contest for the longest flight. 

communications between home and 
school. All homework must be signed, 
homework folders go home every 
Monday and there is to be a special 
report to parents at three-week inter- 
vals. This is in addition to the regular 
report card. 
But parents also are expected to 

assume a great deal of responsibility in 

the operation of the school, serving on 

committees to design policies and 

[Continued on page 3] 

  

  
Srey And still others showed delight as a tune on an old time instrument, the 
dulcimer strikes a responsive chord with a youngster. 

  
An Irquois family was on hand for the Round Dance Saturday at the Nanticoke 

Pow Wow at Millsboro. Photo by H.G.F. See story and more photos on page 8. 

Out of the depths of a long summer-A 
Harrington youth makes the most of a 
final day at the beach before the plunge 
into fall and school. Photo by Dave 
Greenly. 

    
Vineyard Years - Part |i 

On the everyday level, Paul Vineyard 
was a consistently successful driver. 
On October 7, 1946, at Lexington, 
Kentucky, he drove Fred Greenly's 
pacer, Direct Express who was unbeat- 
en both as a 3 and 4-year-old, to his 
record 1:59 Ya. The same day he took 
Morgan Hanover to a 2:00 record, 
putting both 3-year-old pacers on the 
two minute list. He trained “Mighty 
Tide” for the Confort brothers, Mike & 
John, after the horse was purchased by 
Black Shoe Stables for $16,600 when, 
the high bidder ($17,500) failed to 
show. Mighty Tide won 11 of 19 races 
in 1961 and took the American Classic 

(Purse - $50,000) in 1962. 

In addition to Direct Express and 
Mighty Tide, whose record was 1:57 
and 1/5, Vineyard piloted a list of 
2-minute pacers that included Bengazi. 
Hanover who left a record 1:57 3/5 and 
who won the $49,000 Roosevelt Futur- 
ity as a 2-year-old, and Hayes Hanover 
(1:59 3/5). The list of horses he trained 
and drove numbers over 1,000. 

Bengazi Hanover, one of his best 
horses in later years, was the largest 
winning horse and Season's Champion 
both as a two- and as a three-year old. 
At four, he was Free-For-All Pacer, 

  

The new playground at Woodbridge Basics School is already a hit with a future 
student. The school was dedicated in ceremonies Friday afternoon. 

- and as a five-year-old he was retired in 

August, 1965, to stand at stud at Lana 
Lobelle Farms in Hanover, Pa. 

Vineyard was not with Fred Greenly’s 
Direct Express when the horse drop- 
ped dead at Del Mar, Calif. But the 

death of the famous 4-year-old probab- 

ly counts as one of the tragic events of 

the racing years. Not all times were 
happy, and Mrs. Vineyard says it often 
seemed that the things “on which you 
set your heart” turned out the wrong 
way. Vineyard once trained a horse he 
thought a likely prospect for the 
Hambletonian, the great-granddaddy 
and the most prestigious of all harness 
races, but come Hambletonian Day, 
the horse had contracted “shipping 
fever” and stood listless in its stall. The 
owner wanted to enter the race 
anyway, but Vineyard, fearing the 
racer would drop dead, scratched it. 
The horse recovered and went on to a 
fine racing career, but never in the 
Hambletonian. Vineyard himself raced 
in the Hambletonian and finished in the 
money. But he never won the race. 

Whether times were good or bad, 

Elsie Vineyard was expected to be at 

the race with her husband. Once she 

remembers rebelling at the thought of 
another cold night in the grandstand. 

To her insistance that she wanted to 

stay home, Vineyard's repeated reply 

Continued on page 11 

Kent Co. P&R Offers 

Fall Programs 
Kent County Levy Court through its 

Parks & Recreation Department is 
sponsoring several programs for all 
ages in the Lake Forest School Dis- 
trict. Choose from Soccer, Baton & 
Cheerleading, Flag Football, Beginner 
Tennis, Guitar Lessons, Calligraphy I 

or Aerobic Dance. 
The Soccer, Baton & Cheerleading 

and Flag Football programs will be 
held at Lake Forest North Elementary 
on Saturday mornings beginning Sep- 
tember 19 for 8 weeks. 

Soccer for Grades 1-3 and 4-6 is 
scheduled from 11:00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m. 

[Continued page 3] 
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Hit & Run 
Driver Sought 
Delaware State Police at Troop 3 and 

an area family are looking for a hit and 
run driver following an incident on 
County Road 277 last Wednesday. 
Victim of the accident, sixteen year 

old Theresa Strachar, was frightened 
but not injured. However, the car she 
was driving home after an evening of 
babysitting for the Jimmy Rouse 
family, was damaged. 

~ Miss Strachar was traveling south on 
Route 277 near Masten’s Corner when 
a pickup truck going in the opposite 
direction crossed the center line, 
sideswiping her car. The front left of 
Miss Stracher’s car fender was damag- 
ed and the pickup caught the edge of 
the door on the driver's side, bending it 
back for several inches. 
The offending driving never stopped. 

Miss Stracher gave chase but was 
unable to catch up. However, Mr. 
Rouse met the same driver a few 
moments later and was able to give the 
following description. 
The hit and run vehicle was a 1966-69 

white or white and green Ford pickup 
with left front damage and bearing a 
Delaware license plate. 
The driver was estimated to be about 

40 years old and described as unshaven 
wearing a cap and obviously inebriat- 
ed. 
Anyone knowing the whereabouts of 

the truck is asked to call Delaware 
State Police, Troop 3 at 736-4863 or to 
call the Stracher residence at 284-4259 
after 5:00. A reward is being offered 
for information leading to the arrest 
and conviction of the person responsi- 
ble. 

Two of Three 

Sentenced 
to 37 Years 

Two of three sentenced in bank hold up 

Two of three men who robbed the 
First National Bank's Canterbury 
branch last December were sentenced 
Friday to 87 years in prison by 
Superior Court Judge George R. 
Wright. 
The two were Charles Dale Craig of 
Lebanon and Ronald W. Johnson of 
near Camden. 
The third man involved in the armed 

robbery is still missing as is most of the 
$14,000 taken. 
The three entered the bank’s Canter- 

bury office a little after 3 p.m. on 
December 3, 1980 and shortly there- 

after sped off with the money in an 
orange Dodge Colt that was found near 
Petersburg later. The car turned out to 
have been stolen from an employee at a 
Dover tavern. 
The first arrest in the case came in 

January 1981 when Craig, arrested on 
an unrelated criminal mischief charge 
tried to use six of the stolen $20 bills to 
post bond. 
A second arrest came in April when 

Johnson was picked up near Goldsboro. 
The two will serve consecutive sen- 

tences of 25 years for first-degree 
robbery, five years for auto theft, five 
years for carrying a deadly weapon 

[Continued on page 31 
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To my granddaughters, Elizabeth, 
Sarah, Mary, and Susannah Barker, 
daughters of Mary Barker, the sum of 
20 pounds when they each arrive to the 
age of 18 years. I give to John Offley 20 
pounds. I give to my daughter Mary 
Barker two Bonds on Francis Barber 
for the sum of 300 pounds each to be 
delivered to her by my executor. I give 
to my daughter Elizabeth Denny, a 
bond on Francis Barber for 300 pounds. 
I give to my daughter Sarah Collins, a 
bond on Francis Barber for 200 pounds. 
I give to George Cummins 20 pounds. 
‘The will of Thomas Collins was 

by probated 4 April 1789. On 26 August 
af 1790 the surviving heirs appeared in 
by: Orphans Court and “Joseph Barker and 

William Denny who intermarried with 
heirs of Thomas Collins, Esq. deceas- 
ed...petitioned the court to value lands 
of Sarah Cummins deceased agreeable 
to law unto William Collins son of 
Thomas Collins deceased according to 

~ his will.” 

~ Edward H. Richardson Associates, 
Inc., Delaware's largest engineering 
and architectural firm, today announe- 

Delaware Diamonds 
by Joyce Jefferson 

Little Gems 
In this column, we want to give 

you an opportunity to display your 

' gems of local history, The Dela- 

ware Diamonds. Reader com- 
ments, additions and corrections 
for material used will be helpful. 
Queries concerning sources for 
historical and genealogical re- 
search will be published and 
answered as you request. 

30 December 1682 Saccarackett lord 2; 
and owner of all the land between 
Cedar Creeke and St. Jones Creeke 
sold to Benony Bishop of St. Jones 
County...all that parcel of land called 
Bishop's Choice on the west side of 
Delaware Bay and on the South east 
side of a small branch called Bishop's 
Branch running out of St. Jones Creeke 
containing 1050 acres, for which he had 
already received ample satisfaction. 

Richardson Joins Tetra Tech. 
employs a staff of approximately 1,000 3 
persons. 
In making this announcement, Rich- 

THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL, HARRINGTON, DELAWARE WEDNESDAY. SEPTEMBER 16, 1981 

-Portsville Lighthouse- 
Days of Our Years 

-Thirty Years Ago- 
September 14, 1951 - 

The teacher shortage is becoming 
more acute each year, over the nation 

as a whole, but particularly in Dela- 
ware where teacher's salaries are not 
high as they are in other states of 
comparable wealth. 
reed That was the theme of Archie 

«+ Feagan's talk before the Harrington 
Rotary Club Tuesday evening. “Here is 
an illustration,” said Mr. Feagan: A 
teacher of scant experience and train- 
ing is engaged at a salary of $2400 per 
year. Before the beginning of the year 
the teacher is offered a larger salary in 
some other field of endeavor and 
resigns. We scurry about trying to find 
another teacher of comparable training 
and experience, but you find none. We 
may find teachers of more training and 
experience who will not teach for 
$2400, but we can't pay them a cent 

. more than that amount because our 

; *" budget allows only that amount. 
Symbol Chance paced the Kent & 

Sussex Raceway Track Tuesday hight 
in 2:05.4 to lower his own record and 

~~ establish the best time of the meet to 

. date....the sidewheeler has certainly 
: found the local track to her liking as 
, she has won all three of her starts. 

(From Frederica) John E. McBride 
was accompanied by Dick Gordon, of 
town, and George Maris of Dover, 

  

ed that they have joined Tetra Tech, 
Inc., a California based ocean engineer- 
ing and products firm. 
Richardson Associates employs a staff 

of 120 persons and has maintained a 
continuous ranking in the nation’s top 

ard Associates’ President, Arkan Say, 
said “Richardson Associates and Tetra 
Tech have had a working relationship 
since 1977. By this new association, the 
activities of Richardson will be stren- 
gthened and expanded, both financially 

when they motored to Philadelphia 
Saturday to see the baseball game 
between Boston and the Athletics. 
In August 1936, a school bus route 

contract wa awarded to the husband of 
500 design firms for the past nine as well as technically. 
‘years. Tetra Tech, Inc. is currently 

ranked number 39 in the top 500 and 

~ 
state of Delaware. 
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ns HARRY LOUIE 

LAUNDRY & DRY CLEANING 

FAR EAST 
PROFESSIONALS 

Take advantage of our 10% discount to 
all college students with I.D. cards. 

Specializing In: 

Laundry Dry Cleaning 

Leather - Suede Cleaning 

Hat Cleaning / Blocking 
Tailoring 

In by 10, out by 4 

(Mon. - Fri.) 

‘HARRY LOUIE 
LAUNDRY & DRY CLEANING 

129 South Governors Ave. 

Dover Delaware 

734-8195 
Mon. - Thurs. 7 am - 6:30 pm, Fri. 7 am - 7:30 pm 

    

  

   

Richardson was founded in 1949 in the ; ThE a 

gw The Portsville Lighthouse near Bethel, Del. built by a judge from New York in the early 1900's. The “Lighthouse styled 
home” overlooks Broad Creek. The home will be donated to the state. Sketch by Gretchen Banks. ; 

[Continued from page 1] : 

hope to inspire you to become speak- 
ers. I'm going to talk to you today 
about memories. Someone has said 
that memories are like pictures hung in 
a gallery neatly labeled so we can recall 
the pleasant ones at will. 
Many of you today have memories or 

a knowledge of some facet of Harring- 
ton’s history which only you can know 
or tell. You may think you haven't lived 
long enough to make hstory. Do you 
know that what we do here today will 
be history tomorrow? We can never 
undo it or change it. Our grandchildren 
will remember today as part of the 

recorded in some way it will surely 
have parts of it lost forever except in 
someone's memory. 
Let me give you some examples. How 

many of you remember the charcoal 
industry here? Mr. Jehu Camper was a 
boy of 6 years old when he used to lie in 
bed at night and gaze in a northeast 

i [= old days”. But unless it is all     Sat. 7 am - 6 pm direction towards his father’s farm     
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At your Bank Of A Lifetime, you can buy a Certificate 
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Do You Remeber? 
where the coal kilns were burning. He 
told me all he could recall, then he 
found a man in Milford, DE who 
worked in these kilns in Sussex 
County. We went to see him and he 
told us all about the construction of the 
kilns and even allowed us to reproduce 
a picture of the process. 
This was a money crop in the early 

1900's, just like corn and soybeans are 
today. Forests were plentiful, especi- 
ally pines. When the charcoal was 
finished, it was hauled to the train 
depot on ox carts and then shoveled 
into boxcars. Shipped to the city, it 
was used for many things. The most 
popular use was for jewelry work as it 
burned with a white hot flame and n 
residue or smoke. 3 
How many of you remember the 

sorghum mills? Many farmers grew 
sorghum, but only a few processed it. 
It was squeezed through a press and 
the resulting juice cooked until a sweet 

Doll House to be 
Displayed 
A doll house replica of Woodburn, the 

Governor’s House, will be on display at 
the Medieval Fair in Dover at the 
Governor's Mansion on Saturday, Sep- 
tember 26th from 10 a.m. to 3 p.m. 
The miniature mansion was commis- 

sioned by the Delaware Association of 
Lawyer's Wives and was built by 
William Byerly. The house is 30 inches 
deep, 41 inches tall, and 36 inches 
wide. The windows, doors and stair- 
way inside are of hand-carved pine. 
The brick-like exterior was created by 
hand-carving mahogany, then painting 
it. Hinges on the front, back and roof 
allow access to the inside. : 
The Association plans to sell $1 

chances on the house, the proceeds of 
which will be used for a scholarship 
loan program for law students from 
Delaware. 

2 
Da 

HEALTH TIP 
CONTRA-INDICATION 

Contra-indication is a fancy 

term that means, when you 
have a chronic condition of 
some kind, there are certain 
drugs you shouldn't use. If 
you have an ulcer, aspirin is 
contra-indicated. Any drug 
containing sodium is contra- 
indicated for a person with 
hypertension. Products con- 
taining sugar are contra- 
indicated for a diabetic. Aller- 
gy sufferers may be sensitive 
to a number of drugs which 
are therefore contra-indicated 
for them. Consult our pharm- 
acist about drugs. 

Carl June 

Harrington 
Pharmacy 

Hospital Supplies 

and Equipment   

  
tasting syrup remained. Too little 
cooking made it bitter, and over-cook- 
ing made a burned taste. Just as in the 
flour mills, the miller worked on the 
toll system, maybe 3 gallons for the 
customer and one for the miller. This 
was used by many for sweetening 
coffee or on pancakes. Mr. Russell 
Ranum at 5 Points makes this. 
In the early 1900's almost every farm 

had its own brick kiln, peach and apple 
orchard, raised their own vegetables, 
meat, and doctored their own animals 
and family. If a doctor or hospital was 
needed, it was a rare occasion. Hospit- 

als were located in Philadelphia and 
Baltimore and often meant that both 
patient and local doctor went by train 
to them.) 

[Continued next week - Courtesy of 
Grace Welch, “Do You remember” will 
appear in two additional segments. ] 

  
Roger Moore works to finish brick a 

memorial honor roll before Heritage 
Day. 

Roundtrip jet air tra 
limentary meals an 

a Frederica woman, now a widow. She 
has successfully carried on under its 
terms during the intervening years..... 
Six months after procuring the con- 
tract, Feb. 20, 1937, (Ira) Langrell 
died, and his widow Mrs. Lennora 
Lengrell assumed the responsibility. 

-Twenty Years Ago- 
September 15, 1961 

Henry J. Clukey, 74, husband of 
Bessie Galentine Clukey, died in Mont- 
icello Hospital, Monticello, N.Y. Tues- 
day after a lingering illness. Mr. 
Clukey was a famous harness horse 
driver. He was the owner of the Cluke® 
Stables where he trained and racjd 
harness horses. 

The Fall and Winter Fashion Show 
presented by Emanual’s of Dover and 
St. Stephen's Episcopal Church in 
Harrington included the following local 
models: Linda Humes, Kenna Jo 
McKnatt, Claudia Neeman, Sylvia J. 
Outten, Carol Ann Moore, Sue Perry, 
and Janie Phillips. 
There are no mosquitoes in Southern 

California, at least in the portion in 
which John S. Harrington, earstwhile 
local resident resides. 

-Ten Years'Ago- ' 
September 16, 1971 

The residence of Mr. and Mes. Frank 
Quillen on Simmons Street was dam- 
aged by a fire in which a fireman was 
injured Tuesday morning. The fire was 
discovered by a passerby, Mrs. Buck 
Thompson, who warned Quillen when 
she saw smoke pouring from a ventila- 
tor at the east end of the house...The 
injured fireman was Robert Taylor 
who was straddling a ridge pole on the 
roof where it gave way. 
When a state trooper stopped a man 

on Delaware 14 in Harrington Satur- 
day afternoon for suspicion of driving 
under the influence of alcohol, the man 
(John Henry May of Goldsboro) resist- 
ed, became abusive and bit the trooper 
(Clifford G. Lee of Laurel). 

Robbbers 
[Continued from page 1] 

during the commission of a felony and 
two years for conspiracy. 
Craig, who has had a prior robbery 

conviction, will serve the first ten 
years without parole. 
The pair maintained their innocence 

even as they were being sentenced. 

CALL FOR DETAILS     A TRIP PLANNED BY GULLIVER'S IS ALWAYS SOMETHING TO WRITE HOME ABOUT 

 GULLIVER’S TRAVEL 678-3747 

TELEPHONE 
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P&R Programs 
[Continued from page 1] 

Players will be divided into teams for 
skill instruction and games. The fee is 
$8.00 and includes a team shirt. 
The Baton & Cheerleading program 

for Grades 1-3 will be held from 10:00 
to 10:55 a.m., while 4 thru 6 graders 
will meet 9:00 to 9:55 a.m. Participants 
will learn different cheers plus skills of 
cheerleading and baton twirling. The 
girls must provide their own batons. 
However, the $9.00 fee includes pom- 
poms. 
Flag Football will be offered for 

Grades 4-6 from 9:00 to 11:00 a.m. 
Once players acquire the necessary 
skills, they will be divided into teams 
and given a schedule of their games. 
The fee of $8.00 includes a team shirt. 
Beginner tennis for grades 5-8 will be 

offered at Lake Forest High School on 
Saturdays from 9:00 to 10:00 a.m. 
beginning September 26 for 8 weeks. 
Participants must supply a racquet and 
a registration fee of $8.00. 
Guitar lessons will be offered for 

- Grades 6, 7 and 8 at the Drum Pad on 
Rt. 13 near Felton. The 6 week course 

is scheduled on Mondays from 7:30 to’ 
8:30 p.m. beginning September 21. The 
fee is $8.00 (instruction books - $6.50). 
Bring or rent your guitar and learn the 
basics of this string instrument. 
Adults interested in learning Calli- 

graphy, the art of decorate handwrit- 
ing, can register for Calligraphy I to be 
held in the Art Room of Lake Forest 
North Elementary. The 8 week course 

~ will meet on Wednesdays from 7:00 to 
9:00 p.m. beginning Sept. 23. Students 

; will learn the Roman and Italic alpha- 
bets. The fee is $15.00 (plus supplies). 
For those interested in staying in 

shape, the County offers the most 
inexpensive Aerobic Exercise Program 
in the area. Aerobic Dance involves a 
series of dance-like exercises set to 
music and planned for group involve- 
ment. A pair of running or tennis shoes 
is required. Aerobic Dance I will be 
held at W. T. Chipman on Tuesdays 
and Thursdays from 6:30 to 7:30 p.m. 
A faster paced program for those who 
have taken Aerobic I is scheduled for 
the following hour from 7:30 to 8:30. 
Classes begin September 22, meet 
twice a week for 10 weeks and cost only 
$20.00. : 
Kent County Parks & Recreation is 

now taking registration, just dial 
736-2090 to reserve a place in the 
Tennis, Guitar, Calligraphy or Aerobic 
Dance Class. :Soccer, ‘Baton & Cheer- 
leading and Flag Football are mail-in 
registrations. 

Kent County Parks & Recreation, 414 
Federal Street, Dover, Del., 19901. 
  

(Coming Events 
  

The Harrington Little League Organ- 
ization will hold its 1981 covered dish 
awards banquet this Saturday, Sep- 
tember 19, at the W.T. Chipman 
School Cafeteria beginning at 6:30 
P.M. Following the dinner, trophies 
will be awarded to the season’s winning 
teams. 

Twenty of the best clog dancers in the 
world will perform at “Sunfest” in 
Ocean City, Maryland, on Saturday 
and Sunday, September 19 and 20. 

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 16, 1981 

Area Happenings 
All dancers hold some kind of a 1981 
National (U.S.A.) title, and severa 
hold World titles. : 

Delaware State College Center for 
Continuing - Education will offer the 
non-credit course, Writing to Sell, on 
Wednesday evenings, 7:00 to 10:00 
p.m., from September 23 thru Novem- 
ber 25. 
Award-winning author, Priscilla H. 

Price, will instruct students in prepar- 
ing publishable manuscripts and mar- 
keting their own work. Students will 
receive individual attention and crit- 
iques. Topics for discussion include 
recognizing good story ideas, submit- 
ting a manuscript, and knowing the 
markets. 
Writing to Sell will be held at the 

Center for Continuing Education. Fee 
is $50.00. For more information on 
pre-registration, call the Center at 
736-5164. 

“DANCE” - American Legion C.K.- 
R.T. Post #7, Harrington, De., Satur- 
day, September 19, 1981, 9:00 p.m. - 
1:00 a.m. Music by: “Wild Country”. 
$5.00 per couple; $3.00 single. 

On Saturday, Sept. 19, 1981, the 
regular monthly meeting of the Gener- 
al Service Committee of the Odd 
Fellows and Rebekahs of Delaware will 
be held in the rooms of Morning Star 
Lodge No. 6,Independent Order of Odd 
Fellows, Smyrna, 

Basics School 
[Continued from page 1] 

procedures and a volunteer to help in 
regular activities. 
A number of Woodbridge parents 

joined teachers over the summer in 
both planning sessions as committees 
gave shape to the new school program 
and physical labor as the building and 
grounds were given a new look. Rooms 
in the building which formerly housed 
the North Bridgeville Elementary 
school have been given a facelift in 
bright colors of paint and in the 
hallways, hanging plants are suspend- 
ed from skylights. 
On the outside parents labored to 

refurbish the playground adding a 
variety of new homemade equipment 
including hobby horses, balance 
beams, a maypole, tire tree, climbing 
tower and tables. 
The value of the over 463 hours of 

labor they have put plus materials 
donated by individuals and businesses 
amounts to over $6,077 thus far. It is 
hoped that this total can be matched 
with an equal amount of federal dollars 
to further improve the playground. 
Those cited at Friday's dedication 

ceremony included 21 donars for the 
playground, ten for the building and 
some 40 volunteer workers. 
The opening of the school has meant a 

reorganization of the entire district. 
All Woodbridge elementary children 
who are not enrolled in the Basics 

School now attend Bridgeville Elemen- 
tary, the building which last year 
housed the junior high school and the 
Greenwood elementary school. Junior 
high students are located in the same 
building as the high school. Last year 
elementary students occupied those 
classrooms. : 
The reorganization has required ex- 

tensive busing arrangements which 
remained the one apparent hitch in the 
program as students adjust to the 
shuttle system. 
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Their good deed for Heritage Day was offering a cool drink as contestants in the 
10K run paced out the long 6.2 miles. They are Junior girl scouts in Troop 686 of 

   

  

Harrington. 

Harrington City Council 
[Continued from page 1 ] 

the city hall site is the only place left to 
go. 

'-A Reminder to Conrail- 
Council member, Ray Gagne, asked 

the city to send a letter to Conrail 
trainmaster, Joe Morris, questioning 
what he described as a substantial 
increase in the number of engines left 
idling for long periods in the center of 
town. Gagne said there are times when 
as many as five engines left idling for a 
long as an hour to an hour and a half at 
night. The fumes and the noise are 
annoying. Phone calls to Gary Harring- 
ton, the Council's liaison with the 
railroad, brought results. But the 
problem recurs. Gagne said “I don't 
want to get hard nosed with the 
railroad. We live together in the 
town--(but) I want them to give me the 
same consideration as they expect from 
me. : 
The Council also discussed sending a 

letter to State Senator Nancy Cook 
and/or Representative Ronnie Darling 
requesting the state to appropriate 

funds to repair the railroad crossing on 

Clark Street. It was also suggested 

that the state be asked to reroute. 

heavy truck traffic through town until 

the repairs are made. 
-Planning & Zoning- 

The Council set aside a letter from Dr. 

Zosimo Buendia of Harrington pertain- 

ing to a possible zoning change because 

Dr. Buendia did not come to the 
meeting to clarify his intentions. 

But Council members agreed to sit 

down with Mark B. Carp of the 

Baltimore firm of Mark B. Carp & 

Company to discuss the latter's plans 

for the Dudley Willis Peck Avenue 

property on which Carp took an option 

last year. Rezoning of the land to 

accomodate an apartment complex for 

the elderly reverted to the previous 

industrial classification when the year 

was up in June and no work begun. 

Carp has apparently had problems 

getting the HUD funds for the project. 

Rezoning of the land plunged the 

Council in a year-long controversy 

before a referendum and the decision 

to rezone last June. 
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Flu Vaccine Available To Srs. 

Influenza vaccine for senior citizens 

: and persons with chronic diseases is 
now available from public health clin- 
ics. 
Flu shots are available free for eligible 

residents through Division of Public 
Health clinics in State Service Centers 
throughout Delaware. The vaccine is 
recommended for everyone over age 
60, as well as for persons under 60 who 
have: diabetes; chronic heart, lung or 
kidney diseases; chronic severe anem- 

Open Letter To 

To the Town of Harrington, 
I would like to take this time to give 

special thanks to the people who made 
the Harrington Heritage Day 10K Run 
a success. 
1. To the police department: I have 
never seen a better patrol of a race. 
The job you did controlling traffic, 
insuring safety, and leading the run- 
ners was excellent! Enough cannot be 
said for a job well done! 
2. To the ambulance crews: Another 
excellent job! The services you ren- 
dered were appreciated by all runners 
also. Thanks for the medical aid. 
3. To Girl Scout Jr. Troop 686: Thanks 
for supplying the much needed water 
at the watering stations. It’s nice to see 
young people getting involved and 
eagerly wanting to help in a public 
activity. 

4. To Harrington Merchants: Thanks 
for supporting the run by providing 
random prizes. It was a nice way to end 
the race festivities. 

“It is difficult not to be 
unjust to what one loves.” 

: Oscar Wilde 

   

      

  

The Peoples 
Bank Of Harrington 

14.907 % interest on Money Market Certificates 

16.30% interest on Small Saver Certificates 
Rates Available September 15th - 21st 

ia, or other conditions which weaken 
the immune system. 
This year’s influenza - vaccine will 

protect against three flu viruses expec- 
ted to be prevalent this year--A/Brazil- 
78, A/Bangkok/79 and B/Singapore/ 
19. fa : 
For information and appointments, 

call your nearest County Health Unit. 
Additional information is available 

from the toll-free Immunization Hot- 
line number, 1-800-282-8672. : 

Harrington 

5. To all race official volunteers: 
Another job well done. Thanks for 
keeping the race organized and for 
smoothing over some of the rough 
spots. 

With great appreciation, 
Brad Morris 

  

~ 

Back To School 
Special 

Dear Parents, 

Now for the first time you can 
enroll your child for music instruc- 

- tion on guitar, piano, bass guitar 
or drums at a great savings to you 
for the month of September. You 
can enroll your child for one 
month of instruction for half price 
instead of the normal $20 per 
month. 

You Pay Only $10 for 4 private 
lessons. Call now to reserve space 
Limited schedule 

Isaacs Music 
i 528 Peas St, Studio 736.1800            
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EXPRESS 
THE UNIQUE SELF SERVICE CHINESE RESTAURANT 

GRAND OPENING 

IN DOVER 

ch [E] 4k 4% 
   

Don't miss the chance! Like most people admit, Chinese foods is the greatest 
cuisine in the world. When you try Hang’s Express Chinese Foods, you will 
find out the truth. 

The officers of the newly formed Kent & Sussex Chapter of Medical Assistants 
are left to right: Mrs. Bunny Miller [Publicity Chairman], Terri Pena [President], 
Dr. Edward F. Quinn [Advisor], Rose Brooks [Corresponding Secretary], Dr. 
Douglas Miller [Advisor], and Denise Pitlick, [V.P.] Absent from the photo is Dee 
Hare, Program Chairman. Photo by H.G.F. 

  

  

   LUNCH ¢ DINNER » TAKE-OUT 

CHINESE RESTAURANT : 

In Front of Diner at N. Walnut and North U.S. 118, Milford 

  

PLEASANT ATMOSPHERE REASONABLE PRICES 
EXPRESS LUNCHEON EXOTIC DRINKS 
CANDLELIGHT DINNER COCKTAILS 

CALL AHEAD 

422-3 133 YOUR MEALS 422-3134 

CUISINE ( 

      

   

  

At The Peoples Bank of Harrington, you can earn the highest rate 
possible on a six-month money market certificate. This rate changes 
weekly. Also available are 30 month Small Saver Certificates. The 
rate on these certificates changes bi-weekly. To get your high yield 
certificates stop at The Peoples Bank of Harrington. Federal 
regulations prohibit compounding of interest on money market 

gl certificates. Substantial penalty required for early withdrawal. 

  

     
   

  

   
       

  

   The Friendly Bank 
The Peoples Bank 

Of Harrington     Member        
    

  

    
398-3256    Clark & Hanley Sts. 
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CHOPTANK Nursery 
Nursery located on Del. Rt. 14 

near Delaware-Maryland line.    
     Now Open For RETAIL Sales 

Carrying Azaleas, Pyracantha, 

  

    

      
      
   

Crape Myrtle, Hollies, Yews, Etc. 

  

          
  

      

FEATURING: 
CANTONESE & MANDARIN 

    

  

   
   

    

          
  

      

  

  

  

     
    

    
    

  

TASTY! FRESH ANDEASYDIET WILL BE READY IN 15 MINUTES h | Gb : 
A IT a 4 AT'OUR DRIVEN WINDOW Landscape Services Available 

| Mon. thru Thursday 4%... ot. oaal LL rns 11:00 A.M. to 9:30 P.M. OPEN 7 DAYS I 
| Friday & Saturday =... iio hie inna 11:00 A.M. to 10:30 P.M. | i 
| Sonias a en 12NOON t09:30 P.M. Mon. thru Thur. - 11:00 A.M. to 9:00 P.M. Hours: 9-6 Mon. thru Sat. Closeo Sy 4 

oo) Sit in, take out, or order by phone = v : : ER ; 5 

‘ o LOCATED AT: 162 DuPONT HWY. [U.S. 13N] DOVER, DE. | [eros] Fri. & Sat. - 11:00 AM. to 10 P.M. visa Phone 302 He 
| [302] 674-5486 ava) Sunday - Noon to 9:00 P.M. a rr RR TGA 

| _ Be a gr ; 

| ; ROOMS DAY OR WEEK : 
go FoR Saro0D OPEN 7 DAYS ALL YEAR Hi-Grade Fresh Donuts Daily The Dock Spot 

5 | . Homemade Ice Cream + 

| THE HEARVEREAK HOTEL Dairy ir Restaurant 
| Bowers Beach, Dela. Submarines and other Sandwiches li : Se ; d 

| Diam BREAKFAST FROM 5 AM. COCKTAILS & EXOTIC DRINKS Route ie 398.3310 Delicious Seatoo 
| H r 

¢ ® FRIDAY NIGHT ad Shri hon 4; HS Treat a friend to something different 9 N. Bowers Beach, DE 335-3500 in 

| HAPPY HOUR . Steam nimp 93 |RT113DOVER (JUST N. OF BLUE HEN MALL) da 

| Burtons Sport Shop, fe) IF IT SWIMS... 

1 6¥) Commerce St. Harrington, De. RA NE NAVE 

1. Sandwiches - All Kinds Subss ST TAO ot | 2. Homemade Soups & Chili + Suamedd Ue braks Tolle, 
3. Breakfast Specials - Daily : slmbnles Con 

A 4. Cold Platters - Daily Jossnawiat) oD orn 

ol “- Take Out Orders - Hand Dipped Ice Cream £2 DSEAFOC rouwo 11-4 
398-8969 10-7 Owned by Irvin vers & Donald Fry   
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2 BUYS! 
QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED 

QUALITY MEATS 

FRESH 100% PURE BEEF 
GROUND 
BEEF 

i >, SAD MANY TIMES DAILY 

      

  

   
   

FRESH USDA INSPECTED 
ECON 0° PAK 

FRYERS          

   
ANY SIZE PKG. 

PORK LOIN « $1. GQ | PORK LOIN COUNTRY 
RIB PORK CHOPS . . . . . .". STYLE RIBS . 
PORK LOIN 
LOIN PORK CHOPS. . . . . .". BEEF LIVER .        
BEEF ROUND ROUND STEAKS , FLETomew uw 37-33 1 ocraR MAYER MEAT OR BEEF WEINERS. . . . . . . Ld JL Ai 
BEEF ROUND BONELESS TOP ROUND STEAKS..." *2"® | 0scAR MAYER ALL MEAT on eee sotocna . . . "=". 99° rere : 

| BOTTOMROUND WITHEE 3 9 4g ane. $473 TASTER'S CHOICE 
BEEF ROUND BONELESS SWISS STEAKS... .. . 2% | OSCAR MAYER SMOKE LINKS. . "ere I DISHWASHER INSTANT 
BEEF ROUND BONELESS EYE OF ROUND ROAST . . . . ™ 2 | pneu seu rRvEr RAST. . — -...... = "1% }|  3iB.20zBox 80Z JAR 
BONELESS BEEF CUBED STEAKS "oes. 1 3019 your SANDWICH STEAKS. . . . ......... an $3.55 #1 39 $4.29 
BONELESS SIRLOIN TP ROAST, 5 "42% 1. “2.0% | gop gogo Me osvrom mares $1 Fal besoin 

        

   

  

PORK LOIN CHOPS. . . .. ™™ _ 

    

      
   
    

      

   

6 VARIETIES 

PILLSBURY PLUS 
CAKE MIX 

118.2% OL 39 

WITH COUPON ABOVE & $10.00 PURCHASE 

CLOROX 
BLEACH 

         

  

SUE BEE 1 LB. JAR SCOTT WHITE OR ASST SINGLE ROLL 

HOEY" "18 | ToLET TISSUE... an 
Y HILL FRUIT 1 LB. CAN ¢ SCOTT ECONOMY PKG. OF 300 $ 19 

COCKTAIL: 7. oe. BO“ I napkins... 1 
118. 10Z CANS ; KIDD REG. 10 OZ PKG. 9 ¢ 

ARGOPEAS .. .. . .. F1 | marsumactows . . . 2/89¢ 
ARGO 1 LB. CAN 7 $ J VARIETIES 15 OZ CAN 5 

LIMA BEANS. . . . . /*1 | snappy nog Foon . . . 5/1 
4 HEFTY SUPER WEIGHT PKG. OF 15 

MACARONI & CHEESE . 2/69° | Tas Bacs    

  

CELESTE 

CHEESE PIZZA      
    

  

   
   

  

    

   
    
   

  

   

    

  

8 OZ. PKG. 5 VARIETIES 

LE SHAKE YOGURT. . . . 2/19" FOOD CLUB 

     

    

      

PILLSBURY 8 OZ. PKG. 
: by ¢ Li CRESCENT ROLLS. . . . . . g5° 3. 

KRAFT CASINO MILD 10 OZ. PKG. $ 79 GREEN oem | SWISS CHUNK CheEse .  *1° f GREE 
"14 | veLveer cess. . . . . $32 He 0 *79¢ 

     

  

N19 

    

   

    

. 9 09 SKINNED & DEVEINED SLICED i ¢ 

YOUNG & TENDER LB. | 
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mck 1OSCHOOH 
PRICES EFFECTIVE THRU SEPT. 19, 1381 

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 16, 1981 

SAVE 
LAGER Fle] 13 BY NJ] [cHeelll fe] bY 

  

NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR TYPOGRAPHICAL ERRORS 

CLOROX 
BLEACH 

1 GALLON BOTTLE 

by 
EXPIRES SEPT. 19, 1981 

     

  

USDA INSPECTED GRAIN FED 
WESTERN BEEF 

SIRLOIN 

STEAK 

    

  

LINKT ONE WITH COUPON 
& $10.00 PURCHASE 

EXCLUDING MILK & CIGARETTES 

XT 

RITE 

  

HI-C 
FRUIT 
DRINKS 

1QT. 1 PT. CAN 

5 VARIETIES 69¢ 

EXPIRES SEPT. 13, 1981 

LIMIT ONE WITH COUPON (00D | 
& $10.00 PURCHASE 

  

  Joes enum am, 

a COUPON 

PILLSBURY 
PLUS 

CAKE MIX 
11B. 2% OZ. PKG. 

- BO 
EXPIRES SEPT. 18, 1981 

LIMIT ONE WITH COUPON xr 
f $10.00 PURCHASE 

EXCLUDING MILK & CIGARETTES 

  
4 

BP) 14 02. BOX 5, 3A 
ov, NG 7 RN 

Gio aids 

3 
Ba: 

®   LIMIT ONE 
WITH COUPON ti 

courov NR 
GENERAL MILLS 

Nd CEREAL 

EXPIRES SEPT. 19, 1981 

[FOOD 

  

  

     
      

       

   
       

ummone EXO 
WITH COUPON     

    

  
      

          
    

   
   
   

    
       

   
    

   
    

     

   
   

   

  

LIMITONE 
WITH COUPON 

  

        
  

AVAILABLE AT STORES WITH DELICATESSENS 
ALL [TEMS DELI SLICED 

  

   

  

5 VARIETIES 

    

  

i | te ie 
DRINKS JUMBO BOLOGNA. . .. 1'% 

1 T.1 PT. CAN 

ARMOUR STAR 4 69 
WITH COUPON ABOVE & $10.00 PURCHASE 

     
JUMBO ROLL 100 FT. ROLL 

      

  

   

  

SARAN WRAP. . +1 .49 HB BOLOGNA OR OLIVE LOAF , . 

CHEEW POWDER 3 LB. 1 0Z- BOX 

DETERGENT. . .. . . $1.98 PRODUCE 
FANTASTIK 1 PT 6 OZ BOTTLE ¢ 

LIQUID CLEANER . . . . i 
PULSKURY READY TO 118 HEL Lg : 41. 9g [lf SNO WHITE 

SPREAD FROSTING . : CAULFLOWER 
DIETSOA. .. .. . .. P1 oH 
SUNSHINE BONUS PK. 14.4 OZ. PKG. i hn, 

CHIPAROD. ....... 

FRESH & TENDER 

| BROCCOLI 
SNOW CROP 2 VARIETIES 12 0Z CAN 

  

    

  

     
    

  

   
   

| EASTERN , 

DAN 1B20LPG oy PASCAL CELERY . . . : y s ly 20 HE; $1.09 NEW CROP SSB ) 
WARES oe. MACINTOSH APPLES . . °°. . . 99 

$429 BB coe nee i : 
BATTER FSH FULETS . 1 Wil ganawas ........" 2 
MRS PAULS 8 OZ. BREADED , i) 2g PRESIDENT sie - 

HADDOCK FILLETS. . 

QUILLEN a Fa CENTER 
Mon. Tues. & Wed. 8-6 Thurs. & Fri. 8 9 Saturday 8-8 Sundays 10 - 4 P.M. 

DELICATESSEN 
“TENDER, TASTY MEAT & CHEESE 

“IMPORTED STYLE” SUPERIOR $ 
$2.98 is. 

COOKED HAM. . . 

LONGHORN CHEESE™*+*.,* 1 ia 
SUPERIOR MIX OR MATCH 
COOKED SALAMI, P & P LOAF, GERMAN $ 1; . 14 

% 1B 

8 
PRY SU Hal (a Bue TRad Emil WReY LOG! ME Hl Kae: 

    

   
    

      

    

    

  

   
      CUSTOM CUT TO YOUR LIKING.”          
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  Senior Center By Dorothy Graham 398-3780 

  
Gabfest 

  
By Pat Hatfield 349-4255   

Frederica 
  

By Mary “Toby” Johnston 385-5487 } 

  

“Smile.” Monday was Labor Day of 
1981. The Center was closed and most 
everyone celebrated in their own 
particular way, some with cook-outs, 
cook-ins, visits, going to the beach or 
just relaxing at home. 
“It's a Small World After All.” The 

Jolly Timers gave a final rehearsal 
before Heritage Day, September 12, 
1981. Julia Astfalt’s solo, “Battle Hymn 
of The Aged”. Also at practice was Ina 
Hughes, Andy Anderson, Laurence 
Kates, Ella Golt, Pearl Hickman, Lili 
McBride, Essie Redden, Tony Perrone, 

Florence Minner, Mildred Vincent, 
Sylvia & Cecil Meredith, Bertha Dean, 

Marion Brown, Mamie Adams, Elsie 
Neal, Ola Tilden and Jo Burke. 
Elizabeth’ Anthony called B-1, ete., 

until all the cards were filled, people 
laughing and scores counted Tuesday 
afternoon. Treat was ice cream for all 
winners and losers alike. ) 
Chartered bus pulled away from the 

Center Wednesday morning bound for 
St. Michaels. The boat tour was 
enjoyed; the town strolls were inter- 
esting and food was um-um-delicious! 
Mamie, Anna Mae, Lili, Pearl, Cath- 

erine and Thelma are turning books for 
Mr. & Mrs. Santa. Yes, up to that 
again, While they do books, the plaited 
rug sits quietly in the ladies’ restroom. 

Velma, Florence, Hazel, and Jo 
worked on ceramics Thursday. Lillian, 

Mildred, Helen, Francis and Mary 
worked on those dolls, beautiful dolls. 
Bowling at Milford Lanes. David 

McCracken was high scorer Thursday 
afternoon. 
It was a very pleasant sight watching 

Miles Draper and Anna Mae Short pot 
flowers for sale. They were mostly 
already well-rooted; brought in by 
Gladys, Florence and Irene. 
Want to know about all the pets 

owned by the folks at the Center; know 
there must be many. I know of a few - 
there is Melissa, Troubles and of 
course, Simon. Melissa being my 
favorite cat in Harrington and she 
belongs to Clare Richardson. “Lissie” 
puts up with a lot, again she has it good 
too. Maybe Clare will write us about 
them. How about you and your favorite 
animal; either living or passed on to 
animal Heaven. 
Thank you volunteers so very much 

for all the work in the kitchen and 
otherwise. 
Hope you had a lovely Heritage Day 

and saw a friend you haven't seen in 
many a day. Take care and be kind to 

each other. 

Best Wishes to all who are ill and to all 
homebounds. A prayer for those in 
sorrow. Remember, you wonder what 
the younger generation is going to do. 
Well, they are going to wonder what 
the younger generation is going to do. 
Faith. 

  

Greenwood 
  By Pat Hatfield 349-4255 
  

Don't forget the Revival coming up 
for Greenwood United Methodist Char- 
ge. This will be held in the Greenwood 
Church Bldg. from September 20-24 
each evening at 7:30. 
The Greenwood Lions Club held their 

first dinner meeting on Wednesday 
evening, for the fall season. Plans are 
being made for a dinner to be given in 
November to celebrate their 25 years 
of Lionism in the Greenwood area. 
‘Wednesday dinner guests of Mr. & 
‘Mrs. Allison Davis were Mr. & Mrs. 

Graydon Hurst of Wilmington. Mr. & 
Mrs. Ernest Fry of Milford were 
visitors this week. 
Mrs. JoAnne Davis has returned 

home after a delightful visit with her 

sister and family, Mr. & Mrs. Wayne 
Pinkerton of Grand Junction, Colo- 
rado. 

Mr. & Mrs. Jacob Hatfield and Mr. & 
Mrs. Gary Bollinger of Bridgeville and 
family were Sunday dinner guests of 
Mr. & Mrs. Ronald Case in Newark. 
The Woodbridge Junior-Senior Par- 

ents/Teachers/Students Association 
will operate the Kiwanis Barbecue on 
Route 404 on September 19th and 20th. 
On Monday, September 21 at 7:30 

p.m. the Association will sponsor an 
Open House at the new Junior-Senior 
High School at Bridgeville. This will be 
a time for the parents to visit the 
teachers and the homerooms. 

  

Local Interest 
  By Joann Wyatt 398-3943     

Mr. and Mrs. Granville Hill and Mr. 

and Mrs. Woodrow Welch spent Sun- 
day with Mr. and Mrs. Daniel Hill at 
Boothwyn, Pa. 
Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Wyatt of Hur- 

lock, Md., Mr. and Mrs. Gary Wyatt 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Fred Wyatt, 
Jr. and family and Mr. Fred Wyatt, Sr. 
were Sunday afternoon dinner guests 
of Mr. Ricky Wyatt and family of New 
Castle. 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Peck visited 

with Mr. and Mrs. Chuck Peck and son, 
Charlie in Newark on Sunday to help 
their Grandson, Charlie celebrate his 
second birthday. Happy Birthday, 
Charlie! 
They also visited with Mrs. Ruth Peck 

at the Wilmington General Hospital. 
Get well wishes are extended to Mrs. 
Peck. Anyone wishing to send cards 
may send them to Room 4183 Bed 2, 
Wilmington General Hospital, Wilm- 
ington, Del. : 
Mr. and Mrs. John Phillips and family 

of Dover and Mr. and Mrs. Carroll 
Welch, Sr. were dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. David Welch and family on 
Sunday. 
The staff of the Harrington Journal 

would like to wish a Happy Birthday to 
Mr. Harry Farrow and Miss Eva 
Gruwell. They're both celebrating on 
September 15. 
Master Benny Sarro, Jr. is celebrat- 

ing his ninth birthday on September 
15. Happy Birthday Benny! 
Annette Harris was the weekend 

guest of Deanna Aptt and family. 
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Robertson and 

family of Princess Anne, Md. enjoyed 
Heritage Day with Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Aptt and family. 
Heritage day came in all it’s glory, 

complete with opening ceremonies, 
with Mrs. Grace Welch as Keynote 

Ll hh... 

speaker, on “Do you Remember” 
bringing to memory some of the old 
industries and places of interest in 
Harrington. Dr. Claudia Bushman was 
a very special guest for the day. A 
special thanks goes out to Walt 
Messick and his crew who provided the 
shuttle service, the stage for the band, 
and for opening the Museum and 
housing the crafts. The Colonial service 
as Asbury Methodist Church climaxed 
our Heritage Day weekend. So many 
things from face painting, a train ride, 
Bo Bo, crafts, a magic show, square 
dancing, the cloggers, belly dancing, 
antiques, a street dance, lots of good 
food, good fellowship and smiles. Three 
cheers for Harrington and all who live 
here for making it a success. We even = 
had vicitors from as far away as Puerto 
Rico! 

Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Welch, Jr. and 
Raymond and Bobbie Jo Poore spent 
Sunday near Millsboro at the Nanti- 
coke Indian Pow Wow. All had a nice 
day! 
Bryan Elliott was the Friday over- 

night guest of Freddie Wyatt. 
Happy Birthday wishes go out to Jim 

Parsons! 

While in New Castle on Sunday we 
called Michelle Gullo. Michelle was our 
guest when Lake Forest sponsored All 
State Band. She was playing in concert 
onSunday afternoon so we didn’t get to 
visit but we did get to talk to her. 
Thursday, September 17 is the time 

for Girl Scout registration, place is 
Asbury Methodist Church, time for 
Brownies, 7 to 7:30 p.m., for Jr's. 7:30 
to 8:00 p.m. 
Happy Birthday wishes go out to Miss 

Gina Marie Rende! 
Well wishes to all, Take Care, Share a 

Smile, God Bless! 
  

  
Anne's Kitchen 
  

While my family and myself are 
admittedly partial to Italian foods I 
wouldn't want you to get the impress- 
ion that we are adverse to other foods. 
You might say we enjoy well prepared 
and well presented foods of all kinds. 
The simple potato pancake recipe 
following is one of them. No matter 
how good a recipe idea is, if it is thrown 
together without any care to presenta- 

tion a lot will be lost. I think the potato 
pancake recipe which follows is worthy 
of your efforts: 

POTATO PANCAKES 
4 Medium potatoes peeled and raw 
1 small onion 
1 large egg 
2 tablespoons flour 
salt and pepper to taste 
Cooking oil or shortening for frying 
1. Grate peeled raw potatoes and onion 
into a large bowl. Drain off any liquid, 

pressing with a spoon to release all of 
it. 
2. Add the egg, flour, salt and pepper 
and mix well. 
3. Heat enough oil or shortening in a 
egy skillet to grease surface well. 
4. Drop tablespoons full of the mixture 
into the fat and fry till browned. Turn 
over with a spatula and brown on the 
other side. More fat or oil may be 
needed as you go along. 
5. Serve hot with apple sauce as an 

accompaniment to roast pork, pork 
chops or sausage. 

ENJOY! 

CLOCK WINNER 
Darlene Dobraski of Harrington was 

the winner of a clock raffled. off on 
Heritage Day by Nancy Emory, also of 
Harrington. All proceeds from the 
‘raffle are to go to Muscular Dystrophy. 

I've always got time to lay aside the 
bean hulling and the corn husking to 
read and enjoy someone's beautiful 
thoughts about the seasons. Shirley 
Harvey of Barre, Vermont, makes us a 

fine poem which she calls “September”; 
“I'd like to fill a treasure chest with 
September--I'd take: the warmth of 
late summer sun, the brightness of 
marigolds, the smell of drying maple 
leaves, the color of the hillsides, the 
taste of a McIntosh apple, the thrill of 
finding a red ear of corn, the fun of 
riding in a yellow school bus, the 

stiffness of the pumpkins waiting for 
Halloween and the security of another 
harvest. I'd seal the chest carefully-- 
and not peek, 'til the coldest day in 
January.” 
Well, at the present time, my little 

poem about September would go about 
like this: September sheds its bounty, 
All around my kitchen door; There are 
grapes and red tomatoes, Green lima 
beans galore. But this will soon be 
over, a ray of hope doth gleam. Then 
they bring the onions in to freeze, And 
they wonder why I scream!! 
The grass is such a lovely emerald 

green and will likely remain so for 
many weeks yet to come. Most of us 
love the long autumn season here in 
Delmarva, but, in our family, the ones 
who push the lawn mowers do not 
agree with me I look hopefully at the 

kitchen window screens and begin to 
persuade myself I can do without them 
now. I love the fresh air, but the 
screens dim my view of the outdoors. 
Now, I'm beginning to feel the urge to 

scurry around like the squirrels and 
pike stuff up for the winter. I am like 
my mother in this respect. She loved to 
“lay in” a goodly supply of food stuffs 
for the coming winter. It gives one a 
warm and cozy feeling of security. I 
must get over to the factory store and 
get some cases of things such as baby 
carrots and peas. We never can grow 
enough peas. 

Why'is it we never quite realize our 
dreams?All winter long we pore over 
the seed catalogs and plan and dream 
of perfect gardens and beautiful flow- 
ers. We never see the weeds until they 
confront us some spring day. We never 
think of the hard work either, or the 
hot sun or the spells of dry weather. 
Then when we are coping with what 

we planned all winter the summer 
brings us dreams of long winter 
evenings by the fireplace and a good 
book. Some of this does come to pass, 
but somehow these long winter days 
vanish like snow in a February thaw. 
Right now I'm planning on three things 
for winter...cooking, sewing, and read- 
ing “up a storm” as they say in the 
south. ! 

  

Houston 
  

By Margaret Thistlewood 422-4944 

  

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Sickler of 
Saugherties, New York spent last 
weekend with her mother Mrs. Alice 
Kintz and brother, Harris Kintz. 
Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Sharp spent last 

Tuesday sightseeing at Valley Forge, 
Pa. 
Mr. and Mrs. William Fisher and 

family spent from Saturday till Monday 
at Oak Orchard during the Labor Day 
holiday. 
On Saturday evening Sept. 12 at 6 

o'clock. Crystal Shockley and Duane 
Yerkes were married in the Houston 
Methodist Church by Rev. C. Jackson 
Robinson. Reception was held at the 
Houston Fire Hall. They are living in 
their new home near Harrington. 
Mr. and° Mrs. G.K. Murdock of 

Inverness, Scotland are visiting Mr. 
and Mrs. Calvin Hollis Sr. of near 
town. 
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Johnson and 

son Michael of Woodside and Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Talkee of Lincoln were 
Sunday dinner guests of their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Hayes. 
Mrs. Agnes Webb and Mrs. Margaret 

Thistlewood and their families attend- 
ed a family picnic on Sunday Sept. 6th 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Greenlee and family of near Milford. 
About 40 members attended and all 
enjoyed the good food and being 
together. 
Mrs. Ada Passwaters and Mrs. Agnas 

Webb spent Friday in Rehoboth with 
members of the Milford Senior Center. 
Mrs. Hazel Anglin of Kingsville 

Maryland spent several days last week 
with her sister Mrs. Margaret Thistle- 
wood and visited her mother Mrs. 
Anna Sharp of Harrington. 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Minner Sr. 

attended a cookout at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ted Layton on Sunday, with 
members of the Diamond State Twir- 
lers, SEaford Whirleys, Denton Free 
Twirlers and Dover Levi and Lace, all 
square dance clubs. Diamond State 
Twirlers will be holding their first 
nighter on Wednesday, Sept. 16th at 
the Milford Middle School. Come out 
and join the fun. 
OrmrSaturday afternoon, Mr. and Mrs. 

Elmer Wilson and Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Minner, Sr. attended the Perdue 
Grower Festival, held at the Sharp- 
town, Md. Carnival Ground. 
Sunday dinner guests of Mrs. Anna 

English were Mrs. Ann Prentice, Mrs. 
Edna Sap, Mrs. Pauline Morgan and 
Connie and Mr. and Mrs. Francis 
Simpson. 
Mr. and Mrs. James McMahon of 

Wilmington were Sunday dinner 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. William 
Gallagher. 

On Saturday, October 10th Houston 
will be holding their second Heritage 
Day program. More details later. 

  

Andrewsville By Mary Anna Lane 

  
  

Church school at Bethel United Meth- 
odist Church, Sunday, September 20th 
9:30 a.m. 
Worship service at Union United 

Methodist Church, Burrsville, Mary- 

land, Sunday, September 20th, 9:45 
a.m. Rev. Michael Price, minister. 
Church school following at 10:45 a.m. 
Homecoming service at Bethel United 

Methodist Church, September 27th at 
2:30 p.m. The guest speaker will be 
Rev. Joseph V. Holliday, Jr. former 
minister of the West Harrington 
Charge. 
Sympathy is extended to Mr. and 

Mrs. Willis Butler and family on the 
loss of Thelma'’s uncle recently. 
Sympathy is also extended to the 

family of Wallace Smith, who passed 
away last week. Mr. Smith was one of 
the school bus drivers in the area 
carrying elementary children to Wood- 
bridge Jr. High in Greenwood. He 
retired last June. 
The ball season is over and activities 

are over for the season for the 
Andrewville Ruritan Park. The Ruri- 
tan members would like to say 

Rudolph Valentino's full 

“Thanks” for the support in any way at 
the ball games, ice cream festival and 
also the donkey ball game. 
Mr. Russell Bowdle at this writing is a 

patient in Milford Memorial Hospital 
under observation. 

It is great to be able to report Harold 
Bradley underwent heart surgery on 
Thursday and is doing good. Anyone 
wishing to send him a card to brighten 
his day can send it to: MICU, 3rd floor, 
Veterans Hospital, 2100 Ridgecrest 
Drive, Albuquerque, New Mexico, 
87108, or at his home: 860 N. Third St., 
Apt. 5, Phoenix, Arizona, 85020. 
Celebrating an anniversary are Mr. 

and Mrs. Stephen Willey, Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Clendaniel and Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Griffith. Congratulations. 
Celebrating birthdays are - Alton 

Breeding, Dorothy Laughery, Laura 
Griffith, John Calvert, Ida Beauchamp, 
Shirley Calvert, Thelma Butler, Shane 
Larimore, Betty Yoder, Paula Butler, 
Stacy Carter, Ellen Shulties, Bruce 
Bradley, John (Jack) Bradley, Elver 
Ryan, Julie Larimore and Jane Ever- 
line. Best Wishes. 

name? Rudolph Alfonzo 
Raffaele Filibert Guglielmi de Valentina d’Antonguolla. 

  

  

MARION TRACY 
DANCE STUDIOS 

(Home of the Delaware Regional Ballet Co.) 

9S. Walnut Street 
Milford, Delaware 

  I ATTENTION 

“Special”   
- Classes Begin Monday, September 14th 

® Ballet ® Jazz © Tap 

- Mother's Jazz Class 

TO REGISTER PHONE 674-1020     —-—~Ae 

We would like to thank everyone for 
the letters, cards, calls and visits 
during Rod's stay in the hospital and 
also for the other kindness shown us. 
He and George Sipple shared a rom in 
M.M.H. for several days. What a pair - 
the doctors, nurses and other staff 
members though they were in Grand 
Central Station at times. 
Mr. & Mrs. Gerald Helmer of Mary- 

del, De. and Mr. & Mrs. Rawlins 
Scotten visited with Mrs. Scotten’s 
Uncle and Aunt, Mr. & Mrs. Ernest 
Knotts, at their home in Boothwyn, Pa. 

last week. 
Mrs. Anna May Sharp, Mr. & Mrs. 

Tony Marge were dinner guests of the 
R. R. Johnstons Wednesday evening. 
On Thursday Mrs. Jesse Sharp, Mrs. 

Grace Steen of Lincoln, the Marges and 
Mrs. Anna May Sharp visited with 
Jesse's daughter and family in Salisbu- 
ry, Md. Mrs. Joyce Dean and children, 
Keith, Kevin and Susan, served the 
family one of their favorite dishes - soft 
shell carbs. 
Fall activities have begun. Tuesday, 

Sept. 8th, the U.M.W. met at the 
church planning many things for the 
year 81-82. The ladies have been busy 
since last October preparing items for 
the Charity Bazaar at the Blue Hen 
Mall October 23 and 24. Bake goods 
‘and other homemade foods will also be 
needed. 
Homecoming at Frederica Trinity 

Church will be Sunday, November 1, at 
11 a.m. followed by a covered dish 
luncheon. 
November 14 will be the Annual Fall 

Church Supper. Clam fritters and 
turkey and all the fixins. 
The U.M. Women of Trinity will meet 

the second Tuesday of each month at 
the Church at 7:30 p.m. Please come 
and join with the Fellowship at Trinity 
Church. 
There will be a sale at the Thomas 

Spurry Home on David Street next to 
the bank Saturday, September 19th. 

The Church will be serving all day and 
need help for the sale of food. Bake 
goods will be needed; please call Rae 
Matlack: and offer your help and 
donations - 335-5479. 
Trinity M.Y.A.F. dinner meeting will 

be Wednesday evening, September 23 
at 7 p.m. Rae and Ben Matlack, Al and 
Grace Moore, Bob and Dottie Mullane 
and Martin and Marie Porter will 
host the dinner. 
Mrs. Mary Purnell with the John 

Paisley family of Magnolia spent Tues- 
day at Rehoboth and Ocean City. 
Ladies Auxiliary of the Frederica Fire 

Co. met Thursday evening for the first 
meeting and made plans for the 
Delaware State Firemans and Auxilia- 
ries Convention in Rehoboth Sepiem- 
ber 23, 24 and 25. 
Mrs. Frances Davidson, Mrs. Mary 

Purnell, Mrs, Pearl Schmick, Mrs. 
Virginia Schmick, Mrs. Louise Betts, 
Mrs. Bertha Macklin and I will be 
attending. 
The Frederica Adult Center attended 
the Cheer Sr. Program Friday the 11th 
at Rehoboth Beach. They sponsored a 
Crafts Booth in Convention Hall. 
On Thursday, September 24, the 

Adult Bus will be leaving the Center at 
10:30 for the Sr. Cheer Picnic at Trap 
Pond. Friday, September 25, - Mys- 
tery trip. Tuesday, September 29 - 
brithday luncheon at noon; bring a 
covered dish and enjoy. / 
Mrs. Christine Potter has been a 

patient in the Milford Memorial Hospi- 
tal. Mr. Harvey Jester is now in 
Milford Manor. Mr. Howard (Duck) 
Jester and Mrs. Sarah Gourley are in 
Milford Memorial. | 
To all that are ill wherever they might 

- be, our prayers and best wishes, May 
God Bless. 
Mr. & Mrs. Tony Marge left early 

Friday morning for home. We really 
enjoyed their visit. 
Now that club activities have begun, 

please give me a call. Thank you. 
  

| Felton-Sandtown By Lola O'Day sith 
  

The Knit Wit Craft Club will hold 
their meeting this Thursday eve at 
Marie Wheelers. 
Mrs. Ernest Fletcher has returned 
home from a trip to Washington, D.C. 

BIRTHDAYS 
Mark Edward Spence, Jerry Sapp, 

Michael S. Beebe, Donald Darling, Jr., 
Ida H. Roland, E. Reed Hughes, 
Natalie I. Breeding, Marion Haines, 
Tina Greenly, Terry Lynn Hill, Paula 
Jackson, Kenny Prahl, Mark Moore, 
Pam Tatman, FRank Thompson, Way- 
ne Wheeler, Doris Green, Shirley 
Moore, Julia Thorpe, Roland Cohee, 
Robert W. Thompson, Wayne Martin, 
Sr., Betty Lou Staton, Olive H. 
Walters, Virginia Lee Casper, Joan 
Peterson, Larry Rifenberg, Bonnie L. 
Chambers, Frannie Gott, Granville 
Williamson, Kathy Hampton and Lil- 
lian Moore. 

ANNIVERSARIES 
Mr. and Mrs. Benny Moore, Mr. and 

Mrs. Arthur Hurd, Jr., Mr. and Mrs. 

Robert Gott. 
Mr. Tom Cubbage of Viola, De., has 

been admitted to the Milford Memorial 
Hospital. 
Mr. and Mrs. Danidl C. Haines Sr. " 

Viola, De. held a beautiful garden 
wedding for their daughter Kathy and 
Larry Haughten of Felton, Del., with 
Edi Hemphill, performing the cere- 
mony. It was a very large wedding 
with guests from out of state, Mary- 
land, Pennsylvania and New Jersey. 
“Congratulations,” Mr. and Mrs. Hau- 
ghten. 
“Drive with Care” in Felton area, 

Construction ahead. 
Felton’s United Methodist Charge 

Laurence M. Berry eile a ve Pastor 
Viola. sri sneins in din 9:00 a.m. 
Manship. ...uc.ciit vane 10:00 a.m. 
Felton ......... Noy ola vw ate 11:00 a.m. 

Pianist, Viola ...........Lois Walters 
Pianist, Manship ........ Jeanette Dill 
Organist, Felton. ....... Vonna Hobbs 

Del Motor Club Offers AAA Program 
Consumer complaints about car re- 

pairs are frequent. Many of the 
complaints stem from shoddy work- 
manship, mechanies’ incompetence and 
unnecessary repairs. 
To help alleviate this problem locally, 

Club Executive Vice President William 
P. Markland has announced that the 
Delaware Motor Club is now participa- 
ting in AAA’s Approved Auto Repair 
Services (AARS) program. This pro- 
gram, successfully instituted in other 
parts of the country, is designed to 
help members identify competent auto 
repair service facilities. 

In a joint agreement with the Auto- . 
mobile Club of Maryland, the Delaware 
Motor Club is now able to offer its 
45,000 members this valuable service. 
Although six service facilities are 
currently approved in Delaware, it is 

he 

expected that 60 facilities will be 
AARS-certified in both states by 1982, 
To receive the benefits of the AARS 

program, a motorist merely presents 
an AAA membership card to the 
service writer when taking his or her 
car to an aproved repair facility. 

Letter To The Editor- 

Dear sir, 
Thank you very much for the memory 

of Paul Vineyard's Racing Years. The 
article is well written and accurate. 
Many neighbors and friends express- 

ed their pleasure of being reminded of 
many fond memories. 
We appreciate your production of an 

interesting and necessary local news- 
paper. 

Very Truly yours, 
Mrs. Paul Vineyard 

Milford Plaza Shopping Center 

Your Complete Yarn and Needlecroft Shop 

Open Monday thru Saturday 
10:00am - 9:00pm 

_ Mastercharge 
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e Early Bird Games - $50 

Every Sunday Night 

Mechanic Street 398-8031 
s Cash Prizes $15-$50 

% 
ngton Fire House 

Free Admission $ 
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Your Area Church News 

  

ASBURY UNITED 
® METHODIST CHURCH MENNONITE CHURCH CHURCH 

; Rev. Jackson Robinson 2 miles east of Greenwood, Rt. 16, Ellendale, De. 
10 a.m. Sunday School, 11 sm) Greenwood, De. Rev.E.L. Coleman, D.D. 

‘8 Morning Worship, 6 p.m. Junior ‘and Bishop-John Mishler Sunday school 9:15 a.m., Divine, 
Senior U.M.Y.F. Pastor-Mark Swartzentruber worship 10:30 a.m. 

% Assistant - Jay Briggs CALVARY WESLEYAN Decor Alco Beets paomMAIN 

William H. Miller Worship Service 9:30 a.m., Sunday : 
398-3531 School 10:30 a.m., Bible study, 7p.m., 613 Lakeview Avenue 

B Sunday School, 9:30 a.m., Morning} Wednesday Prayer Service, 7:45 p.m. 

GREENWOOD 

Milford, De 

OF THE NAZARENE 
Rt. 313 North 

Rev. Lee Shafer 
Sunday, 10:00 a.m., Sunday School, 

10:46 a.m. Morning Worship & Junior ig 

Church, 6:30 p.m. NYI, 7:00 p.m, 
Evening Worship, Wednesday, 7: 308 
Prayer Meeting. 

LINCOLN-MILFORD- 
HARRINGTON CHARGE § 

& 
Rev. Rudolf Das Garnes 

MT. ZION AM.E. DENTON CHURCH 

  

Worship service 10:40 a.m. (Children s| Rev. John D. Ranney 5 
# Church meets at same time). Wesleyan THE GREENWOOD 9:30 a.m. Sunday Church School. 11:00 

#® Youth, 6:15. Evening worship, 7 pm. | METHODIST CHURCH |, m. The Service of the Word. 
CHAPLAINS CHAPEL 
UNITED METHODIST 

Rev. Mrs. M.S. Russell 

7 Worship service 9:30 a.m. Sunday 
X School 10:30 a.m. Sermon every other 

os Sunday. 

> CHURCH OF THE 
BRETHREN 
Farmington, Del. 

# Sunday School 9:45 a.m. Church 
\¢ service 11 a.m. 

ST. BERNADETTES 
ROMAN CATHOLIC 

%% St. Bernadettes R.C. Church Mass 
i Sunday 9:30 a.m. Confession before 

A Mass. 

CHURCH OF THE 
NAZARENE 

108 Mechanic Street 
Harrington, De., 19852 

Pastor Richard A. Koning 
398-4193 

8 9:452.m. Sunday School, 10:45 a.m. 
£% Worship. 7:00 p.m. Evening Service. 

§ Wednesday, 7:00 p.m., Family night: 

ELLENDALE UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. Mrs. M.S. Russell 
® Sunday School 10 am., worship 
® service 11 a.m. 

JEHOVAH S WITNESSES 
RTE. 13-A,1 M. S. of Woodside 

Felton, Del. 
os SUNDAY 
€ Bible Educational Talk 2:00 p.m. 
& Watchtower Study 2:50 p.m. 

3 "TUESDAY 
@ Congregation Bible Study 7:30 pr m. 
3 THURSDAY 

% Theocratic School 7:30 p.m. 
® Service Meeting 8:30 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Dual Highway 113 
_ Frederica by-Pass 

: Rev. Samuel Ingram 
® Sunday School 9:45 a.m., morning 
\# worship 10:45 a.m., Bible training class 

E 6 p.m. evening service 7 p.m., Bible 

£% study and prayer meeting, Wednesday 
8 7 p.m. 

Greenwood, De. Ze 
Rev. James B. Doughten 

Office 349-4047 
Home 349-4324 

Epworth 
9 a.m. worship, 9:46 a.m. Sunday 

School. 
Todd's Chapel 

10 a.m. worship, 11 a.m. Sunday 

School. 
Greenwood 

10 a.m. Sunday School, 11:15 a.m. 

worship. 

GREENWOOD 
WESLEYAN CHURCH 

Greenwood, Del. 
Rev. Etta M. Clough, Pastor 

Sunday School 10 a.m., worship 
service 11 a.m., evening worship 7 p.m. 

HARRINGTON BAPTIST 
. CHURCH 

Liberty Street 

W.P. Watson 
{ 398-3378 

9:45 a.m. - Sunday School, 11:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship, 5:45 p.m. - Adult 
Choir Practice, 7 p.m. - Evening 
Worship, Wednesdays 10 a.m. - Craft 
Class, 6 p.m. - Children & Youth's Choir 
Practice, 7 p.m. - Prayer Meeting. 

HICKORY RIDGE 
CONGREGATION 

METHODIST CHURCH 
Rt. 13 North of Greenwood, Del. 

Rev. William Fleischauer 
Sunday School 10 a.m. morning wor- 

ship 11:16 a.m., evening worship 7 p.m. 
Wednesday 7 p.m. prayer meeting. 

HOUSTON UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

-9:30 a.m. morning worship, 10:45 a.m. 
Sunday School. 

Sunday School, 11 a.m., Youth Service 
1 p.m., Evening service, 7:30 p.m., 
Monday prayer, 8 p.m., Tuesday wor- 
ship service, 7:30 p.m., Thursday Bible 

349-4876 
Rev. Roy G. Murray 

Sunday School 10 a.m. worship service 

Worship service 9 a.m., Sunday 

School 10 a.m. Sermon every other 
Sunday. 

Church School, 9:30 a.m., worship 
service 11:15 a.m., Bible study Wed- 

Wesley Chapel, Slaughter Neck, 9 § 
REFUGE TEMPLE am. and morning worship. “Church, 2 

VIV CENTE school 10:30 a.m. 

Be AL R | St. Paul, Milford,” Morning Worship 

Metropolitan, Harrington, Church § 
School 11 a.m. Morning worship 12 § 
p.m. 

Trinity, Frederica 11 a.m. worship § 
service, Sunday School 10 a.m. 

7:30 p.m. UM.Y.F. 
Vernon 

10:30 a.m., Church School, 11:45 a.m. @ 

Study, 7:30 p.m. Broadcast Mon-Fri. TRINITY UNITED 

9:30 a.m., WSFD Seaford. METHODIST CHURCH 
SPIRIT AND LIFE 6 Front St., Frederica, Del. ; 

TABERNACLE Sardos, Thompsonville, 9 a.m. wor- § 

Road 571 off Rt. 16 SUD 2 v Saxton, Bowers Beach, 10 a.m. wor- & 
Adamsville, Greenwood ship. 

11 a.m., Praise service, 7 p.m,, Tues- WEST HARRINGTON 
Bay worse: 7:30 p.m., Friday Youth UNITED METHODIST 

vities 7-9 p.m. 
Sponsors of Spirit and Life CHARGE 

Christian School Rev. William A. Markley 

ST. JOHNSTOWN NR 
UNITED METHODIST | 10 am. Ghosh Seto 11 am 3 

CHURCH Worship, 1st and 3rd Sunday nights, ; 

8:45 a.m. Church School, 9:45 worship 3 

Sundays, 9:30 a.m. Church School. 

Bethel- 7 
8:45 a.m. worship, 2nd and 4th 3 

    

1st and 3rd Sunday nights, 5:30 p.m., & 

ST. PAUL'S AME. U.M.Y.F. 3rd Wednesday every month § 
7 p.m., Family night covered dish 

CHURCH dither. # 
101 Mispillion Street Salem Farmington 

Harrington, De. 8:45 a.m. worship, 1st and 3rd § 

398-8966 : 

nesday evening 7 p.m. : Sundays, 9:30 a.m. Church School. % 

GRAHAMAM.E. | WHOLE TRUTH TEMPLE § 
CHURCH CHURCHOFGOD 2 
Greenwood, De. IN CHRIST 
Rev. J. Jackson Bowers Chapel Road, Viola Del. 

Sunday School 9 a.m., worship service 697-2851 or 284-9911 

Rev. Thomas Cartwright 
Sunday School 10:30 a.m. Worship 11 

a.m. evening service 7 p.m.   Vestry Meeting. 

INDEPENDENT BIBLE 10 a.m., afternoon service, 1 p.m. Elder Robert L. Williams 

Sunday School 10 a.m. morning wor- 
FELLOWSHIP CHURCH ST. STEPHEN'S ship, 11 a.m., evening worship, 8 p.m. § 

West Liberty Street PAL CHUR Friday service, 8 p.m., fourth Saturday 
Rev. Ray Newman EPISCOPAL CH of each month. Youth Fellowship ser- & - 

Sunday School 10'a.m., Sunday wor- Raughley Hill Road vice 8 p.m. x 

ship 11 a.m., Sunday evening 7:30 p.m., 898-3710 ‘FELTON METHODIST 5 

Wednesday evening 7:30 p.m. Sunday 9 A.M. - Divine Worship. CHARGE 
; Wednesday 7 P.M. - Evening Prayer 

MT. HERMAN CHURCH |; Healing Service, 7:45 P.M. - Bible Felton, De. 
OF GOD Study. Thursday 7:30 P.M. - Choir Viola: Worship Service 9:00 a.m., 

: Practice. 2nd Sunday 10:30 A.M. Church School 10:00 a.m. 
Greenwood, De. Manship: Worship Service 10:00 % 

a.m. Church School 11:00 a.m. i 

Felton: Worship Service 11:00 $ 
a.m. Church School 9:45 a.m. &   
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Church Of The Nozarene Plans 75th Anniversary 
The Church of the Nazarene at 103 

Mechanic Street, Harrington, Del., 
will hold a 75th Anniversary Celebrati- 
on September 16-20, 1981. There will 
be revival services September 16-19, 
1981, nightly beginning at 7:00 p.m. 
Anniversary Sunday is September 20, 
1981 with the following calendar of 
events: 

9:45 a.m. Sunday School 
10:45 a.m. Worship Service 

3:00 p.m. Anniversary Service 
7:00 p.m. Praise Service 

There will be special music nightly. 
Our speaker will be Dr. Mendell 

Taylor, who was a member of the 
faculty of the Nazarene Theological 
Seminary from 1945 to 1979. He 
became Professor Emeritus upon his 
retirement in 1979. The Seminary is a 

  
Dr. Mendall Taylor 

graduate school for the Nazarene 
ministry. He served as dean until 1971. 
In addition to his preaching ministry, 

Mr. Taylor is widely known in his 
denomination as a writer. He is author 
of many books, including Exploring 
Evangelism, American at the Cross- 
roads, Every Day With Jesus, Every 
Day With the Psalms, and Every Day 
with Paul. 
Dr. Taylor is an able preacher. He 

was ordained in 1933 and served a term 
as pastor of the Church of the Nazarene 
in Hamilton, Indiana. 
A native of Texas, he received his 

bachelor’s degree from Bethany Naza- 
rene College and two graduate degre- 
es, including the doctorate, from the 
University of Oklahoma. 

Calvary Wesleyan Church News 

“Grandparent's Day” was observed 
this past Sunday with awards being 
given to Mrs. Stella Fry as the oldest 
Great, Great Grandparent and Matilda 
Cornish with largest family present. 
Teacher Appreciation Sunday will be 

observed this week with recognition 
being given to Sunday School Teach- 
ers, Children’s Church workers, Youth 
workers and Bus workers. Sunday 
School begins at 9:30 a.m. Morning 
worship hour follows with special song 
by Carlton Goodhand and a message by 
Pastor Miller. 

Sunday evening at 7:00, Lt. Charles 
Venable, Delaware State Police and 
Troop Commander, Bridgeville, Dela- 
ware will present the Gospel message 
as he represents the Gideons. The 
Senior Choir will sing and there will be 
special songs by Jack Carpenter and 
The Men's Chorus. 

The Adult Bible Class is having a 
covered dish supper on Thursday 
evening in the Fellowship. All mem- 
bers are urged to attend. It will start at 
6:00. 

A “Children’s Crusade” with Gloria 
Files and Dorothy Adams is scheduled 
for September 29 thru Oct. 4. An 
outstanding puppet program, music, 
songs, gospel lessons and much, much 
more for all children - Pre-school 
through Grade 6. The program will be 
from 7:00 til 8:00 each evening. 
Birthdays this week go out to Jimmy 

Parsons, Olie Forshee, Natalie McCul- 
lough, Harry Bradford, Stanley Wyatt, 

~ Bessie Harris, Holly Cooper, David 
Moffett, Maude Dickerson, and Ben 
Hollinger. 

Asbury United Methodist Church Notes 
On Sunday, September 20, Asbury 

United Methodist Church will be 
observing Christian Education Sunday. 
During the 11 a.m. service, the church 
school teachers will be rededicated. 
Each teacher will be presented with a 
booklet along with the Sunday School 
Workers Covenant. 
Portions of the covenant include: 

a)order my conduct in keeping with the 
principles of the New Testament, and 
seek the help of the Holy Spirit that I 
may be faithful and efficient in my 
work (Eph. 4:1), b)use the Bible with 
my group on Sunday morning, or other 
meeting times, and help them to 
understand and love it (Ps. 119:16), 
c)make witnessing a major endeavor 

  

(Prov. 11:30), d)apply the teachings of 
Christ in moral and social issues of my 
everyday life. (Jas. 1(22) 
Rev. Robinson's sermon is entitled 

“Importance of Church School Educa- 
tion.” This will be a day to recognize 
our church school teachers and show 
our appreciation for their dedication 
and hard work. 

ee 
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KIMI SUE SCRANTON 
. FREDERICA-A memorial service 
for Kimi Sue Scranton, 22, killed in a 
head-on collision near Milton, Friday, 

September 11th, will be tonight at 8 at 
the Torbert Funeral Chapel, Bradford 

and Reed streets, Dover. 
* Mrs. Scranton was riding in a car with 
her husband, Martin L., who was 

driving north on Delaware 5, when he 
apparently crossed the center line and 
struct a car driven by Edward Menard 
of Reading, Pa. according to state 
police. 
Mr. Scranton was reported in serious 
condition at University Hospital in 
Baltimore. 
Mrs. Scranton had been a waitress at 

the Pizza Hut in Dover for the past four 
or five months. 
In addition to her husband, she is 

survived by a son, Garred Thiry, at 
home; her mother, Beverly Condit of 
Olathe, Kan; and her father, Ray 

. Condit of Texas. 

HARRISON W. LYNCH 
CAMDEN-Harrison W. Lynch, of 

- 341 Gunning Bedford Road, former 
printer for the Milford Chronicle, died - 
Thursday, September 10, in Kent 
General Hospital, Dover, after a long 
illness. 
Mr. 

months ago as a printer for the weekly 
newspaper in Milford after about 40 
years of service. 
His wife, Helen, died in 1978. He is 

survived by a son, William of Camden; : 

Lynch, 76 retired about 14 

  

Obituaries 
a daughter, Dorothy Strahle of Milford 
three brothers, A.C. “Dick” Lynch of 
Frederica, Warren H. and Harry B., 

  

both of Milford; two sisters, Jennie M. 
Willey of Lincoln and Sarah Ann 
Carter of Milford; eight grandchildren 
and eight great-grandchildren. 
Services were Monday afternoon at 1 

at the Berry Funeral Home, Northwest 
Front Street, Milford, where friends 
called Sunday night. Burial was in Odd 
Fellows Cemetery, Milford. 

ELSIE L. STEINER 
MILFORD-Elsie L. Steiner, 74, of 

317 Hall Place, died Monday, Septem- 
ber 7, in Milford Memorial Hospital 
after a long illness. 
Mrs. Steiner's husband, Edmund, 

died in 1972. She is survived by two 
sons, Edward and Donald, both of 

- Milford; a brother, William D. Lank of 
Dewey Beach; two sisters, Sarah 
Marsh of Georgetown and Ann West- 
phal of Indialantic, Fla., and six 
grandchildren. 
Services were Thursday morning at 

11 at Avenue Methodist Church," 

Church Avenue. Friends called Wed- 
nesday night at the Gruwell Funeral 
Home, Milford-Harrington Highway. 
Burial was in Odd Fellows Cemetery, 
Milford. Instead of flowers, the family 
suggests contributions to the Milford 
Memorial Hospital, Clarke Avenue, 

DELMARVA'S LARGEST IMPORT AUTOMOBILE DEALER" 

Milford, 19963, or the Sussex County 
Chapter of the American Cancer Soc- 
iety, 104 Depot St., Georgetown, 
19947. 

BEATRICE T. PANNUCCI ° 
MAGNOLIA-Beatrice T. Pannucei, 

63, of Magnolia died Thursday, Sep- 
tember 10, at Dover Air Force Base 
Hospital after a long illness. 
Mrs. Pannucci is survived by her 

husband, Salvatore; a daughter, Sally 
Ann Pippin of Camden; a sister, Agnes 
Pignatello of Verona, N.J. and two 
grandsons. 
Mass of Christian Burial was offered 
Monday morning at 10 at Holy Cross 
Catholic Church, State STreet, with 
burial in Sharon Hills Memorial Park, 
Dover. Friends called Sunday night at 
Pippin Funeral Home, 119 W. Camden- 
Wyoming Ave., Wyoming, where vigil 
prayers were offered at 7:30. 

MYRLEYV. TELL 
MILFORD-Myrtle V. Tell, of 311 S. 

Washington St., Milford, died on 
Friday, Sept. 4, 1981, in Milford 
Memorial Hospital after a long illness. 
Mrs. Tell's husband, Sigurd W., died 

in 1978. Surviving are a son, Kenneth 
S. Tell, at home; a daughter, Sandra L. 
Keen of Lompoc, Calif.; a sister Della 
Parks, with whom she lived; and one 
grandchild. 
Services were at the Lofland Funeral 

Home, 219 S. Walnut St., Milford. 
Burial was in Henlopen Memorial 

Park near Milton. 

MAE MARTIN 
Mae Martin, 62, of 1008 Montgomery 

Road, Willow Run, died Thursday, 
September 3, in the General Division 
after a long illness. 
Her husband, Arnold W., died in 

1976. She is survived by a daughter, 
Nancy Johnson of Oswego, N.Y.; her 
mother, Margaret Johnson of Green- 
wood; three sisters, Dorothy Willey of 
Greenwood, Charlotte Voshel of Felton 
and Jackie Rash of Smyrna, and a 
granddaughter. 
Services were Saturday, September 

12, at Gracelawn Memorial Park Chap- 
el , Kirkwood Highway and Duncan 
Road. Contributions may be made to 
the Silverbrook United Methodist 
Church, 2205 Lancaster Ave., 19805. 

CHARLES ATTWOOD 
SUDLERSVILLE, MD.-Charles 

Keith Attwood of Sudlersville died 
Saturday, Sept. 5, 1981, at University 
Hospital in Baltimore. He was 37. 
Mr. Attwood was a self-employed 

welder and a veteran of the U.S. Navy. 
He is survived by his wife, Marilyn; 

one son, Jimmy; two daughters, Jen- 
nifer and Janelle; one stepson, Mich- 

“ael; his parents, Mildred S. Stitz and 
Henry Attwood of Sudlersville; and 
one sister, Rosemary Bradley of Fel- 
ton. 

Funeral services were 2 p.m. Wed- 
nesday at the Helfenbein-Hubbard 
Funeral Home in Church Hill. 
Burial was at Church Hill Cemetery. 

The Reverend John H. Parke will 
conduct a Teaching & Healing Mission 
in Wesley United Methodist Church, 
Dover, Delaware, beginning with a 
7:30 p.m. service on Sunday, Septem- 
ber 27 and concluding on Tuesday   evening, September 29th. This Mission 

is sponsored by the Dover Chapter ot 
the Order of Saint Luke, which is an 
interdenominational and International 
organization. 
There will be two morning services at 

10:30 a.m. on Sept. 28th and 29th. 
These will be followed by a 12 o'clock 

  

ALICE EPPS 
BRIDGEVILLE— Alice Epps, 71, of 

near Bridgeville, died Tuesday, Sep- 
tember 8, in Nanticoke Memorial 
Hospital, Seaford, after a long illness. 
Mrs. Epps’ husband, Samuel, died in 

1963. She is survived by a son, Samuel 
of Bridgeville; two daughters, Kather- 
ine Andrews of Smyrna, and Doris 
Andrews of Bridgeville; 20 grandchild-' 
ren and 12 great-grandchildren. 
Services were Sunday afternoon at 2 

at the Young's Funeral Home, 308 N. 
Front St., Seaford, where friends 
called Saturday night until 8. Burial 
was in Macedonia Cemetery, Seaford. 

VIRGINIA B. BACON 
GREENWOOD-Virginia B. Bacon, 86, 

of near Greenwood, died Tuesday, 
September 8, in Milford Memorial 
Hospital after a long illness. 
Mrs. Bacon's husband, Grenville, died 

in 1959. She is survived by a grandson 
and two granddaughters. 
Graveside services were Friday after- 

noon at 2 at Trinity Cemetery, Port- 
land, Conn. Friends called tonight at 
the Fleischauer Funeral Home in 
Greenwood. 

Tuncheon in Fellowship Hall of the 
Church with a question and answer 
period. Please bring your own lunch; 
beverages will be provided. Three 
evening services will be at 7:30 p.m. 
and conclude with the laying-on-of- 
hands. A social hour will follow the 
evening services in Fellowship Hall. 
There will be an opportunity to 
purchase literature from a well stocked 
book table in the Hall after morning 
and evening services. A nursery will be 
provided at a minimum fee during the 
morning sessions. 

  

The Rev. John H. Parke   
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* GRRLIC BRERD 

Every Tuesday from 5 to 8 P.M. 

master charge 

U 

  

   

  

Q 

Milford 

   

11A.M. to 2 P.M. Sunday thru Friday Every Monday from 5 to 8 P.M 

SPAGHETTI NIGHT 

Ua 
PIZZA 

GFATAORIAT 
Milford Plaza Shopping Center 

422-3400 
COPOORBOLDOLL00000000000 

INCREDIBLE 
but true... 

FAMILY BUFFET 
rs 1 5349 SALAD BAR 
GARLIC BRERD 

5199 

v 

- Hours =~ 
SUNDRY they THURSDAY 

1NA.M.to 10 P.M. 
FRIDRY thru SATURDAY 

NA.M.o NI P.M, 
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(Woonsocket, R.I.) — These are the 

words of PAT GRATTON of Radio 

Station WWON in Woonsocket R.1. “It 

started out with a friend telling me that 

she had gotten pain relief of arthritis by 
drinking “Pure Aloe Gel,” says Pat. “I 

mentioned it on my radio show because | 

found out Lee's Pharmacy was selling the 

pure aloe gel. from The General Aloe 

Corp.” People started asking about it, 

then using it, now my show has turned 
into the “ALOE HOUR”. Over 100 

people from Lee's Pharmacy are using 

the product. Anna of Woonsocket said, 
“Pat, | had pains in my back, and my 

husband had pains in his legs. We're on 
our 2nd bottle and we feel great, 1 feel so 

much livelier.” Mrs. O.C. (known as 

Oreo Cookie) told Pat “I'm on my 8th 

bottle, 1 have a slight case of colitis and | 

feel so much relief, I ran out of product 

and went 3 weeks without the product 

and 1 felt miserable. 1 also use the Aloe 
Lotion. Mrs. C.P. says “I'm on my 

2nd bottle. I wasn’t.able to put weight on 

   
   
   
    

   
    

    
   
    

    

   
   
    

    
    
    

   
   

  

© 1981 GENERAL ALOE CORPORATION, ROSWELL, GEORGIA 30077 

Pat Gratton of WWON and Mike Barbaria of Lee's Pharmacy toast with a glass of aloe. 

my right knee. now I feel great. | take the 

product in a shot glass and it tastes like a 

lime rickey.” laughed Mrs. C.P. “My left 

foot was so swollen from arthritis that the 
doctor was going to operate on a burr 

that formed, now the swelling is gone and 
| feel great. 1 also used to take a package 
of Alka Seltzer (18 tablets) a week. Now | 
take none. The Aloe helps me inside as 

well as outside.” MIKE BARBARIA of 

Lee’s Pharmacy is astounded. “In all my 

years as a pharmacist, I've never seen 

anything like it.” We have sold over 400 

bottles since May Ist and it hasn't 

stopped yet. 1 feel good about 

recommending the product because the 

company gives a 100% guarantee to the 

customer to return the product if they feel 
it did not help them. I've never seen so 

many happy faces. and all because of a 

“Little Plant.” Directions for Aloe Vera 

Juice. | 0z. AL-O-JEL™ added to 7 oz. 
water makes a delicious 8 oz. glass of aloe 

juice. 32 oz. bottle of AL-O-JEL™ makes 
two (2) gallons of 100% Aloe Juice. 

Products available at these locations: 

HARRINGTON 
PHARMACY 

Quillen Shopping Center 

Harrington, De. 

398-8123 
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Saturday. Photo by H.G.F. 
Wahaysti” a 9 yr. old Indian boy from North Carolina 

    
Son 

Pow Wow Pictures 

At the right, “Uncle” Walter B. Wright who celebrates his 100th birthday on 
January 21, 1981 was on hand for the Indian Pow Wow on Saturday. Photo by { x 
H.G.F. : 

   
At the opening ceremonies at the Indian Pow Wow onSaturday, Tsonakwa, a 

Canadian Indian, was the featured speaker at the Nanticoke Pow Wow. Others 1 
to r: Mrs. Kenneth Clark, Chief Kenneth Clark of the Nanticoke nation and Mrs. 
Jean Norwood, Program Chairman. Photo by H.G.F. 

Nanticoke Pow Wow 1981 
Out of the ashes like the ancient 

Phoenix Bird of Indian Legend they are 
arisen. They have a quiet sense of 
pride which has helped to maintain 
their dignity all these years. In 1881 
they were finally recognized for what 
“they are...neither white or black, but a 
separate people, The Nanticoke Indian 
Tribe. 
On September 12, & 13, 1981, they 

celebrated their 4th annual Pow Wow 
and a triple centennial at the same 
time. It was the anniversary of the 
founding of their beloved Indian Mis- 
sion Church, a center of the commun- 
ity; it was the birthday (100 yrs.) of the 
oldest member of the tribe, Mr. Walter 
B. Wright; and most important of all 
the anniversary of the recognition of 
the Nanticoke Indian Association. 
After celebrating Harrington's Heri- 

tage Day on Saturday, Sept. 12, I 
decided that it would be nice to attend 
the Pow Wow and see what happened 
there. As a child Ihad often seen the 
Indians at Oak Orchard, but could not 
remember ever attending any such an 
affair, % 

Sunday’s program had Jean Norwood 
as Mistress of ceremonies up to the 
point where they turned it over to their 

              

friend from Canada, TSONAKWA. 
There were addresses from Chief 

Clark, Dr. Frank Wright of the 
Maryland Indian Affairs Office and 
others. Chief Clark made the state- 
ment that there were only about 450 
true Nanticokes. 

The Nanticoke Language is no longer 
known, however there were two 
phrases remembered among the older 
members. These have been incorporat- 
ed into a song and was sung as the 
Women did a Toe Dance. Mrs. Patience 
Harmon, 86 years young, assisted by 
her granddaughter led this routine. 
Their costumes were brilliant with 
color and looked very authentic. | 
After watching many of the dances, 

we decided to move on to the vendors 
booths. We found many beautiful 
beaded items as well as silver and 
turquoise. Of course there were also 
leather goods. One young man named 
Clark had some lovely sketches for 
sale, and we thought we heard him say 
he was a cartoonist also. We bought 
some of their fried bread, picked up 
souvenier books, and headed home. 
The thought in our mind was: Here is a 
people who has reason to celebrate and 

  

  

Professional 
Real Estate Services 

With our long experience in the field of real 

estate buying and selling, we have a great 

sales force to “home in” on your needs! Let 

us work for you. Call or see us today! 

FARROW 
“Realty REALTOR® 

17 Commerce Street 
Harrington, Del. 19952 

OFFICE (302) 398-3455 

HARRY G. FARROW, JR. 
BROKER 

HOME (302) 398-3250 
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sang the Indian Anthem on 
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The Feather Dance performed by Phillip, right and Mark Sammons, left of 
Millsboro, members of the Nanticoke Indian Tribe which is a dance showing the 
skill of an eagle swooping down on its prey. Photo by H.G.F. 

  

on Saturday. Photo by H.G.F. 

by Grace Welch 

be proud of their Heritage. 
The Nanticoke were here when the 

first white settlers came from Europe. 
They: tried peaceful co-existence, but 
were driven away from their lands. 
Eventually they traveled north and 
south and west, leaving only a handful 
in this area. That is the true Nanticoke 
of today. 

Did you know the Nanticoke men 
fought for the Continental United 
States. in. both the Civil and the 
Revolutionary War? In the latter, they 
were promised the entire State of 
Delaware for a reward for service...a 
promise that was never meant to be 
kept. 

Dr. C.A. Weslager has done exten- 
sive research on the Nanticoke and 
has, I am sure, influenced many to be 
sympathetic to their cause. In his book, 
“Delaware’s forgotten Folk”, he says: 
“The little eye people are decemdents 
of Samuel Norwood, who died in 1907.” 
(This defect is a problem with the 
muscles in the eye lids which are not 
developed or strong enough to open 
them all the way, making it necessary 
for the person to hold the head back in 
order to see.) According to Dr. 
Weslager, Mr. Norwood was married 
twice. It seems the children of the first 
marriage always saw everything he did 
and must have caused him some 
aggravation. Legend has it that he 
wished his children had little eyes so 
they would see less. And so, when his 

717 W. Division St.,   
P000000009000000 Coupon 000000000000000¢Q 

With This Coupon 
2 People for the Price of 1 

until 9/25/81 

Saturday Workshops 
1-3 p.m. 

Macrame Towel Hanger Sept. 26th. 
Happy Scarecrow Oct. 24th. 
Cornhusk Dolls Nov. 7th. 
Potpourri Balls Nov 14th. 
Christmas Beaded Orniments Nov. 21st. 

2 for 1 Classes 
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4 Week Classes gat. 10-5, 

Stained Glass 
- starts 

Sept. 30th 
Floral 
starts 

Sept. 28th 

Macrame 
starts 

Sept. 29th 

Christmas 
Decorations 

starts 

Qct. 26th 

Call for more 

information 674-9171   

DELMARVA'S ART CRAFT & HOBBY CENTER 
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An Indian Maiden does the Round Dance with the Nanticokes at the Pow Wow 

second family was born, they had this 
problem. 
Upon our arrival at the Pow Wow, 

this was one of the first things I saw. 
She was beautiful woman, but her 
eyelids were drooping, making me 
wonder if she was a Norwood decen- 
dant. 

There were Indians of all sizes and 
shapes and shades. They ranged from 
the lithe ebony-colored Tuscarora 
brave to the lovely burnished copper 
tones of the lovely Jean Norwood. 
They were regaled in everything from 
feathers and animal skins to Gitanno 
blue jeans. Some were easy to identify 
because of the shape of the face or the 
smooth black hair...though there were 
some of the participants who were 
fair-haired and light skinned. This was 
due to inter-marriages with other 
peoples, I'm sure. Nevertheless they 
still have the Indian Heritage to be 
proud of. 

As we stood under the trees in the 
grove, the sunlight warming us, I 
began to relax and feel at one with this 
ceremony. I guess I still think of 
Indians as I saw them in my Grammar 
School books, stalwart and brave and 
filling me with awe of their background 
and their struggle with life. Standing 
there, listening to the chanting of the 
songs and the beat of the drum, I felt at 
peace with the World and almost as 
though I was living in another time and 
place. 

674-9171, 
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Shinar owned and driven by Ronald Walters of Felton won at Ocean Downs on 

Leonard - Hearns Fight 

To Be Aired At Dover Downs - 
Tonight 

The undisputed Welterweight Cham- 
pionship of the World will be on the line 
when Sugar Ray Leonard meets Thom- 
as Hearns in a 15-round title showdown 
tonight, September 16, at Caesar's 
Palace in Las Vegas, Nev. 
Local boxing fans and sports enthus- 

iasts will be able to watch this dramatic 
welterweight confrontation live on 
closed-circuit television at Dover 
Downs. Tickets for the championship 
card, which begins at 9 p.m., are priced 
at $20, and may be purchased at the 
Dover Downs ticket office, Route 13, 
Dover, and Bag abd Baggage, 228, W. 
9th Street, Wilmington. 
An 18 ft. by 24 ft. television screen 

will be installed on top of the tote board 
normally used for paramutuel harness 
racing. The large screen should allow 
excellent viewing from all seats within 
the Dover Downs complex. 
Leonard, who recently scored a 

ninth-round knockout of Ayub Kalule 
to capture the WBA Junior Middle- 
weight title, will be seeking to unify 
the welterweight division with a vic- 
tory over Hearns. The 25-year-old 
Sugar Ray defeated Wilfred Benetez 
on Nov. 30, 1979 to win his share of the 
crown, and later split two bouts with 
Roberto Duran losing the title on June 

20, 1980 and regaining it in November. 
Leonard's most recent welterweight 
defense was a 10th round KO of Larry 
Bonds in Syracuse, N.Y. in March. 
With eight straight knockouts, includ- 

ing three title defenses, the 22-year-old 
Hearns will provide Leonard with a 
most worthy adversary. Hearns’ fights 
have lasted an average of less than five 
rounds, and the 61” puncher is 
devastating with either hand. 
The Leonard-Hearns showdown will 

feature contrasting ring styles, as well 
as physical makeup. At 6’1” Hearns 
stands three inches above his opponent 
and will enjoy a four-inch reach 
advantage. Leonard is a highly-talent- 
ed boxer-puncher with blazing hand 
and foot speed, while Hearns carries 
the trademark of an awesome power 
hitter who destroys the opposition with 
deadly precision. 
Both fighters came up through the 

amateur ranks, with each achieving 
great success. Leonard's Olympic box- 
ing feats are well documented, and he 
finished his amateur career with a 
145-5 record and a Gold Medal at the 
1975 Pan American Games. Hearns 
was voted the 1977 Amateur Boxer of 
the Year for winning both the National 
AAU and Golden Gloves Champion- 
ships. 

    
The annual Harrington Little League 

Association banquet will be held this 
Saturday night, September 19th at the 
W.T. Chipman Cafeteria beginning at 
6:30 p.m. The banquet will be a 
covered dish affair with the league 
supplying ham, rolls, and beverages. 
All players, coaches, managers, spon- 
sors and families of Harrington's 
minor, major, little, senior and big 

  

    

   

      

     

  

    

    

Little League Dinner 
league baseball teams are invited to 
attend. Trophies will be awarded to the 
winning teams for the 1981 baseball 
season. 
Please bring a well-filled covered 

dish, your own place setting and come 
join us at the banquet. One dollar 
donation per person or five dollars per 
family is requested to help defray 
banquet costs. 

Brian Manges drove 13 yr. old Miss Lady Prince to a wire to wire victory last - 

Wednesday night in the Chick’s Harness feature at the opening of the fall meet at 

Harrington Raceway. Others pictured are L to R: Gary Simpson, ass’'t gen. 
manager of Raceway, owner, Mrs. Lyndale [Dorthea] Coverdale, Frank Chick 
and Linda Fleming. Photo by H.G.F. 

Spartan Season 

Opens This Week 
Tournament 

September 19-20: Harrington Slo-Pit- 
ch Softball League Slow Pitch Softball 
Tournament. Invitational, bracket pl- 
ay, 3 games guaranteed. Bracket 
winners, runners up advance to finals. 
Trophies for 1st and 2nd in each 
bracket. Trophies for 1st and 2nd in 
double elimination, plus 15 individual 
trophies for first place team. To pick up 
players call Dick Crouse 284-9170 or 
398-8953, Leon Wix 398-3528, Ken 
Baker 284-9223. Entrance fee is $80. 
Send checks to Dick Crouse, P.O. Box 
42, Felton, De. 19943. 

1st Annual Heritage Day 10K A Success 
On September 12th, 58 runners lined 

up at Chipman Jr. School to begin the 
first annual Harrington Heritage Day 
10K (6.2 mile) run. At the sound of the 
bell, the runners were on their way up 
the Harrington-Felton road, towards 
Mastens Corner, back around and 
down Weiner Avenue to finish at the 
school. 
The day’s high temperatures took its 

toll on all the runners, creating slow 
times and some heat exhaustion. Of the 
58 runners, 56 completed the race. 
Dennis ITermann of Rock Hall, Md., 

was the overall winner of the race with 
a time of 36:16. Chuck Perdue of 
Salisbury, Md. was second with a time 
of 37:02. 
Dianne Dulin of Oxford, Md., took top 

female honors with a time of 41:47 and 
placed 14th. Barbara Kelly of Smyrna 

  

School Band Instruments 
New-Used-Rentals 

Most Complete Music 
Studio tn Delaware 

7) 

DRUMPAD 

was the second woman finisher, placing 
15th. 
Age category winners are as follows: 

MALES 
14 & under . Jason Gardels, Dover, DE. 
15-19 ....Matt Smith, Bridgeville, De. 
20-24 . . . Chuck Perdue, Salisbury, Md. 
25-29... ....... Glen Kemp, Unknown 
30-34 Dennis Hermann, Rock Hall, Md. 
35-39. . . Jake Zeigler, Middletown, De. 
40 & over . Louis Hines, Salisbury, Md. 
FEMALES 
14 & under Stacey Murdock, Salis., Md. 
15:19 cx. No entries 

Barbara Kelly, Smyrna, De. 
Sean Pam Haley, Felton, De. 

       
2 

Save Time And Money, 

See Us First 

Study With The Best 

Professional Instruction 
On All Instruments Given 

by HONEY VOSHELL 

2 mi. North of Felton 

on Rt. 13 

Guitar and Bass Instruction 
by DAVE JOINER 284-4664   

Over 35. . . . Dianne Dulin, Oxford, Md. 
Caboose Award (last place) - Dave 

Pryor, Dover, Delaware. 
Other locals that did well were: Dave 

Buck, 4th; Brad Morris, 9th; Chris 

Wetherhold, 18th; and Dan Parker, 

41st. 

      

   

              

    

  

   

     

    

    

  

Harrington Softball 
HARRINGTON SOFTBALL LEAGUE 

STANDINGS 

American Div. 
ooh DEE IRN Ee RT W-L 

Cavallos.. /.......8..oa 4-0 
HighPoint .......... 0... ws 2-2 
Kent County Merchants ......... 2-1 
Farmington Fire ........... 4. 1-2 
CarDot.........0..0. or inl, 1-3 

National Div. 
Taylor & Messick ............... 3-0 
Harrington Merchants. .......... 2-1 
Greensboro Jaycees ............. 1-2 
Gallo ............50 0.02 1-3 
Vepeo.. in. civ indir lst 0-3 

RESULTS 
Sept. 7-10 

Tuesday, Sept. 7, rained out, resched- 
uled Monday, Sept. 14. 
Wednesday, Sept. 8: 

High Point 5, Car Dot 4 
Cavallo’s 9, Gallo 4 
Farmington 17, Greensboro 2 

Thursday, Sept. 9 
Taylor & Messick 2, Harr. Merchants 0 
Cavallo 7, Car Dot 1 
Gallo 8, Vepco 6 
Kent Cty. Merchants 9, High Point 1 

This week Cavallo’s continued their 
winning streak with solid defense. 
Farmington Fire Co. took advantage 

of a 9 man Greensboro Team and 
pounded them 17-2. : 
Gallo’s tried desperately to beat 

Cavallo’s but could not get past that 
defense, however, they came back the 
next night and held on to beat Vepco in 
10 innings. 

That young Taylor & Messick Team 
with terrific plays at short stop by 
Coug. Collins smothered Harrington 

. Merchants. 

  

Melvin Joseph, right, shakes Presley Moore's hand in the winner's circle at Free 
State Raceway on August 29 when Mr. Forty nine, owned by Joseph set a track 
and Maryland state record in 1:55.2. At the left is Everett Hall, 2nd trainer and 
Tink Lair, 1st trainer. Mr. Forty Nine by Race Time [Good Time] out of Adele 
Diamond [Meadow Ace]. Mr. Forty Nine first raced at age 4. Mr. Joseph was told 
before that time that Mr. Forty Nine would never make it to the races. Now at 
age 7, he can race over any kind of a racetrack under any condition. 

CENTRAL GRAIN, INC. 
Formerly Killen Grain Co. 

      

——Top Prices Paid, 
——Storage Space Available. 
— Deferred Payment Program. 

Central Grain Co. Inc. 
Harrington, DE 

RAY BRITTINGHAM, Elevator Supt. 

Bring Your CORN To Us 

398-3296  
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FURNITURE 9-16 CLEANERS 216 INSULATION 9.23 HOME SALES 101 

THE FURNITURE BARN Capitol Cleaners SAVE ENERGY - | 

7 "ay Appliances & Launderers, Inc. - INSULATE YOUR HOME 
{ Furniture Fur & Wool Storage Call Anthony Gallo For Free Estimate THE BEST IN THE STATE FOR LESS 

al, 284.9009 We Have The Only Cold Storage Vault 15 Years Exper ience—Can Insulate Every A i Al Types of sing 

wsmonkd | + in the Dover Area Free Pick-up | Type— Attic and Sidewalls —In Old or \  §MilesS.DAFBRY 113 and 1134 

Des 443s | Four Locations 674-0500 & Delivery | New Homes 398.8481 | HOMESALES INC. 395-5443 
TV 101 GYMNASTICS 9.23 | TIRES & SERVICE ~~ a. SPORTINGGOODS sa 
  

Vers 

  

      

GYMNASTICS COUNTRY LTD. 
Horsepond Rd. & Lafferty La. 

McCULLOUGH'S 
TIRE & SERVICE CENTER INC 
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Ear Piercing & Facials Free estimates on jobs 
All makes Water Pumps 

T Vso7 674-1919 MAJOR & MINOR REPAIR WORK \J SPORTING 
| 2167 Gymnastics for All Ages ey GOODS 

WTO SES SE wa Svs gi ai EE CLIFF 742 S. Governors Ave, 
ugus i : 

. COmPpetiioh Team B? 398-3362 Goosen CHAMBERS Ce" Delaware 19901 ; 
Camden, Delaware asses Available | US 13 NORTH HARRINGTON owner. Phone 302-674-1833, 

MOBILE HOME LOTS oz SALVAGE 9.30 VARIETY SHOP 00 CONCRETE—SAND  1F 

HIGH POINT MOBILE HOME PARK Trader's YI) * AuoBodyRepor| = BUMBLE BEE Stop Shop Stayton’s Sand & Gravel, Inc. 
DELUXE MOBILE HOME LIVING Auto MFFE® and Painting £0 Milford, DE Phone 422-5399 Concrete & Mortar Sand 
*LARGE LOTS * PLAYGROUNDS Repair oh ® Glass Installation (3 Toys, Elvis Presley Lamps Topsoil Stone 

CONVENIENT LOCATIONe POOL TL nts ® Freetsimates Paper Products, Owl Lamps, ESSENCES Bie AUREUS SI 
pi * Laundromat | 422.7270 Railroad Ave. Knick- Knacks & Clothes Fresh Country [Sh atr RCI IRR 

| U-S-113&113A Frederica. 335-5444 | ~ Houston Eggs, Salt & Pepper Shakers Office: 24.9178 Wet Ao 

AUTO DEALERS 0% CONSTRUCTION _ 10-7 MUSIC TF EQUIPMENT TF 

DOVER DATSUN ods i i Taslor & Messick, Inc. 
a in wo S| mmm voLvo “i i EE Me [a 

678-3434 ] HARRINGTON, DE. a 205 S SOHMER By Two. Way Radio 3 
RII ” Sina Dual Highey WURLITZER | ppope. 398.3729 Harrington, De, ~~ \:2+= esses 

So. duPont Hwy. Dover ae anni DAY - 302-422-5456 Teen: ay CURRIER 05 : 5 

FURN: REFINISHING ss] HEATERS 040 FUEL OIL 10-28 HAIR STYLING su 
CO Tt * * 

PAINT xDD Roveues | SAVE ENERGY Le - Peninsula Oil Co. NEED ANEW STYLE? ggg 
7 © with ortable Srosens eaters Fuel Off, Kerosane, Gasoline & ANN KUPER 

+ h/ urner oervigce. 
a + 2% Z1 GRIER LUMBER CO. -24Hour Service for Regular Customers ANN’S HAIR PORT SUPER CUTS 

W» Vo, 41 Z, Radio Dispatch Truck CALL FOR APPOINTMENT FOR 
| 5 4 KEROSUN 4224527 . Automatic Delivery of Oil 697-3039 MEN & 

nomosn Furniture Stripping Causey Ave. Milford .Level Payment Plans Available 25 MEADOW AV WYOMING 
NEAR KENT r’ wy Shaw Ave. & Rt. 13 TUE TO SAT WOMEN 

CENTER WOODSIDE, DEL. Phone 302-697-3550 Harrington, De. : 398-8344 CLOSED MONDAY 

HAIR STYLING 923 PLUMBING & HEATING 1125 WELLS — PUMPS 9.16 FLORIST 101 

'Paree Claree Beauty Salon | Harrington Plumbing & Heating | B.U.D. Pump & Well 302-398-3541 
| Men, Women, Boys & Girls Hair Sytling Sup ply Wells Pumps COUNTRY FLOWERS by Nancy 
Perms - Hair Cuts - Coloring - Allikinds of service work Sand Pumping “Let us Help Make Your Day Special” 

Fresh: Dried : Silks & Plants 

    

  

  

  

  

   
  

  
  

  

  

   

  

  

  

  

  

  

    

  

    
  

| Milford Shopping Center Meyers & Gould Pumps Harrington, De. 19952 
Milford Del. 422.5210 398-8877 Near Wyoming 697-6313 Hr. 9-6 * Sat. 9-2 Telegraph Service 

BOWLING MOVING & STORAGE 7 CLOTHING 9.16 LUMBER 10-14 

| A kdl LEM FASHIONS Co. 3 Simpler Lumeen cor co. 
= H : TY " 3 ac or ut ot » aints  *Building Hardware Milford Brunswick Lanes Specieli Sin Moving and Storage oing Back To oY. Clothes Blue Jeans, ei aren 

Leagues & Open Bowling Ace : iy Tops, Jackets, Pull Over Sweaters st 

Nightly 422-9456 | Clothing For Women And Children Ls ive SC tmnt 
i 2 45 Clark, Harringt ton Harrington Now at two locations: RR a. 

ent County-674-0444 ussex County-227-324 398-862 398.4204 Php 

BUILDING SUPPLIES COINS 9.23 PLUMBING - HEATING ., THRIFT SHOPS 9-16 

Woodside Sur plus Sales CASH en 1 CONS Plumbing - Heating - Elec. Wiring Near ly New Bolllique 

Lumber, Windows; Siding, Doors, Molding, Plywood, | $100,121 fos Slang Sher ANTHONY GALLO -—» Thritt Shops 
Roofing, Insulation, Refinishing, Paneling, Everything ( ) ok Sales and Service Le Open Sept. 14-New Fall Arrivals 
for the Builder % Homeosger : Se My of Certified Wis to within 1 0z. of a gram d Open Daily 10-5 E $ Sond 

side ic Light on S. Bound Lane of U.S. 13. an == ny Xcepr yunaay. 
The Dover Army/Navy Store Call 398-8481 Gi Camden, Wyoming M ilford, Delaware 

| Weekdays 8-5 Sat. 8-1 284-4134 Call 736-1959 for current prices =: .%. Installation 697- 6866 S 422-6856 

CHIMNEY SWEEP ss GROCERY i WOODSTOVES 15 AUTO to 
: 2 9 0 OLD MILL 5 The Deli-Barn THE VILLAGE country store | [f1tzgerald’s Auto Salvage 

HIMNEY SWEE J Rt. 113 Fresh Prod Woodstoves ‘n Stuff Top Scrap Prices For Autos - 
ust North of Milford fresh Froduce 

Wood St Chimneys, Cl Subs — Deli EVERYTHING UNDER THE SUN .. Metals - Batteries - Industrial Scrap, Etc. 
oves, ireplaces Cleaned. Order Ahead Meats & Cheeses FOR THE ENERGY CONSCIOUS Remember: Jesus Recycles People, 

ox Quality Work Guaranteed. 422-4344 Groceries Sani 1534 SOUTH GOVERNORS AVE We Recycle Cars. 

Licensed & Insured. 697-9610 Lawn & Garden Items | | 5a & scott sepweLL x Sussex 856-3994 Lincoln 422-7584 

LINOLEUM b> DECORATING o" COUNSELING os HEATER CLEANING 101 
ARGO LINOLEUM CO. KENT COUNTY i h iio 

Featuring Carpets: : Custom Decorating at COUNSELING SERVICES ave your heater cleane 
g ap sum ‘Mann Draperies Etc., Inc. Reasonable Prices “CENTER FOR SUBSTANCE ABUSE | y Armstrong ‘Congoleum ‘Mannington uCustom Draperies Free Shop At Home Service 8 he ebiici b 

Floor Coverings rae Folrbon TREATMENT ZREVENTION us &increase the efficiency by 

“Do it yourself, or we install’’ ’ Bedspraass »Shpeviors 3%) janie 736-4548 ; 259, 
oo 121 N. Washington St. Mitford hye (Opposite Shawnee } ’ 0115 COV. AVE. Alfred J. Gillis 222S.R.R. Ave. 

-8431 Also Grass Turf Available untry Club) ¥ Our Pat DOVER, DEL. 1990] Dover 736-1898 

HARDWARE TF HAIR - STYLING 101 REPAIR& TOWING  10u TIRES 40 

: : | ‘ Jim Baxter's 
TAYLOR'S HARDW ARE Sortigion yeipe Towers Auto Service Delaware Tire Center. Inc. 

Wallpaper — Benjamin Moore Paint Hot eres for ate ] : “Let us keep you going, on the spot, 

Full Line of Paint & Wallpaper Supplies Sl Repair & Towing ao: Lue fom, is rout the fick 
; 'E & ; \GTON weavin - cu in : all us 1or o : 
COMMERCE & DORMAN STS. HARRINGTON ny hora 39 8- 427 5 %Check our products & services. 

Phone 674-0234 
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Vineyard 
[Continued from page 1] 

was, “You'd better come on and go” 

When she demanded “why”, his an- 
swer was “...to pick up the pieces.” She 
didn't ask again. And there were many 
times she was there to pick up the 
pieces. 
Once Vineyard was involved in a 

7-horse pile up from which he walked 
away and in which no one, neither 
horse nor driver, was injured. Other 
times, he was not so lucky. He hobbled 
away from a pile up at Agwam, N.Y. 
concerned about the fate of his horse. 
The horse was all right, and Vineyard 
insisted nothing was wrong with him. 
But he couldn't bear weight on one leg, 
and it was discovered the next day that 
he had a broken leg, the bone 
splintered rather than displaced. Dur- 
ing the recovery period, he appeared at 
the stables every day where he sat in 
an open doorway to prove his original 
point. 

His worst accident may have been on 
the very first night of night racing at 
Harrington Raceway when his ankle 
was mashed.He had been driving be- 
hind an older man,Elbert Saunders 
who was well known and known never 
to drive a straight line down the track. 
Saunders would cut in or out whenever 
someone tried to pass him on either 
side.Vineyard knew that and bided his 
time, giving the elder driver room until 
his horse would tire.But when Vine- 
yard started his move, his sulky was 
bumped and he was thrown out. His 
foot, however, remained in the stirrup 
and the ankle was crushed. 
Dr. Smith, filling in in the absence of 

Dr. W. T. Chipman, the track doctor, 
was called. He attempted to follow 
Vineyard’s wishes and set In sop ihe ankle 

without anesthesia. But that proved 
impossible, and Vineyard finally con- 
sented to being put to sleep for the 
operation. 
All of the bones in the ankle were bro- 
ken, and Dr. Smith warned Vineyard 
that the joint would be permanently 
stiff. A visit to a doctor equipped with 
a lot of electronic gadgetry provided 
temporary relief. But Vineyard, unner- . 
ved by the session in which a bulb held 
by his wife was caused to glow without 
benefit of any apparent electrical 
connection, refused to return for 
treatment. The ankle restiffened and 
remained that way until a colt Vine- 
yard was leading out, took off in a run 
with him in tow. He tore the ligaments 
in the ankle and eventually wore the 
rough edges of the unevenly set bone. 
In time he regained full use of the 
ankle. Wasn't it painful? --“Yes”, says 
his wife, “but what's pain”--especially 
for a man who as a boy set out tomato 
plants the same day a runaway horse 
had wrapped him around a pole, 
breaking several of his ribs. He held 
onto the horse and went back to work 
that day, never telling his father of his 
injury. Then and later, he put on a 
tough act, giving little or no quarter to 
pain. 
There were also good times to 

be remembered. Mrs. Vineyard in- 
sists that the early racing years were 
more fun than the later ones after the 
advent of pari mutuel betting. She says 
the drivers and their wives, despite the 
competition on the track, maintained 
close friendships. She also feels racing 
fans today are less interested in the 
horses and more in their $2 bet. 
For eleven years she worked in the 

box office at Goshen, N.Y. where she 
and her husband attended every Ham- 
bletonian until the race was moved to 
DuQuoin, Ill. She recalls the lavish teas 
which followed 0 the afternoon race. 

THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL, HARRINGTON, DELAWARE 

. These were given by Mr. and Mrs. 
William Cain, for the racing community 
and everyone dressed up “like Lady 
Astor's pet horse” to attend. 
She was also in the box office the day 

it was nearly stormed by an angry 
crowd when the Hambletonian was 
rained out. That was the only race for 
which ticket money would not be 

refunded. 
Her husband remembered horses, she 

recalls people. There was Mahlon 
Haines, the “Shoe Wizard” who made 
his money by developing and selling a 
good work shoe at a reasonable price. 
He also owned horses and would ap- 
pear at the track usually barebeaded 
and constantly tossing a baseball. It 
was Mr. Haines’ habit to offer any 

young man he saw with a cigarette $50 
if he would stop smoking until he was 
21. One who took him up on the offer 
was Delvin Miller, the present owner 
of the Meadowlands stock farms. 

There is also the story of a freak 

accident at Roosevelt Raceway on June 

13, 1947 when driver Clint Hodgins, up 
behind Secrantonian, was tossed from 
his seat into the lap of Daryl Maher 
who was driving Dutch Harbor. The 
two drivers finished the race in one 
sulky, coming in fourth. Maher was 
reported as saying he could have 
finished higher in the money if his 
horse hadn't been carrying double. He 
told Hodgins, “I ought to toss.you 
off----" Hodgins" reply: “You just hit 
the horse and keep going.” 

The Vineyards came to Harrington 
around 1945 at the behest of Fred 
Greenly. But it was about a year before 
they established the home that was to 
serve them for nearly 30 years and 
where Elsie Vineyard still resides. 
When they arrived here, harness 
racing was mostly limited to the Kent 
& Sussex Fair. It was just a few years 

before regular harness meets were 
started at the fairgrounds track. 
Vineyard went on to become an 
institution on Harrington turf where he 
broke and trained many colts, includ- 
ing the aforementioned Direct Express 
and Bengazi Hanover. 

Many of Mrs. Vineyards racing 
recollections are Harrington based. 

A driver familiar to Harrington was 
Jack Brown whose horse “Silent Fox” 
who wouldn't go reined up and who al- 
ways looked like a nag as he paraded to 
the post.The horse and driver were 
subjected to disparaging remarks by 
racing fans who usually suggested the 
“Fox belonged back at the barns. When 

  
Charles “C.D.” Thomas worked as a 

he crossed the finish line first, the 

mockers were the silent ones. 
Mrs. Vineyard has these stories and 

more to tell as she leafs through two 
enormous scrapbooks filled with the 
memorabilia of a lifetime of racing. In 
one of those scrap books is a 1947 Life 
photo story on the hobbies of racing 

drivers. According to the story, Paul 
Vineyard had a penchant for repairing 
radios in his spare time. That, she 
says, was a complete set-up. Her 

husband knew nothing about the 
working of a radio. Harness horses 
were his only hobby, his one occupation 
and his lifetime obsession. 

The Harrington Journal is deeply indebted to Mrs. Paul Vineyard for taking 
the time to share her memories and to correct our errors. 

Distinctive Printing 

by 

The 
Harrington 

hd 
For All Your Printing Needs, Call 298-3206 

groom for Paul Vineyard for some 28 
years [depending on who's counting 
and how]. He remembers Mr. Vineyard 
as “an honest man” and says his first 
horse was “Direct Express.”   

  

"City, and bounded as follows: on the 

* County and State of Delaware in Deed 

" YARD SALE Sat., Sept. 

  

eHousehold   | 

Dt HE 
  

Items under $500 
» Garage Sales 

Yard Sales 
«Giveaways 

Lost & Found 

ent “Classified Rates $1: 25 Words or less- 5° Each additional word. 
The Following Ads Can Run FREE for up fo FOUR WEEKS! ! 

« Employment Wanted 
ltems to Trade (Not to be confused with Help Wanied) 

Deadline: Insertion & Cancellation Mon. 12 Noon 
Mail to: The Harrington Journal, 19 Commerce St., Harrington, DE 19952 
Phone - 398-3206. 
CLASSIFIED DISPLAY: $1.90 per col. inch 

  

  

LEGAL 
NOTICE 

LEGAL 
NOTICE 

  

SHERIFF'S SALE 
OF VALUABLE REAL ESTATE 
By virtue of a writ of Levari Facias, 

for the sale of-land to me directed, will 
be exposed to public sale by way of 

Public Vendue at the front door of the 
Kent County Court House, Kent Coun- 

ty. State of Delaware. on 

29, 1981 
at 1000AM. 

ALL that certain messuage, lot, piece 
and parcel of land and premises 
situated in the City of Harrington, Kent 
County and State of Delaware, on the 
west side. of Weiner Avenue in said 

South by. lands now or formerly of 

Ridgely Vane and Agnes Vane, his 
wife, on the North by lands now or 

formerly of Robert Stauffer, on the 
West by lands now or formerly of Elijah 

Baker, and on the East by Weiner 
Avenue aforesaid, said lot, piece or 

parcel of land having a front on said 
Weiner Avenue of about seventy-two 

(72) feet and extending back therefrom 
between parallel lines about three 

hundred (300) feet, and containing 
twenty-one thousand six hundred (21,- 

600) square feet, more or less, the 
improvements upon said lands being a 

large two-story frame dwelling house, 
garage and other outbuildings. 

AND BEING the same lands and 
premises which were conveyed unto 

James D. Hilton and Sheila A: Hilton, 
his wife, by deed of Lewis E. Wilson 

and Joan B. Wilson, his wife, by deed 
bearing date the 14th day of December, 

A.D. 1976, and of record in the Office of 
the Recorder of Deeds in and for Kent 

Record Book D, Volume 31 at Page 205. 

Improvements thereon being a family, 
two story dwelling and shed. 

Terms of Sale: 20% day of Sale and 
the balance on October 5, 1981. Sale 

subject to confirmation by the Superior 
Court and also subject to a 2% 

Delaware Realty Transfer Tax; 1% to 
be paid by the Seller and 1% by the 

Purchaser. 
Seized and taken in execution as the 

property of James D. Hilton and Sheila 
Hilton, his wife and will be sold by 

Geo. D. Hill, Jr. 
Sheriff 

Sheriff's Office ; 
Dover, Delaware 9/9,9/16,9/23 

  

YARD SALE 
LARGE MULTI-FAMILY 
  

19th. Located on corner of 
U.S. 13 and Paradise Alley 
Road, 3 miles North of 
Harrington, at 9:00 a.m. til ? 
Dishes, lamps, plants, cur- 
tains, clothes, some Avon, 

ete. 

1/t-9/16 

  

CARD OF THANKS 

1 wish to thank relatives 

and friends for visits, gifts 
and cards while I was a 
patient in K.G.H. Dover. 
Also, the doctors and nurses 

in I.C.U. and also on the 2nd 

floor. 

  

Sincerely, 
Agnes M. Torbert 

1/¢,9/16 

PERSONALS 
White, Christian lady in 

her seventies would like to 
meet a white, Christian 

man. Address mail to 
“White Christian Lady” ¢/o 
Harrington Journal, P. O. 
Box 239, Harrington, De. 
19952-0239. 

  

  

3/t, 9/30 

Int pursuance of an order of SANDRA 
W. DEAN, Register of Wills, in and for 
Kent County, Delaware, dated August 

27, A.D. 1981 notice is hereby given of 

the granting Letters Administration on 

the estate of Della Evelyn Elm on the 
27th day of August A.D. 1981. All 

persons having claims against the said 

Della Evelyn Elm are required to 

exhibit the same to such Administrator 
within six months after the date of the 

granting of such Letters, or abide by 
the law in that behalf, which provides 

that such claims against the said estate 
not so exhibited shall be forever 
barred. 
Wiley D. Bly, Administrator of the 
Estate of Della Evelyn Elm, deceased 

SANDRA W. DEAN 
Register of Wills 

Attorney For Estate: 
  

  

PURSUANT TO 10 DEL. C. §5901 

Petitioner represents as follows; 
1. Petitioner, Myrtle Jane Walston 

Smith, is a resident of Kent County, 
State of Delaware, 
2. Petitioner desires to change her 

name from Myrtle Jane Walston Smith 

to Jane Walston Smith. 
3. The change of name is for personal 

reasons. 

persons who will be defrauded or 
adversely affected by said change of 

name. 
WHEREFORE, Petitioner prays that 

the Court enter an Order to change her 
name from Myrtle Jane Walston Smith 

to Jane Walston Smith pursuant to 10 
Del. C. §5901 et seq. 

Myrtle Jane Walston Smith 

RIDGELY AND RIDGELY, P.A. 
BY: Henry duPont Ridgely, Esq. 

307 South State Street 

P.O. Drawer C 
Dover, Delaware 19901 
Attorney for Petitioner 

3/t-9/30. 

IN THE OOURT OF OOMMON PLEAS 
OF THE STATE OF DELAWARE 
IN AND FOR KENT COUNTY 

INRE THE CHANGE OF NAME OF 
MYRTLE JANE WALSTON SMITH 

to 
JANE WALSTON SMITH 

AFFIDAVIT » 
STATEOF DELAWARE » 8S: 
COUNTY OF KENT ~~ » 

  

BE IT REMEMBERED, That on this 

10th day of September, A.D. 1981, 
personally appeared before me, the 

subscriber, a Notary Public in and for 
the State and County aforesaid, Myrtle 

Jane Walston Smith, the Petitioner in 
the foregoing Petition, personally 

known to me to be such, who being duly 
sworn according to law, did depose and 

say that the facts contained within the 
foregoing Petition are true and correct 

as set forth to the best of her 

knowledge and belief. 

Myrtle Jane Walston Smith 

SWORN to and subscribed before me 

the day and year aforesaid. 
Notary Public 

Henry duPont Ridgely, Esq. 
3/1-9/30 

SERVICES 
Poultry Growers Insurance 
coverage, including collapse, 
competitive rates for build- 
ings, equipment, and all 
farm insurance. MARVEL 
AGENCY, Insurance, Mil- 

ford, Del. 422-9626. 

  

  

TFN 
  

4. There are no creditors or other |° 

  

Well Drilling 301-479-0397.   Life Time plastic water weil. 
Call Ken Wood at Life Time   TFNW 

  

NOTICE 
  

GRADUATES OF 
LAKE FOREST HIGH 
SCHOOL should claim 
their yearbooks by Sep- 

- tember 23. They can do 
this by coming to room 
B113 between 3:14 and 
3:30. Relatives. or 
friends may also claim 
books at that time for 
them. Please bring re- 
ceipts and fees due. 
Please do not come dur: 

  

: fool d + CHRYSANTHEMUMS- 
4% k es wn) d 2 : Over 10,000 potted mums in 
ooks - wy 

fore the 23rd will be put oh eam 150 5% 
in temporary storage. Perkor Sihre i a ; 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS ig 8 Rd., Denton, 

The Board of Education of the lgke 3T-9/16 

| District wi ive g 

i bids until 200 PM, EDST, HOMEMAKERS 
Wednesday, October 14, 1981, for the | EARN CHRISTMAS NOW 

following project: 

NO. 81-03-01 
FURNISH ALL MATERIALS AND 
LABOR FOR THE INSTALLATION 
OF ACOUSTICAL CEILINGS AND 
RELATED WORK. 

HDITEMNO. 1 
LAKE FOREST NORTH ELEMEN- 
TARY SCHOOL FELTON, DELA- 
WARE - 13 CLASSROOMS 

| BIDITEMNO.2 
W.T. CHIPMAN JR. HIGH SCHOOL 
HARRINGTON, DELAWARE - LI- 
BRARY - MAIN AREA 

Specifications and bidding information 
may be obtained at the Office of the 

Deputy Superintendent, Dorman 
Street, Harrington, Delaware, 19952. 

Bid must be accompanied by a certi- 

fied check or bid bond in the amount of 
10% of the bid. Bid bonds must be 
furnished by a surety company author- 

ized to do business in the State of 
Delaware and executed by a licensed 

resident agent of the State of Dela- 
ware. 

No bid may be withdrawn for a period 

of thirty days after receipt of bids. 
The Board reserves the right to reject 

any or all bids and to waive any 

informalities. 

James Gussett, President 

Lake Forest Board of Education 
Harrington, Delaware 19952 

BIRTH LIST 
94-81 

Richard & Sherry Kemp, girl 

Barry & Beverly Miller, boy 
95-81 

Jay & Donna Donavan, boye 
Harold & Margaret Brode, boy 

96-81 
David & Joyce Russo, girl 

Andrew & Susan Lyons, girl 
97-81 

Stanley & Amy Taylor, boy 
98-81 

William & Brenda Cohee, boy 

9981 
Calvin & Ann Mann, girl 
Harry & Colleen Thayer, boy 

910.81 : 
Ricky & Deborah Grinolds, boy 

FOR SALE 
WOOD BURNING STOVES 
and fireplaces. Six different 
models. Fire burns slowly 
like charcoal, up to 16 hours.’ 
Guaranteed best price. Gray 
Electronics, 422-9558 (day 
or evening) 2/10 mile north 
of Mispillion Drawbridge, 
Milfor rd. TPN 

  

  

MAGIC WAND CAR 
WASH across from Quillen 

Shopping Center. 422-8921. 
TFN 

  

WOMEN-Need help choos- 
ing a career? Attend Career 
Development = Workshop, 
Sept. 21-30, Del. Tech. Col- 
lege. Call Cheyenne Luzader 
856-5385. 

2/T.9/16 

JOB WANTED 

SITUATION WANTED 
House work, Harrington 

area. No Wednesdays. $25 
per day for average house. 
Experienced. References. 

  

  

. 398-3848, call after 5:00 p.m. 

  

  

Demonstrate toys & gifts 
now through November. No 
collecting or delivery. Free 
kit. Call between 3-5. JoAnn 
653-7298. 

4T-9/23 

4/T, 9/30 

SITUATION WANTED 
Housekeeper, 5 days a 

week or part time, $2.50 per 
hour. Call 398-4132, ask for 

Bonnie. 
4/T, 9/30 

  

Couple interested in live-in 
position to manage motel or 
apt. complex. Call 302-378- 
8201 anytime. 

2/19/16 
  

  

WANTED 
TOBUY 

Guns wanted. Highest 
prices paid for quality guns. 
Call any time, 422-4635. 

TFN 

Boys clothing, 12 mo. thru 
toddler 2. 398-4506. 

4/T-9/16 

LOST & FOUND 

  

  

  

  

i Key found near Harrington 
Public Library, Tuesday, 
August 25. Call 398-3206 to 
identify. 

HELP WANTED 
  

  

Position open for licensed 
qualified real estate sales 
person. Good opportunity 
for right person. Call Far- 
row Realty, 398-3455. 

TFN 
  

Advertising = Representa- 
tive Needed. Salary plus 
commission. Benefits. Good 
hours. Good working con- 
ditions. Need resume & 

references. Call Anne at the 
Harrington Journal. 302- 
398-3204, TFN 
    

  

oF vr 

ANN 
Ne, 

r < 

Your peace | 
nb h) HEART 

    

  

Funeral Home 

[8 W AGENCY 
CS ndurance. 

“Combplete Insurance Protection’ 
1154 S. Governors Ave. 

674-3500 — 856-7828 

Se t— 
McKnatt 

  

50 (Commerce St. 

  DR HARRINGTON, DEI 
al 398.3228 

HAL ke oni |   

Dover 

    

  
AUTOMOTIVE 
  

We buy junk cars and 
trucks. 422-5408. TFN 

Used auto parts at discount 
prices. 422-5408. TFN 

1969 Mustang Grande, re- 
built engine, All high per- 
formance. $1000 or best 
offer. Call 398-8384. TFN 

PAWSON BUS SERVICE INC. 
A) 

es AEE = 

gi ™ 4 

v 
’ \ 

   

: 

  

SEPT. 26th ...... 000 CAMPBELL MUSEUM & 
BURLINGTON MILLS, N.J. 

OCT. 3 & 31st... . BALTIMORE INNER HARBOR 
OCT. 4th ..... “THEY'RE PLAYING OUR SONG” 

FORREST THEATRE, PHILADELPHIA 
OCT. 10-18th............ 9-DAY FLORIDA TRIP 

DISNEYWORLD, ETC. 
OCT. 24th... .............. LURAY CAVERNS 

FRONT ROYAL, VIRGINIA 
NOV.7th ............ OXFORD VALLEY MALL 

LANGHORNE, PA. 
NOV. 2Lst......... WILLIAMSBURG POTTERY 

pessSEtE} “ry 

ag Ly 
RAUGHLEY INSURANCE 

SERVICE 
HARRINGTON, DELAWARE 

Phone 398-3551 

  

VO-TECH 
MENU 

Monday, Sept. 21 
Orange Juice 
Turkey Sub 
Lettuce, Tomato & Onion 
Potato Chips 

  

~ Gingerbread w/topping 

Tuesday, Sept. 22 
Baked Chicken 
Souped-up-Rice 
Buttered Broccoli 
Roll & Butter 
Chilled Applesauce 

Wednesday, Sept. 23 
Pizza 

Cut Green Beans 
Tossed Salad 
Fruit Jello 

Thursday, Sept. 24 
Meat Loaf w/gravy 
Mashed Potatoes 
Buttered Carrots 
Biscuit & Butter 
Chilled Applesauce 

Friday, Sept. 25 : 
Chicken Noodle Soup 
Combination Sand. | 
Lettuce, Tomato & Onion 

Oatmeal Cookies 

WOODBRIDGE 
MENU 

Monday, Sept. 21 

Cheeseburger 
French Fries 

Fruit Punch 

Ice Cream 
Choice of Milk 

  

  

* TOURS - 
© 302-697-6342 

OR COLONIAL 
LIGHTFOOT, VA. 

  

  

LEGAL NOTICES: $2.80 per col. inch 

_Phone - 398-3206 
  

  

LAKE FOREST 
MENU 

Tuesday, Sept. 22 
Homemade pizza squ. 
Creamy cole slaw 

Spiced applesauce 
Chocolate pudding 
Choice of milk 

  

Monday, Sept. 21 
Subs 
Lettuce & Tomato 
French Fries Wednesday, Sept. 23 © 
Pears Surfburger 

Tator Rounds 

Buttered Greens Tuesday, Sept. 22 

Orange Jello Cheese Steak 
Choice of Milk Tater Tots . 

; Fruited Jello Salad 

Thursday, Sept. 24 
Baked Ham 
Potato Salad 
Buttered String Beans 
Cinnamon Rolls/Butter 

Wednesday, Sept. 16 
Student's Cheice 

Thursday, Sept. 24 
Fruit Cocktail Goulash 
Choice of Milk Tossed Salad 

Mixed Fruit 

Friday, Sept. 25 Hot Roll/Butter 
Submarine 
Chicken Noodle Soup 
Cheese Curls 

Ice Cream 

Choice of Milk 

Friday, Sept. 25 
Grilled Cheese 
Buttered Peas 

Polka Dot Peaches 

I” GEORGE GRAHAM D.D.S., P.A. 
: and Associates 

ore pleased to announce the continuation of our! 

reasonable fee policy of the past many years. 

FULL DENTURE HEALTH CARE 

Single Denture *118 

Complete Set (upper & lower) 218 

FAMILY DENTISTRY 
oEXIRACTIONS DENTURES 
FILLINGS ¢CROWNS : 

oCLEANING (15) ®DENTURE REPAIRS (Same Day) 

DR. GEORGE GRAHAM 
DR. GLEN BOWERS 

Open Monday thru Friday 10 a.m. -4 p.m. 

For information and appointments, please call 

749-7873 
{Downtown Plaza) 

*PARTIALS 

*BRIDGES 

224 W, Main St. Salisbury, Md. 

We accept all dental insurance & union plans. 

Md. Medical Assistance Cards Welcome 

  

SYNERGETICS 

' Develops muscle tone. 

    
  

a on 

The Fun-Fithess 
Alternative 
SYNERGETICS: An exciting, new 

way to fitness and fun. Builds 

stamina and endurance just like 

jogging, tennis and serobic dance. 

But much, much more. 3 

Takes physical fitness above and J as 

beyond . . . to Synergize your body. F wig if 

Improves coordination. 
One of the only clinically siress- 

tested body conditioning programs 

today. Exhilarating musical, 

hardwork and fun 

So what are you waiting for. 

“Call now and join your 

neighbors.” 
it's your best filness alternative. 

736-6083 
Over thirty dasse< in Kent County. 
Two classes in Ha rington ! 
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Fin : | 

| 1 9 a or Cubed Stock 2 99|b. 

1lb. Vac-Pac * Bottom Round Roasts (Well Trimmed) 209b. { & 

1.291b. Eye of Round Roasts (Well Trimmed) 9 99|pb, 
Ground Round ~ 5lbs.or Mo reqs J RS 

Lo (Extralean) 2 19|b. 2. 09lb. 3 viz” 

{. ay's Old Fashi r Loaf ’ © 0 IAL Boss s 2 Foe ion or B.B.Q. Loa Dairy Market 
villens (Deli - Slice ~ Country Enri 

\ resh Pork Sausag ly Enriched 
White 2g=lele 

20 oz. Loaf = T= A 

1) 

ie 

Homemade 

  

2.29lb. 
dda sade oiinth leliadat dali 
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1.49 Tasters     

£ X |  WIN$100,000 | “=> | 
x 

x ‘Or eo’ | 

i  INPRIZES icoccidiwa, " 0" x 
x . N\A 

Downy” x Cookies ) 1 fe 

Fabric Softener Xe In 4 Di A Al i SS h : ica : 150z.Bag \ Gy | 

33 oz. Container ; x 1.1 9 $d 

29° Sweepstakes % Morton's 
X 2 Ch | 

( "Lucky Charms” k Redearmnyourcoupons on these fine produc Macoroni & Cheese | 

Breakfast Cereal x Casserole ol 

140z.Pkg. x a 
Xx 
x 
x 
x 

} 1 

- : . WR A 

Sor OO 
. FREEZE 

3 DRIED 

: ; e 

    

  

  

    
  

  

  

1 Choice § becattemated 

| | ion S Honey Buns { 1 
10 qt. a Can 

UR 

Yellow Texas Onions $ 3 9 9 
| 

Taster's Choice Nestea 
Instant Cotes Nlnstant Tea 

  New Crop 
£ Bartlett Pears 
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{ 
{ 59°lb. Philadelphia $ 

Cream Cheese § ¢?® 
( | 8oz. Pho, 

! 69° . dn t PHILADELPHIA 

} 2Litre Container Toll House Morsels  % J\ CREAM CHEESE 
\ sabia ibalsiob slate toalnlalnidlelalatels . | | pn 

as We reserve the right to limit CITE 1 {[E rt | DORM AN STREET 

For your shopping convenience, we are open every day of the year! “Phone 398. 8768 HARRINGTON, DE. vo   
Sp
d 
d
D
 

gn
 

br
i 

—-—
 

et 
oe 

ao 
= 

® 
+ 

pd
 

y
t
 

Ch
 

O
D
D
 

a
 
i
 an
y 

Gy
 

Ts
 
a
 

A
 

ha
 
T
y
 

h
o
 

TA
R 

Ca
m 

i 
0 

TN
S 

a 
al
y 
D
e
n
 

ll
 
o
S
)
 

me
)


