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Harrington Council holds public hearing for new town hall 
HARRINGTON, City Hall - Last 

Wednesday night the Town Council 
members met to present three 
properties under consideration as 
possible sites for the proposed new 
Town Hall. “This meeting here tonight 
is to let the citizens of Harrington know 
that we have these properties under 
consideration. Those who came here 
tonight can ask questions following the 
presentation by Councilmen Ray 
Gagne and Curtis Melvin”, said Jackie 
Wyatt who was filling in for Mayor 
Alfred G.B. Mann who it was believed 
was still in Kansas following the death 
of his mother. The three properties 

   

under consideration as being the final 
three the building committee thought 
warranted the most consideration are 
as follows: 1-a lot on the corner of 
Liberty Street and Gordon Street 
belonging to the Catholic Church; 2-the 
building which was the former Peoples 
Bank, and 3-a building belonging to 
Gayle Smith on Commerce Street 
across from Burton's Sport Shop. The 
latter is the one the committee 
strongly advises the City to purchase. . 
The lot would cost $12,500 plus a steel 

building of $85,000 making the total 
$97,500.00. The Peoples Bank building 
would cost $65,000 for the purchase 
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Man freed following 

fatal shooting 
Curtis Harmon of Lake Forest Mobile 

Home Estates was freed last week 
after Judge Trader, Kent County 
Court of Common Pleas, ruled that 
there was not enough evidence to 
support the charge of manslaughter 
placed against him. Harmon had been 
arrested on December 7 following the 
fatal shooting of Gary A. Wilson, also 
of Lake Forest Mobile Home Estates. 
At the preliminary hearing, Judge 
Trader released Harmon saying he had 
the right to defend himself. He shot 
Wilson when the latter came to his 
home and threatened him with two 
knives. 
Delaware State Police at Troop 3 

investigated the shooting that occurred 
at the Lake Forest Mobile Home Park 
on U.S. Rt. #13, 1%» miles south of 
Felton at 8:40 p.m. on Monday, 
December 6. Investigation revealed 
that Gary A. Wilson, 27, of Lot 9, Lake 
Forest Mobile Homes, Felton, 
Delaware and Curtis B. Harmon, 30, of 
Lot 70, Lake Forest Mobile Homes, 
Felton, Delaware got into an argument 
at the trailer home of Wilson. Wilson is 

alleged to have gone to his kitchen and 
got two knives placing a knife in each 
hand and demanded Harmon to leave 
his residence, Harmon complied and 
proceeded to his residence where he 
removed a .22 caliber revolver from his 
bedroom. Harmon was in his trailer 
when he heard Wilson drive up. 
Harmon went out to meet Wilson still 
in possession of the revolver and 
confronted Wilson who was still 
carrying the two knives, one in each 
hand. Harmon allegedly shot Wilson 
when he feared for his own safety due 
to Wilson not stopping his advance 
toward him. Wilson was struck in the 

right shoulder and abdomen. Wilson 
was given emergency treatment at 

Milford Memorial Hospital but died at 
10:50 P.M. Harmon was charged with 
manslaughter and taken to J.P. Court 
#7, Dover, where secured bond was set 
at $15,000. Harmon was first 
incarcerated at Delaware Correctional 
Center Smyrna, in default of bond. But 
he was released after the December 9 
preliminary hearing. 

  

See Parade Results & Pics on Page 3 
  

Harrington Police last week respond- 
ed to the scene of a shooting with 
thoughts of arresting the man who 
wielded the gun. Instead they 
apprehended the person who was shot. 

It turned out that Howard John 
Benson, 61, of 112 Milby St., 
Harrington, was shooting in self 
defense when he wounded Willis Troy 
Matthews, 21, of Clark’s Corner, 
Harrington. Matthews and a compan- 

ion, Lawrence Lee Casson, also of 
Clark’s Corner, were trying to break 

  

into Benson's house. 
Harrington Police were called to the 

area when someone reported that 

Matthews was shot as he attempted to 
enter the house to borrow $2 from 
Benson. The original claim was that 
Benson shot at him through the door. 

It took about an hour for police to 
persuade the wary Benson to open the 
door. However, when he did, his story 
confirmed police suspicions when they 
examined the physical scene. There 

plus $45,000 for interior renovations 
and another eighteen thousand five 
hundred dollars for incidentals for a 
total of $128,500. The Smith building 

would cost $59,000 (140,000 for the 
building and $19,000 for the house to 

the rear) plus other expenses including 
furnishings, paving, landscaping, 
remodeling the front of the building 
and a contingency fund for a total of 
$118,500. 
ihe committee rated the Smith 

Building as the best prospect, the new 
builidng second best and the Peoples 
Bank least of all. Other properties such 
as the Harrington Cleaners and the lot” 
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between the cleaners and Raughley 
Insurance and a lot owned by Dudley 
Willis on the south side of Peck Avenue 
were not considered. 
- The increase in the tax rate would be 
according to the following chart: 

The Tax Rate Increase Per $100 

based on 9% Mortgage Rate 
Years Lib. St. Peoples Smith 

in cents Bank Building 
in cents lin cents 

5.11.6 10 9.2 
10 71 6.2 5.6 
15 5.7 4.9 4.5 
The proposal for a new City Hall will 
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be put on the ballot during the City's 
election coming up on January 11th. It 
will be on the ballot in the form of a 
referendum. It must pass by the voting 
public before the City Council could 
proceed. Talk around the council table 
on Wednesday led to the conclusion 

that perhaps the new hall could be paid 
off in fines. The new shop building 
going up near the water tower was 
underwritten by fine money. “We 
programmed $28,000 for fines in the 
'82 budget. All of the fines went into 
the General Fund plus all excess went 
there too. The net result is the building 
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The first snowfall of the year, a hefty one for December, gave the area a pre-Christmas coating of 
white as temperatures dropped to the frigid teens and below on Sunday, Monday and Tuesday. 
Harrington police are warning area motorists that snow emergency routes will be strictly enforced. 
Several cars parked in violation of those routes have already been towed. 

Harrington man fires in self defense 
was no bullet hole through the door. 
Benson told police he shot Matthews 
when the latter forced the door open. . 

It turned out this was not the first 
time Matthews had given Benson 
trouble. In October they robbed him of 
$175, and on November 2, Matthews 
alone beat him up and took $150. 
Neither incident was reported to the 
police. 
This time, however, Benson decided 

to take action in his own defense. When 

Matthews forced his way into the 
residence, Benson shot him in the 

upper right chest with a 22 caliber colt 
action rifle. 

In addition to Matthews and Casson 
police arrested Kevin Flamer and 
Leroy Polk, both 17 and both of 
Harrington. The two youths had 
accompanied the older men. 
Polk and Flamer were committed to 

Stevenson House in default of $10,000 
bond. They have since been released. 

Casson is in Delaware Correctional 
Center, Smyrna in default of $10,000 
bond. The wounded Matthews is in 
Delaware Division in Wilmington. 
Charges against the four are 

burglary second degree and attempt- 
ed theft. 

Harrington police said further 
charges against Matthews and Casson 
are pending. Benson was not charged. 
State Police at Troop 3 assisted in the 

investigation. : 

Frederica 

woman 

arrested on 

drug charges 
At 8:00 a.m. on December 3, 

Delaware State Police arrested Regina 
R. Pastre, 30, of the High Point Trailer 
Park, Frederica, Delaware. Ms. Pastre 
was charged with one count of 
possession with intent to deliver 
marijuana and one count of promoting 
prison contraband. The arrest 
culminated a six month investigation 
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going up now around the water 
tower....the City pound.” said 
Councilman Curtis Melvin. 

It was also pointed out that senior 
citizens would not be exempt from the 
property taxes. Their exemption would 
be as it relates to the capitation tax. 
Former Mayor Alfred B. “Buck” Cahall 
called for applying fines now to the 
property tax “...which would reduce 
the current taxes that would help some 
people here in the City”. The property 
taxes under the plan presented would 
mean an increase of $12 to $15 per 
property. 

INC | 
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Call Santa! 
Hey Boys and girls: 

How would you like to be able to call 
and talk to Santa and his elves and tell 
them what you would like for 
Christmas? I bet if you call him and 
then write him a letter, he will be sure 

to pack his sleigh with your presents 
right on top!!! 

On Thursday and Friday nights, 
December 16 and 17, Santa and his 
elves will make a stop in Harrington to 
talk to you on the telephone. Santa will 
be reached at 398-3232 from 6 p.m. 
until 8 p.m. on Thursday night and 7 
p.m. until 9 p.m. on Friday night. 
Then he'll be rushing away in his 

sleigh with your Christmas lists and 
letters to get ready for Christmas eve. 
Be sure to get your Mom and Dad to 

help you call Santa. He wants to talk to 
all the little boys and girls that he can!!! 

Merry Christmas 

Jaycees say 
i h a n k S 99 

The Harrington Jaycees would like to 
express their sincere thanks to) the 
following individuals and organizations 
for their various contributions of time, 
money and merchandise towards the 
Harrington Jaycee Christmas Parade. 
Without them this parade would not 
have been possible. 
City of Harrington, Harrington City 

Police, The Peoples Bank of 
Harrington, Taylors Hardware Com- 
pany, The First National Bank of 
Harrington, Pat Kohut, Janet Rettig, 
Lynn Outten, Harrington Foodrite, 
Watkins Auto Supply, Raymond 
Brown, Taylor and Messick, CATV- 
Harrington, - David Jones, John 
Bartsh, Carol Marker, Judi Walls and 

Lawrence Price. 
Harrington Chamber of Commerce, 

Graphics Unlimited, Frankie Hend- 
ricks, Harrington Fire Company, 
Delaware Fire Police, Randy Fergu- 

son, Merrymakers Club, Donald 
McKnatt, Maria McClellan, Marge 

McClellan, Jehu Camper. 

  

SORRY 
We failed to check our 

arithmetic. Last Tuesday was the 
41st, not the 51st anniversary of 
Pearl Harbor. Thanks to all alert 
readers who reminded us. 

  

SANTA CLAUS WILL BE IN 

HARRINGTON 

Recent word from the North Pole 

indicates that Santa Claus will be 

in Harrington each Saturday from 

pow until Christmas. Santa’s 

house is located on the vacant lot 

across from the Harrington Post 

Office and will be open from noon 

to 2:00 P.M. each Saturday. All 

good little girls and boys are 

invited to visit Santa Claus and 

Charter members of the Burrsville Ruritan Club helped the local chapter by detectives assigned to Troop 4, 
Georgetown. Investigators determined 
the woman to have smuggled 
marijuana into the Sussex Correctional 

celebrate its 23rd birthday last Thursday. They are [from left] Bill Parker, 
Russell Bowdle, Morris Adams, Wayne Geisel and Robert T. Collins. Founded in 
1928 in Hollandville, Virginia, Ruritan has become the largest rural civic 
organization in the country. Its purpose along with service to the community is 

  
Ruritan of the Year, Richard Johnson, right, says he was “totally surprised” by 

  

Ruritans celebrate “Blue Ribbon’ year 
The Burrsville Ruritan Club marked 

its 23rd anniversary last week with a 
banquet at the Harrington Fairgrounds 
Restaurant. In addition to their 
anniversary, the Ruritans celebrated 
earning the “Blue Ribbon” award for 
1982. The local club was one of only 
three out of fifty Ruritan chapters in 
the district this year to earn that 
distinction. 

At the conclusion of the evening the 
Ruritan Club honored its outgoing 
president, Richard Johnson, by naming 
him “Ruritan of the Year”. 
The evening was also the occasion for 

the installation of officers for the 1983 

year and for “Ladies Night™ Ruritan 
wives and wives of deceased members 
were guests. 
The installation of the following 

officers was conducted by Herb 
Litoford, District Governor Elect: 
President - George Lacey, Vice 

President - Morris Adams, Secretary - 

Jerry Fletcher, Assistant Secretary - 
Stark McLaughlin, Treasurer - Wayne 
Spicher and Director (3 years) - Doug 
Hignutt. The other directors currently 
serving are Tom Webster and Carl 
Senos. 
New member Alvin “Buck” Thompson 

was initiated by Zone Governor 

Preston Beauchamp. 
Richard Johnson, emcee for the 

evening, gave a report of the club’s 
activities for the year during which he 
has served as president. The goal the 
service oriented Ruritans set for 1982 
was earning the Blue Ribbon award. 
That goal was achieved when the 
award was presented at the district 
convention in Quimby, Virginia last 
month. Johnson unveiled the banner 
announcing the award and detailed the 
club activities which helped the 
Ruritan earn it. 
In 1982 the Burrsville Ruritans: 
-donated money to three area fire 

companies, Harrington, Denton and 
Greensboro. 
-presented two scholarships - one to a 

student from North Caroline and 
another to one from Lake Forest. 

-made donations to American Field 
Service chapters at Lake Forest, 
Woodbridge and North Caroline High 
Schools. 

-sponsored a calf for a 4-H member to 
raise. 
-through five different money-making 

projects (two suppers, one auction and 
two food concession stands at private 

- sales) raised over $6,100. 

| : 1 : . . . i i li . . : b oa creating a climate of understanding between rural and urban people. The his selection. The choice was announced last week at the Burrsville Ruritan’s ing or Soha, 0 3 present their Christmas lists. 
Ji Burrsville Chapter, located near the Maryland-Delaware line, strives to maintain Christmas party and Ladies Night banquet by George Lacey. The choice is by distribute the contraband to other 

an even balance in membership between the two states. It now has 33 members. secret ballot. Johnson's wife, Shirley, is in the foreground. prisoners within the Sussex facility. HARINGY o FIRE COMPANY 

Regina Pastre is employed by the EE Eiki 
Department of Corrections. as an 
accounting assistant and bookkeeper 
within the Sussex County facility. She 
was arraigned at Magistrate Court 3 in 
Georgetown pending release or 
committal on a secured bond totalling 
$25,000. Ms. Pastre was suspended by 
the Department of Corrections with 
the intent to dismiss pending a 
departmental hearing. 

  

  

  

       



  

PAGE TWO pl THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL, HARRINGTON, DELAWARE WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 15, 1982 
  

W.T. Chipman Junior 

School Honor Roll 
1st Marking Period 
9/7/82 to 11/9/82 

7th Grade 
High Honors 
Melissa Allen, Beth Collinson, Deborah 
Endres, Kelly Jones, Tawnya Minner; 
Troy Rowland, Mathew Slaughter, 
Michelle Varney and David Welch 

Honors 
Lawrence Benson, Kevin Dill, Ronald 
Farmer, Candy Gamido, Tina Kalous- 
ek, Tina Harrington, Donna Longfel- 
low, Jeremy Maffett, Amy McClem- 
ents, Mary McGuire, Paige Parker and 
Sherri Parsons 
Honorable Mention 
Charles Caldwell, Kellie Campbell, 
Lisa Cartwright, Joseph Gohra, Kitty 
Jones and Melinda Washburn. 

| 

8th Grade 
High Honors 
Shawn Caulk, Derek Dill, Tracy 
Kepple, Rebecca Petrovich, Kristin 
Reid, David Towers, Rebecca Voras, 
Rebecca Williams, Teresa Wood, 
Randy Wrotten, Michelle Zdradzinski 
Honors" 
Robert Bates, Richard Brown, Helen 
Downing, Crystal Gibbs, James Green, 
Renee Green, Julie Keller, Linda 
Poore, Anita Vogt, Mary Walker, 
Jennifer White, Chelle Willets, Tammy 

Wix 
Honorable Mention 
Chad Casey, Carla Casper, Pam Cohee, 
Tami Killen, Lisa Luckenbach, Dawn 
Mecllroy, Dionne Moore, Monica 
Morris, Randall Myers, Eric Payne, 
Mark Scarbourgh, Rose Vilone 

  

  The Smith building, Commerce St., Harrington, is one of the properties 

under consideration as the possible site for a new town hall. [See story on page 

one]. 
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...good enough to wear 
the Wrangler brand! 

Wrangler — the name means quality, styl 
ing, comfort and durability. When we - 
make a pair of boots, they must fit this 
Wrangler tradition. Discriminating boot 
buyers ask for Wrangler Boots because 
they recognize the smart styling and ap- 

preciate the all-day comfort. They buy 
again and again because they know 

Chick Harness & Supply, Inc. 
Rt. 13 ¢ Harrington, DE 

398-4630 

Open 7 Days A Week 

and Wed.; Thurs., Friday evenings *til 9 p.m. 

2 

MIERTCA 
08919264 B 
m———_ 

Wrangler's quality and durability. 
See for yourself. First time 

boot buyer or seasoned vet- 
eran, once you try a pair of 
Wrangler Boots, your feet 
won't accept anything less. 

  
  

DON'T JUST LET YOUR MONEY “CHAT AWAY” "TIL THE LAST WORDS 
YOU HEAR ARE “GOODBYE!” 

Have a chat instead with one of our bank investment counselors from whom 
you'll get expert advice in getting the highest return for your money....with 
certificates of deposits which are federally insured to give you a higher interest 
yield; with asset protection and secure retirement insurance plans....to name 
some of the astute ways to invest! 

For more encouraging words about your investment future, see us today for a 
talk about tomorrow! 

The Peoples Bank of Harrington 
“The Friendly Bank” 

Clark-Hanley St. 398-3256   HIBHIAL DPT AAAANC) CORPORATION 

     

   
    

  

     

  

    
    
    
    
    

  

      

  

    
    

    

      

   

  

Lake Forest North 
Honor Roll 

Grade 3 
High Honors 
Andrew Jackson 
Honors 

Frederick Feutz, Tammy Harvey, 
Samantha Kornrumpf, Elizabeth Kos- 
lowski, Robert Nechay, LaTanya 
Pittman, Katrina Shelman, Mark 
Steele, Ben Walters, Kerry White. 
Grade 4 
High Honors 
Brian Haley 
Honors 

Amy Bryan, Drew Hammond, Stacey 
Hopkins, Angie Kennedy, Craig Killen, 
Anna Nichols, Randy Thompson, 
Michelle VanNess, Danny Voshell, Al 
Wood. 
Grade 5 
Honors Honors 
Chris Sluter 
Honors 

Kim Dannenhauer, Rob Hawkins, 

Wendy Pizzadili, Shelly Shockley, 
Mike VanNess 

Grade 6 
High Honors 
David Brock, Jinny Crouch, Theresa 

Flanagan, John Hensley, Brandy 
Markland, Paul Voshell ‘ 
Honors 

Brian Bassett, Sandy Brown, Lisa 
Buswell, Jeff Ford, Kim Gibbs, Crystal 
Greenley, Rachel Gussett, Charles 
Harris, Patricia Mason, Noah Mathay, 
Stacey Mosley, Tony Mosley, Kelly 
Rawding, Michele Ryder, Lor 
Schieferstein, Jennifer Slack, Scott 
Talley, Keith Thompson, Susan Welch... 
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IF YOU HAVE HOLIDAY 
CLOTHING or WINTER WOOLENS 

1 THAT ARE IN NEED OF 
A CLEANING. YOU CAN BE 
SURE OF PROFESSIONAL 
SERVICE and CARE at.. 

Capitol Cleaners 
FREE PICK-UP & DELIVERY e 4 Locations 

674-0500 

qd 2 AAT] 
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Community Calender 
  

SHOPPING SPREE RESCHEDULED 
Join us for the 4th Annual Christmas 

Shopping Spree for Children co-spon- 
sored by Kent County Levy Court and 
the City of Dover Recreation 
Department. This special program is 
designed to give children the 
opportunity to shop “on their own” for 
present. Come Sunday, December 12 
between 1 and 4 p.m. to the Dover 
Park on White Oak Road where 
merchants from Capitol Office, Roots & 
Branches and Wicker Phantasy will 
offer gifts priced five dollars and 
under. Honor Society members from 
Caesar Rodney, Holy Cross and Lake 
Forest High Schools will assist children 
with gift selection and wrapping. While 
children select those secret purchases, 
parents may relax around a fire place 
and enjoy this fun filled family outing. 
For additional information, phone the 
Kent County Recreation Office at 
736-2090. HE 
IN PROGRESS - The Lake Forest 

Student Government Association is 
offering Lake Forest key chains for 
sale at 85 cents each. Anyone 
interested who has not been contacted 
by an SGA member can call the high 
school at 284-9291 for information. 

DECEMBER 13-18 - Local represen- 
tatives of the Bureau of the Census will 
conduct a survey of employment in this 
area during the work week of 
December 13-18, 1982. 

WESLEY CONT. ED. REGISTRA- 
TION - The Office of Continuing 
Education registration for the Spring 
Semester at Wesley College will be 
held from December 13 - 23 and from 
January 3 - 12. Students may register 
at the Office of Continuing Education 
located at 34 North State Street or at 
Dover Air Force Base, Building 520, 

Room 227 between 9 a.m. and 8 p.m. A 
special evening registration will be 
held on Monday January 10 from 7 - 8 
p.m. at the Information Desk located 
on the first floor of the College Center. 
For further information, or a brochure, 
call 736-2484. 

DECEMBER 16 - No-till farmers may 
want to mark December 16 as the date 
for the ninth annual Mid-Atlantic 
No-till Conference, to be held at the 
York County Fairgrounds in Pennsyl- 
vania. In previous years this 
conference has been held in early 
January. The change was made to 
avoid conflict with the annual 
Northeastern Weed Science Society 
meetings, held in early January in New 

York. 

Conference chairman John P. Harris 
says the change to December 16 should 
also encourage more exhibitors to 

«viparticipatey. since the early January 
‘date “came” very ‘close to the 
Pennsylvania Farm Show, and in the 
past the close scheduling may have 
eliminated some exhibitors. 
DECEMBER 16 - A special Christmas 

program will be held, Thursday, 
December 16th at 7:30 p.m. at the 
Woodbridge Basics School. A short 
play “Shoemaker and the Elves” is 
being presented by Mrs. Shaw’s and 
Mrs. Cannon's second grade classes. 
Everyone is invited to attend this 
special program. Refreshments will be 
served. Sponsored by the Basics School 
PTSA. 

DECEMBER 15 - DECEMBER 22 - 
Adult Evening Programs Registration 
for vocational and technical subjects 
will be held at the Kent County 
Vo-Tech Center, Woodside from 9 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. beginning December 15, 1982 
through December 22, 1982 and again 
from January 3, 1983 until January 
17th, 1983. On January 4th there will 
be a night registration from 7 to 9 p.m. 
These registration dates are for 43 
different vocational courses that will 
meet for the next 12 weeks. For more 
information call Kent Co. Vo-Tech at 
697-3257. 5 
DECEMBER 18 - There will be a 

microwave demonstration at Peck 
Bros. Supply/Southern States Store on 
213 Harrington Ave. from 10:00 - 
12:00. The demonstrator will be Sally 
Foulk. There will be door prizes, free 
recipes and samples. Everyone is 
invited! Sponsored by the Farm Home 
‘Advisory Committee. 

JANUARY 19 Real Estate 
Salesperson’s Course will be offered by 
Wesley starting January 19, pending 
approval of the Real Estate 
Commission. The course will be held on 
Monday and Wednesday evenings from 
7 - 9:45 p.m., with some Saturday 
morning classes. For further informa- 
tion on the Real Estate Salesperson’s 
Course, contact Mrs. Repp, Program 
Coordinator at 734-2492. : 

DECEMBER 19 - A Christmas 
cantata, “Born to Die”, will be 
presented at the Independent Bible 
Fellowship Church, Liberty Street, 
Harrington, at 7 p.m. 

DECEMBER 19 - There will be a 
candlelight Christmas Service at 
Griffith's Chapel in Williamsville on 
December 19 at 4:00 sponsored by the 
Williamsville Historical Society. 

DECEMBER 22 - The annual Lake 
Forest High School Christmas 
Program combining the Drama and 
Music departments will be held 
Wednesday, December 22, 1982 at 7:30 
p.m. in the High School Auditorium. 
Donations will be accepted at. the door. 

3T 12-22 
DECEMBER 17 - This week a Kent 

County Christmas tradition is repeated 
with a special evening opening of five 
historic sites on December 17th from 7 
to 9 p.m. 
The Division of Historical and 

Cultural Affairs invites the public to 
participate in a candlelight tour of the 
Old State House on the Dover Green, 
The Delaware State Museum on South 
Governor's Avenue in Dover, and the 
John Dickinson Mansion, Octagonal 
Schoolhouse and Allee House, all on 
Route 9 east of Dover. 
Santa Claus will be making an 

appearance at each location and holiday 
refreshments will be served at the 
Allee House. ol 
DECEMBER 17 - W.T. Chipman 

Band and Concert featuring traditional 
Christmas music and including 4 small 
ensembles: a saxophone quartete, a 
brass choir, a flute trio and a woodwind 
ensemble. Concert time is 7:30 p.m. at 
the Chipman Field House in 
Harrington. 

REGISTER UNTIL DECEMBER 22 - 
The Adult Education Division of the 
Kent County Vocational Technical 
School District is 
registrations for the following new 
courses at our Woodside Campus: 
General Office Practice; and at our 
Kent North, Dover location Commer- 
cial Foods Preparation, Retail 
Salesmanship and Security Guard 
Training. They will all start during the 
week of January 17, 1983. 
Registration will be held at the Adult | 

Education Office, Kent Center, 

Woodside daily from 8:30 A.M. to 4:00 
P.M. until December 22, 1982 and from 

January 3, 1983 up to the 1st night of 
class. : 

For more information call Mr. 
Rummell at 697-3257. 

DECEMBER 14 - 

The Harrington Rotary Club, Melvin 
Luff, President, is looking forward to 
its annual Christmas party scheduled 
for Tuesday evening, December 14, at 
the Blue Coat Inn, Dover, at 6:30 p.m. 

Continued on Page 8 
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1 8 ;  — ; 12-15 MOBILE HOMELOTS 1222 FURNITURE 1215 EQUIPMENT 7 | DECORATED CAKES 1222 CHIMNEY SWEEP 1222 THRIFT SHOP 

I] Decorated Cakes For 0 ° EW BOUTIQUE 
44 ip All Occasions Old Mill Chimney Sweeps NEARLY Ni ; HIGHPOINTMOBILEHOMEPARK | $ 2 TAYLOR & MESSICK, INC. WoidingecBoaeys, | 737 Prtesonal Thrift Shop : . : ; ) i tan DELUXE MOBILE HOME LIVING pes > Shu: JOHN DEERE FARM EQUIPMENT Showers. Current Novelty ~ Serving Kent DEPRESSION PRICES *LARGE LOTS * PLAYGROUNDS Cp LAWN AND GARTEN IA IPYENT Cakes Including Smurf, uss CLOTHES FOR THE ENTIRE 

*CONVENIENT LOCATIONe POOL FURNITURE STRIPPING By Two-Way Radio i ele Strawberry Shortcake OVES FAMILY 
* Laundromat Phone 398-3729 np 1 3] and Pac Man : ¢ Woo 31 Camden Shop U.S.1138113A Frederica Wotan | Road 370-Near Kent Vo-Tech Harrington, DE | ..0..... Mary Trzepacz - 284-3327 Licensed and FIRE PLACES 697-6866 

; WOODSIDE, DEL. Phone 302-697-3550 Felton. DE 19943 Insured CAPS & LINERS 697-68 

PHOTOGRAPHIC SPECIALIST 1222 JANITORIAL 12°15 CONCRETESAND TF BUILDING SUPPLIES 12-29 FUELOIL 1215 | 
[J ° ® ° : 5 : / 2 * 

RPS Studio Reliable Janitorial & Carpet | Biavions Ss ie) vel Ine, Woodside Surplus Sales Peninsula Oil Co. 
Photographic Specialist Cleaning Services Topsoil Stone oodasi p Fuel Qil, Kerosene, Gasoline & 
110 N. Washington St. © Select & Regular Fill Dirt Lumber. Windows, Siding, Doors, Molding, Plywood, Sttioar urne I Bs Milford, Delaware 19963 «Office Cleaning® Delivered or Loaded on Your Truck Buti, Ieulstion Refinishing, Paneling isvenying Bat Dispates Tok i 

(302) 422-5532 eFloor Stripping e Window Cleaninge PIT LOCATION: 1 Mile off LER Woodside Traffic Light on S. Bound Lane of U.S. 18. Saati able 
) Milford Harrington Rd. Shaw Ave. & Rt. 13, Portraits » Weddings 422.6301 Free Estimat RITTER Weekdays 8-5 Sat. 8-1 284-4134 | “rringion. De. 398-8344 
Copy & Restoration ee Esti es : 
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1982 Christmas Parade Winners Scenes fr om Jaycees 

  

    

  

  

  

    
      

  
  

  

  

  

  

  

    

  

              
  

  

      

3 @ 
Grand Prize 4-H Clubs Ch i P d 4 @ Harrington Brownie Troop 332 1st - Harrington Sunshine 4-H r iS mas ar a e 

Equestrian - 1st 2nd - Viola Fire Flies 4-H ; 
The Peoples Bank of Harrington Decorated Autos 

Commercial Floats 1st - Bob’s Wrecker Service 
Ist - First National Bank of 2nd - Vicki Ivins - 

Harrington 3rd- Country Flowers 
2nd - All Rite Rubbish Removal Marching Units 

Non-Commercial Floats 1st - Felton Odd Fellows Lodge 
1st - First State Coon Hunters 2nd - Marion Tracy Dance School 

2nd - Harrington Baptist Church Fire Company 
3rd - Harrington Fire Company Ladies 1st - Camden Wyoming Fire Company 

: Auxiliary 2nd - Greenwood Fire Company 
qo Fire Company with Marching Unit 

| Cub Scouts 1st - Felton Fire Company and Little 

1st - Bridgeville Cub Scout Pack 166 Creek Fire Company - tied 
2nd - Felton Cub Scout Pack 141 2nd - Ellendale Fire Company 

Girl Scouts : Individual 
1st - Harrington Girl Scout Troop 686 1st - Mike Smith and Mark Barter 
2nd - Milford Girl Scout Troop 185 ~~ -2nd - ET 

Brownies ’ High School Bands 

1st - Harrington Brownie Troop 332 1st - Milford High School Band 
2nd - Milford Brownie Troop 232 Junior Bands 

| Boy Scouts 1st - Dover Central Middle School 

{ NS 1st - Felton Boy Scout Troop 141 2nd - Milford Middle School 
2nd - Harrington Boy Scout Troop 76 3rd - Woodbridge Junior High School 

(@ 

(® 

BIN GO Every Sunday Night acy. 4p | ; 
ington Fi J Auto & Weld 7:30PM. Harrington Fire House 9 {3 Uto ewamg 

Mechanic Street 398-8931 2 Rt. 10, Sandtown, DE 

(C Early Bird Games - $50 Free Admission Mig & Tig Tune Ups 
: Cash Prizes $15-$50 

Milford Arc & Acet Brakes : 
| SH Fl / | Exhaust 

Postmaster ) $s NEE. thine! pass Specializing in E fd A . 

'0FF{ Everything ap pointed 20 ver, ing. Aluminum & 

(C5 John T. Bailey has been appointed S ia Stainless Steel Repairs on 
» postmaster of Milford, DE 19963, it anta savs: x » 

was announced last week by William F. 4 . ” Fabrication : all Makes 
Bolger, Postmaster General of the U.S. : ~ . 
Postal Service. D ont Miss This! Farm Machinery i 
Mr. Bailey was one of 15 postmasters . 8. w . 

appointed simultaneously in the states 20 % OFF NIG HT Trailers & Specializing in 
of Maryland, New York, Pennsylvania, [ GIVE YOUR : Hitches N 
Virginia and West Virginia. 
The effective date of their [ALE7A LT Tuesday, December 21 v k Grill Volkswagen 

appointments must be within 30 days i Hy 3 
of November 27, 1982. 3 hrs. oo. -5t08 P: m. ne b Fis G Toyota 

$Y mri acks Miss Shelley Obhanenial Yon Datsun 
Perkins is the Taylors Hardware Nameits Honda 
new Miss Commerce St. Harrington, DE 
Delaware-USA Advertise ir. “Everything in store 20% off except sale items 398-3291 Te lephone 284-9066 
1983 3 HARRINGTON appliances. 

; Shelley Perkins, of Newark 
{ was crowned Miss Del- JIM DICKINSON 
~ aware-USA on Saturday, 

December 4, 1982 in : 302-422-3000 
Milford. She was chosen 
from 19 entrants from all ! 
over the State to represent 
Delaware at the 1983 Miss 
USA pageant in Biloxi, 
Mississippi next year. Per- 
kins, 21, of Newark was ; 
sponsored by Newark Farm B RAN D NAM E TOYS - GAM ES - Vi D EO 

=H and Home Supply in : 
() Newark, and works as an 

administrative assistant at 
Neilson Business Equipment 

Center in Newark. 
First runner-up was Miss 

Sherry Smith of Wilming- 
ton, 2nd runner-up was Miss 
Meghan Malone of Newark, 

p 3rd runner-up was Miss 
Carla George of Wilmington 
and 4th runner-up Miss 

0 Karen Adams from Wilm- 
of ington. The Miss Congenial- 

ity title was awarded to 
wo Marti Barrows from Mary- 

del. 
A crowd of 650 attended 

the pageant at the Milford 
High School and enjoyed a 
beautiful show produced by 

MILFORD PLAZA SHOPPING CENTER MILFORD. DE 19963 

  

   
| World of Barbie Barbie Cosmetics 

Reg. Sale 

  

    

E ie Mike Sonor Midnight (Barbie’s Horse) $13.99 $12.85 Lots-O-Lip Gloss 5 
: Western Skipper 10.95 6.95 Beauty Set All 10 % off at | 

> Bubble Bath 12.95 9.95 Cosmetic Case register from 

3 Electronic Piano 22.95 17.50 Jewelry regular low price | 

  

  Cologne 

AID MAITY MORRIS IIV-S1T0RIS SPBCLAILS: 

Snakes have an “egg” tooth 
which they use to hatch 
out of their shells. This 
tooth falls off shortly after 
hatching.        
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BB VALUABLE IB BEB VALUABLE IB BB VALUABLE BB VA f" | % & % a % f a LUABLE ma 

7 HUNTS iE 8B 3 VARIETIES 1) n TIDE KING BE B LIPTON 
] KETCHUP 8 8 SCOTT TOWELS @ i LAUNDRY DETERGENT ig § TEA BAGS 

Bl wozeomne $1 49 g Bl nous 3 / $2-00 & Bl @ozeox $2.99 - B rwcreks $1 59 

8 EXPIRES DEC. 18, 1962 J i EXPIRES DEC. 18, 1982 4 | EXPIRES DEC. 18, 1982 ] EXPIRES DEC. 18, 1982 
® WITH COUPON & $10.00 PURHCASE pe WITH COUPON & $10.00 PURHCASE : WITH COUPDL. & $10.00 PURCHASE WITH COUPON & $10.00 PURCHASE | 
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: BF 
SLICED 

1B gh    

SPLIT CHICKEN BREAST 
POLSKA KIELBASA, SMOKED SAUSAGE OR BEEF SMOKED SAUSAGE 

HILLSHIRE FARMS 
SKINNED & DEVEINED 

BEEF LIVER 
ERE 

    
  

   

        
DELI ESSKAY CHICKEN BOLOGNA   

     

  

AVAILABLE AT STORES WITH 
DELICATESSEN. 

CUT TO YOUR LIKING" 
(ALL ITEMS DELI SLICED) 

  

PEPPERS . 

TANGELDS. . . 
BRED 

RADISHES . . 

  

2% 07. BOTTLE 
WESSON 0IL 

"HUNTS 8 OZ. CANS 

TOMATO SAUCE 
HUNTS 6 OZ. CANS 

‘TOMATO PASTE 

7 

sy 

3/50 

ESSKAY BAR-8-0 

SWIFTS 

SLICING PEPPERONI 
NEW YORKER 

MONTERAY JACK CHEESE 
“TENDER, TASTY MEAT & CHEESE CUSTOM 

CALIFORNIA NAVEL 

ORANGES . 
10/99¢1 Tomatoes 

SELECT 

CUCUMBERS . . . 

  

  
a3 TIQ THE SEASON TO BE THRIFTY 

HOLIDAY FOOD SAVINGS 

  

PA. DUTCH 16 OZ. PKG. 

NOODLES 
GENERIC WHITE PKG. OF 4 ROLLS 

TOILET TISSUE 

LOAF OR OLD FASHION LOAF. . . .“ 

      

    

  

    

    

    

wrote | Borrow Roun posst = ¥1-% 
SMOKED | |EAN SLICED BACON. . . ... 
PICNICS FRESH USDA 

  

         
  

    

    USDA INSPECTED GRAIN FED 
|OWA WHOLE 

BONELESS BOTTOM 

ROUND ROAST 

  

    
    

  

   

FRESH USDA INSPECTED 
ECON 0 PAK 

FRYING CHICKEN 
   
    

    

     

  

         
  

  

  

   

    
    

      

     

    

   

Fm 2 <u 
Nigr00 5 8 0B 
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sid 
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FOOD 

[03 HARRINGTON FOOD RITE ° 

  

    

  

   
   

   

BIRDS EYE 12 OZ CAN 

AWAKE 
‘B KRAFT LA CREME § 0 

TOPPING . . . . 
SNOW CROP BABY 16 02. 

he’ 
1% 

    
SNOW CROP 64 OZ. SIZE 
CHILLED 5 ALIVE FRUIT 

BEVERAGE. . . 
LOG CABIN 16 OZ. PKG. 

    
    

      

   

  

    
$1.39 

       

    

        

  

QUARTERS ¢ 

cane. 2/00 | wa seas. 5 
a FRENCH TOAST . 83° 

    OR BUTTER TASTIN 

BISCUITS. . 
SELATEST 7 GAL CONTAINER 
ORANGE 

JUICE, +t, 
KRAFT 16 OZ. PKG. 
CHEEZ 

WHIZ . . . .. 
SEALTEST 16 OZ. PKG. 
SOUR 

CREAM . . . .. 
SEALTEST 8 OZ PKG. 
3 VARIETIES 

DIPS 

COLES GARLIC WITH BUTTER 1 LB. 2p 
#1 39     TASTE 0 SEA 7 OZ. SHRIMP 

| DINNER . 
TASTE 0 SEA 8 OZ 6 

SEAFOOD . 
PS (@) x ; . EXC o . 

BA Va\Y 2 FO Sp - 

| ri LS REPS #03 3 P) 

           
          

OCEAN SPRAY 

CRANBERRY 
COCKTAIL 

269 
HUNTS 

PRIMA SALSA 
SPAGHETTI SAUCE 

9 
OT RESPONSIBLE FOR TYPOGRAPHICAL 

ERRORS - WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO 
LIMIT QUANTITIES. 

NESTLE'S 

SEMI-SWEET 
MORSELS 

159 128 OZ. 
SIZE 

12 0 
PKG. 

POST 40% 
BRAN FLAKES 

99 
PRICES EFFECTIVE THRU DEC. 18, 1982 

J VARIETIES 

32 0Z. JAR 

16 OZ 
BOX    

  

LOCALLY OWNED & OPERATED 

Quillen Shopping Center 398-4398 

Monday, Tuesday & Wednesday 8-6 
Thursday... .2..0i.. vives 8-8 
Friday... codidn divi dates 8-9 
Saturday’: cif na a ay 8-7 
Sunday ...:... 000 asain, 10-4 

di 

0) 

o 
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Over The Backyard Fence 
Local Interest 
by Joanne Wyatt 398-3943 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Greenley and 
family of Douglasville, Georgia would 
like to wish a very Happy Birthday to 
Barbara's sister, Kathy Marsan who 
will be celebrating on December 12, 
and to Barbara's Aunt Margie who will 
be celebrating on December 26, and 
also to her sister Becky Marsan, who 

will be celebrating on December 28th. 
Happy Birthday, Kathy, Aunt Margie 

and Becky! 
Belated Happy Birthday wishes go 

out to D.J. Banta! 
Little Miss Shelly Winkler celebrated 

her fifth birthday on Friday, December 
10. A party in her honor was held on 
Saturday afternoon at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Butler. It was attended 
by friends and family. All enjoyed cake 
and ice cream. Shelly also had a party 
with her classmates in Kindergarten on 
Friday. Happy Birthday Shelly! 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Bennett and 

Mr. and Mrs. John Winkler enjoyed 
dinner at the Avenue in Rehoboth on 
Saturday evening. The occasion was 
Richard and Debbie's anniversary. 
Happy Anniversary Richard and 
Debbie! 
Get well wishes go out to Mr. Leslie 

Simpson, Sr! 
Sympathy is extended to Mrs. 

Delores Swain on the death of her 
father. 
Get well wishes go out to Mr. Richard 

Bennett. 
Mr. and Mrs. Woodrow Welch spent 

Saturday evening with Mr. and Mrs. 
Carroll Welch, Sr. 
The Wesleyan men held their menthly 

prayer breakfast on Sunday morning, 
December 12. 
Happy Birthday wishes go out to 
Kelly and Billy Griffith! : 

, Mr and Mrs. Richard Pitlick have just 

  

returned from two weeks in the 
Hawaiian Islands. While there they 
celebrated their twenty fifth wedding 
anniversary. They visited the islands 
of Oahu, Molakaiki, Maui and Hawaii. 
A highlight of their trip was visiting 
the U.S. S. Arizona Memorial at Pearl 
Harbor on December 7. Happy 
Anniversary to the Pitlicks! 
Happy Birthday wishes go out to 

Danny Dill! 
Due to the snow on Sunday the 

Christmas program at Asbury United 
Methodist Church has been postponed 
until next Sunday morning December 
19. 

Happy Birthday wishes go out to 
David Jarrell! : 
Get well wishes go out to Mr. Woody 

Poore, Sr. 
Monday evening dinner guests at the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Brown 
were Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bradley and 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Coverdale. Other 
guests this week have been Mr. and 
Mrs. Frances Weldon of Wilmington, 
Mrs. Amy Price, Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Brown, Mrs. Linda Collins 
and son and Mr. and Mrs. Willard 
Cornish. 
Mrs. Gale Vogelien and daughter, 

Kate, have recently returned home 
after spending a week in Hawaii. 
Mrs. Joseph Voglien of Cherry 

Valley, N.Y. is spending the week 
visiting with her son and family Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard “Bean” Voglien. 
Mr. Rick Wyatt, Ms. Marianne Durr 

and sons, J.R. and Ronald of New 
Castle spent Monday evening visiting 
with Rick’s father and his brothers and 
their families. 

Well wishes to all, take care, share a 

smile, God bless. 

  

    

  

  
[Happy 42nd Wedding Anniver- 

sary to Mr. and Mrs. G. Klein 

Moore, Jr.] 

A MARRIAGE MADE 
IN HEAVEN 

I was always told, as a little girl, 
that God picked out our mate. 
Forget about “Love at first 

sight” or leaving it to fate. 

| 

Of all the matches made in 

Heaven, I can vouch for one. 
The closeness in this marriage 

can be compared to none. 

I've seen them when the times 
were rough, when others would 
have failed. 
But through thesé times, they 

stuck together and happiness 
prevailed. 

My Dad worked hard from dusk 
to dawn with very little sleep. 

> My Mother washed and sewed 
our clothes and tried to make ends 
meet. 

X I dways saw them happy, I 
never saw them sad. 
I never heard them fight or fuss, 

I never saw them mad. 

I'm sure they had their ups and       

  

  

think of childhood days, 

the years, “Let me count the 

ways”. 

by side, 

equal tn their pride. 

people, turn a HOUSE INTO A 
HOME. 

Happy Anniversary, Mom and 
Dad! 

$3 HCO Mr IC IC CD 

sosssnssssenssssne 

Seasons Greetings 

soossososos0008000 

    

downs, but not in front of us. 

them out before they caused a 
fuss. 

They must have always worked | 

I always think of “happy” when I | 

They loved each other through | 

42 years together, waking side | 

Sharing lfe’s ups and downs, 

  Their prayers together for us 
kids sustained us through the 
storms. 

The love they showed us through 
the years, is lke a fire that 
warms. 

Heaven, then sat back on His 

throne, 

Yes, God made this match in | 

A
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t
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And watched these two great 

Love, 

Carol Ann   

  
Harrington Sunshine 4-H 
The meeting of the Harrington 

Sunshine 4-H club was called to order 
by our President, Kim Zeitler. Keith 

Melvin led us in our pledges, Karen 
Taylor read us a Bible reading. Ricky 
Zareo read us a poem, Diana Russum 
led us in a song, Robin Zareo gave a 
safety report on Holiday Safety Tips 
and Karen Taylor gave a health report 
on the artificial heart. 
OLD BUSINESS (reports given as 

follows) - Thanksiving Favors - Dawn 
Russum; Jr. Council Meeting - Robin 
Zareo, Operation Reindeer - Karen 
Taylor; Family Night - Karen Taylor; 
Christmas Parade - Susie Melvin. 
Our club walked through the parade, 

dressed up in costumes from different 
countries. We won a first place trophy. 
Public Speaking - (People who 

entered stood up and told what they 
received. They are:) Karen Taylor - 
Blue ribbon; Kim Zeitler - Blue ribbon 
and plaque; Robin Zareo - Red ribbon; 
Janene Zareo - Blue ribbon; Ricky 
Zareo - Blue ribbon; Denise Yannucci - 
Blue ribbon; Susan Larimore - Blue 

ribbon; Dawn Russum - Red ribbon; 
Dina Russum - Red ribbon. 
NEW BUSINESS Gong Show 

entries will be due January 24. More on 
this later 

Teen Center will be January 22 & 23. 
More on this later. 
Jr. Council Christmas party will be 

held at Pat Jones’ house. It will be from 
7:00 to 9:30. Be sure to take your 
refreshments and gag gift. 
Christmas Favors - (Those who signed 

up are) Jodi Jacobson, Darryl 
Minner, Susan Larimore and Elaine 
Zeitler. Dawn Russum and Mrs. 
Melvin are in charge. 

March 23 - County Skating party. 
December 20 - Our club will hold its 

Christmas party and caroling. We will 
meet at the St. Sephens Church at 
6:30. We'll go caroling first, then we 
will go to Mrs. Zareo’s house for the 
party. Remember your gift for 
exchange. 

Kim Zeitler and Ricky Zareo did their 
speach that was for Public Speaking. 
The meeting was then turned over to 

Mrs. Everline. Dawn Russum has a 
demonstration to do next month. Bank 
clean-up next month is Mrs. Melvin, 
Susie Melvin, Keith Melvin, Ann 
Pearson, Jodie Jacobson and Tina 
Bunting. 

Refreshments next month is Robin, 
Janene and Ricky Zareo. 

Reporter, Dawn Russum 

. Karen Cohee, 

December 15, 

  

Senior Center 
by Dorothy Graham 

Smile! All to myself I think of you, 
think of the things we used to do, think 
of the things we used to say, think of 
each happy bygone day. Sometimes 
I sigh, and sometimes I smile, but I 
keep each olden, golden while all to 
myself. - Wilbur D. Nesbit. 
Reverend Watson chose as his topic 

for discussion, Chapter 13 of 
Corinthians. Reverend Watson said 
“Love is kind". Be careful of what you 
say to each other. He began and ended 
the Happy Hour with a prayer. Mrs. 
Watson was at the piano for all the 
favorite hymns and those present did 
enjoy the inspiration they received. 
Mamie Adams, Jo Burke, Marion 
Brown, Catherine Donovan, Gladys 

THE QUEEN AND HER COURT - Pictured are from left to right: Sherry Hill, Ethel Holden, Clara Judy, Sylvia, 
Smith, Wilmington, 1st runner-up; Karen Adams, Wilmington, 4th runner-up; Cecil Meredith, Mildred Vincent, Tony 
Shelley Perkins, Miss Delaware-USA 1983; Meghan Malone, Newark, 2nd Perrone, Frances Wright, Mary Sapp, 
runner-up; Carla George, Wilmington, 3rd runner-up and Marti Barrows, Virginia Smith, John McCready, 
Marydel, Miss Congeniality. Photo RPS Studio, Milford, DE. 

Frederica 
by Mary “Toby” Johnston 335-5487 

Frederica Ladies Auxiliary of The 
Volunteer Fire Company entertained 
their families and guests Saturday 
evening with a Christmas Buffet. 
The Christmas season is here - Don’t 

forget to visit a friend, relative, 
neighbor or an acquaintance. Knock on 
a door, wish someone a Merry 
Christmas and a Happy New Year, 
today, or any day before Christmas. 
Mother was just having breakfast 

when who should arrive but her cousin 
Mrs. Pearl Swain from Lincoln and Her 
daughter-in-law, Mrs. Dorothy Swain. 

It was so nice to have them. 
Mrs. Mary Purnell, Mrs. Elsie 

Stubbs, Mrs. Frances Davidson, Mr. 
and Mrs. Zora Tatman, Angelica 

Moore, Mr. Sam Shumar, Mrs. Rae 
Matlack and I attended the Christmas 
program as Sardis Church Sunday 
evening. 
The Frederica Trinity Choir sang. 

Attending were pianist Mrs. Elneta 
Harrington, Mrs. Eva Burrell, Mrs. 
Frieda Edge, Mrs. Marty Downing, 

Mrs. Kitty Shumar, Mrs. Helen 
Powers, Mr. Robert Mullane and Mr. 
Benjamin Matlack. 

December 19th The ‘Charge 

Christmas service will be at Saxton 
Church, Bowers at 7:30 p.m. Everyone 

is welcome. 

Friday, December 17th, M.Y.A.F. 
will serve the Highway Dinner at 
Trinity Church, 12 noon. Please call 
Virginia or Rae if you can help, 
Thursday and/or Friday. 
Santa will arrive to town Friday 

evening on the fire truck, December 
17th. 
A State Quilt is being made under the 

direction of Mrs. Emma Warner. Each 
block to be embroidered in State 
colors. A quilting bee will be held at 
the church after it is assembled. It will 
be given away at the Street Fair in 
June for a sum. See a member for 
details. 

Twice this year it has been my 
pleasure to renew old friends at the 
Corner Beauty Shop operated by Mrs. 
Carol Dodd. The first was seeing 
Nettie Gross Rogers. Tuesday, it 
was Pauline Dawson Reed of Houston. 
You can bet your boots our tongues 
really did a piece of wagging. Surely 
there has to be the third encounter. 
Looks and feels like winter is here. 

Frankly I like warmer weather. Guess 
the young ones would like snow and 
ice. 
To everyone and to all that are ill 

wherever they might be, our prayers 
and best wishes. May God Bless. 

Felton/Sandtown 
by Lola O'Day 284-9175 

BIRTHDAYS - Ray Starkey, Warren 
Draper, Greg Thompson, Beverly E. 
Beebe, Herman F. Woikoski, Bill 
Paskey, Dale Hall, Raymond P. 
Stewart, Jr., Tommy Greek, Larry 
Sipple, Herb Moore, Wayne E. 
Carlisle, Richard Crouse, Scott 
Stumpf, Joy Young, Carl W. Browne, 

Diane Welch, Earl 
Walters, Jack Grimm. 
ANNIVERSARIES - Mr. and Mrs. 

Kenny Martin, Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Cox, Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Hurd, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wm. E. Dill. 
Scott Stumpf entertained 10 children 

at the Burger King of Dover, at his 
10th birthday party. A good time, fun 
and games were enjoyed. 
The Felton Fire Co., Main Street, will 

be holding their Annual Christmas 
party for the children, sponsored by 
the Felton merchants, on Wednesday, 

at 7:00 p.m. The 
Chipman Band will furnish Christmas 
music for a sing-a-long, getting all in a 

Green wood 
by Pat Hatfield 

Report from Greenwood United 
Methodist Charge: Todd’s Christmas 
Dinner and play was held on December 
11 at 6:30. 
The Women's Society of the 

Greenwood Church held their Christ- 
mas dinner on December 6. A lovely 
program followed, arranged by Mrs. 
Nila Schulze including readings by Lee 
Anne Durig, and Mrs. Carl Schulze and 
music by members of the choir. The 
evening ended with the group singing 
carols. 
Don't forget this date: December 19, 

the Greenwood Christmas Cantata and 
pageant at 7 p.m. in the Greenwood 
church. 
Mrs. Pauline Morgan and daughter, 

and Mrs. Anne English of Houston 
were Sunday afternoon visitors of Mr. 
and Mrs. Allison Davis. 
Barbara Davis of Harrington was a 

Tuesday evening dinner guest of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Allison Davis. 

Talk to 

Santa! 
Moms and Dads, 
Your children can call and talk to 

Santa Claus on Thursday and Friday 
nights, December 16 and 17 for free. 
Calls will be taken by Santa or his elves 

from 6 p.m. until 8 p.m. on Thursday 
night and 7 p.m. until 9 p.m. on Friday 
night. Please encourage even the 
youngest child to talk to Santal!! The 
phone number is 398-3232. 

merry spirit for the holidays --- Ho! Ho! 
Ho! Here comes Santa Claus, arriving 
to welcome all a “Merry Christmas.” 
Pack 141, Cub Scouts Christmas party 

will be held at the Viola V.C.F. Ruritan 
Club, at 2:00 p.m., Sunday, December 
19, 1982. 
The Felton Annual Fire Co.'s 

Christmas party was held on December 
11, 1982, plenty of good food and 
merriment for all. 

The Knit Wit Craft Club will have 
their Annual Christmas party at Kathy 
Handley’s in Viola, time 7:30 p.m. An 
exchange of gifts, games and good 
food, for the evening's enjoyment on 
December 15th. 
The Viola Ladies Aide, held their 

Christmas party at Mrs. Grace 
Kersey’s, of Viola. The decorations 
arranged by her son, Lee, were 
beautiful, inside the home and outside. 
Refreshments were home baked and 
enjoyed. 

All of the R.S.V.P. group and the 
staff of the Cheer Center for the 
Greenwood Senior citizens enjoyed 
luncheon on Wednesday at the Hostess 
House. Thirty-one members were 
present. 
The Greenwood Cheer Center report 

a splendid success with their Christmas 
Bazaar and wish to thank all who came 
and helped. 
On Tuesday, the group went to the 

new Dover Mall for a shopping trip. On 
December 17 they will have their 
annual Christmas dinner at noon. 

TSC VC Ov SoA ~~ NOY ~~ ~~~ 

Dorothy Willey, Mary E. Nelson, 
Thelma 'Legates, Amy Poynter, 
Annabel Morrow, Elwood Morris and 
Florence Minner. 
The Jolly Timers all nineteen of them, 

were really singing of Christmas and it 
is absolutely beautiful! Sylvia was at 
the piano with Cecil, Mildred, Elwood, 
Elma, Andy Anderson, Bertha Dean, 
Ella Golt, Virginia, John, Lillie 
McBride, Gladys Hill, Annabel 
Morrow, Marion Brown, Ola Tildon, 
Roxanne Brown and Florence Minner. 
“Come on, you Senior Sounds, it's 

Gab Fest 
by Pat Hatfield 349-4255 
Rustle of paper; glitter of tinsel; what 

did I do with that list? No box will ever 
fit this; I'll just never get done on 
time!....Sound familiar? But then, you 
put the carols on the stereo, and they 
bring you their peace and their joy and 
you end up listening to Jim Nabors 
singing “O Holy Night” and once again 
you are overwhelmed with the true and 
holy meaning of Christmas. 
We are singing along with wee Garith 

“Rudolph, the Red-nosed reindeer”, 
“Here Comes Santa Claus, Right Down 
Santa Claus Lane;” “Up On the 
Houstop, Reindeer Pause, Out Jumps 
Good Old Santa Claus” and all the old 
favorites. But recently I shared with 

Garith an old, old Christmas song or 
poem that my mother used to recite to 
me. I wonder if any of you Senior 
citizens among our readers have known 
this one. It goes: “Christmas Eve is 

““ coming soon; “Now you dear-old man, 
Whisper what you'll bring to me; tell 
me if you can. Johnny wants a pair of 
skates; Susie wants a dolly, Nellie 
wants a story book; she thinks dolls are 
folly. As for me, dear Santa Claus, my 
little brain is not very bright. So, 
choose for me, dear Santa What you 

think is right!” ; 
I do not think the last lines made 

much impression on me as to the 
selection of gifts. I always knew what I 

Houston 
By Margaret Thistlewood 422-4944 

Mrs. Mildred Fisher is spending 
several weeks with her daughter and 
son-in-law Mr. and Mrs. John Faris of 
Las Vegas, Nevada and will visit her 
daughter Jean Atkinson of Camarillo, 
California for several weeks. 
Christmas service at Griffith Chapel 

will be held Sunday afternoon, 
. December 19th at 4 p.m. There will be 

lots of special music. Rev. Hugh Miller 
and Rev. Jackson Robinson will deliver 
the message. 
Ann and ‘Angelo Abbate vosuitly 

celebrated their 25th wedding 
anniversary. Their son and his wife 
Angelo and Nancy and their daughter 
Debbie had a surprise anniversary 
party for them held at the St. 
Bernadette Catholic Church of 
Harrington. They have recently moved 
into their new home. 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Hayes were 

recent dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Taubee and children of Lincoln. 

Anne’ s Kitchen 

Now on Sale at 
  

Food Rite 

Harrington Hairport 

Quiflens 

To Order By Mai 

P.0. Box 25 

  

Burtons Sport Shop 

Harrington Pharmacy Bodies Markets 

0'Biers Market 

and the 

5.50 per copy 

Anne Paladin 

Harrington, DE 19952 

Add 1.00 Extra for postage and handling 

Check or Money order 
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time to practice.” With that, Sylvia 
calls the singing group together. 
Wednesday was card day for me at 

Kathryn Smith's. My, it was truly a 
Christmas party, tables beautifully 
decorated as was her home. 
Refreshments, a delicious, delightful 
coconut cake and lots of hot coffee. 
Guess what? was high scorer! Boy, oh, 
boy, was I ever tickled. (had lots of 
good partners). You should see the 
year-long present Virginia Willey gave 
Mary E. Nelson. Others present were 
Ethel Rapp, Ruth Powell, Mildred 

Wagner and Hazel Langrell. : 
The Band went Friendly visiting 

Monday at Country Rest Home, 
Greenwood. Julia Astfalt sang a solo 
“0, Holy Night”. Everyone concerned 
was so well pleased. 
Bowling at Milford Lanes. Needle- 

work and clowns, The two L's from 
Dover were here directing clown 
making. Local shopping with Clint. 
Board meeting at 7:30 p.m. Pool, 
Bingo, crocheting, ceramics, Christmas 
all around, have a few things left and 
nice, too! In ceramics, that is, in other 
crafts - lots and lots of things. Come on 
over and see!!! 
Best wishes to all. Be kind to each 

other. Keep the Christmas spirit going 
every day. 

If peace cannot be maintained with 
honor, it is no longer peace. Lord 

Russell. Faith! 

wanted, and, being a spoiled only child, 
I got it. I remember the Christmas 
when I was four, I became intrigued 
with the number seven and I asked for 
seven dolls for Christmas. And of 
course I got them, all the way from a 
big German bisque doll my Dad 
purchased at Wanamakers down to a 
week china one in, my stocking. The 
two I remember most, even yet, were 
twin dolls about eight inches long, 
dressed in pink dotted swiss and 
reclinging in a small wooden bed 
painted green. That same year I also 
got a tiny coffee grinder that would 
really grind two or three coffee beans 
at a time and put it into a wee drawer. 
Some of those toys would be worth a 
fortune antique-wise now. My parents 
said that I was very careful with my 
toys and took excellent care of this, but 
through the year svisiting children 
were rough and tore'them up. And I 
was such a meek little soul, I just stood 
there and let them rather than fight. 
Well, I've had to get over some of that 
through the years! 

I really miss making Christmas 
cookies on the scale that I used to. I 
made about 25 different varieties and 
about 80 or ninety pounds for friends 
and home. Even being “set” in my 
ways, I've had to bow to the years a 
little. 

Recent dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Marvel were Mr. and Mrs. 
George West and children, Mrs. Lorrie 
Green, Mr. and Mrs. Frank Marvel and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. David Marvel 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. John Marvel 
and son and Mt. and Mrs. Elmer 
Freeman and son. 
Mrs. Estelle Gallagher entertained at 

lunch on Wednesday, Dec. 8th, guests 
were Ella Simpson, Francis Parvis, 
Pauline Morgan, Edna Sapp, Mrs. 
John Rose, Doris Brinster, Margaret 
Towers, Anna Bell Brown, Mrs. 

Whitley Jewell and Mrs. Major 
Sockrider also Eva Smith and Mrs. 
George Cascone of Wilmington. 

OF THE WEEK 

       

    

      
    
    
    
    

    
    

    
    
    
    
    
    

      
   

  

      
       

PREVENT STROKE 
“Eat more onions and 

HN garlic and you may 
‘H protect yourself against 

a stroke,” says re- 
searchers at George 
Washington U. Both of 
these bulbs contain an 
anti-coagulant that gets 
into the bloodstream 
and works to inhibit 
clot-promoting sub- 
stances. Whether cook- 
ed, raw, or extract, 
says Dr. Vanderhock, it 
decreases blood coagu- 
lation to build resis- 
tance against strokes. 

Carl June 
HARRINGTON 

PHARMACY 
() 
RS HARRINGTON 

LS—— 
398-8123 

Hospital Supplies 
and Equipment 
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WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 15, 1982 
  

Ares Churel Wews 
Asbury d.M. Church 
The Church School Christmas 

Program will be held in Collins Hall 
on Sunday, December 19 at 9:45 a.m. 
This program was cancelled last 
Sunday due to inclement weather. The 
teachers and children have worked 
hard to prepare for this presentation. 
Support them with your presence this 
Sunday morning. 
The Annual Candlelight Service will 

be held next Sunday, December 19 at 
~ 7:00 p.m. All of our choirs will be 

participating. This is always a joyous 
and inspiring service at Asbury and 
everyone is invited. 
On Friday, December 24 at 11:00 

p.m., there will be a Christmas Eve 
Candlelight Service at Houston 
Church. All are cordially invited to 
attend. Celebrate the birth of our 
Saviour at this time of worship. Did 

pp ————————— ————————————eee a ——————————————LL- LLL. 

Independent Bible Fellowship Church 
you ever stop to realize that 
non-believers as well as believers, 
witness the fact of Jesus’ birth every 
time they write 1982? Jesus’ birth is a 
time-table for the whole world for 
1,982 years ago. He was born. 

POINSETTIAS 
If you would like to place a Poinsettia 

in church for the holiday season, the 
deadline is Dec. 16. Please let me know 
if it is In Honor or Memory of a relative 
or friend so it can be placed in the 
church bulletin for Dec. 19. Last year 
they were ordered and delivered; this 
year they will not be. You can purchase 
them and bring to the church by 2 
o'clock, Saturday, Dec. 18. Please call 
me at 284-9193 if any questions. Thank 
you, Mary Lou Betts, Flower 
Chairman. : 

Harrington Baptist Church 
Saturday - 6-9 p.m. - A Beans 'n Jeans 

Dinner at the church for boys and girls 
ages 4 thru grade 12. Sponsored by the 
Acteens. 
Sunday night at 7 p.m. the Christmas 

Contata will be presented by the adult 
choir and followed by the Sunday 
School program with classes present- 
ing the Christmas Story. 
Mission Friends will not meet during 

the month of December. Their next 
meeting will be Saturday, January 29, 

1983 from 10 a.m. til 12 noon. 
Homebounds are invited to hear 

Pastor Watson each Sunday at 10:30 
a.m. over WYUS - 93, Milford. 

_ “And so it was, that, while they were 
there, the days were accomplished that 
she should be delivered. And she 
brought forth her first born son and 
wrapped him in swaddling clothes, and 
laid him in a manger; because there 
was no room in the inn. Luke 2:6-7. 

Happy Holidays! 

  
    
         

  

   
   
   

    

      
   

  
  

BRB LBB BEBE 
Calvary Wesleyan Church 

Harrington, DE 

ANNOUNCES 

Special Christmas Services 

| Sunday Evening, Dec. 19 - 7:00 - The Senior Choir - 

| will present Christmas Cantata “AN OLD ~~ 
FASHIONED CHRISTMAS”’ 

Christmas Eve, Dec. 24 at 6:30 p.m. Candlelight 

~ Service for the Family 

Sunday, Dec. 2% at 9:30 a.m. - The Children’s 

Christmas Musical 

William H. Miller, Pastor - Phone 398-3531 

BABB BEB EE EEY 
Area Church News - Courtesy of the following sponsors: 

  

  
      

            

FARROW REALTY 

Home [302] 898-3250 

   

  

    
17 Commerce Street DOVER 

Harrington, Del. 19952 VOLKSWAGEN, INC. 

Office 302) 39813455 SUBARL-AUDI 
Harry G. Farrow, Jr. Dov Hi over, Del., 734-4761 

  

Compliments to    
     
    

    

              

  

SERVIOTAR. the Church Community 
from 

AETNA SHIRT CORP. YaslorsHlatinars | 

51 Clark St. Harrington, DE 398-3291 
Harrington 

1-26 Fy 

  

  

  

  

Area Churches 

present 
Christmas 

programs 
FELTON UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH presents a Christmas 
Musical Play, December 18, 1982, 7:00 
p.m. 

ok sk ok ok ok ok ok ok kok sk sk okok sk sk ok ok 
Bethel Church Christmas am 
The Christmas Program at Bethel 

Church, Andrewsville, will be held at 7 
p.m. on December 20. (The program 
was postponed from December 12.) 

Christmas play given by Felton UMC 
Choir and congregation, Saturday, 18 
December 7:00 P.M.   
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Porter Sand & Gravel Ro ‘ 
Fill Dirt Top Sail NANTICOKE HOMES, Salvation Army Thrift 

itl Cras : INC. Stores 
ypes of Excavating 

Contract or Hourly 349.4561 678-3636 Bours Yon Thurs 9-6 Bainglon Spa 

Hon Fredorioe Road P.0. Box F 205 S. Dual Highway Somers: 653-7095 
arrington, Delaware Greenwood, Delaware phimlen. DE. Wilmington - 654-8808 

335-5132 15 § All piano & organ needs 1-5 

AGENCY 
“Let A Single Call Do It All” 

COMPLETE INSURANCE PROTECTION 
SINCE 1932 

[Other offices in Milford & Georgetown] 

1154 S. Governor's Ave. Dover 

  

 McKnatt 

Funeral Home minp ord HEART 

OUR FIRST 50 Commerce St. 
CONSIDERATION HARRINGTON, DEL. 

   

For God so loved the world, that he 
gave his only begotten Son, that 
whosoever believeth in Him should not 
perish, but have everlasting life. (John 
3:16) 

“Born to Die”, a Christmas Cantata by 
on Hamilton will be presented on 
Sunday, December 19, at 7:00 p.m. 

Many of our members will participate 

in the cantata, but all of the church 

body has a party both by their 

presence and through the support they 
have given in various ways during the 
past months. Both the cast of players 
and the choir members have sensed the 

wonderment of the music and words, 
and it is their sincere desire that the 
message set forth in word and song will 
be a blessing and a witness to the Glory 
of God. 
The story begins at the manger, but 

even then the shadow of a cross is 
there. Long before Jesus ever came to 
that manger in Bethlehem, He knew 
that he would be despised of the world 
and that the world would even kill 
Him. Jesus was not born to live. He 
was born to die. 
For God sent not His Son into the 

world to condemn the world; but that 
the world through him might be saved. 

Red Cross to give aid 

to flood victims 
The American Red Cross is involved 

in providing emergency disaster relief 
services to victims of the 1982 floods 
caused by the Illinois and Mississippi 
Rivers cresting over flood stage. 
Over 35,000 people have been forced 

to leave their homes in Missouri, 
Illinois, and Arkansas as a result of - 
massive flooding. 
The American Red Cross is providing 

emergency shelter, food, clothing, and 
medical care for the disaster victims in 
these areas. 

Obituaries 
ADGERIAN JORDAN 

LINCOLN - Adgerian Jordan of rural 
Lincoln died Sunday, Dec. 5, 1982, in a 
fire at home. She was 12. 
Miss Jordan was a student at Milford 

Middle School and a member of the 
Pentecostal Holy Church. 
She is survived by her mother, 

. Patricia; her sister, Hawatha, of the 
~ same address; her maternal grandmo- 
~ ther, Ossie Jordan of Cuthbert, Va. 

There was no viewing. 
Funeral services were at 1 p.m., 

Saturday, in the Pentecostal Holy 
Church in Lincoln. 
Burial was in Old Hickory Cemetery, 

Lincoln. 

674-3500 856-7828 
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HUGHES 

1"DELAWARE MAID" 
SCRAPPLE 

Felton, Delaware 

284-4854 1.9: 
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qulliver travel.inc.] Harrington Plumbing 

ANDY BARROS '& Heating “Complete Banking Facilities’ 

| president Supply Al'the 

; . All kinds of service work PEOPLES BANK Ie south state street Free estimates on jobs OF HARRINGTON 
over, delaware 19901 

302-678-3747 Meyers 5 Saks P umps: Phone 398-3256 

12.20 1229) "12-29" 

HI GRADE DAIRY QUILLEN’S DAIRY SER 
MA ; 

Processor and Distributor HARRINGTON FOODRITE Bie +! ORIENT EXPRESS 4 
Coden Dorman St. 4 a — 
rade A Dairy Products i i Harrington, Dela : 
"97 Clark St. Sr Shr ie i ji LuneheDimnervishe-out 

‘Harrington, Del. 19952 674-8410 
Phone 398-8321 Kee Change, Owner   

  

  U.S. 113 S. Dover   

     

  

    

     

  

   

     

  

Dolphin Seafoods St. Georees Instead of flowers, the family suggests 

Eat in-Take out Thsica : of: flowers. the ta mily contributions to the Heart Fund, Depot 

Call ahead suggests contributions to the Red Lion Street, Georgetown 19047 or 10 the | 
Steamed crabs clams Evangelical Association, U.S. 301 Memorial Fund of Mt. Olivet United 

shrimp Bear 19701 Se dielali '* Methodist Church, Seaford, 19973. 

New Burton Rd. Just [Continued on page 8] 
north of Del State News ” hg 

ASBURY UNITED Rev. James B. Doughten Lisa 

674-3872 1-5 Rev. Jackson Robinson le pi 629.4355 Church 
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CALVARY AN Todd's Chapel Monday Prayer .. 8:00 p.m. 5 

       

  

        

    

   

  

     

     
   

   

  

       
     
    

    

    

The Delaware Chapter of the 
American Red Cross is accepting 
monetary contributions to help defray 
the costs of the relief efforts. 
Contributions should be made payable 
to “American Red Cross - Disaster 
Relief Campaign” and mailed directly 
to one of our local offices. In Kent 
County: American Red Cross, 122 
West Division St., Dover, DE 19901. 
In Sussex County: American Red 
Cross, Girard Bank Building, P.O. Box 
613, Georgetown, DE 19947. 

RALPH GILLEY 
MILFORD - Ralph Gilley, 53, of 
Milford-Harrington Road, died of 
cancer Thursday in the National 
Institutes of Health Hospital, Bethes- 
da, MD, where he had been a patient 
for the past month. 
Mr. Gilley, an Army veteran of the 

Korean War, was a self-employed 
commercial window cleaner. 
He is survived by his wife, Belphia; a 

daughter, Gail Trovitch of Weatherly, 
PA; a brother, Raymond of Anawalt, 
W.Va.; four sisters, Rena Howard of 
Claymont, Carol Colaluca of Long 
Beach, Miss., Waunita Pfiffer of 
Wyoming and Connie Akers of Welch, 
W. Va.; his grandmother, Cora Dollar 
of Anawalt, and a granddaughter. 
Services were Monday afternoon at 1 

at the Berry Funeral Home, Northwest 
Front Street where friends may call 
Sunday night. Burial was in Odd 

Fellows Cemetery. 

CLARA S. DAVIDSON 
WILMINGTON - Clara S. Davidson, 

of Ingleside Retirement Home, 1005 N. 
Franklin St., died of a heart attack 
Tuesday, November 30, 1982, in the 
Memorial Division, where she had been 
hospitalized for the past two weeks. 
She was 88. : 
Mrs. Davidson taught Sunday school 

at the Red Lion United Methodist 
Church in Red Lion from 1922 to 1975. 
Her husband, Alfred F. died in 1965. 
She is survived by two sons, Ernest A. 

_ of Dover and Donald B. of Greenwood; 
a daughter, Helen A. Dasher of Bear; a 
brother, Lewis C. Stafford of Newark; 
two sisters, Lora Butler and Rachael 
Burge, both of Newark; seven 
grandchildren, and 12 great-grandchil- 
dren. : : 
Services were at 2 p.m. Friday at the 

Gebhart Funeral Home, 531 Delaware 
St., New Castle. 
Friends called one hour earlier. 
Burial was in St. Georges Cemetery, 

Wm. H. Miller Worship Service ..10:00 a.m. 

(John 3:17) 
What is Christmas? As the story 

continues, we find the answer to this 
question through the Holy Scriptures 
and in song. And, as the beautiful 
Christmas story takes us home, we can 
hear the bells ringing out the message 
loud and clear; “Born to die upon 
Calvary - He was wounded that I might’ 
live”. 

We especially invite you to this 
presentation of the Christmas 
Message, and it is our desire that your 
Christmas will be made joyous through 
the sharing of God's blessings. 

  

- JANE W. KANE 
BRIDGEVILLE - John W. Kane, 52, 

of Toddville Apartments, died of 
cirrhosis of the liver in Milford 
Memorial Hospital Thursday, where he 
was hospitalized for the past six weeks. 
Mr. Kane was a laborer. 
He is survived by his mother, Hennie 

E. Kane of Bridgeville. Re 
Services were Monday afternoon at 1 

in William's Chapel, 501 N. Cannon St., 
Bridgeville, where friends called after 
11. Burial was in Mount Calvary 

Cemetery, near Seaford. 

ELIZABETH M. D. ALGIER 
SEAFORD - Elizabeth M. Dennis 

Algier of 535 Nylon Boulevard died of 
heart failure Monday, December 6, 
1982 in Nanticoke Memorial Hospital, 
where she had been hospitalized for the 
past two weeks. She was 72. 
Mrs. Algier is survived by her 

husband, Melvin B.; two sons, Robert 
B. of Seaford and Melvin Douglas of 
Greenwood; her mother, Gracie Dennis 
of Greenwood; three brothers, 

Raymond and Joe Dennis, both of 
Greenwood, and Donnie Merel Dennis 
of Florida; a sister, Lois Comstock of 
Seaford; five grandchildren, and 10 
great-grandchildren. 
Services were Thursday afternoon at 

1 p.m. at the McKnatt Funeral Home, 
50 Commerce St., Harrington. 
Friends called Wednesday evening. 
Burial was in Hollywood Cemetery, 

Harrington. 

FRANKE. SMITH 
GREENWOOD - Frank E. Smith, 65, 

of Greenwood, died of a cerebral 
hemorrhage Saturday, December 11, 
1982 in Peninsula General Hospital, 
Salisbury, MD where he was 
hospitalized for the past week. 
Mr. Smith retired in 1979 as a 

self-employed farmer and poultryman 
in the Woodland area near Seaford. He 
was a veteran of World War II. He was 
a member of the Kiwanis Club of 
Seaford. He was also a 32nd degree 
member of Masonic Hope Lodge 4 
AF&AM in Laurel, of the Kent-Sussex 
Scottish Rite Club, and of the Mount 
Olivet United Methodist Church in 
Seaford. 
He is survived by his wife, Alma S. 

Smith; a brother, George W. of 
Lakeland, Fla.; and a sister, Grace S. 
Smith of Tamerac, Fla. 
Services were held Tuesday afternoon 

at 2 in the Mt. Olivet United Methodist 
Church, High Street, Seaford. Burial 
was in Odd Fellows Cemetery, Laurel. 

Tuesday Worship Service 7:30 p.m. 
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INC Adis ay 8 2:50 a Morning Worship 9:30 a.m. SUNDAY dish dinner 7:00 p.m. 
. dS Sunday School 10:45 a.m. K Woreh Seton SAM Worship isa 

Congregation Bible Study = 7:30 p.m. orship Service 11:00 A.M 3rd Sunda y FELLOWSHIP CHURCH Ist & 3rd Sundays, 

pr : AY West Liberty Street WEDNESDAY Church School 9:30 a.m. 
Ha : D I'heocratic School 7:30 p.m. est Liberty Evening Pravor and Bethel 

rrington, elaware Y Service Meeting 8:30 p.m. Sond chev. Ray Newman oS Healing Serviee 7:00 P.M Warship 8:45a.m 

a Tar Bible Study TPM 2nd & 4th Sunday. 

pat Highway na Sunday Worship 30 Po THURSDAY Church School 9:30 a.m. 

19952 Freqerics hy: pass nay Shire 10 PM WHOLE TRUTH TEMPLE 
Rev. Samuel Ingram ; A OF GOD 

Sunday School 9:45a.m. i pi ... 7:00 p.m. IN CHRIST 

4 Moron Worship na a.m. . Bowers Chapel Rd., Viola, Del 
ible Training Class :00 p.m. ; 697 2851 or 284 9911 

: vening Service 7:00 p.m. Greenwood, De. hy ’ 

12-29 Fiveniny Service Y pm Rev. Thomas Cartwright Said Fler Ronen! L. Williams 

Sticke i Sunday School 10:30 a.m. THE Sdneay nehoo 2.1, 
‘ Bible Study & Prayer Meeting 7 p.m. Morning Worship Be thier Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 

/ Evening Service 7:00 p.m. Rev. Lee Shafer ~ Evening Worship om 

2 milek eas 3 d MT. AME Sunday School 10:00 aim. “ric ay : CRYIre : p.m, 

FIRST NAT ra Gut Rr Sar de ont 
TONAL BANK Hish hd re John Mishler Ellendale, De. Junior Church 10:45a.m. Youth Fellowship Service 8:00 p.m. 

41 Mark Swe tornt der Rev. E.L. Coleman, D.D. NY 6:30 p.m. TON METHODIS 
nt 5 Jay Briggs Sunday School 9:15a.m. Evening Worse 7:00 p.m. gh el. 

iin y Divine Worshi 10:30 a.m. 
Commerce St. Deco Allen Beachy Pisin Wosthip 2.0 Prayer Meeting 7:30 p.m. Worship Service 9:00 a.m. 

Worship er ; 3% am. CHURCH +3 Church School 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday 8 :30 a.m, : 

. % a 613 Lakeview Avenue . Bible Study 7:00 p.m. : Worship Service 10:00 a.m bh) > : . R d If D: Garnes ors ip Dervive 3! am, 

Harrington, Delaware Wednesday Prayer Service 7:45 p.m. How Vile De. i Rev. Ru 5 25 Neck Church School 11:00 a.m. 

: Sunday Church School 9:30 a.m, Morning Worship 20m: Worhiisarh Honsm 
J ARE ov Te 00 a.m. *hurch S 10:30 a.m. orship Service 3 . 

19952 Greenwood. De. The Service of the Word 11:00 2.m Church School cht 4 big 
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Maxi with Frannie Pitts 

Perfect Beauty, driven by Ross Hayter. 
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turning out winners 
Although the doors may have closed 

on racing this Fall at Harrington 
Raceway, the track there continues to 

be full 6 days a week as over 450 
harness horses are in training for the 
Winter. And if this year's crop of 
young hopefuls turn out anything like 
last year’s there promises to be many 
happy owners and trainers in the 
offing. : 
Topping the list of horses that trained 

at Harrington last winter-and who have 
since gone on to fame and glory this 
year are the 2 year olds, Perfect 
Beauty, Big Shift and Polo Club. The 
latest addition to the “star” lineup, 
would also include the 3 year old trottin 
filly, Crown Rose. 
Perfect Beauty's credentials have 

already been well documented; winner 
of 10 races in 10 starts, holder of 
Harrington Raceway’s 2 year old 

trotting record and holder of a 1:57 3/5 
record, which is only three-fifths of a 
second off the world record for her age, 
sex and gait. Perfect Beauty is owned 
by Delbert Cain of Harrington, DE. 
Big Shift only started 5 times this 

year, but one of those set the 2 year old 
pacing mark at Harrington Raceway 
when the Sam Belote driven youngster 
went under the wire in 2:02 3/5 for 
owner Gloria Belote and the HMW 
Stable of Dover, DE. 
Polo Club was just one of a quartet of 

standouts from the Charles and 
Frances Pitts stable of horses. She 
took a 1:57 3/5 record and won close to 
$100,000 in 16 starts this year. She 
joins stablemates Gold Creek Milt, 
Charlie Who and Maxi - all 2 year old 
pacers who have identical marks of 
2:01 3/5 and all were trained at 
Harrington. 

Case, O’Donnell 1982 

dash and money leaders 
COLUMBUS, Ohio - Walter Case, Jr., 

who competes primarily in the New 
England area, leads all other harness 
drivers in races won this year. 

The 21-year-old holds a 15-race lead, 
440-425, over his nearest competitor, 
Herve Filion, the all-time leader in race 
wins. 
This race, however, should go down 

to the wire. Last year, Filion finished 
second, just one win behind Eddie 
Davis. Davis had 404 wins to Filion’s 
403. 
The money crown should remain with 

last year’s champion, Bill “Magic” 
O'Donnell, who already has purse 
earnings exceeding $5.4 million this 

1982, now becomes the first to top $5 
million. John Campbell holds second 
place with earnings of $4.3 million. 
DASHES WON - Walter Case, Jr. 

440; Herve Filion 425; David Magee 
320; William O'Donnell 312; Terry 
Kerr 290; Reg Gassien 283; Eddie 
Davis 283; Doug Brown 282; Carmine 
Abbatiello 266; Kim Crawford 261. 

MONEY WON - William O'Donnell 

$5,418,516; John Campbell $4,273,856; 
Herve Filion $3,273,220; Catello Manzi 
$2,704,405; Ron Waples $2,676,482; 

Carmine Abbatiello $2,552,936; Will- 

iam Haughton $2,533,101; William 
Gilmour $2,422,045; David Magee 

  

  

Crown Rose became the latest to 
make the Harrington training facilities 
roster of brilliant performers. Earlier 
this summer she established herself as 
a premier trotter when she won both 
heats of the Bloomsburg Fair's 3 year 
old filly division. On Saturday, Dec. 4, 
she went one step further for owners 
Deborah and Frank Lambert of 
Farmington, DE. That's when she 
broke the 3 year old trotting filly 
standard at Dover Downs and the 
all-age mark as well when she trotted 
home in 2:01 3/5. 
Crown Rose shares barn space at 

Harrington with the Lambert's other 
trotting sensation, Reggie Crown. He 
took a mark of 2:01 3/5 earlier this 
summer and has amassed earnings of 
over $60,000. 
These are but a few of the top 
performers that had their early 

  

Harrington training facility still 

education at Harrington last winter, 
but what about the prospects of this 
year’s young hopefuls?Perfect Beauty's 
got a “spitting image” full sister that 
looks promising and Crown Rose has a 
full brother that’s coming along nicely. 
Veteran trainer, Del Manges has a 
couple that he thinks will be hard to 
beat come summer and the Myer 
brothers, Bill and Ellis also have their 
fingers crossed about a horse or two in 
each of their stables. The hopes and 
dreams go on and on.... 
One thing for sure though, with over 

450 horses in training at Harrington, 
you can bet that there's some future 
champions going around the track on 
almost any ‘given day. Great horses 
have been coming out of Harrington's 
training facility for more than 40 years 
and no doubt they'll still be coming 
forty years down the road. 

Area 4-H News 
Roland Hill, a 4-Her from the 

Hollymount 4-H Club, was the winner 

of a new 10-speed bike for his 
outstanding work with the 4-H 
Bike-A-Thon. Roland completed the 25 
mile course and collected the most 
sponsors and pledge money to win the 
bike. Nine year old Roland is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Roland Hill, Jr. of Lewes 
and he is beginning his second year in 
4-H. The bike was given by the Sussex 
County 4-H Jr. Council and presented 
to him by the Council president Chris 
Majchrzak of Seaford. 
The Dublin Hill Yellow Jackets 4-H 

Club collected the award for club with 
most riders and the club with most 
pledge money collected. Club member, 
Melissa Wilson, received the award for. 
her club at the Jr. Council meeting. 
Melissa was last year’s winner of a 

scheduled a Christmas party for 
December 29th at 7:00 p.m. at the 

University of Delaware Substation. A 
hayride will begin at 7:00 p.m. at the 

Substation in Georgetown and wind 
through Sussex County countryside. 
Upon conclusion of the hayride, the 
4-H'ers will adjourn to a Christmas 
party and dance. Games, dancing and 
refreshments are all on the agenda for 
a fun evening. So don’t be left out. It is 
the policy of the Cooperative Extension 
Service, University of Delaware that 
no person shall be subjected to 
discrimination on the grounds of race, 
color, sex, handicap, age or national 
origin. This activity is open to all 
Sussex County 4-H members. 

  

  

  

  

              
  

  

    
  

            

    
  

      
  

   
   

  

  
  

  

  

  

    

  

   

    

     
  

  

      

    

  

  

    
  

  

      

  

    

  

  

  

                  
    

A . : 10-speed bike. 
season. O'Donnell, the first driver to $2,129,867; John Patterson, Jr. nel 
top $4 million in seasonal earnings in $2,060,053. ThesSussex County Jr. Connell iis IRA 

Cork compound WITH A 

S G ti under the insoles . . . easons Greetings of DIFFERENCE. 
Crown Rose with Frank Lambert. i : CONFORMS 

Vital Statistics on 1982 Horses of the Year 2 YOUR FEET 
: : : LARGE 

Pacers - Pacers * Pacers SELECTION OF Sonu mg, 
CATEGORY HORSE TIME | STARTS | IST | 2ND | SRD | $ EARNED SIRE/DAM Sy guarantees an income at 2 : 

2 yr. old colts Fortune Teller | 1:55 3/5 9 5 9 1 $i313.175 Governor Skipper/Uncanny Ability | RED NG | autve The anger you ive the 
? ? Wi i: e e return. 

2 yr. old fillies Bardot Lobell | 1:54 4/5 15 12 9 1 $ 959,421 Nero/Barbella Hanover i - 
; Peck Bros. Farm Supply 

3yr.old colts | Cam Fella 1:544/5 | 33 28 2 0 ¢ 879,723 | Most Happy Fella/Nan Cam Harrington - 398-3654 

3 yr. old fillies Three Di 1:53 1/5 | 1 2 Albatross/Ambiguit yr ee Diamonds / 21 6 1 $ 502,270 guity THAIPD CIE CID CHAD CID ING) 
Aged horses Genghis Khan) | 1:51 4/5 29 18 4 5 $ 551.050 Meadow Skipper/Robin Dundee 3 . 

Steele’s Music House 
ed mares Fan H 1:54 3/5 12 4 Albatross/Farm Norah Ag anover | 1:54 3/ 28 4 $ 263,443 U.S. 13 — Felton, Del. 

Trotters - Trotters * Trotters Open Daily 9 a.m.-9 p.m. 
CATEGORY " ; Huis TIME | STARTS | 1ST SRD | SEARNED SIRE/D Complete line of Country song William H. Outten 
2 B . Cr A 3 Commerce St., 

yr. old colts Dancer's Crown | 1: 9 9 0 0 $406,512 Speedy Crown/Sissie Blaze books & accessories Harrington 398-3276 

2 yr. old fillies | AmbroBlush | 1:593/5| 20 EE 9 Speed Jj NATIONWIDE 331, peedy Crown/Sparma Hanover v . ; 

. = ais Guitar Instruction 284-9849 INSURANCE 
3 yr. old colts Jazz Cosmos : 5 2 14 2 1 $608,248 Speedy Crown/Jessamy Hanover CORAL CLHIAY CORA) CHM CoRR Natgrve o Lie insurance Company 

3 yr. old fillies Dance Spell 1:56 3/5 19 14 2 0 $340,281 Speedy Crown/Crystoma Hanover FIRST oy ONA | _— TFN 

Ard borvs, | Bathe 6935 @ | 12 | 5 | 1 | swee0 | Pay Freight/Flemington's Jane BANK ShangHai | 1, ppow REALTY 
Aged mares Delmegan 1:56 3/5 15 6 S : Member DELICIOUS CHINESE 0 0 $145,750 uper Bowl/Delmonica Hanover F.D.I.C. FOOD 

Good Luck! . 17 Commerce Street 
i A Collection of New Paintings Teshossrions Milford DE Harrington, Del. 19952 

: : OD g : ... Many of which Harrington 422-2 270 Office [3021 395-3255 
are of local 

BOOED BOESODOESOOBB0E = nisi. - wae | | pct vin 
: | y Canterbury Mastercharge & WSFS HARRY G. FARROW, JR. 

| . : to | VERNON 284-3201 BROKER 
Ladies and Gentlemen of all ages come | i. os Home [302] 398-3250 

; Good luck to all teams! 0 p=! GOO , — 12-15. 
Ae 

“Port Mahon Lighthouse’ American G ood Luck to 

Legion : 
Fo) g Martin Jarrell Everyone! 

—Exhibit will continue through Dec. 31— : ’ 
® / / 9 W. Loockerman St., Dover ira-s00_ gf CKRT Post 7 M ou co, RAY S 

. obile Petroleum 
cma ——— Harri ngton Products PLUMBING & 

: Phone 398-8870 
Fa rrow Realt Compliments to Lake HEATING 

: for Y Forest & W.T. Chipman Sales and Service Ni rth R il d A 
: 17 Commerce St. Harrington, DE Teams & Bands 0 aliroad Ave. 

© Christmas Specials © [302] 398-3455 R.D. 3- Box 124 Wyoming, DE 
: Harry G. Farrow, Jr., Broker 12.15 Harrington, DE 19952 

*Ear Piercing, all ages. $7.00 includes RENT 697-3936 12.29} 

gold, silver, pearl, and birthstone ALS a 
earrings. © Farm house in the country in Harrington area. er ol - 
eProfessional precision haircuts Excellent condition. Super clean. Nice kitchen and oa i Porter Sand TROPHY HUT 
*Custom Body and curly perms bath. Couple only. $250.00 per month plus utilities. — 3 
*Color, highlighting and frosting Lease, references and security deposit required. E Ra & Gravel Trophies 

French braiding, hair straightening Apart ment - In town Harrington. O-y bedroom, Wl ul Saduss 
*Body waxing super large living room, kit~* s Excellent { Fill Dirt i Mbony 

A Makeup, facials, cosmetic face lifts condition. Heat bea} LD and trash ; i Bol Expert Engraving 
‘ eManicure and pedicures include gs * per month. Lease, securit : : i Stylist A oF : ’ y PN All Types of Excavating : : 

Susie Fenipeon | ede RENAL required. Immediate occupancy. or _shlely Contract or Hourly Prompt Quality Service 

6 miles W. of Harrington, DE oq 3 9 8 -HAI R Owned and Operated by: Hou - In town Harrington. 3 bedrooms, living RY. 13 Harrington |. Hgtn-Frederica Road 140 N. DuPont Pkwy. 
3 mi. E. of Burrsville, MD s faq." room, dining room, kitchen and bath. No utilities. Across from the Harrington, Del 
Corner of Rt. 14 - Road 113 Vicki I vins $275.00. Lease, security deposit, references required. 5 fairgrounds gton, Delaware 736-6456 

. n7d k |. 

BOOS OODOOOOOPOOIBBOB@ [LIne covpany “units | 339-9132, 5         
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® @ 
as Obituaries . ......... Letter to the Editor 5 : : emp Young; three daughters, 
: [Continued fr on pege 0] Young at home, Doris Allred of Winter . 
: KERMIT W. SHEPPARD Suk, Fla, Sad Beuy J en Redden of Dear Editor: ® 2 : i § .; four sisters, Rosa : : ; . . : : : > | oi yea di Remit W, Snoppnd of Foes of 2 hore. MD, Grace In every school in America, kids are marijuana is a killer! Yet, Jimmy Kids taking drugs don’t ever with this terrible blight of drugs and : Wednesday, Dec. 8, 1962 in Kent Clendaniel of Marydel, MD, Pearl Crying for help,” says Dave Toma, who Carter appointed Peter Borné as head remember parents telling them they Bleohol and. permissivencss and : . G : ne Ho ital ‘where he had been Smith of Cambridge, MD and Jessie has spoken to 40-50 million kids, of his Drug Administration and loved them! Sextiality and the things that sre being : 

Genes ; Sora,” ast 8 weeks. He Postles of Frederica, DE; five Parents and educators in the last national drug enforcement body. Borne Toma urges parents to go together as done. And God, we pray for a spiritual gn : a ize P : grandchildren and three great-grand- twenty years about the dangers of WANTED TO TAKE AWAY ALL a family unit to church. He tells us that revival. Cleanse this awful filth away . To Mr. Sheppard retired in 1976 after children. drugs. ' SANCTIONS ON MARIJUANA! we, as parents, are never done, from fomus. ¢ turning to J king as a farmer in the Hartly area Services were Monday in the - Dave Toma was the New York cop ~ “Not only do they come into school the moment of concept to the day they Lord, may there be a grea he i ; Lh ne y Emmanuel Holiness Campground Who (was the basis for the TV like mummies and parents dont ge. : God. Start with our government os. Ee a " Anna Mae. died in 1961. He Sanctuary. : character Baretta), the man of many know,” says Toma, “but for thousands If parents don’t tell their children leaders and those who have been so | i. is SUrvIve dy .a Son Milbourne of Burial was in Forest Lawn Memorial disguises who busted the drug of kids a day, incest is epidemic. Sui- they love them, then the cults and the blind, and the entertainment ine ustry aa Hartlv: a dau End Betty Ann Hall of Park. distributors, the pushers, the butchers cide attempt is the 2nd leading cause of Moonies and the Jones’ will. that influences these young peop e tha 0) RE 
Tut sville Fla ; four brothers, Jesse of CHARLES R. CLARK SR. and murderers of this world. He is a death among high school students. People take drugs as a cry for help. they might see what their influence is oF Lewes, Norris of Camden, Barney of BOOTHWYN, PA - Charles R. Clark fabulous policeman. He became  Aleohol is the first.” - They take drugs when the family unit doing and those court decisions, | Ar M del and Homer, also of Camden; Sr., 67, of 4601 Naamans Creek Road, interested in the twisted lives of drug “What about responsible drinking? ” is broken down, and they take drugs Strictly with their power to deal wit mu 
fons a Tessie Thompson of died Thursday of cancer at his home, users and even wrote a book, “Dave kids ask. when they don’t know the Word of this lawlessness. : a.m Hartly. Mabel Reed of Greenwood and after a long illness. Toma Confronts - To Change Lives “No,” says Toma, “because 20 million God, when there is no direction, no God almighty, wake us up, we pray, ; yo aki and Mary Walls both of Mr. Clark was a bricklayer for the With Love.” alcoholics today were once responsible discipline, no love!” and help this land repent of our sins : ext Barelav. MD: nifie y ndéhildren and Allied Chemical Corp., Claymont, Del., This may surprise you, as it did me, drinkers. Every day, 15 teenagers die Then kids want to get high, and they 2nd we ask for forgiveness ; and i at | 
two Ad REL for 36 years, retiring in 1974. He was a that drugs are used by kids from of alcoholism, and 4 adults die EVERY don’t care how. What the dealers have cleansing in J esus’ name. Amen.” 3 the Se tee: So Te abD m Saturday in member of the U.S. Trotting wealthy families,and not kids from the HOUR of alcoholism!” told Toma is they cut the grass with rat A transcript from the interview i Th the Torbert Finoral pw. el, Bradford Association and the Linwood Heights 8hetto so much, not half as bad as in Yet the Illinois legislature once poison, dunk speed in Drano, put for all who did not view it WI I. Reed Streets apa: where Methodist Church, Linwood. the rich communities, but he tells us debated the problem to get kids off the cracked glass in cocaine for school kids from a Concerned Citizen i» for Sha dé enitod cao Sour belore He is survived by his wife, Mary like it is: “We are involved in this marijuana, should they lower the to snort, and sell grass and pills dipped : ns A y : : ichols Clark, to whom Mr. Clark was mess!” drinking age. in embalming fluid to pass to the Jr. x ul was in Lakeside Cemetery, Richals Clarks I Charles R. Dave talks to kids without cameras, “People must make a commitment and High and ne Fim school kids. Talk to Santa! i REV LLOYD C. YOUNG Jr. of Milford, Del.; two daughters, lights, or teachers. He talks to them take some moral stand,” says Toma. School officials may want to do W ANDERS ON. S.C. - The Rev. Lloyd Betty Ferguson of Boothwyn and Ann Straight. There are 421 poisons in Yet, entertainers like Johnny Carson something, but they are scared about Dear Editor . anc C Young 74, of Anderson, died of Bradley of Linwood; a brother, William marijuana alone. Hundreds of students make a big joke of grass and alcohol. it, Parents are almost afraid to Boys and Girls: wil heart failitre Saturday, December 11, E. of Harrington, Del.,; and seven ar¢ going numb. They are: losing Everybody s doing it! acknowledge it. If they know their kids Remember to call Santa Thursday, Hai 1982 in the Anderson Memorial grandchildren, sensations, like no feeling in their hand The major networks do not encourage are smoking grass, they maybe don’t December 16 from 6 p.m. - 8 p.m.; fur Hospital, where he was hospitalized for ~~ Services were Monday afternoon at 2 x no feeling In their leg. They're losing Toma to speak. They pay writers and want to acknowledge it, because they Friday, December 17 from 7 p.m. - 9 398 
4 a NS at the Ward Funeral Home, 1459 t eir memories, becoming psychotic or TV stars well to influence the young don’t know what to do about it. You p.m. Phone number is 398-3232. = D Young was the founder and Market St., Linwood, where friends neurotic, and parents don’t know! kids. feel helpless. = I, ig ar. dship Emmanuel called Sunday night. Burial was in Many kids overdose on drugs. Grass Toma's answer is “We've got to get Pat Robinson of The 700 Club led the : Ww pastor. 0 Ch LH DR of Linwood Lawncroft Cemetery. Instead 1S not a piece of cake. 0.D. on drugs back to the basics of life! We got to get audience in this prayer: “Father, I © nev Blojinpes cn ; ay iT of flowers the family suggests Were Elvis Presley, Balueci, Jimmy back to loving!” thank You for Dave Toma and the < are the Sout ig member of the contributions to the Linwood Heights Hendrix, Freddie Price, and Janice Personally, he didn’t remember tremendous work he is doing. We ask Jou Conference, an es o ard Methodist Church, 1627 Chichester Joplin. They would not be dead today walking around his home without his You to bless him for alerting this General Porelgn Ri irk : Helen Ave., Linwood, Pa. 19061. but for drugs. mother touching him and his brothers = nation, and Father, all we can say is Hi He is survived by his ’ : ’ The American Medical Association and sisters. He said, “We needed to there is a sickness in this land. It's ified . finally woke up and admitted know that our parents loved us!” almost like we're cursing ourselves wit 

X 3 

new Coming Ra 
to Events | 

3 [continued from page 2) 
seh 

George Thompson is in charge of 
| ii arrangements. ichar 

‘sk i Beginning in January, the club's reign in England. 
a meeting nights will be changed to % z 
a Mondays instead of Tuesdays as : %, : presently scheduled. The time and & GCOMF ORT GLOW %, e oan an er fol place will remain the same, the I, ¢ 

Harrington Restaurant and Newsstand & KEROSENE HEATERS ‘4. to / 100 Delaware Avenue, at 6:15 p.m. ¥ + WE STOCK ALL POPULAR SIZES S | : . | on Planning a Party? D + WE STOCK ALL THE REPLACEMENT PARTS ! © pe Are Jou planning a bares it holiday « WE SELL THE KEROSENE 1 es g ain ® | ton season? Whether you're the company | : 
president, an office manager, the 2) WE HAVE UNBEATABLE PRICES 

| 5 holiday hostess or a parent planning a Cae" ) ’ 
| 0 party for teenagers, you will want to Na —2) ANGERSTEIN & 
| Cal have a responsible party that will allow wy a 

nal, all of your guests to get home safety 315 New Rd. Webbs La. & New Burton Rd. 
— and avoid a tragedy this holiday Elsmere rare Dover 

| season. EE ——— 999-0501 697-9515 
Igew For tips on how to plan a responsible 

| party and to make sure that no one 
n runs afoul of Delaware's tough new 
| drunk driving law, contact the Office of 
| Highway Safety at 9 E. Loockerman Sh t | 

‘St., Dover, 19901 or call 736-4475, for : era on n n 
free brochures. You may also pick up 
copies at your local State Police Troop. R o D over 

Governor makes Chri i hristmas Day Buffet | appointments to 
T served 1 to 9 p.m. iy boards and | . | o_o - $8.95 Adults commissions 

Recently Governor du Pont made Children under 12 - $5.95 : 
several appointments to boards and 
commissions that do not require Senate i ed 
approval. They are as follows: Reservations accept for 
Council on Game and Fish 

Chester Lee Carroll, Felton, un- groups of 8 or more 
| 3 p til February 22, 1983; David A. : 

) ; Jones, Milford, until October 11, 1985; 4° 
Sherman G. Stevenson, Sr., Felton, ; Fey until October 11, 1985; Norman S. Wix. Yo J : : ; Harrington, until October 18, 1985; pt” 4 > Now you can ride off into the sunset with the Council on Transportation ? Charles H. : new ick f hoi Th Fi t { 
West, Milford, reappointed until Sheraton ’ Inn-Dover : car or pICKuUp o your c oc. € I'IrS er tm Delaware Devel bol National Bank of Harrington is having a sale of STeiner, Milford, until November 12, 1570 North duPont Highway/Dover new car and new truck loans that will give you J 1985; Joseph L. Warnell, Lincoln, until 

. . ; 
Novembr 12, 1985; C. Leslie Wix, 302-678-8500 the lowest interest rates in town. Le Harrington, until November 12, 1985. % 16% We all know that a good deal on a car is no 

    

    
   

        
                

deal at all if you can’t afford the financing. Now BE SLE the First National Bank of Harrington puts that y 
new car or truck within everyone's reach. But | L & M Fa 
hurry, this sale is for a limited time only. Stop in : : | soon at the Bank of a Lifetime, before the Loan Fashions For The 1 1 0% Arranger rides ... again! 

: 
& 

Whole Family 
Annual Percentage Rate 

| lL Boys and girls laminated hooded jackets $7.00 : Blade Th F : t N t1 ] Bank | : | Gi oy plover $10 Waren Diilas e€ I'1I'St INaltional r | adies zippered dress slacks size 8-20 
: | 

Wide selection of men & boys winter jackets ¢ of Har | i 1n ton : Er for Christmas lg hl 
MEMBER a : NEW Shipment of Quality || Deck the halls with boughs of holly, 9 Commerce Street FDIC - 

fill your homes with lots of cheer. " ] Merchandise May this season be warm and jolly, Harringto 1, Delaware : 
Convenient Lay-A-Way Plan = L Ve DR one 398-3232 BA 27 

avere s | OFA BS | | Canterbury 284-3201 A FETIM a1 45 Clark St. Harrington, DE 697-2167 TV SERVICE Ai |   
    R770 Daa v ooo 
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Classifieds 
   

   

  

    

  

  

December 20, 1972, and of record in the H Diabetics and Aller "FOR SALE - 3 piece livin i A Delcampo, Adrian Harmon, Wynell : : CLASSIFIEDR ATES Suff 5 Ii gy oor + 7 NZ sifice of the Recorder of Deeds, in and CITY OF HARRINGTON Irwin, Gary Lewis, John Schuicios, Golden Triangle 
® (CLASSIFIED DISPLAY: $1.90 per col. inch ufferers! A small insulated suite, matching for Kent County, Delaware, in Deed Anne S ; ; . MH ASSIFIED DISPLAY: $1.90 per co. > . . : : RT 2s PUBLIC HEARING nne Sparklin, Nancy Wilkerson Chilled Pears 

e Eup Be Ai Ice Box” case protects ginger jar lamps, 2 coordin- RecordBook G, Vol. 28, at page 76; and Rezoning request pre- 129.8 Christmas Treat 
: Mail to: Jue Harvigon Journal, 19 Commerce St., Harrington, DE 19952 medication from tempera- ated oriental rugs all like AND BEING 2 part ofthe same Jands sented b g Sha , 5; Frost Milk rea 

: $175 for 25 words or less - 5° each additional word, ture extremes at Harrington new. Call 398-8027 after 5:30 and premises conveyed unto East End, nig ! Ts pn Ry y ° The following ads can run FREE Pharmacy. 3T 12-22 p.m. 2T 12-15 Ines 8 Delaware corporation, by deed Pro osed Amendment Everett Outten, Edgar Ramsey, Mae 

3 for up fo FOUR WEEKS | gt iam B. Wiolloner and Ems C. : pe 0 Williams Woodbridge . 
ger, his wife, bearing date Apr 0 Zoning map: southern DISCHARGES t ‘Household items under $500 ‘Garage Sales ¢ . WANTED AUTOS FOR SALE 26, 1974 and of record in the office of end of 8 map: (3) car Richard Bennett, Beverly Bert 

8 ‘Lost & Found Giveaways 4 Ww ; a } the Recorder of Deeds, in and for Kent ] ted 100 Reynolds French, Lillian King, Robert School Menu 
: ‘Employment Wanted ‘Items to trade © anted, licensed qualified Jeeps, Cars, Trucks under County, Delaware, in Deed Record garage located at Lord, Jr., Wm. MacBlain, Nora 
¢ (Not to be confused with Help Wanted ‘Yard Sales . real estate salesperson. 398- $100 available at local gov't Book E, Vol. 29, at page 334. Center Street from R - 1 Spangler Monday, December 20 
o . : : eese Steak 
oleeveonnnnsei ONS 3903206.  cerinsent 3455. TFN sales in your area. Call Terms of SALE: 20% day of sale and fo C L. n Sh French Fries on roll 

: subject to confirmation by Superior Date: December 27 Chilled Pears CORRECTIONS ext. 5087 for directory on Ca aa a 0 ’ age 
READ YOUR AD THE Poultry GrowersInsurance py aq REFINERY how to purchase. 24 hrs. IY oa a i? ein 1982 Ice Cream 

coverage, including collapse, 3T 12-22 Seller and 1% by the Purchaser. Time: 7:30 P.M. Choice of Milk 

  

  

ARS! 
FIRST Day I app A competitive rates for build- COTY. Siigns PLE TY oF ; Seized and taken in execution as the Place: Council Cham- Licenses Tuesday, December 21 ny corrections to be made . : t d all plus cash bonuses, 1976 CHEVETTE - Interior property of: EAST END, INC., GR. 103 Flemi Chicken Noodle S 
must be called in from 8 18% eduipment, ane 2% fringe benefits to mature and exterior like new, MYERS & ASSOCIATES, LTD. & Pre: eng licenses hi farm insurance. MARVEL . 2% : ; . ; > LAKEWIND, INC. will be sold by Street Marringe issued by the derk Peanut Butter & Jelly a.m. to 9 a.m., the day after AGENCY. I Mil individual in Harrington 48,000 original miles, air heriffs Offics of the peace, Edith Hemphill, Kent Bol & ch 
your ad appears. One (1) § "no Jp So area. Regardless of exper- conditioning, motor in per- Dover, Delaware ty: Deigware i fhe week 4 SS opm hese 
extra insertion will be made pitas ; ience, write A.C. Sears, fect condition, asking $2200. ; GEO. D. IT 1982: 3 Cherr or 
at no charge for an error not Life Time plastic water ig Texas Refinery Call evenings, 398-3744. Bin Joseph Hole: nr i Gators Amn ie i) of Milk 
the fault of an advertiser. well. Call Ken Wood at Life orp., Box 711, Fort Worth, TFN SHERIFF'S SALE eed, Gallitzin ohn Theodore 

The Harrington Journal Time Well Drilling, 301-479. Texas 76101. 1T 1215 CARD OF THANKS ALA ER ally, vues. Wednesdey, December 22 
WILL NOT be responsible (397. TFN for the sale of land to me directed, will a. List Cross, Dover, DE; Donald Reed Lucas, Buttered Ri / 
for more than [1] incorrect ; MOBILE HOMES We would:like to express be exposed to public sale by way of ~ Columbus, IN and Elizabeth Ann S id h ice w/gravy 
insertion. Typesetting, layout & com- FOR SALE Public Vendue at the front door of the Bernard, Milford, DE; John Kevin Bell, ~Succotas 

our sincere thanks for the Kent County Court House, Dover, Kent Lr Martha Rosetta Holloway, Dover, DE; Hot Rolls w/Butter 

  

] : oon : Del St Edwin M i d Sh Le M SITUATION WANT arge jobs. Professional Te. New 1983 14x70. 3 bed- cards, flowers, visits and Compt Sis * Relavass, Fi BIRTH LIST a i Dae Loe Orange Smiles : 

ED sults. Quality work. Har- room, furnished and set up other acts of kindness to all at 2:15 Hector & Valerie Oliva, Harrington, Draper and Kathleen Lucks, Smyrna, Choice of Milk : 
WILL BABY SIT - Reliable rington Journal. 398-3752. on your lot, $12,995. Don't OU neighbors, friends, and House Located: irl DE; Jeffrey Wayne Montgomery, Thursday, December 23 

and dependable teenager TFN | Financing avail. [amily made during my 5 Dixon Street. 124-82 Parkesburg, Wy and Maria Cristina. HotDog ow Roll 
pay more: Irinancing avail- Jerry & Kathy Sylvester, Felton, girl Coker, Madrid, Spain; William Clifton 

will baby sit in your home in 
Harrington area. References 

position services. Small and 

BUSINESS CARDS - Rais- 

  

able. Kent Mobile Homes, 
2170 No. duPont Hwy., Do- 

recent stay in the hospital. 
A thanks to all the nurses on 

ALL those two several lots, pieces or 
parcels of land and premises situated in 

Tery & Beverly Hay, Harrington, boy 
David & Joann Dale, Harrington, girl 

Wallace, Jr., Wyoming, DE and Helene 

Resnick, Dover, DE; Anthony Glen 

Baked Beans 

Chilled Mixed Fruit 

furnished upon request. Call © lettering, most colored © Fon 0) aoe mn the 3rd and 4th floor of the the city of Harrington in Kent County  Ajn & Nancy Wilkerson, Nassau, girl Harmon and Marietta Louise Coleman, Joo (ream 
: printing at no extra charge ’ . . fal wh ice t and State of Delaware, lying on the 125-82 Harrington, DE; Dennis Gene Cheslock . : 

398-8061 any time. TFN > hospita who were So nice 10 west side of Dixie (Dixon) Street in said Marydel, MD and Sheila Marie Jeffers, Choice of Milk 

  

Most logos and cuts no extra FOR SALE 
  

me and also a special thanks 

  

town, and is bounded on the north and 
James & Wynell Irwin, Felton, girl 

126-82 Magnolia, DE; John Kurt Smart, 

HELP WANTED charge. Min. order, 500. to Dr. Aranilla and Dr. south by a sixteen foot Alley, on the  Niehoias & Cynthia DelCampo, Lincoln, Clasaugus, PA and Fatrica Ame pro ro ol Menu 
x A ‘ : nti i 3 y y , : iam Edwar - 

WANTED - Writer for Quality printing. Guaran- Homemade entertainment Sherman. Also a thanks to hi od Dixie Doon) Pb boy 127-8 Jones, Jr. and Sandra Lee Hain, 
news and socials for Milford teed. Harrington Journal. center, 34” x 72". Asking (Chaplain Brown, Reverend having a combined frontage thereon of Michael & Karen Baynum, Lincoln, girl Greenwood, DE; David Joseph Fravel, Monday, December 20 
area, call Anne, Harrington Sop in to see Srbles 2nd $45, 308-8395. AT 1229 Hays and Pastor Ingram for Tiny Ye fest’ 31g evieadng bee Robert & Elaine Betts, Milton, boy De DE ore Demise Grace Milen Chili Con Carne 

: : © erefrom between lines of unequ i , DE; . 
Journal, 398-3206. TFN. prices. Poinsettias, wreathes, their prayers and visits. width to the said twenty foot alley. Be oth ii Rose Lorraine Yearsley, Frederica, Buttered Rice 

HELP WANTED - Qual Quality printing. Letter- Christmas trees, hanging Elmer Lindale, dr. Le Sonlenietierenl Wha. (ey wma) 128-82 3 DE api otton, Niarnery and Linda ol Gr oon Beans 
ified person to work as a heads, forms, envelopes, baskets for sale after 8th. and family pr dt gl toe JEL Connie Justice: Dagsboro, 8irl Henry Hall, Seaford, DE and Rose eo read 
writer advertising sales and camera ready or custom. Open every day till dark. LEGAL NOTICES such as dwelling (bungalow) and other Raymond & Sherry White, Ellendale, Elaine Zimmerman, Camden, DE; T us X Teli ; Competitive prices Har’ Parker. Stont. Denton: outbuildings and known as 5 Dixon oo Kenneth Byron Winston and Glenda uesday, December 21 

v . ’ + : i . newspaper elivery or {hat J 1. 398-3752 G b Road. Dent Street, Harrington, Delaware. Anthony & Jacqueline Troise, Dover, Maria Johnson, Dover, DE; Edward Hot Dog on Roll 

RACEWEEK. Must¢be able rington Journal. ' reensooro noada, venton, SHERIFF'S SALE irl Mark Martinez, Dover, DE and Brenda Baked B 
to write clearl Call Anne MD. 37 12-15 OF VALUABLE REAL ESTATE AND BEING the same lands and 4 Sue Gibbons, Lincoln, DE. aKe eans 

y: ; ATTENTION LANL. . By virtue of a writ of Levari Facias, premises conveyed unto Russell Hands Sauerkraut 
398-3206. TFN White enamel, 2 burner for the sale of land to me directed, will nd Myra Hands, his wife, by deed of Chilled Pineapple 

Responsible serious high 
school student to volunteer 
services in exchange for on 
the job training in office 

LORDS - List your rental 
properties with us. Qualified 
tenants waiting. We will 

‘screen applicants, prepare & 
execute lease, collect rent 

top, coal or wood stove. 

Good condition. Can be 

hooked up to hot water 
heater. Asking $75.00 422- 
5621. 4T 12-15 

be exposed to public sale by way of 

Public Vendue at the front door of the 
Kent County Court House, Dover, Kent 

County, State of Delaware, on 

Charles A. Tharp and Etta Tharp, his 
wife, dated December 80, 1938, of 

record in the Office of the Recorder of 
Deeds in Dover, Delaware, in Deed 

Record Book E, Volume 15, Page 337, 

the said Russell Hands being departed 

Hospital 

Notes 

Lake Forest 

Menu 

Monday, December 20 

Wednesday, December 22 
Spaghetti w/meat sauce 
Tossed Salad 
French Bread 
Fruit Jello 

  

skills. Your chance to ac- and furnish complete state- a Uioge rah lots, pieces or this life on or about 1966 leaving the BIR Pizza Burger 
y 4 " N aoe parcels of land, with no improvements, said Myra Hands as the survivin \ . 3 quire on the job experience ment of your account month- ANTIQUES - 15% OFF on thereon erected, situated in South tenn i a Brin ADMISSIONS Company Peas Yuwrsday; December 23 

to help you when looking for ly. Call 398-3455 Farrow items ! until Christmas Murderkill Hundred, Kent County, therefrom however any outconveyance Medford Lofland, Robert Creeden, I opeye Salad Jag Lune 

full time job after gradu- Realty. TEN GAI LOS ANTIQUES » Delaware, and designated as follows, in of record, Jr., Connie Justice, Linda Rogers, Applesauce 
ation. Call 398-3752 Ss eak 4 ) near accordance with a Plot Plan of record in Improvements: 1 Story House, 2 Rebecca Benson, Ricky Hicks, Gina Chilled Milk 
auon. Lall dJd-d i : Sp YARD & LAWN HANDY- Andrewsville, 6 miles south- the office of the Recorder of Deeds in Sheds Baker, Richard Bennett, Mary d f 

to Anne. I'FN MAN will xe I west of Harrington 20% and for Kent County, Delaware, in Plot Terms of SALE: 20% day of sale and  Konessey, Karen Baynum, Elaine Betts Tuesday, December 21 | 
; - ul rake leaves, " Cr iy Book I at page 61, as 8 follows, to-wit:- the balance on February 7, 1988, Sales ASC Student’s Choice Menu 

WANTED Writer for clean up gardens, wash OFF Hummels (figurines, subject to confirmation by Superior Francis Bradley, Otis Carmine, Philip 

Magnolia area for news and 
socials. Call Anne, Harring- other odd jobs around your 2T 12-22 Lots 6, 8, 13, 14; Solle 0 ) Madeline Stefero, Harry Vease 4 ton Journal, 308. 3206. TFN house. Call 898-3609 or FOR SALE small dining Lakewind, Section III: Seller 4nd 1 oy dre Purchaser, | the James Williams, Willard Ik ip Tossed Salad |] 1 0 DAYS BE we 

398.3206 TFN os Lots 9, 10, 11, property of: MYRA JANE HANDS will 128.82 Jrange Smiles 4 
WANTED - Reporter for : room hutch, maple finish AND BEING a part of the same lands be sold by ADMISSIONS Hot Roll/Butter Es il bi] ’ 
Woodbridge School District. $200. Call after 4:30. and premises conveyed unto East End, GPO, D. HILL, JR. Roland Eskridge, Jr., Nora Spangler, Chilled Milk ara Christmas Kis 1 i a 398.4172 M15 beobimpomoin byimt WHEE Sey War Sle ni™  yupgay, Deremtber 2 | 
nal, 398-3206. TEN Markowitz, his wife, bearing date 1 3T 12-29 Robert Creeden, Jr., Cynthia Meatball Sub 

% 

windows and cars or do plates and bells) 398-8481. Lots 5, 6, 1, 12, 19 

  

Court and also subject to a 2% 
Delaware Realty Tax: 1% to be paid by 

Dover, Delaware 

Hollinger, Thomas Jones, Ruth Joseph, 

Elsie Ling, Kathy Pippin, Sarah Snow, 

Wednesday, December 22 
Beef-A-Roni 

  

  

  

  

  

  "WINTER SPECIAL" 
REFLEXOLOGY ATTENTION FARMERS 

Durita Sumpter 
Call 7-9 p.m. 

For Appointment 

Harrington, De. 

Legal Problems? 
10% Off 
Parts & Labor 

Now 

thru Dec. © Jan. © Feb. 

FROM DEC. 1 TO FEB. 28 E.J. 
WILSON WELDING WILL OFFER 
A 20% DISCOUNT ON LABOR 
FOR THE REPAIR OF 

The answer to your 

legal problems 

ALUMINUM IRRIGATION PIPE 

kod 
ES 

® 
2 
Be 

7d ‘may be just a phone call away. 

         
     

  

    
    

  

  

AT THE SHOP ONLY. i! we at ; aylor & Messick, Inc. 
Johnson, Dodge & O’Brien, P.A. is a full service oF 
law firm engaging in all areas of the practice of 284-4456 PHONE 422-7159 ia omen Road ia Ti 

wt AFFORDABLE prices. Ln farriogion sani hid 
"Home Of The Long Green Line’ Ed 

Real Estate Criminal Trials DANI 
Divorce Personal Injury ’ 
Custody Probate/Estates Toll Free No. for New Castle Th 2 
Bankruptcy Wils/Corperations & Sussex Counties Only. G 1 ; 

Business Law Traffic Violations 800-282-8525 

WotmensComp..=... 4%. cn ef am Spectrum - “Walt Disney’s Home a ery 

: Great Ice Odyssey” 0 ifts an 
RAUGHLEY INSURANCE Waiting list onl es 

28 N. State Street, || BAVCHLEY INSURANCE 1.8 ous oa Furnishings 
SERVICE | § J:n29&Feb.13......... Three Little Bakers The new store featuring 

“Fiddler on the Roof” 
Samanta Sugar Babies - Philadelphia 

“Mickey Rooney & Ann Miller” 

Dover 

674-8260 674-4350 
unique gift ideas for all 
occasions, including 

silk floral arrangements 
and attractive Christmas 

  HARRINGTON, DELAWARE 

      
      Open daily, evenings & Sat. by appointment “Any i Tests Ty reasonable prices. 

- suggestions - feel free : 
PHONE 398-3551 to call”, Stop in our shop! 

AN 
    S. Governors Ave. & Wyoming Ave. 

Dover, Del. (formerly Tennis Corner) 

: 674-0431 

DOLLARS GO UP IN A Ji ! 

SMOKE... Re N OLD-FASHIONED 
Guns 1 IKE, 

  

  

  
arrington 

ealty.Inc.   DON'T LET YOUR HEATING   
  

736 N. DuPont Hwy. 

ERA 
[DICTTZTN B) DR £0 1°10) 

= 302-736-0800 

FOR SALE 
*Lovely older home in nice neighborhood, 3 BR, 1 1/2 
baths, new plumbing; carpet & antique roll-top desk 

  

  

(9500 BTU 
HEATER 

Removable Tonk 

Now $124.95 

  We Have Everything 
~~ You Need For Your 

. Holiday! 

‘Ng © Poinsettias 
2 $5.95 to 

    

    

     

  

   

   

VS |   JONSERED 520 

now $255. 

     
  

    =
 2%
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POULAN-PIONEER List $324.95 

E and E ENGINE SHOP 
PEARSON'S CORNER 

* All Your Holiday Baking Needs 
* Candy Making Supplies 

* Natural Foods 
© *Woodstoves And Accessories 

plumbing, new gas, FHA, heat up and down, new 
storm windows. Price to sell. Call today! R-456 

*Quiet Country Atmosphere - Lovely 3 BR Rancher on 
1 plus acre. All electric, VA assumable mortgage at 

    
  

    
i 9.95 - 

incl. Price just reduced! R-433 List $34 Reg. $174.95 J $9.95 | 
i 3 * Unusual Holiday Gift : 

*Possible owner financing VA or FHA, excellent OCK BELOW COST! © Ideas | 

country rancher, 3 BR, 2 baths, 1 1/2-car garage ALL MOWERS INST LAWN BOY * large Anvriment Oftnes ] 
[detached]. 1 acre, A Real Bargain! R-411 P-28 Pioneer =~ + Bible And Religious Gift Items | 

: 1, eToys 
*Good Income Property - 2-story frame, 2 apts. live in CHAINS As . NOW $ 250 EX Lnaassoriment Of Christmas A 

one, rent the other or rent both. New copper ; : ~ Candies ] 

. 
  

  

  

  
  

      

  

8%, Fireplace, well and septic systems recently legar's [4 onal JUST ARRIVED! SS RL 7 
redone. Owner says sell! R-438 IGA v > Marydel 492-8609 lumbing.¢ Hatiio * Cooli W ALLTHIS AND MORE AT: | NEW SLEEPING pl wer Ls 

Dover Rt = Service on all Plumbing ® Heating ® Cooling BYLER’ Sl 

Excellent Investment - 4 Mobile Homes - very good mokes my 

     
736-1898 

FINANCING AVAILABLE | 
Nyartly STORE 

RT. 8-5 miles West of Dover 
On RD. 159 PHONE - 674-1689 

condition. Possible $800 per month income. Call for E& E Engine : FREE 
details. C-231 4 Shop ESTIMATES     X Sale Ends 12/18         i 

4
 

r
e
 

e
S
 s
p
 

F
p
 

  
     



  

THE HARRINGTON JOURNAL, HARRINGTON, DELAWARE WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 15, 1982 PAGE TEN 

i paERRY DAVINGS ONYC 
  

     
gap ” J 

TA ; 
1 ; LAIN i eal Tr L INDY A 

ARON SAL TH > 8) NN NY (3 - .- 7%) 

eS fof ba. . ] 

2 g : SS 

Xp RR vg \ 
75 a oa 4, 
'¥a - AGA ver , 
WALA [JR 
ns. ee 

J 0 Ah . 

if Z jes TY \ ay - 

OA A NAL 

Jennie- O Self Basting Turkeys-16-24 Ib. 77¢ Ib. 
-10-16 Ib. 79° Ib. 

Esskay’ 5 Silver Label Fully Cooked Low Salt Hams-up to 62 Ibs. 
-Shank Portion $1.19 Ib. 

-up to 572 Ibs.-Butt Portion $1.39 Ib. 

=17-19 Ibs.-Whole Ham $1.65 Ib. 
-Full Shank Half $1.69 Ib. 
-Full Butt Half $1.89 Ib. 

Hormel Spiced 
Luncheon Meat 

Deli Sliced $1.69 Ib. 

  

  Meat Prices Good 

Thru 12-24-82 

  

    

  

dm Hormel Pear 
%:- 1 Shaped Canned Hams 
a. 3b.Can$7.95 5b. Can $11.95 

  

“ Quillens Fresh Homemade Dairy Market Country 

Pork Sausage 5 Enriched White Bread 
Loose $1.49 Ib. 9. 1 2002. Loaf 59" 

Stuffed $1.59 Ib.     

  

Ed | 
(1 police 
the Th 
l Dr. Vj 

  

  

[Ys 

i Armour’s ““Treet” 
Ge ; 

Luncheon Meat 

12 oz. Can 

$1.29 
    
  

1412 oz. Can 

69¢ 

  

»] Hunts Stewed Tomatoes 

  

16 oz. Pkg. 99¢ 

5 Sunshine Cheez-It Crackers ire 

Armour’s Corned Beef 
120z. Can 

$1.59     

  

  
  

Chef Boyardee Cheese  ¥ 
Pizza Mix 
28> oz. Pkg. 

$1.69 
  

  

== Gulden’s Spicy 
nl Brown Mustard 

24 oz. Jar 99¢ 

   
SPICY BROWN 

  

  

San-Giorgio Elbow 
Macaroni 

16 0z. Pkg. 69¢ 
  

   IEE E2iT 7 ’ 
1, Enriched Rice 

  

Lipton Ring O Noodles 

or Noodle Soup Mix 

2 envelopes 59° Pkg. 
  

  

ws, Welch’s Frozen 
ta ? cath 

== Cranberry Juice 
12 oz. Can 

99¢ 

  
  

  

  

Ice Cream 
1 Gal. Ctn. 

$2.49 

  
    

  

LT TA TOTAL ALCL TTI LL 

Breyer’s ‘All-Natural’ 

51b. Bag $1.39 

““Dragon’’ Long Grain Clorox Liquid 

Bleach 
Gal. Jug 

  

  

New!!! ““Liqua-4’’ Skin Cleaning 

System Liquid Bath Soap 

21 oz. Cont. 49¢ 
  

19¢ Ib. 

  

  

Florida Pink 

Grapefruit 

4 for $1.00 

89¢ 
  

‘‘Steakumm”’’ 

Sandwich Steaks 

14 oz. Pkg. $1.99 

  

    
  

Shedd’s Spread Country 

Crock Oleomargarine 
3 Ib. Tub 
$1.59 
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term ol 
his in 

~~ electior 
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indicate tha 
are also pr 

they are th 
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Commande 
CK.R.T.F 

The Dece; 

Legion C.K 
was enlighi 
Curtis Melv 
its outstanc 

renovating 

Roll on Corr 
The honor 

WWII and ] 
Office, but a 

its being 

Property, it 
Years went 
honor roll w 

was a disgra 
At first, B QuillensL airy: /Varket | 

UANCLCT ACR GER Ld 8 CRT lie DET {EE DORMAN STREET 

12/16-17-18 AAA TT Te SNS 

  

  

  

Ho, 
‘Holidays 

Foryour shopping convenience, we are open every day of the year! 

     


